
ITEM

1.

2.

3.

4.

COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE

NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CASA FORD INC.
EL PASO, TX

CRAWFORD BUICK GMC
EL PASO, TX

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

VERANO

GROUP I - GASOLINE AUTOMOBILES 
(APPROXIMATELY 20 PER YEAR)

FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH STD $0.00 

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

NO BID NO BID

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 STD

STD N/A $0.00 

STD

POWER SEATS

CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL

N/A

STD

N/A

NO BIDNO BIDINCL

MODEL NUMBER

Solicitation #:  2012-292
Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 

NO BID

UNIT PRICE

NO BID NO BID

2013 FORD

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICEUNIT PRICE

2013 DODGE DART2013 BUICK

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012
Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES

$22,349.00

AUTOMOBILES

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR

YEAR/MAKE

NO BID

PFDH41

$550.00 

$225.00 

INCL

INCL

MODEL NUMBER

$17,853.00

DESCRIPTION

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID NO BID

YEAR/MAKE
MODEL NUMBER FOCUS

$15,587.94

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR $20,157.94 $29,240.88

YEAR/MAKE 2013 FORD 2013 BUICK 2013 DODGE 

$19,079.89 NO BID

MODEL NUMBER FUSION SE LACROSSE AVENGER JSDH41

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID NO BID NO BID

YEAR/MAKE

PHILPOTT MOTORS
NEDERLAND, TX

NO BID

NO BID

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 1



ITEM

1.

2.

3.

4.

COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE

NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CASA FORD INC.
EL PASO, TX

CRAWFORD BUICK GMC
EL PASO, TX

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

YES

GROUP II - HYBRID AUTOMOBILES
 (APPROXIMATELY 15 PER YEAR)

$0.00 NO BID NO BID YESFRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH STD STD NO BID

YES

CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL STD STD NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID YES YES

AUTOMOBILES

POWER SEATS N/A STD NO BID $0.00 NO BID NO BID NO

MODEL NUMBER

NO BID

YEAR/MAKE

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID NO BID NO BID

2013 TOYOTA
MODEL NUMBER FORD FUSION HYBRID LACROSSE CAMRY

YEAR/MAKE 2013 BUICK

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR $25,309.94 $29,240.00 NO BID $24,578.00

MODEL NUMBER

NO BID
YEAR/MAKE

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID NO BID NO BID

2013 TOYOTA PRIUS
MODEL NUMBER FORD CMAX HYBRID 11223

YEAR/MAKE 2013

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR $23,821.94 NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-292

PHILPOTT MOTORS
NEDERLAND, TX

UNIT PRICE

$23,875.00

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 2



ITEM

1.

2.

3.

NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CASA FORD INC.
EL PASO, TX

CRAWFORD BUICK GMC
EL PASO, TX

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

NO BID

YES

YES

YES

N/A

STD

STD

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH

CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL

HYBRIDS

POWER SEATS

MODEL NUMBER
YEAR/MAKE

SUV HYBRID VEHICLE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MODEL NUMBER

NO BID

YEAR/MAKE

SUV HYBRID VEHICLE NO BID NO BID NO BID

2013 TOYOTA
MODEL NUMBER FORD CMAX HYBRID HIGH LANDER

YEAR/MAKE 2013

UNIT PRICE

SUV HYBRID VEHICLE $23,821.94 NO BID NO BID $35,962.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

GROUP III - HYBRID SUV VEHICLES 
(APPROXIMATELY 2 PER YEAR)

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-292
Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 

PHILPOTT MOTORS
NEDERLAND, TX

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 3



OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE  AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

A.   BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM 
OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT 
MODEL YEAR 2015 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

B.   VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM 
OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2016 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) AS 
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

C.  VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM 
OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2017 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) AS 
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

D.   NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS:
Within  consecutive calendar days

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contra
NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CASA FORD INC.
EL PASO, TX

CRAWFORD BUICK GMC
EL PASO, TX

DICK POE DODGE LP
EL PASO, TX

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

PHILPOTT MOTORS
NEDERLAND, TX

YES             NO

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-292
Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 

YES             NO

YES             NOYES             NO

YES             NO

120

YES             NO

120 60

YES             NO

NET - 30 DAYS

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

90-120

YES             NO

YES              NO YES               NO

  
NET - 30 DAYS

YES             NO

YES                 NO

    
NET - 30 DAYS

YES             NO

YES             NO

NET - 30 DAYS

YES             NO

  

YES             NOX

X

X X

X X X

X

X

X

X

XX

X

X

X

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 4



ITEM

1.

2.

3.

4.

COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE

COMMENTS:

NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

INCL.
COMPACT PWR SEATS ONLY 

AVAILABLE ON SE W/201A LEATHER 
APPEARANCE PKG.

FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH STD STD INCL.

INCL.CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL TILT STD STD INCL / SE 
ONLY

$2,126
(SE ONLY)

INC
(SE ONLY)

AUTOMOBILES

POWER SEATS N/A HEIGHT ONLY 
STD

MODEL NUMBER FUSION SE

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID $19,480.00 $0.00 $0.00

MODEL NUMBER 1GB69 FUSION S

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR $19,331.00 $17,957.00 $0.00 $0.00

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR $17,428.00 $15,597.00 $0.00 $0.00

FOCUS S P3EMODEL NUMBER 1JU69

UNIT PRICE

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR $14,913.00 $13,999.00 $0.00 $0.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012
Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 

Solicitation #:  2012-292

GROUP I - GASOLINE AUTOMOBILES 
(APPROXIMATELY 20 PER YEAR)

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

SAM PACK'S FIVE STAR 
FORD 

CARROLLTON, TX

YEAR/MAKE 2013 FORD

YEAR/MAKE 2013 CHEVY MALIBU 2013 FORD

MODEL NUMBER 1PL69 FOCUS SE
YEAR/MAKE 2013 CHEVY CRUZE 2013 FORD

YEAR/MAKE 2013 CHEVY SONIC 2013 FORD

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 5



ITEM

1.

2.

3.

4.

COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE COMPACT MID-SIZE

COMMENTS: 

NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO SPARE TIRE OFFERED - REPAIR 
KIT ONLY

INCLFRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH STD

CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL STD INCL

INCLPOWER SEATS STD

MODEL NUMBER

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

MODEL NUMBER 1GC69 FUSION SE HYBRID

MID-SIZE SEDAN 4 - DOOR $25,237.00 $25,827.00 $0.00 $0.00

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

COMPACT SEDAN 4 - DOOR NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 
SAM PACK'S FIVE STAR 

FORD 
CARROLLTON, TX

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012

AUTOMOBILES

YEAR/MAKE

YEAR/MAKE

YEAR/MAKE 2013 CHEVY MALIBU ECO 2013 FORD

MODEL NUMBER

MODEL NUMBER
YEAR/MAKE

Solicitation #:  2012-292
Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES

GROUP II - HYBRID AUTOMOBILES
 (APPROXIMATELY 15 PER YEAR)

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 6



ITEM

1.

2.

3.

NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$0.00 

FRONT BUCKET SEATS, REAR BENCH NO BID INCL. $0.00 $0.00 

CRUISE CONTROL/TILT WHEEL NO BID INCL. $0.00 

HYBRIDS

POWER SEATS NO BID INCL (SEL ONLY) $0.00 $0.00 

MODEL NUMBER
YEAR/MAKE

SUV HYBRID VEHICLE NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00

MODEL NUMBER C-MAX SEL

$0.00

YEAR/MAKE 2013  FORD

SUV HYBRID VEHICLE NO BID $25,629.00 $0.00

MODEL NUMBER CMAX SE
YEAR/MAKE 2013 FORD

UNIT PRICE

SUV HYBRID VEHICLE NO BID $24,339.00 $0.00 $0.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

GROUP III - HYBRID SUV VEHICLES 
(APPROXIMATELY 2 PER YEAR)

Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-292

SAM PACK'S FIVE STAR 
FORD 

CARROLLTON, TX

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 7



OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE  AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

A.   BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM 
OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT 
MODEL YEAR 2015 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) AS
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

B.   VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM 
OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2016 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) AS 
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

C.  VENDOR OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM 
OF THE CONTRACT THROUGH THE MANUFACTURER'S BUILD-OUT DATE
FOR MODEL YEAR 2017 VEHICLES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S) AS 
APPLICABLE UNDER THE PRICE ADJUSTMENT CLAUSE:

D.   NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contra
BIDS SOLICITED:           23                             BIDS RECEIVED:               6                    BIDS LOCAL:     17                         NO BID:           0
NOTE:  THIS IS A BEST VALUE PROCUREMENT.  PRICE AND OTHER FACTORS SHALL BE EVALUATED TO DETERMINE AN AWARDEE.
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

45-60 60-120
(DEPENDING ON FORD'S PRODUCTION 

SCHEDULE)

YES             NO YES                 NO YES              NO YES               NO

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
        

YES             NO YES             NOYES             NO YES             NO

YES             NO YES             NO YES             NO YES             NO

YES             NO YES             NOYES             NO YES             NO

RUDOLPH CHEVROLET, LLC
EL PASO, TX

SAM PACK'S FIVE STAR 
FORD 

CARROLLTON, TX

Project Name:  CITY FLEET VEHICLES Department:  GENERAL SERVICES 

                                                   CITY OF EL PASO
                                                   BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  AUGUST 8, 2012 Solicitation #:  2012-292

X

X

X X

X

X

X

X

APPROVED BY:____/s/________

DATE:____8/20/2012___  2012-292 CITY FLEET VEHICLES - GENERAL SERVICES FLEET DIVISION 8


