Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012

Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294

Department: General Services

ATO ZTIRE & BATTERY, INC.

AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS

AMARILLO, TX CARROLLTON, TX
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM TS PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE
NO. ANNUAL TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT
QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)

100 COOPER SE KELLEY (GOODYEAR)

1 TIRES P205/75R14 01307 $71.20 $7.120.00 356296855 $57.20 $5,720.00
100 DURO DP3000

2 TIRES P215/60R16 8830001621560 $71.29 $7.129.00 FIRESTONE #140718 $73.76 $7.376.00
100 COOPER SF340

3 TIRES P215/75R15 34015 $75.96 $7,596.00 GOODYEAR #183025418 $82.40 $8,240.00
260 P225/60R16 GOODYEAR RS-A

4 TIRES POLICE PURSUIT 732354500 $88.95 $23,127.00 GOODYEAR #732354500 $87.50 $22.750.00
100 P225/60R18 GOODYEAR RS-A

5 TIRES POLICE PURSUIT 732312500 $123.65 $12,365.00 FIRESTONE #005254 $106.09 $10.609.00
400 DURO DP3000

6 TIRES P225/70R15 8830001522570 $70.00 $28.000.00 GOODYEAR #183482418 $84.87 $33,948.00
100 SAMSON GL283A

7 TIRES P225/70R19.5 61128015 $148.15 $14,815.00 DUNLOP #271124002 $268.86 $26,886.00
260 P235/55R17 GOODYEAR RS-A

8 TIRES POLICE PURSUIT 732002500 $106.00 $27.560.00 FIRESTONE #077325 $104.28 $27.112.80

9 100 P235/70R15 COOPER COBRA $101.08 $10,108.00 GOODYEAR #183408418 $87.54 $8.,754.00

TIRES 39637

50 ACHILLES HIT

10 TIRES P235/70R16 1302316735 $91.22 $4.,561.00 GOODYEAR #402027477 $91.96 $4.598.00

11 TI2F?ES P235/70R15 COOI;E(I;?FMO $78.00 $15,600.00 GOODYEAR # 137719568 $85.82 $17.164.00

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES




Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012

Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294

Department: General Services

ATO ZTIRE & BATTERY, INC.

AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS

AMARILLO, TX CARROLLTON, TX
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM TN PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE
NO. Q'TJ"LNN[!I'?'II'-Y TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT
PRICE) PRICE)
12 T|2R5Es P245/70R19.5 SAM;?&%:%A $173.27 $4,331.75 FIRESTONE #169981 $317.31 $7.932.75
13 Tlg(I)ES P255/65R17 TO;’;&:HT $128.29 $6.414.50 FIRESTONE #098048 $107.06 $5.353.00
14 Tlg(I)ES P255/70R16 Af;(I)I;zIﬁEeS?:sIT $102.95 $5,147.50 | GOODYEAR #137840039 $107.98 $5,399.00
$5,119.25
15 TIESES P255/70R22.5 SAMS;)BI‘(I)ZGSL283A $204.77 BIDDER'S PRICE DUNLOP #271128871 $295.16 $7.379.00
$5,119.00
16 T||1a?ss P285/75R24.5 SAM;?S‘&: 83A $275.34 $2,753.40 FIRESTONE #156590 $377.00 $3.770.00
P315/80R22.5
17 Tf‘.fé’s LOAD RANGE L SAMS&%&"Z%A $345.00 $103,500.00 DUNLOP #271113472 $493.92 $148,176.00
20-PLY
18 T.;?;s P385/65R22.5 SAMS;’;;;,LZ“T $413.65 | $12,409.50 FIRESTONE #294586 $593.49 | $17.804.70
19 TII1=15ES P425/65R22.5 SAM%‘;;"J?;‘Z%T $486.46 $7.296.90 DUNLOP #271131486 $615.83 $9.237.45
20 TII1?5ES P445/65R22.5 Gﬁ;‘;?&';&'::a $749.90 $11,248.50 FIRESTONE #294608 $759.45 $11,391.75
4.8-8 IPL, GENERAL, PRO | 25INCH $95.00

21 (6 TIRES WHITE NON-MARKING | 2.50 INCH RIM, 3 INCH, 3.75 3 |§c7|; I:s’\:ga.oo $630.00 CARLISLE #5120511 $21.85 $131.10

1 AMSON GL274A
22 TI:ES 10.00R22.5 S ;?07‘20 A $236.15 $23.615.00 DUNLOP #271124004 $341.00 $34.100.00

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012

Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

ATO ZTIRE & BATTERY, INC.

AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS

AMARILLO, TX CARROLLTON, TX

EST. U EXTENDED U EXTENDED

ITEM T PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE

NO. M TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT

QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)

250 SAMSON GL282A

23 TIRES 11.00R22.5 885342 $249.00 $62.250.00 DUNLOP #271124000 $325.73 $81.432.50

24 |5 TIRES 12:00R20 SAMSS(;EISE;ZMA $416.28 $2.081.40 SAMSON #871732 $419.99 $2.099.95

25 TléoES 14.00R24 SAMSON 41400 $845.54 $16.910.80 BRIDGESTONE #263354 $1.211.48 $24.229.60

L-3

20 SAMSON L2

26 TIRES 17.5-25 306851 $660.06 $13.201.20 FIRESTONE #425129 $849.96 $16.999.20
50 ACHILLES AP

27 TIRES LT215/85R16 1302202763 $98.38 $4.919.00 FIRESTONE #189701 $97.49 $4.874.50
60 ACHILLES AP

28 TIRES LT225/75R16 1302202763 $100.73 $6.043.80 FIRESTONE #189752 $105.34 $6.320.40
60 GOODYEAR ATLS

29 TIRES LT235/75R15 411828478 $82.58 $4.954.80 FIRESTONE #189837 $97.36 $5.841.60
60 ACHILLES AP

30 TIRES LT245/75R16 1302204763 $110.12 $6.607.20 FIRESTONE #189769 $103.95 $6.237.00
50 GOODYEAR SR-A

31 TIRES LT245/75R17 179636492 $150.21 $7.510.50 FIRESTONE #207483 $117.23 $5.861.50
25 DURO DL6000

32 TIRES LT265/75R16 8660001626SE $130.86 $3.271.50 FIRESTONE #207602 $122.35 $3.058.75
25 PEGASUS SUV

33 TIRES LT265/70R17 1952317763 $137.38 $3.434.50 FIRESTONE #200156 $138.68 $3.467.00

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE PART A - ITEMS 1-33 $471,632.00 $584,254.55
BIDDERS PRICE $471,631.75

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES




Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012
Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

®

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

ATO ZTIRE & BATTERY, INC.

AMARILLO, TX

AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS
CARROLLTON, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE
AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

|NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE
EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE

NO OPTION OFFERED

|[EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

X

[]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES |:|

NO

YES NO |:|

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION FORM 'l v

2010
Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012
Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

MARTIN TIRE COMPANY REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
EL PASO, TX PHOENIX, AZ
EST. ou EXTENDED e EXTENDED
ITEM T PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE
No. | ANNUAL | TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE | (QUANTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNIT PRICE | (QUANTITY x UNIT
QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)
100 MASTERCRAFT F/S FR3850
1 | 1iRES P205/75R14 VIC0631 $70.33 | $7.033.00 4098043 $47.51 $4,751.00
100 MASTERCRAFT FIS FR710
2 | 11RES P215/60R16 VIC12106 $79.35 | $7.935.00 4085061 $83.33 | $8,333.00
FISFR380
100 MASTERCRAFT
3 | 11RES P215/75R15 VICO6313 $75.78 | $7.578.00 #098329 $51.50 | $5,150.00
260 P225/60R16 MASTERCRAFT FIS FIREHAWK P41
4 | TIRES | POLICE PURSUIT MC22703 $103.11 | $26,808.60 067911 $94.21 | $24,494.60
100 P225/60R18 MASTERCRAFT F/S FIREHAWK GT
5 | nres | POLIGE PURSUIT \IC22704 $134.26 | $13,426.00 4005254 $109.09 | $10,909.00
400 MASTERCRAFT F/S DESTINATION LE
6 | 1iRES P225/70R15 VICo5312 $83.04 | $33,216.00 46048 $92.93 | $37,172.00
100 ROADMASTER FIS FS 560 PLUS
7 | 1iRES P225/70R19.5 \IC95302 $223.44 | $22,344.00 00716 $269.28 | $26,928.00
260 P235/55R17 MASTERCRAFT F/S FIREHAWK GT
8 | TIRES| POLICE PURSUIT MC22711 $132.96 | $34,569.60 #077325 $107.53 | $27,957.80
100 MASTERCRAFT F/S DESTINATION INDY 500
9 | 11RES P235/70R15 VIC39737 $95.49 | $9,549.00 118656 $96.66 | $9,666.00
50 MASTERCRAFT F/S DESTINATION LE
10 | 1RES P235/70R16 MC51533 $107.49 | $5,374.50 4054375 $106.66 | $5,333.00
200 MASTERCRAFT F/S INSIGNIA SE 200
11 | 11RES P235/70R15 VICOBI15 $77.23 | $15,446.00 4076030 $94.74 | $18,948.00

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012

Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

El Paso
i\llilmerica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294

Department: General Services

MARTIN TIRE COMPANY REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
EL PASO, TX PHOENIX, AZ
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM TS PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE
NO. ANNUAL TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT
QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)
25 ROADMASTER F/S FS 560 PLUS
12 TIRES P245/70R19.5 MC95801 $264.14 $6,603.50 #169964 $300.45 $7,511.25
50 MASTERCRAFT F/S DESTINATION LE
13 TIRES P255/65R17 MC50112 $141.44 $7,072.00 #083190 $111.06 $5,553.00
50 MASTERCRAFT F/S DESTINATION LE
14 TIRES P255/70R16 MC50121 $120.26 $6,013.00 #147033 $117.55 $5,877.50
25 MASTERCRAFT F/S FS560
15 TIRES P255/70R22.5 MC92322 $297.16 33&33»%9.9.: #192982 $303.15 $7,578.75
10 ROADMASTER F/S FS 560 PLUS
16 TIRES P285/75R24.5 MC92054 $390.38 $3,903.80 #156590 $349.26 $3,492.60
P315/80R22.5
17 300 LOAD RANGE L NO BID NO BID $0.00 BIS M860 $613.83 $184,149.00
TIRES #186301
20-PLY
30 F/IS T839
18 TIRES P385/65R22.5 NO BID NO BID $0.00 #204586 $544.65 $16,339.50
15 F/S T839
19 TIRES P425/65R22.5 NO BID NO BID $0.00 #296594 $607.26 $9,108.90
15 F/IS T839
20 TIRES P445/65R22.5 NO BID NO BID $0.00 #294608 $694.43 $10,416.45
4.8-8
21 |6 TIRES WHITE NON-MARKING NO BID NO BID $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
100 F/S FS 560 14 PLY
22 TIRES 10.00R22.5 NO BID NO BID $0.00 #193050 $358.73 $35,873.00

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
/sl

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES




Bid Opening Date: AU
Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

i\lli\merica City

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

MARTIN TIRE COMPANY REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
EL PASO, TX PHOENIX, AZ

EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED

ITEM TS PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE

No. | ANNUAL | TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNITPRICE | quaNTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNITPRICE | quaNTITY x UNIT

QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)

250 ROADMASTER FIS FS 560 PLUS

23 | TIRES 11.00R22.5 MC92034 $342.39 | $85,597.50 #156531 $332.81 $83,202.50

B/S VCH INDUSTRIAL

24 |5 TIRES 12:00R20 NO BID NO BID $0.00 #190194 $964.64 $4,823.20
20 B/S VCH INDUSTRIAL

25 | 1RES 14.(|)_(_)3R24 NO BID NO BID $0.00 4293016 $1,801.47 | $36,029.40
20 FIS SGG LD

26 | TIRES 17.5-25 NO BID NO BID $0.00 #425180 $766.73 | $15,334.60
50 MASTERCRAFT F/S TRANSFORCE HT

27 | TIRES LT215/85R16 MC51215 $119.48 | $5,974.00 #189701 $109.65 | $5,482.50
60 MASTERCRAFT F/S TRANSFORCE HT

28 | TIRES LT225/75R16 MC51221 $120.65 $7.239.00 #189752 $124.51 $7.470.60
60 MASTERCRAFT F/S TRANSFORCE HT

29 | TIRES LT235/75R15 NMC51211 $116.30 $6,978.00 4189837 $108.26 $6,495.60
60 MASTERCRAFT F/S TRANSFORCE HT

30 | TIRES LT245/75R16 NMC51213 $137.05 $8,223.00 4189769 $116.83 $7,009.80
50 MASTERCRAFT F/S TRANSFORCE HT

31 | TIRES LT245/75R17 NMC59502 $160.38 $8,019.00 4207483 $131.31 $6,565.50
25 MASTERCRAFT F/S TRANSFORCE HT

32 | TIRES LT265/75R16 NMC51219 $144.99 $3,624.75 #189786 $133.06 $3,326.50
25 MASTERCRAFT F/S TRANSFORCE HT

33 | TIRES LT265/70R17 MC51218 $161.48 $4,037.00 #200156 $142.68 $3,567.00

TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE PART A - ITEMS 1-33 $343,993.25 $644,849.55

BIDDERS PRICE NOT PROVIDED
THEIR TOTAL $351.422.25

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES




Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012
Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

MARTIN TIRE COMPANY

EL PASO, TX

REDBURN TIRE COMPANY
PHOENIX, AZ

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE
AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE
EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE

CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE

|[EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

X

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES

NO|:|

YES |:| NO

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012

Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

EL PASO, TX
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM T PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE
no. | ANNUAL | TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNITPRICE | oy aNTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNITPRICE 1 quantry x unir
QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)
1 | 100 P205/75R14 NOT PRODUCED NO BID $0.00 $0.00
TIRES
100 GOODYEAR EAGLE
100 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
3 | 11RES P215/75R15 SRA 18302541 $91.29 | $9,129.00 $0.00
260 P225/60R16 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA
4 | TIRES | POLICE PURSUIT 732354500 $93.98 | $24,434.80 $0.00
100 P225/60R18 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA
> | TIRES| POLICE PURSUIT 732312500 $129.84 | $12,984.00 $0.00
6 | 400 P225/70R15 NOT PRODUCED NO BID $0.00 $0.00
TIRES
100 DUNLOP SP461
7 | 11RES P225/70R19.5 117083 $259.18 | $25,918.00 $0.00
260 P235/55R17 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA
8 I TIRES| POLICE PURSUIT 732297500 $112.27 | $29,190.20 $0.00
100 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
9 | 11RES P235/70R15 SRA 133400415 $96.85 | $9,685.00 $0.00
50 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
10 | 1 2ee P235/70R16 0202747 $103.84 | $5.192.00 $0.00
200 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
1 | 1rEs P235/70R15 SRA 183406418 $98.57 | $19,714.00 $0.00

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES




Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012

Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

El Paso

All-America City

\ l I I ' 4
2010

Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

EL PASO, TX
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM | == PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE
No. | ANNUAL | TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNITPRICE | aNTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNITPRICE |\ ANTITY x UNIT
QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)
12 25 P245/70R19.5 DUNLOP SP461 $274.74 $6,868.50 $0.00
TIRES 271127093 BIDDERS PRICE
$13,737.00
50 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
13 | TIRES P235/6sR17 SRA 183579418 $141.15 | $7,057.50 $0.00
50 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
'* | TIRES P235/70R16 SRA 183601418 $122.04 | $6,102.00 $0.00
25 DUNLOP SP160
15 | TRES P255/70R22.5 271112871 $293.96 | $7,349.00 $0.00
10 DUNLOP SP160
16 TIRES P285/75R24.5 271108790 $328.35 $3,283.50 $0.00
300 P315/80R22.5 GOOODYEAR G289
17 | 1IRES LOAzDofiFﬁ-I\IYGE L 756141613 $633.73 | $190,119.00 $0.00
30 DUNLOP SP 231A
18 | 1RES P385/65R22.5 271131183 $573.43 | $17,202.90 $0.00
15 DUNLOP SP 281
19 | 1IRES P425/65R22.5 271131483 $641.12 | $9,616.80 $0.00
15 GOODYEAR G296
20 TIRES P445/65R22.5 756314365 $780.99 $11,714.85 $0.00
4.8-8
21 |6 TIRES WHITE NON-MARKING NOT PROVIDED NO BID $0.00 $0.00
100 DUNLOP SP348
22 TIRES 10.00R22.5 271124004 $35348 $35,34800 $000

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

/sl

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES

10



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012

Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
'\
2010
Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

EL PASO, TX
EST. EXTENDED EXTENDED
ITEM TN PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE PRODUCT BRAND AND PART PRICE
NO. ANNUAL TIRE DESCRIPTION NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT NUMBER UNIT PRICE (QUANTITY x UNIT
QUANTITY PRICE) PRICE)
250 DUNLOP SP160
23 | TIRES 11.00R22.5 $316.08 $79,020.00 $0.00
24 |5 TIRES 12:00R20 NOT PROVIDED NO BID $0.00 $0.00
20 SOLIDEAL
25 | TIRES 14.00R24 SLG3L $660.00 | $13,200.00 $0.00
20 0 SOLIDEAL
26 | TIRES 17.5-25 SLaL $900.00 $18,000.00 $0.00
50 GOODYEAR
27 TIRES LT215/85R16 6949 139081303 $246.16 $12,308.00 $0.00
60 GOODYEAR G949
28 | 1IRES LT225/75R16 139072303 $239.15 $14,349.00 $0.00
60 GOOYEAR WRANGLER
29 | TIRES LT235/75R15 HT 744826802 $125.55 $7,533.00 $0.00
60 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
30 | 1iRES LT245/75R16 HT 744395600 $135.92 $8,155.20 $0.00
50 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
31 TIRES LT245/75R17 SRA 179636492 $159.35 $7,967.50 $0.00
25 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
% | TIRes LT265/75R16 SRA 179746492 $154.05 | 33.851.25 $0.00
25 GOODYEAR WRANGLER
TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE PART A - ITEMS 1-33 $608,414.25 $0.00

BIDDERS PRICE $615,282.75

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE:

09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES
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Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 15, 2012
Project Name: TIRES, LIGHT & HEAVY DUTY

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
'l
2010
Solicitation #: 2012-294
Department: General Services

WINGFOOT COMMERCIAL TIRE SYSTEMS, LLC

EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE
ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE
AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR
WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO TH
EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE

CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT

PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO TH

E

|[EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

X

L]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES

NO|:|

YES |:| NO |:|

BIDS SOLICITED: 8

BIDS RECEIVED: 5

BIDS LOCAL:

7

NOBIDS: 0

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 09/20/2012

2012-294 TIRES, LIGHT HEAVY DUTY - GENERAL SERVICES
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