



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: **AUGUST 29, 2012**

Project Name: **PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH**

Department: **INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY**

Solicitation #: **2012-309**

ITEM	ESTIMATED QTY.	DESCRIPTION	ALINC TECHNOLOGIES AUSTIN, TX		AUSTIN RIBBON & COMPUTER SUPPLIES, INC. AUSTIN, TX		CHECKPOINT SERVICES, INC. EL PASO, TX	
			UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL
1.	1,600	PERSONAL COMPUTER - STANDARD USER CONFIGURATION	\$976.79	\$1,562,864.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$1,562,866.67	\$905.08	\$1,448,128.00	\$734.40	\$1,175,040.00
			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
STATE MANUFACTURER:			OPTIPLEX 9010		OPTIPLEX 7010 MINITOWER		OPTIPLEX - 7010 *SEE ALTERNATIVE OPTION	
STATE MODEL & NUMBER:			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
2.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - MID-LEVEL USER CONFIGURATION	\$1,100.64	\$88,051.20 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$88,050.83	\$1,020.00	\$81,600.00	\$814.98	\$65,198.40
			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
STATE MANUFACTURER:			OPTIPLEX 9010		OPTIPLEX 7010 MINITOWER		OPTIPLEX - 7010	
STATE MODEL & NUMBER:			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
3.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - POWER USER CONFIGURATION	\$2,670.61	\$213,648.80 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$213,649.17	\$2,175.53	\$174,042.40	\$1,969.34	\$157,547.20
			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
STATE MANUFACTURER:			PRECISION T1650		PRECISION T1650		PRECISION - T1650	
STATE MODEL & NUMBER:			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
4.	20	PERSONAL COMPUTER - HIGH END USER CONFIGURATION	\$2,588.84	\$51,776.80 BIDDER'S PRICE \$51,776.88	\$2,705.32	\$54,106.40	\$3,075.30	\$61,506.00
			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
STATE MANUFACTURER:			PRECISION T3600		PRECISION T3600, MT, 635W		PRECISION - T3600	
STATE MODEL & NUMBER:			DELL COMPUTERS		DELL		DELL	
EXTENDED TOTAL			\$1,916,340.80 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$1,916,343.54		\$1,757,876.80		\$1,459,291.60	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: *9-20-2012*



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: **AUGUST 29, 2012**

Project Name: **PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH**

Department: **INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY**

Solicitation #: **2012-309**

<p align="center"><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p> <p>ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p> <p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p> <p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p> <p>BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT CARD:</p> <p>BIDDERS PROMISED DELIVERYS:</p> <p>Within _____ consecutive calendar days</p> <p><small>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</small></p>	<p align="center">ALINC TECHNOLOGIES AUSTIN, TX</p>	<p align="center">AUSTIN RIBBON & COMPUTER SUPPLIES, INC. AUSTIN, TX</p>	<p align="center">CHECKPOINT SERVICES, INC. EL PASO, TX</p>
	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
	<p align="center">NET - 30 DAYS</p>	<p align="center">NET - 30 DAYS</p>	<p align="center">NET - 30 DAYS</p>
	<p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p>
	<p align="center">14 DAYS</p>	<p align="center">7-10 DAYS</p>	<p align="center">14-21 DAYS</p>

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *D. Jean*

DATE: *9-26-12*



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: **AUGUST 29, 2012**

Project Name: **PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH**

Department: **INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY**

Solicitation #: **2012-309**

ITEM	ESTIMATED QTY.	DESCRIPTION	COMPUTERS R US, INC. EL PASO, TX		DECISION TREE INC. EL PASO, TX		DESERT COMMUNICATIONS, INC. EL PASO, TX	
			UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL
1.	1,600	PERSONAL COMPUTER - STANDARD USER CONFIGURATION STATE MANUFACTURER: STATE MODEL & NUMBER:	\$1,259.00	\$2,014,400.00	\$669.00	\$1,070,400.00	\$697.00	\$1,115,200.00
		DELL OPTIPILEX 7010			* SEE "A" ADDITIONS TO THIS RESPONSE HP HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 SEE DOC #12827 FOR CONFIG		HP HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 MT PC	
2.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - MID-LEVEL USER CONFIGURATION STATE MANUFACTURER: STATE MODEL & NUMBER:	\$1,787.00	\$142,960.00	\$735.00	\$58,800.00	\$771.00	\$61,680.00
		HP PRO 3500			HP HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 SEE DOC #12851 FOR CONFIG		HP HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 MT PC	
3.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER- POWER USER CONFIGURATION STATE MANUFACTURER: STATE MODEL & NUMBER:	\$3,285.00	\$262,800.00	\$1,865.00	\$149,200.00	\$1,832.00	\$146,560.00
		HP Z420 LJ449AV			HP HP WORKSTATION Z620 SEE DOC #12718 FOR CONFIG		HP HP 2620 WORKSTATION	
4.	20	PERSONAL COMPUTER - HIGH END USER CONFIGURATION STATE MANUFACTURER: STATE MODEL & NUMBER:	\$3,685.00	\$73,700.00	\$2,189.00	\$43,780.00	\$2,145.00	\$42,900.00
		HP Z420 LJ449AV			HP HP WORKSTATION Z620 SEE DOC #12714 FOR CONFIG		HP HP 2620 WORKSTATION	
EXTENDED TOTAL			\$2,493,860.00		\$1,322,180.00		\$1,366,340.00	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: *9-20-12*



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 29, 2012
Project Name: PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH

Solicitation #: 2012-309
Department: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY

ITEM	ESTIMATED QTY.	DESCRIPTION	FORTRESS SYSTEMS INTERNATIONAL, INC. CHARLOTTE, NC		HOWARD TECHNOLOGY SOLUTIONS, A DIVISION OF HOWARD INDUSTRIES, INC. ELLISVILLE, MS		JC TECHNOLOGY INC DBA ACE COMPUTERS ARLINGTON HTS, IL	
			UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL
1.	1,600	PERSONAL COMPUTER - STANDARD USER CONFIGURATION	\$798.00	\$1,276,800.00	\$860.00	\$1,376,000.00	\$713.37	\$1,141,392.00
			STATE MANUFACTURER: LENOVO		HOWARD		ACE COMPUTERS	
			STATE MODEL & NUMBER: M82 - 3302B3U		Q77MKB		VISION 8HTI	
2.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - MID-LEVEL USER CONFIGURATION	NO BID	NO BID	\$944.00	\$75,520.00	\$813.90	\$65,112.00
			STATE MANUFACTURER: NO BID		HOWARD		ACE COMPUTERS	
			STATE MODEL & NUMBER: NO BID		Q77MKB		VISION 8HTI	
3.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - POWER USER CONFIGURATION	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,111.00	\$88,880.00	\$1,939.04	\$155,123.20
			STATE MANUFACTURER: NO BID		HOWARD		ACE COMPUTERS	
			STATE MODEL & NUMBER: NO BID		Q77AKB		LOGICAD 297	
4.	20	PERSONAL COMPUTER - HIGH END USER CONFIGURATION	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,280.00	\$45,600.00	\$1,845.99	\$36,919.80
			STATE MANUFACTURER: NO BID		HOWARD		ACE COMPUTERS	
			STATE MODEL & NUMBER: NO BID		WX7900		LOGICAD 397	
		EXTENDED TOTAL		\$1,276,800.00		\$1,586,000.00		\$1,398,547.00

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: 9-20-12



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 29, 2012
Project Name: PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH

Department: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY
Solicitation #: 2012-309

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT	FORTRESS SYSTEMS INTERNATIONAL, INC. CHARLOTTE, NC	HOWARD TECHNOLOGY SOLUTIONS, A DIVISION OF HOWARD INDUSTRIES, INC. ELLISVILLE, MS	JC TECHNOLOGY INC DBA ACE COMPUTERS ARLINGTON HTS, IL
<p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>		<p>** PER MUTUAL AGREED UPON PRICING AT TIME OF EXTENSION</p>	
<p>ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<p><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>	<p><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p> <p>** SEE NOTE ABOVE</p>	<p><input type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<p><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p> <p>** SEE NOTE ABOVE</p>	<p><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<p><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p><input type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	<p>NET - 30 DAYS</p>	<p>NET - 30 DAYS</p>	<p>NOT STATED</p>
<p>BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT CARD:</p>	<p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS:</p>	<p>30 DAYS</p>	<p>21 DAYS</p>	<p>25 DAYS</p>
<p>Within _____ consecutive calendar days IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.</p>			

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: 9-20-12



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 29, 2012

Project Name: PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH

Department: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY

Solicitation #: 2012-309

ITEM	ESTIMATED QTY.	DESCRIPTION	LENOVO (UNITED STATES) INC. MORRISVILLE, NC		NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS HOUSTON, TX (4 YEAR OPTION)		NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS HOUSTON, TX (5 YEAR OPTION)				
			UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL			
1.	1,600	PERSONAL COMPUTER - STANDARD USER CONFIGURATION	THINKCENTER	\$700.00	\$1,120,000.00	HP	\$677.00	\$1,083,200.00	HP	\$708.00	\$1,132,800.00
			M82 TOWER			HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 MT			HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 MT		
2.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - MID-LEVEL USER CONFIGURATION	THINKCENTER	\$800.00	\$64,000.00	HP	\$751.00	\$60,080.00	HP	\$780.00	\$62,400.00
			M92P TOWER			HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 MT			HP COMPAQ PRO 6300 MT		
3.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER- POWER USER CONFIGURATION.	THINKSTATION	\$1,700.00	\$136,000.00	HP	\$1,812.00	\$144,960.00	HP	\$1,843.00	\$147,440.00
			E31 WORK STATION			HP Z620 WORKSTATION			HP Z620 WORKSTATION		
4.	20	PERSONAL COMPUTER - HIGH END USER CONFIGURATION	THINKSTATION	\$2,270.00	\$45,400.00	HP	\$2,125.00	\$42,500.00	HP	\$2,155.00	\$43,100.00
			S30 WORK STATION			HP Z620 WORKSTATION			HP Z620 WORKSTATION		
EXTENDED TOTAL				\$1,365,400.00		\$1,330,740.00		\$1,385,740.00			

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: 9-20-12



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: **AUGUST 29, 2012**

Project Name: **PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH**

Solicitation #: 2012-309
Department: **INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY**

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT	LENOVO (UNITED STATES) INC. MORRISVILLE, NC	NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS HOUSTON, TX	NETSYNC NETWORK SOLUTIONS HOUSTON, TX
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR: ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT: TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT: NO OPTION OFFERED	<p align="center"> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> </p>	<p align="center"> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> </p>	<p align="center"> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> </p>
PAYMENT TERMS: BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY PROCUREMENT CARD: BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY IS: Within _____ consecutive calendar days IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.	<p align="center"> NOT STATED YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/> NOT STATED </p>	<p align="center"> NET - 30 DAYS YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/> 30 DAYS </p>	<p align="center"> NET - 30 DAYS YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/> 30 DAYS </p>

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: *9/20/2012*



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: AUGUST 29, 2012
Project Name: PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH

Solicitation #: 2012-309
Department: INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY

ITEM	ESTIMATED QTY.	DESCRIPTION	NWN CORPORATION HOUSTON, TX		SPECTRUM IMAGING TECHNOLOGIES INC. EL PASO, TX		TECHNICAL & SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION, INC. HOUSTON, TX	
			UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED 3 YEAR TOTAL
1.	1,600	PERSONAL COMPUTER - STANDARD USER CONFIGURATION	\$730.00	\$1,168,000.00	\$940.00	\$1,504,000.00	\$682.29	\$1,091,664.00 BIDDER'S PRICE NOT PROVIDED
			STATE MANUFACTURER: HEWLETT - PACKARD STATE MODEL & NUMBER: PRO 6300 MT		LENOVO THINKCENTRE M92P		HEWLETT PACKARD HP PRO6300 MT PC QV983AV	
2.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - MID-LEVEL USER CONFIGURATION	\$795.00	\$63,600.00	\$985.00	\$78,800.00	\$748.96	\$59,916.80 BIDDER'S PRICE NOT PROVIDED
			STATE MANUFACTURER: HEWLETT - PACKARD STATE MODEL & NUMBER: PRO 6300 MT		LENOVO THINKCENTRE M92P		HEWLETT PACKARD HP PRO6300 MT PC QV983AV	
3.	80	PERSONAL COMPUTER - POWER USER CONFIGURATION	\$1,879.00	\$150,320.00	\$1,620.00	\$129,600.00	\$1,841.67	\$147,333.60 BIDDER'S PRICE NOT PROVIDED
			STATE MANUFACTURER: HEWLETT - PACKARD STATE MODEL & NUMBER: Z620		LENOVO THINKSTATION E31		HEWLETT PACKARD HP Z620 WORKSTATION LJ450AV	
4.	20	PERSONAL COMPUTER - HIGH END USER CONFIGURATION	\$2,185.00	\$43,700.00	\$3,975.00	\$79,500.00	\$2,153.13	\$43,062.60 BIDDER'S PRICE NOT PROVIDED
			STATE MANUFACTURER: HEWLETT - PACKARD STATE MODEL & NUMBER: Z620		LENOVO THINKSTATION S30		HEWLETT PACKARD HP Z620 WORKSTATION LJ450AV	
EXTENDED TOTAL			\$1,425,620.00		\$1,791,900.00		\$1,341,977.00 BIDDER'S PRICE NOT PROVIDED	

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: 9-26-12.



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Bid Opening Date: **AUGUST 29, 2012**

Project Name: **PERSONAL COMPUTERS (PC) REFRESH**

Department: **INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY**
Solicitation #: **2012-309**

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT	NWN CORPORATION HOUSTON, TX	SPECTRUM IMAGING TECHNOLOGIES INC. EL PASO, TX	TECHNICAL & SCIENTIFIC APPLICATION, INC. HOUSTON, TX
<p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p> <p>ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p> <p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p> <p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p> <p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	<p align="center"><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>IF THE BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>	<p align="center"><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>	<p align="center"><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p>
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p align="center"><input type="checkbox"/></p>

BIDS SOLICITED: 15 BIDS RECEIVED: 15 BIDS LOCAL: 11 NO BIDS: 0

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: *[Signature]*

DATE: 9/26/12.