CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

BID ITEM: COLLECTION SERVICES - VARIOUS CITY FACILITIES
BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 13, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-060

Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

EL PASO DISPOSAL, LP FRIED%@TAEESJ;CLING HEIST DISPOSAL, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP 1 WASTE COLLECTION
ANNUAL ANNUAL EST. 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL EST. 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL EST. 3 YEAR TOTAL
FREQUENCY FREQUENCY FREQUENCY
EM DESCRIPTION CONS.ll-QlliNER F::;ll’}n;\l:lrglll)is CSI?:L':JEPR ANNUAL COST (CEO)g'II'-IE’ElRDYEEIZR CI?I(s)-lI; T.liR ANNUAL COST (CEO)gEI'E‘IRDYEEER CI?I(s)-lI; T.liR ANNUAL COST (CEO)g'II'-IE’ElRDYEEIZR
NO. PICK UP (ANNUAL x COST x3 YEARS) (ANNUAL x COST x 3 YEARS) (ANNUAL x COST x3 YEARS)
PER PICK UP) PER PICK UP) PER PICK UP)
1. SCHEDULED P/UP 4cyY 11544 $8.48 $97,893.12 | $293,679.36 NO BID $8.12 $93,737.28 | $281,211.84
2. SCHEDULED P/UP 6CY 9516 $12.72 | $121,043.52 | $363,130.56 NO BID $12.18 $115,904.88 | $347,714.64
3. EMERGENCY P/UP 4cyY 6 $8.48 $50.88 $152.64 NO BID $35.00 $210.00 $630.00
4. EMERGENCY P/UP 6CY 6 $12.72 $76.32 $228.96 NO BID $50.00 $300.00 $900.00
GRAND TOTAL: ITEMS 1 THROUGH 4 $219,063.84 | $657,191.52 NO BID $210,152.16 | $630,456.48
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/30/13

2013-060 COLLECTION SERVICES - VARIOUS CITY FACILITIES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

|V

2010

BID ITEM: COLLECTION SERVICES - VARIOUS CITY FACILITIES
BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 13, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-060
Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

EL PASO DISPOSAL, LP

FRIEDMAN RECYCLING

HEIST DISPOSAL, INC.

COMPANY
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
RECYCLABLE MATERIAL COLLECTION
ANNUAL ANNUAL EST. | 5 vEAR TOTAL ANNUAL EST- |5 vEAR TOTAL ANNUAL EST. | 3 yeaR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION CONTAINER | ESTIMATED | cOSTPER | FREQUENCY | = oo nen || cosTPER | FREQUENCY 7o oo nen |l cosTper | FREQUENCY | = ppr\nen
NO. SIZE FREQUENCIES| PICKUP | ANNUALCOST | oot pervear PICKUP | ANNUAL COST | cocr peg vear PICK UP ANNUAL COST | - cos7 per vEAR
PICK UP (ANNUAL x COST X 3 YEARS) (ANNUAL x COST X 3 YEARS) (ANNUAL x COST X 3 YEARS)
PER PICK UP) PER PICK UP) PER PICK UP)
1. SCHEDULED P/UP 3CY 260 $6.15 $1,599.00 $4,797.00 $6.27 $1,630.20 $4,890.60 $6.69 $1,739.40 $5,218.20
2. SCHEDULED P/UP 6 CY 2444 $12.30 $30,061.20 $90,183.60 $12.54 $30,647.76 | $91,943.28 $13.38 $32,700.72 | $98,102.16
3. EMERGENCY P/UP 3cY 2 $6.15 $12.30 $36.90 $34.00 $68.00 $204.00 $40.00 $80.00 $240.00
4. EMERGENCY P/UP 4CY 5 $8.20 $41.00 $123.00 $34.00 $170.00 $510.00 $40.00 $200.00 $600.00
5. EMERGENCY P/UP 6 CY 5 $12.30 $61.50 $184.50 $34.00 $170.00 $510.00 $40.00 $200.00 $600.00
GRAND TOTAL: ITEMS 1 THROUGH 5 $31,775.00 | $95,325.00 $32,685.96 | $98,057.88 $34,920.12 | $104,760.36
. $250,838.84 | $752,516.52 $32,685.96 | $98,057.88 $245,072.28 | $735,216.84
GROUP 1 & 2 GRAND TOTAL: $32,685.96 | 98,057
PRICE; NO BID |PRICE; NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
NOTE:

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

4/30/13

/sl

2013-060 COLLECTION SERVICES - VARIOUS CITY FACILITIES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

i\lli\merica City

2010

BID ITEM: COLLECTION SERVICES - VARIOUS CITY FACILITIES
BID OPENING DATE: MARCH 13, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-060
Department:

EL PASO DISPOSAL, LP
EL PASO, TX

FRIEDMAN RECYCLING
COMPANY
EL PASO, TX

HEIST DISPOSAL, INC.
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.
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PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES N | ]

ves [ | N0 [Xx]

YEs [ | NO

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 23 BIDS RECEIVED: 3

BIDS LOCAL: 11

NO BIDS:

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/30/13 2013-060 COLLECTION SERVICES - VARIOUS CITY FACILITIES - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES




