Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

El Paso
i\lli\merica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078

Department: TRANSPORTATION

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba

AFFORMD:;E.II:E":':'\T (?ES CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP | GROUNDSKEEPING XERISCAPED MEDIANS, TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES, ROUNDABOUTS & PARKWAY (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT ((WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) 52) 52)
ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS, YEAR
1. TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES, NO BID NO BID $2,196.48 $114,216.96 $2,536.92 $131,919.84 $7,240.00 $376,480.00
ROUNDABOUTS & PARKWAY: WEST OF
RAILROAD DR./US HIGHWAY 54
GROUP | - TOTAL $114,216.96 $131,919.84 $376,480.00
BIDVUEK'S PRIVE:
X3 YEARS| $1,129,440.00, 3
YEAR

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department: TRANSPORTATION

El Paso
i\ll—ll.\merica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
AFFORMD:;E.IITE":':}\T(?: CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il GROUNDSKEEPING XERISCAPED MEDIANS, TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES, ROUNDABOUTS (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT|/ MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT [ (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT [(WEEKLY AMOUNT x{| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x{| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) 52) 52)
ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS,
1. TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES, NOBID NOBID $4,918.68 $255,771.36 $3,260.78 $169,560.56 $10,100.00 $525,200.00
ROUNDABOUTS & PARKWAY: EAST OF
RAILROAD DR./US HIGHWAY 54 PER YEAR
GROUP Il - TOTAL $255,771.36 $169,560.56 $525,200.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
HEURLE $1,575,600.00
GRAND TOTAL $369,988.32 $301,480.40 $901,680.00
(GROUP | + GROUP II)
BIDDER'S PRICE: $2,705.040.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
AFFORI\ADSS.IITE":':"T (l:)ES CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il MAINTENANCE TURF MEDIANS (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
MONTHLY AMOUNT (ESTIMATED ANNUAL{ MONTHLY AMOUNT MONTHLY AMOUNT MONTHLY AMOUNT |ESTIMATED ANNUAL
ITEM LOCATION (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL (GROWING ¢g$:fLGl:{'g3vl:lT; (GROWING ¢g$:fLGl:{'g3vl:lT; (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL
NO. SEASON ONE (GROWING SEASON SEASON ONE SEASOI\S PRICE X 7 SEASON ONE SEASOI\S PRICE X 7 SEASON ONE (GROWING SEASON
TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X 7 MONTHS) [ TIME ONLY PRICE) MONTHS TIME ONLY PRICE) TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X 7 MONTHS)
) MONTHS)
1. CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS $29,595.00 $207,168.00 $5,600.00 $39,200.00 $3,000.00 $21,000.00 $7,780.00 $54,460.00
MONTHLY ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED ANNUAL|MONTHLY AMOUNT MONTHLY AMOUNT MONTHLY AMOUNT|ESTIMATED ANNUAL
LOCATION AMOUNT AMOUNT TOTAL (DORMANT SEASON 'ﬁgr:If(I-Dg':lmonllj\:-l'l-' (DORMANT SEASON 'ﬁgr:If(I-Dg':lmonllj\:-l'l-' (DORMANT SEASON AMOUNT TOTAL
‘Dgﬁﬁ"ﬁ.’ﬂffﬁf?" (DORMANT SEASON||  ONETIMEONLY | oo cooni ' | ONETIMEONLY | gpycovom it || ONETIME ONLY | (DORMANT SEASON
PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) MONTHS) PRICE) MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS)
2. CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS $20,696.00 $103,480.00 $7,960.00 $39,800.00 $1,850.00 $9,250.00 $1,100.00 $5,500.00
GROUP lll - CITYWIDE TURF
MEDIANS $310,648.00 $79,000.00 $30,250.00 $59,960.00
(ITEM 1+ ITEM 2)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:__/s/
2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 3

DATE: 1/17/13



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department: TRANSPORTATION

El Paso

All-America City

NI LN

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
AFFORMDSS.IITE":':# (l:)ES CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV CITYWIDE ON DEMAND PRUNING AND TREE/BUSH REMOVAL
ITEM ONE TIME ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT [[ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT | ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT |ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT
: TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
1. PRUNING SMALL TREES/BUSH NOBID NO BID $25.00 $2,500.00 $95.00 $9,500.00 $25.00 $2,500.00
(0 To 12 IN TRUNK DIAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
2. | PRUNING MEDIUM TREES/BUSH NO BID NO BID $32.50 $3,250.00 $185.00 $18,500.00 $25.00 $2,500.00
(12 IN TO 24 IN TRUNK DIAMETER)
(ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
3. PRUNING LARGE TREES/BUSH NO BID NOBID $50.00 $7,500.00 $275.00 $41,250.00 $35.00 $5,250.00
(LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK
DIAMETER) " ESTMATED AMNUAL " ESTMATED AMNUAL " ESTMATED AMNUAL " ESTMATED AMNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL NO BID NO BID $175.00 $4,375.00 $300.00 $7,500.00 $250.00 $6,250.00
(0 To 12 IN TRUNK DIAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
4

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

BID TABULATION FORM

CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION
DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
AFFORMDAOES.IFE":':»T (l:)ES CAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV CITYWIDE ON DEMAND PRUNING AND TREE/BUSH REMOVAL
ITEM ONE TIME ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT |ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT||ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT |ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT
) TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
5. MEDIUM TREE/BUSH REMOVAL NO BID NOBID $400.00 $10,000.00 $750.00 $18,750.00 $350.00 $8,750.00
(12 TO 24 IN TRUNK DIAMETER)
(ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL
6. (LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK NO BID $450.00 $11,250.00 $1,500.00 $37,500.00 $450.00 $11,250.00
DlAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
RO e NetoAL & AND $38,875.00 $133,000.00 $36,500.00
(ITEMS 1-6)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contraci

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE:

1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba

AFFORMD‘GE'T'EJ':}TSESCAPE DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN| EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE | GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO. TX SERVICE EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP V STREET TREE MAINTENANCE (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)

MAINTENANCE ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION WEEKLY ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT( MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT|[ MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. AMOUNT (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT [(WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT [(WEEKLY AMOUNT x{| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x

52) 52) 52) 52)
1. | VARIOUS LOCATIONS CITYWIDE |  NOBID NO BID $1,880.50 | $97,786.00 $265.00 $13,780.00 $2,870.00 | $149,240.00
PER YEAR
GROUP V - TOTAL $97,786.00 $13,780.00 $149,240.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
X3YEARS $447,720.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

El Paso
All-America City
N
2010
Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION

AFFORDABLE LANDSCAPE
MAINTENANCE
EL PASO, TX

DELTA UNLIMITED, INC. dba
DELTA PEST CONTROL & LAWN
SERVICE
EL PASO, TX

EVERGREEN LAWN SERVICE
EL PASO, TX

GREEN EARTH LANDSCAPE
EL PASO, TX

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE

HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT
QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION

IS EXERCISED WITHIN:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
|iF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT: |

[ ]

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
|IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

X

NO OPTION OFFERED

L]

[ ]

[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET 30 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

1% - 10 DAYS

NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

X

YES NO

X

YES NO

X

YES NO

YES I:I NOI:I

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Department: TRANSPORTATION

El Paso
All-America City

‘g

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.

THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP | GROUNDSKEEPING XERISCAPED MEDIANS, TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES, ROUNDABOUTS & PARKWAY (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT | (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) 52) 52)
ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS,
TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES,
1. e oUND ARG 8 PArR e op|  $2.252.80 | $117,145.60 $177,199.88 | $1,800.00 | $93,600.00
RAILROAD DR./US HIGHWAY 54
GROUP | - TOTAL $117,145.60 $177,199.88 $93,600.00

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

N-America Gity

MK

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION
H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC. | RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC. | THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il GROUNDSKEEPING XERISCAPED MEDIANS, TRIANGLES, TRAFFIC CIRCLES, ROUNDABOUTS (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)
ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT ((WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x
52) 52) 52) 52)
ALL CITY XERISCAPE MEDIANS,
1. | roUNEABO e & Ayt | 6498080 | $259,001.60 | $4,446.15 | $231,199.80 | $4,300.00 | $223,600.00
RAILROAD DR./US HIGHWAY 54
GROUP Il - TOTAL $259,001.60 $231,199.80 $223,600.00
GRAND TOTAL
(GROUP | + GROUP II) $376,147.20 $408,399.68 $317,200.00
BIDDER'S PRICE: $0
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE:

1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

El Paso

All-America City

‘II

2010

IV

Solicitation #: 2013-078

Department: TRANSPORTATION

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC.

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.

THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il MAINTENANCE TURF MEDIANS (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)
MONTHLY AMOUNT [ESTIMATED ANNUAL|| MONTHLY AMOUNT ANEﬁZ’F:,;E%NT MONTHLY AMOUNT ANEﬁZ’F:,;E%NT MONTHLY AMOUNT |ESTIMATED ANNUAL
ITEM LOCATION (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL (GROWING TOTAL (GROWING (GROWING TOTAL (GROWING (GROWING AMOUNT TOTAL
NO. SEASONONE | (GROWING SEASON SEASONONE | (o DRICE X 7 SEASONONE | o\ o RICE X 7 SEASONONE | (GROWING SEASON
TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X 7 MONTHS) || TIME ONLY PRICE) TIME ONLY PRICE) TIME ONLY PRICE) | PRICE X 7 MONTHS)
MONTHS) MONTHS)
1. CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS $4,285.71 $30,000.00 $5,139.00 $35,973.00 $2,978.00 $20,846.00
MONTHLY ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
AMOUNT ESTIMATED ANNUALIMONTHLY AMOUNT| o "~ o IMONTHLY AMOUNT| oo T IMONTHLY AMOUNT|ESTIMATED ANNUAL
LOCATION (DORMANT SEASON AMOUNT TOTAL _ || (DORMANT SEASON | rors " nopmant || (PORMANT SEASON | 1or " nopmany || (PORMANT SEASON | AMOUNT TOTAL
ONE TIME ONLY | PORMANT SEASON|  ONETIMEONLY | oppcon pricE x5 | ONETIMEONLY | b oo orice x5 ONETIMEONLY | (DORMANT SEASON
PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS) PRICE) MONTHS) PRICE) MONTHS) PRICE) PRICE x 5 MONTHS)
2. CITYWIDE TURF MEDIANS $2,200.00 $11,000.00 $2,569.00 $12,845.00 $1,644.00 $8,220.00
GROUP Il - CITYWIDE TURF
MEDIANS $41,000.00 $48,818.00 $29,066.00
(ITEM 1+ ITEM 2)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:___/s/
DATE: 1/17/13 2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 10




El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM iy’
Solicitation #: 2013-078
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS Department: TRANSPORTATION
H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC. RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC. | THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV CITYWIDE ON DEMAND PRUNING AND TREE/BUSH REMOVAL
ITEM ONE TIME ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT |[ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT||ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT | ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT
) TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
1. PRUNING SMALL TREES/BUSH $30.00 $3,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00 $17.00 $1,700.00

(0 To 12 IN TRUNK DIAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100

ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL

REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
2. | PRUNING MEDIUM TREES/BUSH $45.00 $4,500.00 $300.00 $30,000.00 $17.00 $1,700.00
(12 IN TO 24 IN TRUNK DIAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 100
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
PRUNING LARGE TREES/BUSH
3. (LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK $65.00 $9,750.00 $500.00 $75,000.00 $25.00 $3,750.00
DIAMETER) RS TMATED ANNUAL RS TMATED ANNUAL RS TMATED ANNUAL RS TMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
4, SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL $80.00 $2,000.00 $150.00 $3,750.00 $200.00 $5,000.00
(0 TO 12 IN TRUNK DIAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
11

APPROVED BY:___/s/
2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

DATE: 1/17/13



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
N
2010
Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION

Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012
Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS
H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC. | RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC. | THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV CITYWIDE ON DEMAND PRUNING AND TREE/BUSH REMOVAL
ITEM ONE TIME ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
NO LOCATION AMOUNT ANNUAL AMOUNT [[ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT||ONE TIME AMOUNT | ANNUAL AMOUNT||ONE TIME AMOUNT| ANNUAL AMOUNT
) TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
5. | MEDIUM TREE/BUSH REMOVAL $200.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $12,500.00 $250.00 $6,250.00
(12 TO 24 IN TRUNK DIAMETER) (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25 (ONE TIME AMOUNT X 25
ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL ESTIMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
SMALL TREE/BUSH REMOVAL
6. (LARGER THAN 24 IN TRUNK $800.00 $20,000.00 $1,000.00 $25,000.00 $250.00 $6,250.00
DIAMETER) CESTMATED ANNUAL CESTMATED ANNUAL CESTMATED ANNUAL CESTMATED ANNUAL
REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS) REQUESTS)
GROUP IV - ON DEMAND PRUNING AND
TREE/SHRUB REMOVAL $44,250.00 $156,250.00 $24,650.00
(ITEMS 1-6)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
12

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13

2013-078 GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC.

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.

THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP V STREET TREE MAINTENANCE (SEE LIST OF LOCATIONS)
MAINTENANCE ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED ESTIMATED
ITEM LOCATION WEEKLY ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE |ANNUAL AMOUNT|| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT| MAINTENANCE | ANNUAL AMOUNT
NO. (WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x|| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x| WEEKLY AMOUNT |(WEEKLY AMOUNT x
AMOUNT 52) 52) 52) 52)
1. | VARIOUS LOCATIONS CITYWIDE $400.00 $20,800.00 $1,518.00 $78,936.00 $864.00 $44,928.00
GROUP V - TOTAL $20,800.00 $78,936.00 $44,928.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:__/s/
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DATE: 1/17/13
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Bid Opening Date: DECEMBER 19, 2012

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: GROUND MAINTENANCE - CITY MEDIANS

El Paso
i\ll—ll.\merica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-078
Department: TRANSPORTATION

H. REPAIR SOLUTIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

RANSOM LAWN SERVICE, INC.
EL PASO, TX

THREE C's CONTRACTORS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
INOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT
QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION

1S EXERCISED WITHIN:

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
|IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT: |

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
JIF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[ ]

X

[ ]

[ |

[ ]

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS: 1% - 10 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS/NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

Y PHOCUREMENT OAMD, Yes[ | no ves | X | nol| ves | X | nol | ves [ I nol ]
BIDS SOLICITED: 42 BIDS RECEIVED: 7 BIDS LOCAL: 42 NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/

DATE: 1/17/13
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