El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
rem | ESTIMATED UNIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED UNIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY S S
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $17.00 $1,700.00 $5,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 100 BUILDING STONE, IN LOADS OF TONS
TEN (10) TONS OR MORE
DELIVERED: $23.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $73.00 $10,950.00 $32,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 150 CEMENT STABILIZED BACKFILL| CUBIC
(2 SACKS) TRANSIT MIX YARDS
DELIVERED: $73.00 $10,950.00 $32,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $135.50 $2,710.00 $8,130.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 20 ORDERS LESS THAN TWO (2) CuBIC
a CUBIC YARDS YARDS
DELIVERED: $135.50 $2,710.00 $8,130.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.O.B PLANT: $34.00 $32,300.00 $96,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 950 CEMENT STABILIZED BASE TONS
MATERIAL
DELIVERED: $40.00 $38,000.00 | $114,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
ITEM UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY o oo
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
ORDRES LESS THAN TEN (10) F.O.B PLANT: $38.00 $1,900.00 | $5,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $46.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $6.00 $31,800.00 $95,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 5300 BASE, DRY TONS
DELIVERED: $12.00 $63,600.00 $190,800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $6.75 $6,750.00 $20,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 1000 BASE, PROCESSED TONS
DELIVERED: $12.75 $12,750.00 $38,250.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $14.00 $42,000.00 $126,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 3000 SCREENING, COLORS: RED TONS
DELIVERED: $20.00 $60,000.00 $180,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Solicitation #: 2013-094
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
mEm | ESTIMATED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY o o
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $11.00 $11,000.00 $33,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 1000 SCREENING, COLORS: GRAY TONS
DELIVERED: $17.00 $17,000.00 $51,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $28.00 $14,000.00 $42,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 500 SCREENING, COLORS: TAN TONS
DELIVERED: $34.00 $17,000.00 $51,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CUBIC F.0.B PLANT: $90.00 $45,000.00 | $135,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 500 TRANSIT MIX e
DELIVERED: $90.00 $45,000.00 | $135,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ORDERS LESS THAN TWO (2) CUBIC F.0.B PLANT: $152.50 $11,437.50 $34,312.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9a 75 TONS CUBIC YARDS
DELIVERED YARDS
DELIVERED: $152.50 $11,437.50 $34,312.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094

Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
rEm ESTIMATED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY o o
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $14.00 $42,000.00 | $126,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 3000 EXIT STONE TONS
DELIVERED: $17.00 $51,000.00 | $153,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $16.00 $16,000.00 $48,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 1000 BLASTING ROCK TONS
DELIVERED: $22.00 $22,000.00 $66,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $269,547.50 | $808,642.50 F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID
GROUP 1 - TOTAL (1 through 11)
DELIVERED: $356,047.50 | $1,068,142.50 |  DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

All-America City
2010
BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Solicitation #: 2013-094
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
THIS BID IS FOR FULL TRANSPORT LOADS OF 5,500 GALLONS. FREIGHT IS
BASED ON A FULL TRANSPOORT LOAD, EVEN IF A FULL LOAD OF METERIAL
IS NOT ORDERED. THE COMMON CARRIER BILLS DEMURRAGE AT $80.00
PER HOUR, AFTER THE SECOND HOUR. RETURN FREIGHT IS ONE-HALF OF
GROUP 2 - PAVING MATERIALS GOING TARIFF. PUMP ANDT::S‘;L:::ARGE IS $80.00 PER LOAD.
ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
ITEM UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY o o
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $4.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $2.50 $1,250.00 $3,750.00
1 500 CSS-1THEMULSION GALLONS
DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.9231 $1,461.55 $4,384.65
F.0.B PLANT: $89.50 $8,950.00 $26,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 100 COLD MIX TONS
DELIVERED: $95.50 $9,550.00 $28,650.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) F.0.B PLANT: $89.50 $4,475.00 | $13,425.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $97.50 $4,875.00 $14,625.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $69.75 $209,250.00 | $627,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
HOT MIX ASPHALT CONCRETE
3 3000 PAVEMENT, FOR PATCHING TONS
DELIVERED: $75.75 $227,250.00 | $681,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094|
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 2 - PAVING MATERIALS
ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
ITEM UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY o o
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) F.0.B PLANT: $69.75 $3,487.50 $10,462.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $77.75 $3,887.50 | $11,662.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $228,162.50 | $684,487.50 F.0.B PLANT: $1,250.00 $3,750.00
GROUP 2 - TOTAL (1 through 3a)
DELIVERED: $245,562.50 | $736,687.50 DELIVERED: $1,461.55 $4,384.65
FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEE WILL BE ADDED
TO ABOVE PRICES AT RATE OF $.4424/TON FOR
ASPHALT & POLYMER LOADS OR $.00133/GAL FOR
EMULSION LOADS.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY:__/s/

2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

All-America City
2010
BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Solicitation #: 2013-094|
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
TEM ESTIMATED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY S S

NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $15.75 $2,362.50 $7,087.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

1 150 FRANKLIN RED SCREENING TONS
DELIVERED: $21.75 $3,262.50 $9,787.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $23.00 $1,725.00 $5,175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

2 75 FRANKLIN RED 3/4" OR EQUAL TONS
DELIVERED: $29.00 $2,175.00 $6,525.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $23.00 $1,725.00 $5,175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

FRANKLIN RED 1 1/2" OR

3 75 EQUAL TONS
DELIVERED: $29.00 $2,175.00 $6,525.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $23.00 $1,725.00 $5,175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

4 75 FRANKLIN RED 2" OR EQUAL TONS
DELIVERED: $29.00 $2,175.00 $6,525.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Solicitation #: 2013-094|
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
EM ESTIMATED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ONIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY o oo

NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.O.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 75 SANTA FE RED 3/4" TONS
DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6 75 SANTA FE RED 1 1/2" TONS
DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $38.00 $2,850.00 $8,550.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

7 75 MESA RED 3/4" TONS
DELIVERED: $44.00 $3,300.00 $9,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $38.00 $3,800.00 $11,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

8 100 MESA RED 1 1/2" TONS
DELIVERED: $44.00 $4,400.00 $13,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exthed
BID TABULATION W

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Solicitation #: 2013-094|
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
mem | ESTMATED UNIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED UNIT ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY S S

NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)

F.0.B PLANT: $33.00 $2,475.00 $7,425.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 75 DESERT TAN 3/4" TONS

DELIVERED: $39.00 $2,925.00 $8,775.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $33.00 $2,475.00 $7,425.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 75 DESERT TAN 1 1/2" TONS
DELIVERED: $39.00 $2,925.00 $8,775.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $75.00 $11,250.00 $33,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

11 150 COBBLESTONE 1" TO 6" TONS
DELIVERED: $81.00 $12,150.00 $36,450.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $70.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

12 50 RED BOULDERS EACH
DELIVERED: $120.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094

Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION ERGON ASPHALT &
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC EMULSIONS, INC.
EL PASO, TX AUSTIN, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
ITEM UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION measure | PRICE PERITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY oo oo
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $60.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 20 GRAY BOULDERS EACH
DELIVERED: $110.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $35,087.50 $105,262.50 F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID
GROUP 3 - TOTAL (1 through 13)
DELIVERED: $43,687.50 $131,062.50 DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $532,797.50 |$1,598,392.50 F.0.B PLANT: $1,250.00 $3,750.00
GRAND TOTAL ITEMS - GROUP 1 +2+3
DELIVERED: $645,297.50 |$1,935,892.50 DELIVERED: $1,461.55 $4,384.65

FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEE WILL BE ADDED
TO ABOVE PRICES AT RATE OF $.4424/TON FOR
ASPHALT & POLYMER LOADS OR $.00133/GAL FOR
EMULSION LOADS.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY:

2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-AmericaCity

"\

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094|
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CEMEX CONSTRUCTION
MATERIALS SOUTH, LLC
EL PASO, TX

ERGON ASPHALT &
EMULSIONS, INC.
AUSTIN, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

]
]

NO OPTION OFFERED. D

PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NO |:| YES I:I NO
[BTODER S PRUNISED DECTVER T VYT —— COTSTCUTVE CateToar

I — 1 1

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 24

of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contracti

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

1



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
deﬂ‘#.jr?.:.} DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM Pl:;:(I:TE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 Pl:;:(I:TE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $28.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $9.50 $950.00 $2,850.00
1 100 BUI#IIZE):\‘NG1()ST_I_()OI\'I\‘ES: g\IRL'\(zggg OF TONS BIDDZI:)SBT:ICE:
(10) DELIVERED: $35.00 $3,500.00 | $10,500.00 $16.50 $1,650.00 | $4,950.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 $8,250.00 $24,750.00
2 150 CEMENT STABILIZED BACKFILL| CUBIC BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
(2 SACKS) TRANSIT MIX YARDS | o\ \veRED: $67.00 $10,050.00 | $30,150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2a 20 ORDERS LESS THAN TWO (2) CUBIC
CUBIC YARDS YARDS | pE| \VERED: $125.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $30.00 $28,500.00 $85,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 950 CEMENT STABILIZED BASE TONS
MATERIAL
DELIVERED: $35.50 $33,725.00 $101,175.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contraci

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

12



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094|
Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM UNIT Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 UNIT Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY PRICE Unit Pri PRICE L
NO. nit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
ORDRES LESS THAN TEN (10) F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $125.00 $6,250.00 $18,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $6.50 $34,450.00 $103,350.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 5300 BASE, DRY TONS
DELIVERED: $11.50 $60,950.00 $182,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $6.50 $6,500.00 $19,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 1000 BASE, PROCESSED TONS
DELIVERED: $11.50 $11,500.00 $34,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $10.00 $30,000.00 $90,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 3000 SCREENING, COLORS: RED TONS
DELIVERED: $16.00 $48,000.00 $144,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contractl

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS Solicitation #: 2013-094
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013 Department: TRANSPORTATION
MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY o g
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $7.50 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $2.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
7 1000 SCREENING, COLORS: GRAY TONS NO BID
DELIVERED: $13.50 $13,500.00 $40,500.00 $9.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $33.00 $16,500.00 $49,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 500 SCREENING, COLORS: TAN TONS
DELIVERED: $40.80 $20,400.00 $61,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 500 TRANSIT MIX f::é%
DELIVERED: $88.00 $44,000.00 | $132,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ORDERS LESS THAN TWO (2) cUBIC F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9a 75 TONS CUBIC YARDS YARDS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $125.00 $9,375.00 $28,125.00 $65.00 $4,875.00 $14,625.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contracti
APPROVED BY:__/s/
DATE:__ 2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 14



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO ey
BID TABULATION \J

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-094

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
Department: TRANSPORTATION

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013
MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 1 - MISCELLANEOUS STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY i i
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $9.00 $27,000.00 $81,000.00 $19.50 $58,500.00 $175,500.00
10 3000 EXIT STONE TONS BIDDZF;SBT;ICE:
DELIVERED: $16.00 $48,000.00 $144,000.00 $28.00 $84,000.00 $252,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $14.00 $14,000.00 $42,000.00 $13.00 $13,000.00 $39,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
11 1000 BLASTING ROCK TONS NO BID
DELIVERED: $20.00 $20,000.00 $60,000.00 $18.00 $18,000.00 $54,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $167,250.00 | $501,750.00 F.0.B PLANT: $82,700.00 $248,100.00
GROUP 1 - TOTAL (1 through 11) BIDDER'S PRICE:
DELIVERED: $331,750.00 | $995,250.00 DELIVERED: $119,025.00 | $357,075.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contractl

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094|
Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 2 - PAVING MATERIALS
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
Q'I'tjbi\":ﬁr?.:.} DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $5.00 $2,500.00 $7,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 500 CSS-1HEMULSION GALLONS
DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 100 COLD MIX TONS
DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $60.00 $180,000.00 | $540,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 3000 HOT MIX ASPHALT CONCRETE TONS
PAVEMENT, FOR PATCHING
DELIVERED: $66.40 $199,200.00 | $597,600.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contracti

DATE:

APPROVED BY:__/s/

2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 2 - PAVING MATERIALS
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY A A
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
ORDERS LESS THAN TEN (10) F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3a 50 TONS (10 TONS=1 LOAD) TONS
DELIVERED DELIVERED: $125.00 $6,250.00 $18,750.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $182,500.00 | $547,500.00 F.0.B PLANT: NO BID NO BID
GROUP 2 - TOTAL (1 through 3a)
DELIVERED: $205,450.00 | $616,350.00 DELIVERED: NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contractl

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094|
Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
Q'I'tjbi\":ﬁr?.:.} DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $10.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 150 FRANKLIN RED SCREENING TONS
DELIVERED: $16.00 $2,400.00 $7,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $25.50 $1,912.50 $5,737.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 75 FRANKLIN RED 3/4" OR EQUAL | TONS
DELIVERED: $32.50 $2,437.50 $7,312.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $24.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
FRANKLIN RED 1 1/2" OR
3 75 EQUAL TONS
DELIVERED: $31.00 $2,325.00 $6,975.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $23.40 $1,755.00 $5,265.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 75 FRANKLIN RED 2" OR EQUAL TONS
DELIVERED: $30.40 $2,280.00 $6,840.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contracti

DATE:

APPROVED BY:__/s/

2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094
Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
ITEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
ANNUAL DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM UNIT Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 UNIT Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
QUANTITY PRICE ! Que PRICE ! Que
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $65.00 $4,875.00 $14,625.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 75 SANTA FE RED 3/4" TONS
DELIVERED: $72.00 $5,400.00 $16,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $65.00 $4,875.00 $14,625.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 75 SANTA FE RED 1 1/2" TONS
DELIVERED: $72.00 $5,400.00 $16,200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $49.55 $3,716.25 $11,148.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 75 MESA RED 3/4" TONS
DELIVERED: $56.55 $4,241.25 $12,723.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $49.55 $4,955.00 $14,865.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 100 MESA RED 1 1/2" TONS
DELIVERED: $56.55 $5,655.00 $16,965.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contractl

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094|
Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
ITEM S ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
Q'I'tjbi\":ﬁr?.:.} DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM Pl:‘l‘lléTE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 Pl:‘l\lléTE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3

NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)

F.0.B PLANT: $40.80 $3,060.00 $9,180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 75 DESERT TAN 3/4" TONS

DELIVERED: $47.80 $3,585.00 $10,755.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

F.0.B PLANT: $40.80 $3,060.00 $9,180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 75 DESERT TAN 1 1/2" TONS

DELIVERED: $47.80 $3,585.00 $10,755.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

F.0.B PLANT: $75.55 $11,332.50 $33,997.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 150 COBBLESTONE 1" TO 6" TONS

DELIVERED: $82.55 $12,382.50 $37,147.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

F.0.B PLANT: $139.00 $6,950.00 $20,850.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 50 RED BOULDERS EACH

DELIVERED: $180.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contractl

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso
[k kx|

All-America ity

\llw

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

Solicitation #: 2013-094

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Department: TRANSPORTATION

MINICONCRETE
JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO. TX MATERIALS, INC.
’ EL PASO, TX
GROUP 3 - LANDSCAPE ROCK
ITEM S ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED ANNUAL EXTENDED| 3 YR EXTENDED
UNIT OF UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual UNIT TOTAL (Estimated | TOTAL (Annual
Q‘tlhi\":\lqr?#Y DESCRIPTION MEASURE PRICE PER ITEM PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3 PRICE Annual Quantity x | Extended Total x 3
NO. Unit Price) years) Unit Price) years)
F.0.B PLANT: $139.00 $2,780.00 $8,340.00 $80.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
13 20 GRAY BOULDERS EACH NO BID
DELIVERED: $180.00 $3,600.00 $10,800.00 $150.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $52,571.25 $157,713.75 F.0.B PLANT: $1,600.00 $4,800.00
GROUP 3 - TOTAL (1 through 13) B
DELIVERED: $62,291.25 | $186,873.75 DELIVERED: $3,000.00 $9,000.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID
F.0.B PLANT: $402,321.25 |$1,206,963.75 F.0.B PLANT: $84,300.00 $252,900.00
GRAND TOTAL ITEMS - GROUP 1 +2 + 3 T
DELIVERED: $599,491.25 |$1,798,473.75 DELIVERED: $122,025.00 | $366,075.00
BIDDER'S PRICE:
NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contracti

DATE:

APPROVED BY:

2/12/13

Is/

2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-AmericaCity

i

2010

BID ITEM: STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARAY 2, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-094|
Department: TRANSPORTATION

JOBE MATERIALS, L.P.
EL PASO, TX

MINICONCRETE
MATERIALS, INC.
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

]

NO OPTION OFFERED. D
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY YES | X NO D YES D NO
PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within ___ consecutive calendar 1

days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases 8 24

of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 14 BIDS RECEIVED: 4 BIDS LOCAL: NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contractl

APPROVED BY:__/s/

DATE:__2/12/13 2013-094 STREET CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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