
Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$17.25 $86,250.00 $15.00 $75,000.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$18.40 $9,200.00 $20.63 $10,315.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC.

EL PASO, TX

BORITEX INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

20603

200

12

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

SUNNYCARE

6002PART NUMBER:

GEORGIA PACIFIC

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

C-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED,

 10¼" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3½" X 10¼"

PRICE PER CASE
ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

240

10

10 1/4 X 13

2" CORE

13" X 10.25"

PART NUMBER: 37 - 436 5106

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

A1.
[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable]

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable] ROYAL PAPERS SUNNYCARE - (BROWN)

7 7/8 X 800 800'

6
CS

6

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

A2.

ROLLED TOWELS, UNBLEACHED,

7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 1



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$33.00 $56,100.00 $30.00 $51,000.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC.

EL PASO, TX

BORITEX INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

500

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

4.3" X 3.8"

96

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

NO BID NO BID

PART NUMBER:

GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDSPART B: 

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable]
B1.

(GREEN) C-FOLD TOWELS,

 BLEACHED, 10 1/4" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" X 10 1/4"

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

A3.

COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET TISSUE,

2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2') X (3 1/2" OR 4")

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable]

PART NUMBER:

ROYAL PAPER SUPER SOFT SUNNYCARE

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

37 - 541 5608

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 2



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$18.40 $9,200.00 NO BID NO BID

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$37.25 $63,325.00 NO BID NO BID

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC.

EL PASO, TX

BORITEX INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

4 1/2 X 3 1/2

500

B3.

96
 RLS

65130 (EARTH FIND)

(GREEN) COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET

TISSUE, 2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2") X (3 1/2" OR 4")

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] ROYAL PAPERS NO BID

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

PART NUMBER:

37 - 436

GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDS

PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

PRICE PER CASE

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

NO BID
B2.

(GREEN) ROLLED TOWELS,

UNBLEACHED, 7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] ROYAL PAPERS

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

PART NUMBER:

2" CORE

7 7/8 X 800

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PART B: 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

ITEM 

NO. 

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 3



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE

HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT

QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION 

IS EXERCISED WITHIN: 

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

1% - 10 DAYS

BASED ON CURRENT MARKET CONDITIONS

2

1.5% - 10 DAYS; 1% - 20 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

10

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

PAYMENT TERMS:

BORITEX INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

YES                            NO YES                            NO

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

BARON CHEMICAL CO., INC.

EL PASO, TX

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

X X

X X

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 4



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$15.40 $77,000.00 NO BID NO BID

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$21.10 $10,550.00 $21.30 $10,650.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE: 6 6 
RLS/CASE

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

P728N-6 37 - 436

8 X 800'

800'

A2.

ROLLED TOWELS, UNBLEACHED,

7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable] PUTNEY ROYAL PAPER

PART NUMBER:

10 1/8 X 13

150

16

A1.

C-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED,

 10¼" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3½" X 10¼"

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable] PUTNEY NO BID

PART NUMBER: P100B

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 5



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$35.70 $60,690.00 $36.95 $62,815.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable]

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

B1.

(GREEN) C-FOLD TOWELS,

 BLEACHED, 10 1/4" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" X 10 1/4"

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

NO BID NO BID

PART NUMBER:

PART B: GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDS

A3.

COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET TISSUE,

2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2') X (3 1/2" OR 4")

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

4.5 X 3.8

500

96

PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] ATLAS ROYAL PAPER

PART NUMBER: A250 65130

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 6



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$34.99 $59,483.00 NO BID NO BID

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE: 96

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

A250

4.5 X 3.8

500

B3.

(GREEN) COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET

TISSUE, 2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2") X (3 1/2" OR 4")

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] ATLAS NO BID

PART NUMBER:

B2.

(GREEN) ROLLED TOWELS,

UNBLEACHED, 7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] NO BID NO BID

PART NUMBER:

PART B: GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 7



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE

HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT

QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION 

IS EXERCISED WITHIN: 

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

YES                            NO YES                            NO

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
10 - 14 10

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORP.

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

X

X

X

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 8



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$17.35 $86,750.00 $16.40 $82,000.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$20.45 $10,225.00 $16.35 $8,175.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

 800'
FEET/ROLL

6 6
ROLLS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BENMORE ELEMENT 60335

PART NUMBER: 45800 60335

8' X 800 8"

12 12

A2.

ROLLED TOWELS, UNBLEACHED,

7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable] BAYWEST

A1.

C-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED,

 10¼" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3½" X 10¼"

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable] BAYWEST EASYPORT CFW2400

PART NUMBER: 49190

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

CFW2400

10 1/8 X 13 13" X 10 1/4"

200 200

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 9



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$33.25 $56,525.00 $30.30 $51,510.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$17.35 $86,750.00 $16.40 $82,000.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable]

200 200

12 12

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

B1.

(GREEN) C-FOLD TOWELS,

 BLEACHED, 10 1/4" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" X 10 1/4"

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

BAYWEST EASYPORT CFW2400

PART NUMBER: 49190 CFW2400

10 1/8 X 13 13" X 10 1/4"

PART B: GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDS

A3.

COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET TISSUE,

2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2') X (3 1/2" OR 4")

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

4 3/8 X 3 3/4 4.25" X 3.5"

500 500  2 PLY

96 96

PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] BAYWEST EASYPORT 42352

PART NUMBER: 54000 42352

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 10



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$20.45 $10,225.00 $16.50 $8,250.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$36.50 $62,050.00 $30.30 $51,510.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 96

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

54900 42352

4 3/8 X 3 3/4 4.25" X 3.5"

500 500 2 PLY

B3.

(GREEN) COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET

TISSUE, 2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2") X (3 1/2" OR 4")

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] BAYWEST EASYPORT 42352

PART NUMBER:

RTK800M

8' X 800 8"

800'
FEET/ROLL

6 6
ROLLS

B2.

(GREEN) ROLLED TOWELS,

UNBLEACHED, 7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] BAYWEST EASYPORT RTK800M

PART NUMBER: 45800

PART B: GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 11



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE

HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT

QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION 

IS EXERCISED WITHIN: 

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
1 7

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

YES                            NO YES                            NO

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

NET - 30 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS

X

X X

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 12



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$16.08 $80,400.00 $16.55 $82,750.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$18.04 $9,020.00 $18.60 $9,300.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE: 6
RLS

6/800

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

6256 NIB-25055-3

7 7/8" 7 7/8 X 800

800' 800
LINEAR FEET

A2.

ROLLED TOWELS, UNBLEACHED,

7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

500 

CASES 

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable] WAUSAU OR EQUAL NETCHOISE (SCA)

PART NUMBER:

NIB-22223-3

10 X 13

240 150
SHEETS PER PACK

10 16/150

A1.

C-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED,

 10¼" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3½" X 10¼"

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

5,000

CASES 

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or brand Name, as applicable] BOARDWALK OR EQUAL NETCHOICE (SCA)

PART NUMBER: 1510

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., NC.

EL PASO, TX

WESTERN PAPER DISTRIBUTORS

EL PASO, TX

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 13



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$27.85 $47,345.00 $33.50 $56,950.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$18.35 $91,750.00 $17.50 $87,500.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable]

240 240

10 10
PACKS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

B1.

(GREEN) C-FOLD TOWELS,

 BLEACHED, 10 1/4" X 13" 

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" X 10 1/4"

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

5,000 

CASES

ANNUALLY

GEORGIA PACIFIC GEORGIA PACIFIC

PART NUMBER: 25190 GP-25190

10 X 13 10.100 X 13.200

PART B: GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDS

A3.

COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET TISSUE,

2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2') X (3 1/2" OR 4")

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

4 X 3.5 4.000 X 4.050

500 500
SHEETS PER ROLL

96 80
ROLLS PER CASE

PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] ELEMENT OR EQUAL GEORGIA PACIFIC

PART NUMBER: 60119 GP-19880/01

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., NC.

EL PASO, TX

WESTERN PAPER DISTRIBUTORS

EL PASO, TX

PART A: NON-RECYCLED PRODUCTS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 14



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

$23.42 $11,710.00 $18.80 $9,400.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

$33.48 $56,916.00 $33.50 $56,950.00

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

(PER CASE)
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

SIZE PER SHEET:

SHEETS PER PACKAGE:

PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 80
ROLLS

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

235 GP-19880/01

4.5" X 3.5" 4.00 X 4.05

500 500
SHEETS

B3.

(GREEN) COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET

TISSUE, 2 PLY, WHITE, 500 SHEETS,

(4" OR 4 1/2") X (3 1/2" OR 4")

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

1,700 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] ATLAS PAPER MILL GEORGIA PACIFIC

PART NUMBER:

GP-26301

7 7/8" 7.875" X 800.

800' 800'
LINEAR FEET

6
RLS

6
ROLLS PER CS

B2.

(GREEN) ROLLED TOWELS,

UNBLEACHED, 7 7/8" X 800"

MUST HAVE 2" CORE

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

500 

CASES

ANNUALLY

PRODUCT BRAND INFORMATION

[Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable] WAUSAU OR EQUAL GEORGIA PACIFIC

PART NUMBER: 45800

PART B: GREEN SEAL PRODUCT STANDARDS

ITEM 

NO. 
DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY
PRICE PER CASE

TOTAL EXTENDED 

PRICE 
(PRICE PER CASE x 

ESTIMATED ANNUAL 

QUANTITY)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., NC.

EL PASO, TX

WESTERN PAPER DISTRIBUTORS

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 15



Bid Opening Date:  JANUARY 30, 2013 Solicitation #:  2013-127

Project Name:  PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE

HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT

QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION 

IS EXERCISED WITHIN: 

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT

BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

BIDS SOLICITED:   37 BIDS LOCAL:   31

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS RECEIVED:     8     NO BIDS:  0

7 WORK DAYS
UPON AWARD, AND KNOWLEDGE OF USAGE

 WE CAN DELIVER WITHIN 3 DAYS

7 - 10 DAYS

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

SPECTRUM PAPER CO., NC.

EL PASO, TX

WESTERN PAPER DISTRIBUTORS

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Department: AVIATION(EPIA)

YES                            NO YES                            NOX X

X

APPROVED BY:__/s/_____

DATE: ___2/5/13_________  2013-127 PAPER SUNDRIES FOR DEPARTMENT OF AVIATION 16


