
BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

      OR       OR       OR       OR

                   _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT

      OR       OR       OR       OR

30 % MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

WHOLESALER     

DISTRIBUTOR     

JOBBER     

DEALER     

RETAILER     

OTHER ____________________________

$0.00

NO BID

$45.00

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

ITEM 

1.

$0.00

$40.00

COST PER SERVICE COST PER SERVICECOST PER SERVICE

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION COST PER SERVICE

N/A

STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX
GROUP I:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT SERVICE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

Front Alignment only

W/ Rear alig. $20 more

Cars w/ front & rear alignment

PART A:  PARTS - PRICE LIST PRICING

                  04/2013      

DESCRIPTION

        OTHER_____________________

            ___________________

P R I C E    A D J U S T M E N T    FACTOR

              DAYTON                __________________

            ___________________

            ___________________

          ____________________

            ___________________

        OTHER_____________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

        OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID $65.00 

ITEM 

1.

ITEM 

2.
HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

AUTOMOTIVE VEHICLES

$80.00
PER HOUR

NO BID$79.00

$0.00SUBTOTAL - GROUP 1

NET NET NET NET
STEERING PARTS

(To be used in conjunction with 

Group II:  Installation Service)

GROUP II:  STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS INSTALLATION SERVICE AND PRICING

$120.00

                   Price List or Catalog

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
               FLAGG________

                TSS-0413D       

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 1



BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

      OR       OR       OR       OR

                   _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT

      OR       OR       OR       OR

30 % MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

WHOLESALER     

DISTRIBUTOR     

JOBBER     

DEALER     

RETAILER     

OTHER ____________________________

STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

NO BID

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

DESCRIPTION

GROUP II:  STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS INSTALLATION SERVICE AND PRICING

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

NET NET

P R I C E    A D J U S T M E N T    FACTOR

NET

             __________________           ____________________

ITEM 

2.

STEERING PARTS
(To be used in conjunction with 

Group II:  Installation Service) 

(ALTERNATE)

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

        OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________

                   Price List or Catalog

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

            ___________________

              DAYTON   

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

                  04/2013                  ___________________

               FLAGG________

NET

            ___________________

                TSS-0413D                   ___________________

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 2



BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

      OR       OR       OR       OR

                   _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT

      OR       OR       OR       OR

30 % MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

WHOLESALER     

DISTRIBUTOR     

JOBBER     

DEALER     

RETAILER     

OTHER ____________________________

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

DESCRIPTION P R I C E    A D J U S T M E N T    FACTOR

ITEM 

1.

SUSPENSION PARTS 
(To be used in conjunction with

Group II:  Installation Service)

                   Price List or Catalog

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)
               FLAGG________

NET

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

                TSS-0413D                   ___________________             ___________________

                  04/2013                  ___________________
NO BID

NET NET NET

GROUP II:  STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS INSTALLATION SERVICE AND PRICING

              DAYTON             ____________________             __________________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

        OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________

            ___________________

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 3



BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

      OR       OR       OR       OR

                   _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT                    _____% DISCOUNT

      OR       OR       OR       OR

30 % MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP                    _____% MARK-UP

List Number_____________________
Dated__________________________

WHOLESALER     

DISTRIBUTOR     

JOBBER     

DEALER     

RETAILER     

OTHER ____________________________

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NO BID

STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

PART B:  STEERING & SUSPENSION SERVICE LABOR RATES

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$0.00 per vehicle

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

               FLAGG________

Regular Hour Rates

DESCRIPTION P R I C E    A D J U S T M E N T    FACTOR

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

ITEM 

2.

SUSPENSION PARTS 
(To be used in conjunction with

Group II:  Installation Service)

(ALTERNATE)

NET NET

$0.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle

             __________________

ITEM 

1. AUTOMOTIVE VEHICLES

                   Price List or Catalog

(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)

Holiday Hour Rates

NET NET

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

        OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________         OTHER_____________________

N/A Regular Hour Rates

DESCRIPTION

              DAYTON   

GROUP II:  STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS INSTALLATION SERVICE AND PRICING

Holiday Hour Rates

$45.00 per vehicle

Regular Hour Rates

$45.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle $45.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle

                  04/2013                  ___________________             ___________________

          ____________________

                TSS-0413D                   ___________________             ___________________

N/A Holiday Hour Rates

X 

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 4



BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

LABOR COST (Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)


STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

PART B:  STEERING & SUSPENSION SERVICE LABOR RATES

DESCRIPTION

ITEM 

1.
HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS

$45.00 per vehicle $79.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle

Regular Hour Rates

Holiday Hour Rates

Regular Hour Rates Regular Hour Rates Regular Hour Rates

$45.00 per vehicle $79.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle $0.00 per vehicle

HANGAR ASSEMBLY 

INTERNATIONAL 

PART # 1664263C1

HANGAR ASSEMBLY 

INTERNATIONAL 

PART # 1664263C1

HANGAR ASSEMBLY 

INTERNATIONAL 

PART # 1664263C1

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

Holiday Hour Rates Holiday Hour Rates Holiday Hour Rates

PART C:  SAMPLE PRICING - MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

HANGAR ASSEMBLY 

INTERNATIONAL 

PART # 1664263C1

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST)

ITEM 

1.

   E736-55   

$47.36

$61.57

$ 45.00 HR x 1 1/2

Truck labor rate

$129.07

  338-1218 DAYTON  

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET)

 ______________________

$109.53 $_____________________

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP)

$ 57.85_ $_____________________ NO BID_

$ 79.00  

Truck labor rate

$_____________________

Truck labor rate

$ 79.00 PER HOUR  $_____________________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 5



BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

LABOR COST (Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)


LABOR COST (Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)


NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

SPRING PIN TRIANGLE 

SUSPENSION SYSTEM

B1408-46

SPRING PIN TRIANGLE 

SUSPENSION SYSTEM

B1408-46

KING PIN SET 

TRIANGLE SUSPENSION 

SYSTEM FKP99-C

KING PIN SET 

TRIANGLE SUSPENSION 

SYSTEM FKP99-C

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

KING PIN SET 

TRIANGLE SUSPENSION 

SYSTEM FKP99-C

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

PART C:  SAMPLE PRICING - MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

KING PIN SET 

TRIANGLE SUSPENSION 

SYSTEM FKP99-C

ITEM 

2.

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:  __FKP99-C____  _300-265 DAYTON___  ______________________

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $_266.58__ $  535.92 _ $_____________________

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $_346.55_ $__283.07__ $_____________________

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

$_ 13.19  $  28.11__

$_____________________

Truck labor rate

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $__706.55__ $_79.00 PER HOUR__ $_____________________

$_45.00 HR x 8 HR___

Truck labor rate

$_79.00_

Truck labor rate

$_____________________

SPRING PIN TRIANGLE 

SUSPENSION SYSTEM

B1408-46

$_____________________

Truck labor rate

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST)

SPRING PIN TRIANGLE 

SUSPENSION SYSTEM

B1408-46

ITEM 

3.

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:  _B1408-46__  __327-487 DAYTON__  ______________________

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP)

$_____________________

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $_17.15__ $__8.83__ $_____________________

$__45.00 x 1.1 HR__

Truck labor rate

$_79.00_

Truck labor rate

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$__66.65__ $_79.00 PER HOUR__

NO BID

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 6



BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

LABOR COST (Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)


LABOR COST (Assume one (1) hour labor from PART B)


STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

$_____________________

SIDE BAR 

INTERNATIONAL 

1654690C1

SIDE BAR 

INTERNATIONAL 

1654690C1

NO BID
ITEM 

4.

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:  __E693-55__  __330-157 DAYTON___  ______________________

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $_____________________$_16.86__

$_____________________

Truck labor rate

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST)

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

SIDE BAR 

INTERNATIONAL 

1654690C1

SIDE BAR 

INTERNATIONAL 

1654690C1

$_39.11__

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $__21.92___ $_20.66__

$_80.42__ $__79.00 PER HOUR___ $_____________________

$__45.00 x 1.3.__

Truck labor rate

$__79.99__

Truck labor rate

$_____________________

NO BID

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

THE ROD RIGHT

MOOG

ES3030R

THE ROD RIGHT

MOOG

ES3030R

THE ROD RIGHT

MOOG

ES3030R

$_____________________

THE ROD RIGHT

MOOG

ES3030R

 ______________________

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $145.19 $346.18

$_____________________

Truck labor rate

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $__247.25 _ $79.00 $_____________________

$ 45.00 x 1.3  

Truck labor rate

$ 79.00 

Truck labor rate

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $188.75 $182.85

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:   ES3030R  310-395 DAYTON

PART C:  SAMPLE PRICING - MANDATORY REQUIREMENT (EVEN IF BIDDING AS SPECIFIED)

BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE - NO BID

SUBTOTAL COST - GROUP II

SUBTOTAL COST - GROUP I

ITEM 

5.

TOTAL EXTENDED COST - GROUPS I & II $1,349.94

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$_____________________

$_____________________

$_____________________

$_1229.94_

$ 120.00_

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 7



BID # 2013-151

BID DATE:  APRIL 03, 2013 DEPARTMENT:  GENERAL SERVICES - FLEET 

TERM OF THE CONTRACTOR FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER AGREES TO EXPECTED PERFORMANCE

(TURN-AROUND) TIME AS LISTED ABOVE

IF A BIDDER SPECIFIES A LONGER RESPONSE TIME THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED RESPONSE TIME, THE CITY'S RESPONSE TIME SHALL PREVAIL OR THIS MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED:    23                                                  BIDS RECEIVED:     3                                        BIDS LOCAL:      3                                             NO BID:     1

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

    NO YES

YES     NOYES     NO

NET - 30 DAYS 3% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

    NO

    NOYES

YES     NOYES

    NO YES     NOYES

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT AND STEERING & SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

STANLEY SPRING & 

SUSPENSION

EL PASO, TX

TRUCK ENTERPRISE 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

DALTON BRAKE & 

WHEEL

EL PASO, TX

X 

X X 

X X X 

X X X 

APPROVED BY:     /s/     

DATE:   4//17/2013        

 2013-151 WHEEL AND AXLE ALIGNMENT, STEERING AND SUSPENSION PARTS AND SERVICE -

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT - FLEET DIVISION 8


