
Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$25.15 $6,639.60 $19,918.80 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $25.75 $6,798.00 $20,394.00 

/cs /cs /cs

$32.65 $66,214.20 $198,642.60 $39.43 $79,964.04 $239,892.12 $34.25 $69,459.00 $208,377.00 

/cs /cs /cs

NO BID

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

PRICE

PART A
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

PACKAGES PER CASE:

10 pkg / cs

96 x 1

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

PRICE

4.1" x 3.5"

LEFT BLANK

192121

9.5" x 10.75"

250

ATLAS LEFT BLANK

A250 37-541

500

96

4.5 x 3.8

2,028

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 500

2641

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2

2 PLY TOILET TISSUE

96 ROLLS / PER CASE

SINGLE FOLD BLUE WINDSHIELD 

TOWELS 12 PACKS PER CASE

9/250

4.5 x 3.5

500

SCA

14102121

9.5 x 10.75

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

2250 / cs

PART NUMBER:

ROSES

82157

96

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE:

SIZE PER SHEET: 

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

PART NUMBER:

SIZE PER SHEET: 

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 1



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$113.70 $15,008.40 $45,025.20 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $17.65 $2,329.80 $6,989.40 

/cs /cs /cs

$19.95 $19.95 $59.85 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $23.95 $23.95 $71.85 

/cs /cs /cs

NO BID

NO BID

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

PACKAGES PER CASE:

KRYSTAL FRESH PRODUCTS

12/Bx

PRICE

URINAL SCREENS 

SCREENS WITH BLOCK 12/CASE 

MULTI SCENTED

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

8.0 x 660'

Solicitation # :  2013-155

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

1

WHITE CENTER PULL TOWEL

6 ROLLS PER CASE

2 PLY - 7.9" x 660'

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

PART NUMBER:

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE: 6 x 1

720

132

6/cs

3

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

KRYPBS 12-Sani

4

37-505

7.9

SIZE PER SHEET: 

12 each

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ROSES SW LEFT BLANK

52308

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

PART NUMBER:

660

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

6

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 2



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$39.00 $13,572.00 $40,716.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 

/cs /cs /cs

$18.90 $8,391.60 $25,174.80 $18.60 $8,258.40 $24,775.20 $16.25 $7,215.00 $21,645.00 

/cs /cs /cs

NO BID NO BID

37-432

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

12 / cs

350

12 x 1

8' 8 x 350'

12

444

HARD WOUND TOWELS NATURAL

8" x 350' - 12 ROLLS/CASE

348

PACKAGES PER CASE: 4 Gal / Cs

BIO RENEWABLES HAND, HAIR, 

AND BODY WASH FOAM SOAP 

1 GAL EACH - 4 PER CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

PART NUMBER:

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

03986

PRICEDESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

350' LEFT BLANK

PLATINUM PUTNEY ROYAL PAPER

37-432 P720N

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

PRICE

DIAL
5

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

6 MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

PART NUMBER:

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE:

7.9" x 350'

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 3



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$21.85 $44,311.80 $132,935.40 $27.65 $56,074.20 $168,222.60 $20.35 $41,269.80 $123,809.40 

/cs /cs /cs

$370.44 $31,116.96 $93,350.88 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $192.10 $16,135.31 $48,405.93 

/55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum Bidder's Price

NO BID

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

1000 1000'

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

ATLAS

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

37-627 A700 37-627

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

9" 9" x 1000' 3.55" x 1000'

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

LEFT BLANK

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

ROYAL PAPER

PART NUMBER:

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 / cs 12 12 x 1

7 2,028

JUMBO ROLL TISSUE

9" x 1000' WHITE 2 PLY

12 ROLLS / CASE

PLATINUM

SIZE PER SHEET: 

8 84

MULTI SURFACE CLEANER

55 GALLON DRUM

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: SIMPLE GREEN LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER: SMP13008 267606

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 55 Gal 

PACKAGES PER CASE: Drum 55 Gal/Drum

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 4



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$267.50 $6,420.00 $19,260.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 

/pallets /pallets /pallets

$339.80 $12,232.80 $36,698.40 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $238.53 $8,587.19 $25,761.56 

/55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum Bidder's Price

NO BID NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

9 24

ROCK SALT 50 LBS. OR LESS PER 

SACK

SOLD BY THE PALLET

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: MORTON

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: ROYAL LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER:

PART NUMBER: 3984

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 50#

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 55 gal

PACKAGES PER CASE: 50 per pallet

10 36

CONCRETE FLOOR DEGREASER 

LOW FOAM

55 GALLON DRUM EACH

PACKAGES PER CASE: Drum 55 Gal/Drum

NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MI-BARG55 199606

SIZE PER SHEET: 

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 5



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$57.60 $5,529.60 $16,588.80 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $60.75 $5,832.00 $17,496.00 

/cs /cs /cs

$5.80 $208.80 $626.40 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $5.70 $205.20 $615.60 

/bag /bag /bag

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

PRICEDESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

11 96

INDUSTRIAL HAND CLEANER 

1 GALLON EACH - 4 PER CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: GOJO

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

4 / cs

LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER: 095504 95504

SIZE PER SHEET: NO BID

PACKAGES PER CASE: 4 / 1 gal

LEFT BLANK

NO BID

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 25 #

8826

PACKAGES PER CASE: 25/Bag 40 Bag

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

12 36

ABSORBENT FLOOR DRY 

25 LB. BAGS EACH - SOLD BY THE 

PALLET

MOLTEN

5

SIZE PER SHEET: 

PART NUMBER:

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 6



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$13.75 $1,320.00 $3,960.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $11.00 $1,056.00 $3,168.00 

/ea. /ea. /ea.

N/C N/C $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 

/ea. /ea. /ea.

NO BIDNO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

13 96

JR. JUMBO TISSUE DISPENSER 

EACH PART# 600-661 MADE FOR 

ONE 9 in. ROLL OR EQUAL

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: GEORGIA PACIFIC LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER: 590-09 66TR

SIZE PER SHEET: 9" NO BID

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE: each 1 each

14 84

FOAM SOAP DISPENSER EACH 

MADE BY SPARTAN CHEMICAL 

PART # 516-9757 OR EQUAL

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: DIAL

PART NUMBER: 06055

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE: 6/cs each

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 7



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$222.15 $7,997.40 $23,992.20 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $148.85 $5,358.92 $16,076.76 

/55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum Bidder's Price

$218,983.00

$656,949.00

$164,270.17

$492,810.50

NO BID

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

PRICE

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

55 gal

PRICE

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

GLASS CLEANER 55 GALLON 

DRUM HARVARD CHEMICAL 

PART # 258-340055 OR EQUAL

PART NUMBER: 14111

PACKAGES PER CASE:

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PRICE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: CARROLL

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

LEFT BLANK

340006

Drum

PART A - 36 MONTH TOTAL $432,889.92

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

PART A - 12 MONTH TOTAL $144,296.64

55 gal drum

15 36

SIZE PER SHEET: 

X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 8



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$370.45 $18,522.50 $55,567.50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $18.85 $942.50 $2,827.50 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

$17.10 $27,360.00 $82,080.00 $18.99 $30,384.00 $91,152.00 $18.85 $30,160.00 $90,480.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX
PART B- RECYCLABLE PRODUCT
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

1 50

C-FOLD ABSORBENT, 

WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLEACHED 

10 1/4" x 13"

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" x 10"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: GEORGIA PACIFIC LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER: 206-03 75004304

SIZE PER SHEET: 10 1/4 x 13 13" x 10.25"

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 pkg / case

2 1,600

C-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED, 10 

1/4" x 13"

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" x 10 1/4"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: GEORGIA PACIFIC PUTNEY LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER:  206-03 P100B 75004304

SIZE PER SHEET: 10 1/4 x 13 10 1/8 x 13 13" x 10.25"

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 240 150 200

PACKAGES PER CASE: 2400 / cs 16 12 pkg / case

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 9



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$17.60 $28,160.00 $84,480.00 $19.30 $30,880.00 $92,640.00 $17.65 $28,240.00 $84,720.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

$17.00 $5,950.00 $17,850.00 $19.10 $6,685.00 $20,055.00 $17.95 $6,282.50 $18,847.50 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

3 1,600

MULTI-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED, 

9 1/8" x 9 1/2"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: GEORGIA PACIFIC PUTNEY LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER: 20204 P200B 756004306

SIZE PER SHEET: 9 1/8 x 9 1/2 9.25 x 9.5 9.4" x 9.25

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 250 200

PACKAGES PER CASE: 4000 16 20 pck / case

4 350

SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS, 

UNBLEACHED,

 9 11/16" x 10 3/4 "

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: GEORGIA PACIFIC PUTNEY LEFT BLANK

PART NUMBER: 235-04 P600 75004301

SIZE PER SHEET: 9 11/16 x 10 3/4 9.25 x 10.25 10.5" x 9.3"

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 334 250

PACKAGES PER CASE: 4000 / cs 12 16 pck / case

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 10



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$21.25 $3,187.50 $9,562.50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

$18.70 $29,920.00 $89,760.00 $23.99 $38,384.00 $115,152.00 $19.95 $31,920.00 $95,760.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

NO BIDNO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

5 150

ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHED, 

NON PERFORATED,

W 7 7/8" x L 400" WITH 1.5 CORE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: PLATINUM

PART NUMBER: 37421

SIZE PER SHEET: 7 7/8

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 350'

ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL, 

W 7 7/8" x L 800", 1 3/4" CORE SIZE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: GEORGIA PACIFIC PUTNEY LEFT BLANK

800'

6 6 rl / case

PART NUMBER: 263-01 P728N-6 37-436

8 x 800' 7.9" x 800'

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 / cs

6 1,600

6 / cs

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SIZE PER SHEET: 7 7/8"

PACKAGES PER CASE:

800

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 11



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$34.00 $54,400.00 $163,200.00 $39.99 $63,984.00 $191,952.00 $38.50 $61,600.00 $184,800.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

$218,983.11

$656,949.25

$218,983.11

$656,949.25

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

4.5 x 3.8

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

Solicitation # :  2013-155

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

4.5" x 4.0"

PRICE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

PART NUMBER:

4.5 x 4.0

COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET 

TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO 

LARGER THAN 4.5" x 4.5" W AND 

NO SMALLER THAN 3.8" L x 4.5" W

PLATINUM ATLAS LEFT BLANK

37541 A250 37-602

PART A + PART B 

36 MONTH TOTAL

500 500 500

96 / cs 96 96 rl / case

$970,245.50

7 1,600

$159,145.00

PART B - 36 MONTH TOTAL $510,951.00 $477,435.00

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE:

SIZE PER SHEET: 

$943,840.92

$170,317.00

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

PART A + PART B 

12 MONTH TOTAL
$314,613.64 $323,415.17

PART B - 12 MONTH TOTAL

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE PRICE

X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 12



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:  Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

       YES                     NO   

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

of emergency.

       YES                     NO   

2 10-14 10

       YES                     NO   

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases
9 AM - 5 PM24 5-7 days

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

PAYMENT TERMS: Net - 30 Days Net - 30 Days

BARON CHEMICAL CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CENTRAL POLY-BAG CORPORATION

LINDEN, NJ

1% - 10 Days

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY SERVICES 

, INC. 

EL PASO, TX

X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

X X 

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 13



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$32.95 $8,698.80 $26,096.40 $24.00 $6,336.00 $19,008.00 $23.96 $6,325.44 $18,976.32 

/cs /cs /cs

$33.55 $68,039.40 $204,118.20 $25.75 $52,221.00 $156,663.00 $33.80 $68,546.40 $205,639.20 

/cs /cs /cs

PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 96 Roll per case 80

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SIZE PER SHEET: 4 3/8 x 3 3/4 4.1" x 3.1" 4 x 4.05

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 500 Per Roll 500 Roll 550

CT COMMERCIAL GEO. PACIFIC

PART NUMBER: 54000 41312 19880/01

PACKAGES PER CASE: 8 12 9

2 2,028

2 PLY TOILET TISSUE

96 ROLLS / PER CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

SIZE PER SHEET: 9" x 10" 9" x 10.25" 9.5 x 10.25

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 334 250 - 2 ply

CT COMMERCIAL GEORGIA PACIFIC

PART NUMBER: 13400 SFB4000 350

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

1 264

SINGLE FOLD BLUE WINDSHIELD 

TOWELS 12 PACKS PER CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

PART A

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 14



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$22.58 $2,980.56 $8,941.68 $108.45 $14,315.40 $42,946.20 $9.70 $1,280.40 $3,841.20 

/cs /cs /cs

$23.30 $23.30 $69.90 $23.50 $23.50 $70.50 $18.20 $18.20 $54.60 

/cs /cs /cs

PACKAGES PER CASE: 6 6 6

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SIZE PER SHEET: 7 3/4 x 12 8" x 11.5" 8 x 10

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 600 Per Roll 600 600

CT COMMERCIAL ADVANTAGE OR EQUAL 

PART NUMBER: 06002 CPW600 A1430

PACKAGES PER CASE: 121 Case 6 1

4 1

WHITE CENTER PULL TOWEL

6 ROLLS PER CASE

2 PLY - 7.9" x 660'

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

SIZE PER SHEET: Block 4 oz.

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: UOM12 Screens 12

FRESH PRODUCTS ULTIMATE SOLUTIONS

PART NUMBER: 950 12-3USPB 1YPBUS

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

3 132

URINAL SCREENS 

SCREENS WITH BLOCK 12/CASE 

MULTI SCENTED

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: LEFT BLANK

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 15



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $38.95 $13,554.60 $40,663.80 $31.77 $11,055.96 $33,167.88 

/cs /cs /cs

$18.00 $7,992.00 $23,976.00 $16.70 $7,414.80 $22,244.40 $18.67 $8,299.48 $24,898.44 

/cs /cs /cs Bidder's Price Bidder's Price

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 350 Ft/Roll 350' Ft / Rl 350'

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 12 12

GEO PACIFIC ENVISION

PART NUMBER: 46200 RTK350 26401

SIZE PER SHEET: 8" 8" 7.875 x 350' / Roll

4 4 gls / cs

6 444

HARD WOUND TOWELS NATURAL

8" x 350' - 12 ROLLS/CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

5

CT COMMERCIAL

Cont. Gallon

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: UOM GALLON

NO BID

SPARTAN SUNFLOWER FRESH ROCHESTER MIOLAND

PART NUMBER:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

3305 11901900

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

348

BIO RENEWABLES HAND, HAIR, 

AND BODY WASH FOAM SOAP 

1 GAL EACH - 4 PER CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

SIZE PER SHEET: 

PRICE

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 16



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$23.30 $47,252.40 $141,757.20 $21.00 $42,588.00 $127,764.40 $19.87 $40,296.36 $120,889.08 

/cs /cs /cs

$217.44 $18,264.96 $54,794.88 $259.00 $21,756.00 $65,268.00 $214.90 $18,051.60 $54,154.80 

/55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum

PACKAGES PER CASE: 1 1 Drum

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SIZE PER SHEET: UOM Gallon 55 Gal

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: GL/DR 55

SPARTAN MULTI SURFACE CLEANER RMC DFE 401

PART NUMBER: LD-500-55 0040 11792857

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 12 12

8 84

MULTI SURFACE CLEANER

55 GALLON DRUM

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: LAUN-DRY

SIZE PER SHEET: 3 7/8 x 1000 3.8" Roll 9"

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 12,000 Ft/Roll 1000' Ft/Rl 1000'

CT COMMERCIAL GEN OR EQUAL

PART NUMBER: 10020 JRT3810 JRT 1000-2 Ply

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

7 2,028

JUMBO ROLL TISSUE

9" x 1000' WHITE 2 PLY

12 ROLLS / CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 17



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$242.55 $5,821.20 $17,463.60 $375.00 $9,000.00 $27,000.00 $389.69 $9,352.56 $28,057.68 

/pallets /pallets /pallets

$224.15 $8,069.40 $24,208.20 $239.00 $8,604.00 $25,812.00 $194.00 $6,984.00 $20,952.00 

/55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum

PACKAGES PER CASE: 1

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SIZE PER SHEET: UOM Gallon 55 Gal

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: GL / DR 55 Drum

SPARTAN SNB130 RMC LA 190

PART NUMBER: CC6045-55 2130 10262057

PACKAGES PER CASE: Per Pallet 50 1

10 36

CONCRETE FLOOR DEGREASER 

LOW FOAM

55 GALLON DRUM EACH

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: LAUN-DRY

SIZE PER SHEET: UOM Bag Bag 50 lbs.

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: LB. / BG 50# Bags / Pallet 49

LEFT BLANK SCOTT

PART NUMBER: 0763 Rock Salt ROCKSALT

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

9 24

ROCK SALT 50 LBS. OR LESS PER 

SACK

SOLD BY THE PALLET

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: LEFT BLANK

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

1 Bag $4.95  49 Bags /Pallet

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 18



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $49.00 $4,704.00 $14,112.00 $57.00 $5,472.00 $16,416.00 

/cs /cs /cs

$7.25 $261.00 $783.00 $5.75 $207.00 $621.00 $6.67 $240.12 $720.36 

/bag /bag /bag

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: LB. / BG 50 #

PACKAGES PER CASE: Per Pallet 40 1 Bag

ST. CLOUD

PART NUMBER: OILDRY50 OILDRY50

SIZE PER SHEET: UOM Bag Bag 50 lbs.

4 4 gals / cs

12 36

ABSORBENT FLOOR DRY 

25 LB. BAGS EACH - SOLD BY THE 

PALLET

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: LAUN-DRY

11

BALCONES

4 x 1 gal

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: UOM Gallon

NO BID

SPARTAN BIO-RENEWABLE WATERLESS 

HAND CLEANER W/ PUMICE
DEB

PART NUMBER:

PACKAGES PER CASE:

2974 Heritage

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

96

INDUSTRIAL HAND CLEANER 

1 GALLON EACH - 4 PER CASE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

SIZE PER SHEET: 

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 19



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$17.65 $1,694.40 $5,083.20 $16.00 $1,536.00 $4,608.00 $12.95 $1,243.20 $3,729.60 

/ea. /ea. /ea.

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 No Charge $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

/ea. /ea. /ea.

NO BID

Free with Award of item 5

PACKAGES PER CASE: 1 12

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

14

100 Mc

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: UOM Each

SPARTAN LITE N FOAMY RMC

PART NUMBER: 9757 11901900

PACKAGES PER CASE: 1 1

84

FOAM SOAP DISPENSER EACH 

MADE BY SPARTAN CHEMICAL 

PART # 516-9757 OR EQUAL

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SIZE PER SHEET: 

UOM Each 9" Disp

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: Disp

SCA GP/SCA

PART NUMBER: 311-02 66T 59009

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

13 96

JR. JUMBO TISSUE DISPENSER 

EACH PART# 600-661 MADE FOR 

ONE 9 in. ROLL OR EQUAL

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: LEFT BLANK

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 20



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$142.80 $5,140.80 $15,422.40 $156.00 $5,616.00 $16,848.00 $277.00 $9,972.00 $29,916.00 

/55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum /55 gal d rum

Bidder's Price

Bidder's Price

$561,413.16

HARVARD RMCLAUN-DRY

Solicitation # :  2013-155

PART A - 36 MONTH TOTAL

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PACKAGES PER CASE: 1

PART A - 12 MONTH TOTAL

15 36 MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

$187,137.72

SIZE PER SHEET: UOM Gallon 55 Gal

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: GL / DR 55 Drum

PART NUMBER: CC60007-55 340055 12001057

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

GLASS CLEANER 55 GALLON 

DRUM HARVARD CHEMICAL 

PART # 258-340055 OR EQUAL

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

$179,056.30

$537,168.90

$174,238.22

Bidder's Price: LEFT BLANK

$522,714.66

Bidder's Price: LEFT BLANK

X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 21



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$32.95 $1,647.50 $4,942.50 $16.40 $820.00 $2,460.00 $16.20 $810.00 $2,430.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

$22.35 $35,760.00 $107,280.00 $16.40 $26,240.00 $78,720.00 $16.20 $25,920.00 $77,760.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200 200 200

PACKAGES PER CASE: 12 12 12

CFW2400 CF2452

SIZE PER SHEET: 10 1/8 x 13 13" x 10.25" 10.25 x 13

2 1,600

C-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED, 10 

1/4" x 13"

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" x 10 1/4"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST CT COMMERCIAL CLASSIQUE OR EQUAL

PART NUMBER: 49190

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 250 200 200

PACKAGES PER CASE: 8 12 12

PART NUMBER: 13400 CFW2400 CF2452

SIZE PER SHEET: 9" x 10" 13" x 10.25" 10.25 x 13

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

1 50

C-FOLD ABSORBENT, 

WINDSHIELD TOWELS, BLEACHED 

10 1/4" x 13"

FOLDED SIZE 3 1/2" x 10"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST CT COMMERCIAL CLASSIQUE OR EQUAL

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

PART B- RECYCLABLE PRODUCT
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 22



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$19.00 $30,400.00 $91,200.00 $17.25 $27,600.00 $82,800.00 $16.76 $26,816.00 $80,448.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

$15.30 $5,355.00 $16,065.00 $16.25 $5,687.50 $17,062.50 $16.48 $5,768.00 $17,304.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

PACKAGES PER CASE: 15 16 16

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SIZE PER SHEET: 9 x 10 10.2" x 9 9.5 X 10.5

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 268 250 250

ROYAL PAPER NOVA OR EQUAL 

PART NUMBER: 47000 37412 275 sk- natural

PACKAGES PER CASE: 20 16 16

4 350

SINGLE-FOLD TOWELS, 

UNBLEACHED,

 9 11/16" x 10 3/4 "

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

SIZE PER SHEET: 9 1/8 x 9 1/2 9.2" x 9.4" 9 x 9.5

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 200 334 250

KIMBERLY CLARK CRYSTAL WARE

PART NUMBER: 48300 01807 MFW33412

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

3 1,600

MULTI-FOLD TOWELS, BLEACHED, 

9 1/8" x 9 1/2"

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 23



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $33.50 $5,025.00 $15,075.00 $18.88 $2,832.00 $8,496.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

$20.00 $32,000.00 $96,000.00 $17.70 $28,320.00 $84,960.00 $18.30 $29,280.00 $87,840.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 800 800' N/A

PACKAGES PER CASE: 6 6 6

5

CT COMMERCIAL ELEMENT OR EQUAL

PART NUMBER: 45800 RTK800M 60335

6 1,600

ROLLED TOWELS NATURAL, 

W 7 7/8" x L 800", 1 3/4" CORE SIZE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

SIZE PER SHEET: 8" 8"

12 12

2068 60332 - White

Roll 7 7/8 x 720'

400' N/A

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

8" 7 7/8 X 350'

PART NUMBER:

NO BID

KIMBERLY CLARK ELEMENT OR EQUAL150

ROLLED TOWELS, BLEACHED, 

NON PERFORATED,

W 7 7/8" x L 400" WITH 1.5 CORE

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: 

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

SIZE PER SHEET: 

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 

PACKAGES PER CASE:

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 24



Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

ITEM

NO.

$43.75 $70,000.00 $210,000.00 $39.90 $63,840.00 $191,520.00 $27.55 $44,080.00 $132,240.00 

 /cs  /cs  /cs

Bidder's Price

Bidder's Price

Bidder's Price

Bidder's Price

PART A + PART B 

36 MONTH TOTAL
NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$967,931.16

Bidder's Price: LEFT BLANK

PART B - 36 MONTH TOTAL $472,597.50

PART A + PART B 

12 MONTH TOTAL

$406,518.00$525,487.50

Bidder's Price: LEFT BLANK

Bidder's Price: LEFT BLANK

PACKAGES PER CASE: 96 96 Roll 96/cs

PART B - 12 MONTH TOTAL $157,532.50
$135,506.00

Bidder's Price: LEFT BLANK

SIZE PER SHEET: 4 3/8 x 4 1/2 4.5" x 4" 4.0 x 3.5

SHEETS PER PACKAGE: 500 500 500

ROYAL PAPER BOARD WALK

PART NUMBER: 50000 37602 BWK 60118

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

7 1,600

COMMERCIAL ROLL, TOILET 

TISSUE 2" PLY, WHITE, NO 

LARGER THAN 4.5" x 4.5" W AND 

NO SMALLER THAN 3.8" L x 4.5" W

MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME: BAY WEST

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER PRICE

12 MONTH TOTAL 

(QTY x PRICE x 

12)

36 MONTH TOTAL 

(12 MTN TOTAL x 

3)

PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

$322,643.72

$175,162.50

$336,588.80

$1,009,766.40

$349,400.72

$1,048,202.16

X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____
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Bid Opening Date:  APRIL 10, 2013

Project Name: PAPER SUNDRIES

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (A) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:  Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

BIDS SOLICITED:       30                              BIDS RECEIVED:      6                               BIDS LOCAL:         5                            NO BID:      0      

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases
24 LEFT BLANK 24of emergency.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

       YES                     NO          YES                     NO          YES                     NO   

1 7 3-5

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

LAUN-DRY SUPPLY

EL PASO, TX

SOUTHWESTERN MILL 

DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

EL PASO, TX

SPECTRUM PAPER CO. INC.

EL PASO, TX

PAYMENT TERMS: Net - 30 Days 1% - 10 Days 1% - 20 Days

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation # :  2013-155

Same un it p rices provid ing no industry 

increases occur during th is t ime period

X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X X 

X 

X 

X 

X X 

X X 

APPROVED BY:___/s/____

DATE:__4/22/2013_  2013-155 PAPER SUNDRIES - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 26


