CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America Gity

2010

BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES

BID # 2013-156
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

DESERT GARAGE EP.SD. INC.
DOORSLLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ’
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ NET [ NeT [
ITEM PARTS FOR OVERHEAD DOORS - %DISCOUNT || - %pDISCOUNT [ | - _%pbDISCOUNT [
1 +_7 % MARKUP E +_5 % MARKUP EI + % MARKUP EI
Price List or Catalog
(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) AMARR AMARR DOOR MPANY
List Number
Dated
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER x] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] X] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER ] x] L]
OTHER ] ] ]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America Gity

2010

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES
BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID # 2013-156

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

DESERT GARAGE EPS.D. INC.
DOORS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ’
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [ NET [ NET [
ITEM ALTERNATE - %DISCOUNT || - %DISCOUNT || - _9%pIscount [ |
Parts for Overhead Doors
1 +_ 7 %mARKUP  [x] + 5  %MARKUP | X] + % MARKUP ]
Price List or Catalog
(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable) LIFT MASTER ARMARR DOOR
List Number
Dated
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER [X] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER ] [x] ]
OTHER O O O

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO oo
BID TABULATION Il

2010

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES BID # 2013-156

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

" DOORSLLC EP.SD. INC.
EL PASO, TX ’
PART B: OVERHEAD DOOR SERVICE LABOR
RATES
ITEM DESCRIPTION
$64.45 $75.00 $0.00
ITEM Emergency Repairs (After hours /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE
A 5:00 p.m. to 8:00 a.m.) $64.45 $150.00 $0.00
/HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE
$64.45 $55.00 $0.00
ITEM Emergency Repairs (Normal hours /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE
B 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.) $64.45 NO BID $0.00
/HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE
$47.45 $40.00 $0.00
ITEM | Maintenance / Repairs (Normal Hours 8:00 /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE
c a.m. to 5:00 p.m.) $47.45 NO BID $0.00
/HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE
$47.45 $40.00 $0.00
ITEM | One-Time Preventive Maintenance (Normal /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE /HOURLY RATE
D Hours 8:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m.) $47.45 NO BID $0.00
/HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE /HOLIDAY HOURLY RATE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES
BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID # 2013-156

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

DESERT GARAGE
DOORS LLC
EL PASO, TX

E.P.S.D. INC.
EL PASO, TX

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING (REPAIR RATES)

NARROW BUTT HINGE by OVERHEAD

NARROW BUTT HINGE by OVERHEAD

NARROW BUTT HINGE by OVERHEAD

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER DOOR CORP DOOR CORP DOOR CORP
PART # HI-1 B PART # HI-1 B PART # HI-1 B
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 10212 102678
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $0.62 $1.21 $
TEM lCITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $1.00 $1.27 $
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM $40.00
PART B) $47.45 MAD HOUR 1 0
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $48.45 $41.27 $

BOTTOM FIXTURE STANDARD by

BOTTOM FIXTURE STANDARD by

BOTTOM FIXTURE STANDARD by

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP
PART # BF-OHD PART # BF-OHD PART # BF-OHD
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 42377 99285591
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $5.00 $5.24 $
TEM|CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $7.15 $5.52 $
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM $80.00
PART B) $47.45 2-HR MAD $
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $54.60 $85.52 $

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE: TIAipﬂﬁa\ﬁ:%sb\{glueg;’ocurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exthed
BID TABULATION M

2010

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES BID # 2013-156

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

DESERT GARAGE E.P.S.D. INC.
DOORS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ’
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING (REPAIR RATES)
TOP FIXTURE by TOP FIXTURE by TOP FIXTURE by
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP

PART # TF-OHD PART # TF-OHD PART # TF-OHD

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 99000385 99418102

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $1.50 $2.05 $

'TE"" CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $2.14 $2.16 $
Iﬁﬁ?gg COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM $47.45 $80.00 $
)

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $49.59 $82.16 $

SLIDE LOCK by SLIDE LOCK by SLIDE LOCK by
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP

PART # LO-OHD PART # LO-OHD PART # LO-OHD

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 9900035 99321552

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $1.25 $2.33 $

'TEM|CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $1.80 $2.45 $
:;ﬁgcT)l; COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM $47.45 $40.00 $
)
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $49.25 $42.45 $

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES
BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

BID # 2013-156
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

DESERT GARAGE E.P.S.D. INC.
DOORS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ’
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING (REPAIR RATES)
SPRING ANCHOR BRACKET by SPRING ANCHOR BRACKET by SPRING ANCHOR BRACKET by
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP
PART # SAB-OHD PART # SAB-OHD PART # SAB-OHD
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 9934892 99000511
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $8.03 $1.88 $
TEM CITY's COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $11.50 $1.98 $
tﬁg(T)r; COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM $47.45 $80.00 $
) -
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $58.95 $81.98 $
STEP PLATE by STEP PLATE by STEP PLATE by
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP OVERHEAD DOOR CORP
PART # ST-3 PART # ST-3 PART # ST-3
BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 99000242 99000242
PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $0.42 $0.45 $
'TEM CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $0.60 $0.47 $
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM
PART B) $47.45 $40.00 $
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $48.05 $40.47 $

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exthed
BID TABULATION M

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES

2010

BID # 2013-156
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

DESERT GARAGE
DOORS LLC
EL PASO, TX

E.P.S.D. INC.
EL PASO, TX

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING (REPAIR RATES)

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER

CABLE, for 10' 1" DOOR,
ASSEMBLED by
OVERHEAD DOOR CORP
PART # CABA-OHD

CABLE, for 10' 1" DOOR,
ASSEMBLED by
OVERHEAD DOOR CORP
PART # CABA-OHD

CABLE, for 10' 1" DOOR,
ASSEMBLED by
OVERHEAD DOOR CORP
PART # CABA-OHD

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 99000378 9900370

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP) $1.45 $1.64 $
'TE"" CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT OR MARK-UP OR NET) $2.07 $1.73 $

LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM

PART B) $47.45 $80.00 $

TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $49.52 $81.73 $

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES

BID DATE: APRIL 3, 2013

4

BID # 2013-156
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

DESERT GARAGE E.P.S.D. INC.
DOORS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX ’
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.
NO OPTION OFFERED.
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 5% - 10 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES [ ] YES L] YES | |NO |
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 5 1
Within ____ consecutive calendar days.
In cases of emergency, delivery must be made within 24 4
hours or the next morning.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 24 4
order in cases of emergency.
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
BIDS SOLICITED: 9 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 BIDS LOCAL: 9 NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: ___ 4/9/13

2013-156 MAINTENANCE OF OVERHEAD DOORS AT CITY FACILITIES




