CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

‘l”l'

2010

BID ITEM: GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE

BID DATE: April 3,2013

BID # 2013-172
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

USD, INC.
EL PASO, TX

PART A: GMC/CHEVROLET - PROPRIETARY PARTS

PRICE

ADJUSTMENT

FACTOR

ITEM DESCRIPTION

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
N[=3 NeT [ NET [
ITEM GMC CHEVROLET PROPRIETARY PARTS - 50 % DISCOUNT m - % DISCOUNT EI - _ % DISCOUNT ]
1: + % MARKUP L] + % MARKUP (] + % MARKUP L]

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

Price List or Catalog
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

GMC /CHEVROLET

GMC /CHEVROLET

GMC /CHEVROLET

List Number
Dated

ACD LIST 0213 CITY
02/13

TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER
DISTRIBUTOR
JOBBER
DEALER
RETAILER
OTHER

Lodoo

[x]

-
wn
-

HRNNn

]

Lodoo

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)
OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE
INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

YES NO

YES NO

X

YES NO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: _/s/

DATE: _4/17/2013

2013-172 GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE: April 3,2013

BID # 2013-172
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

USD, INC.
EL PASO, TX

PART B: SERVICE LABOR RATES

SERVICE AND REPAIR OF VARIOUS GMC / CH

EVROLET MODELS PERFORMED

BY MECHANICS CERTIFIED BY GMC / CHEVROLET.

REGULAR HOURS:

N/A

$0.00 / Per Hour

$0.00 / Per Hour

AFTER HOURS/ EMERGENCY:

N/A

$0.00 / Per Hour

$0.00 / Per Hour

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER

FRONT HUB PART #12429205

FRONT HUB PART #12429205

FRONT HUB PART #12429205

PART NUMBER:
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER: FW293
1. [PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $330.57
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $165.29
LABOR COST (assuME (1) HOUR OF LABOR FROM PART B NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $165.29
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER REAR AXLE PART #26059962 REAR AXLE PART #26059962 REAR AXLE PART #26059962
PART NUMBER:
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER: NO BID - N/A
2. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): N/A
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): N/A
LABOR COST (assuME (1) HOUR OF LABOR FROM PART B NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) N/A

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

Is/

APPROVED BY:

DATE: _4/17/2013

2013-172 GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE
BID DATE: April 3,2013

BID # 2013-172

DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

USD, INC.
EL PASO, TX

SAMPLE PRICING

ITEM

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER

HEAD GASKET PART #12589226

HEAD GASKET PART #12589226

HEAD GASKET PART #12589226

PART NUMBER:

BIDDER PART NUMBER: NO BID N/A
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): N/A
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): N/A
LABOR COST (ASSUME (1) HOUR OF LABOR FROM PART B NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) N/A

ITEM

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER

FAN MOTOR PART #89022511

FAN MOTOR PART #89022511

FAN MOTOR PART #89022511

PART NUMBER:

BIDDER PART NUMBER: NO BID - N/A
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): N/A
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): N/A
LABOR COST (assuME (1) HOUR OF LABOR FROM PART B NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) N/A

ITEM

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER

TRANSMISSION PART #12552099

TRANSMISSION PART #12552099

TRANSMISSION PART #12552099

PART NUMBER:

BIDDER PART NUMBER: NO BID - N/A
PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): N/A
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): N/A
LABOR COST (assuME (1) HOUR OF LABOR FROM PART B NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) N/A

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: _/s/

DATE: _4/17/2013

2013-172 GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES




El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO ;
BID TABULATION II

2010

BID # 2013-172
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

BID ITEM: GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE

BID DATE: April 3,2013

USD, INC.
EL PASO, TX
SAMPLE PRICING
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER FUEL PUMP MODULE PART FUEL PUMP MODULE PART FUEL PUMP MODULE PART
PART NUMBER: #25331861 #25331861 #25331861
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER: MV1743
6. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $517.12
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $258.56
LABOR COST (AssuME (1) HOUR OF LABOR FROM PART B NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $258.56
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER
PART NUMBER: GEAR REM PART #26062311 GEAR REM PART #26062311 GEAR REM PART #26062311
ITEM |BIDDER PART NUMBER: 36-0012
7. |PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $932.74
CITY'S COST, AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $466.37
LABOR COST (ASSUME (1) HOUR OF LABOR FROM PART B NO BID
TOTAL COST (CITY'S COST + LABOR COST) $466.37
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1-7) $890.22 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: _/s/

DATE: _4/17/2013

2013-172 GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE

BID DATE: April 3,2013

4

BID # 2013-172
DEPARTMENT: GENERAL SERVICES

USD, INC.
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES

X

NO

YES

NO

YES NO

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within consecutive calendar days.

1

Within hours or overnight after receipt of verbal
order in cases of emergency.

4

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 8 BIDS RECEIVED:

1

BIDS LOCAL:

7

NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY: _/s/

DATE: _4/17/2013 2013-172 GMC/CHEVROLET LIGHT DUTY PROPRIETARY PARTS AND SERVICE - GENERAL SERVICES




