Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

\I”l!

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department:. GENERAL SERVICES

EL PASO
CREATIVE MAILBOX
DESIGN, LLC DBA (?:EAEIEEOR";?GF‘?SQ AU'I;O:ﬂSLI;?g;EICE THE INK HOUSE KNIGHT SIGN
CREATIVE SIGN GRAPHICS SYSTEMS PRINTING CO. INDUSTRIES, INC.
T[:\I:AS;(:\N?L EL PASO, TX INCORPORATED EL PASO, TX TUSCALOOSA, AL
’ EL PASO, TX
PART 1 - EXTERIOR SIGNAGE
DESCRIPTION REF
Fl(m# TEXT QTY COST COST COST COST COST
1ST FLOOR DEPARTMENT | —
MAIN ENTRANCE
PRIMARY SIGN CITY 1
FABRICATION AND 1 CITY HALL 1 $10,972.75 $13,300.90 NO BID NO BID $5,074.00
INSTALLATION
MAIN ENTRANCE
SECONDARY SIGN AND 2 EXECUTIVE CENTER 1 $6,274.75 $6,940.00 NO BID NO BID $3,390.00
INSTALLATION
MONUMENT SIGN CITY 1
FABRICATION AND 3 CITY HALL 1 $9,073.75 $9,940.00 NO BID NO BID $5,223.00
INSTALLATION EXECUTIVE CENTER
BUILDING REAR LIGHT
BOX
(FREEWAY VISIBLE) 4 CITY 1 1 $10,081.75 $10,650.00 NO BID $8,975.00
FABRICATION AND
PLUS $1,500.00 - NO BID
INSTALLATION QTY 25 Exterior
doors entries
service areas
$36,403.00 $40,830.90 NO BID NO BID $22,662.00
TOTAL COST - PART 1
BIDDER'S PRICE
$42,330.90

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE




El Paso
[ % |

All-America City

||”|r

2010

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department:. GENERAL SERVICES

EL PASO
CREATIVE MAILBOX
DESIGN, LLC DBA (I::):EAE:EOR";?G"?SBQ AULOI'nSLEFI)'ROI;EICE THE INK HOUSE KNIGHT SIGN
CREATIVE SIGN R o R PRINTING CO. || INDUSTRIES, INC.
T[;EMS;iNsL EL PASO, TX INCORPORATED EL PASO, TX TUSCALOOSA, AL
’ EL PASO, TX
PART 2 - INTERIOR SIGNAGE
1st FLOOR DEPARTMENTS F|C% # TEXT DIMENSIONS MEDIA COST COST COST COST COST
HUMAN RESOURCES &
HUMAN RESOURCES ) CAST ALUMINUM,
FINANGIAL SERVICES | 5 FUNMAN RESOURCES | arLemTers | CAST AL $1,986.06 $3,093.20 $1,696.00 NO BID $1,174.00
HUMAN RESOURCES & HUMAN RESOURCES CAST ALUMINUM,
FINANCIAL SERVICES | 6 P N RESOUNCES | 4" LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH | $2,024.63 $3,253.20 $1,696.00 NO BID $1,811.00
RECEPTION TEAL SQUARE
MUNICIPAL CLERK " CAST ALUMINUM,
i 5 MUNICIPAL CLERK 4 LETTERs | CRST ALY $1,117.94 $2,108.00 $742.00 NO BID $978.00
CAST ALUMINUM,
MUNICIPAL CLERK 6 MUNICIPAL CLERK 4" LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH |  $1,156.53 $2,332.00 $742.00 NO BID $1,017.00
RECEPTION
TEAL SQUARE
PURCHASINGENTRY | & PURCHASING 4 LETTERS | oL $913.68 $1,660.00 $530.00 NO BID $827.00
OWN
SURCHASING CAST ALUMINUM,
frbviiariis 6 PURCHASING 4" LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH | $952.27 $1,772.00 $530.00 NO BID $864.00
TEAL SQUARE
CITY COUNCIL " CAST ALUMINUM,
CHAMBERS ENTRY 5 CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS | 4" LETTERS | ~acizoct $1,630.25 $2,668.00 $1,060.00 NO BID $1,132.00
APPROX. SINTRA WITH 14~
ELEVATOR DIRECTORY MUNICIPAL CLERK, " "
TOR DR 7 |purcHshGORECTONALs | 24X2¢" | ACRYLCORP, $534.40 $560.00 NO BID NO BID $265.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO All-America City
BID TABULATION FORM ‘|||l'

2010

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

EL PASO
CREATIVE MAILBOX
DESIGN, LLC DBA gﬁé‘ggggﬁﬁ:g AULOI"SSE?QZE'CE THE INK HOUSE KNIGHT SIGN
CREATIVE SIGN U o PRINTING CO. || INDUSTRIES, INC.
Tli\linsr!iN?L & PASO X NCoROmTED ELPASO,TX || TUSCALOOSA, AL
’ EL PASO, TX
PART 2 - INTERIOR SIGNAGE
2nd FLOOR DEPARTMENTS Fl(% # TEXT DIMENSIONS MEDIA COST COST COST COST COST
CITY COUNCIL ) CAST ALUMINUM,
CITY COUNCILENTRY | 5 iyt eLETTERS | O A $2,082.38 $1,772.00 $1,378.00 NO BID $1,434.00
CITY MANAGERENTRY | 5 CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE | 4" LETTERS Cgigﬁ'g’x)'m"’ $1,336.61 $1.772.00 $1.060.00 NO BID $1,132.00
CITY MANAGER CAST ALUMINUM,
6 CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE | 4"LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH |  $1,375.20 $1,884.00 $1,060.00 NO BID $1,172.00
RECEPTION
TEAL SQUARE
. . CAST ALUMINUM,
CITY ATTORNEY ENTRY | 5 CITY ATTORNEY'S OFFICE | 4" LETTERS | Cho fLoMIL) $1,387.68 $1,884.00 $1,060.00 NO BID $1,172.00
CITY ATTORNEY CAST ALUMINUM,
o 6 CITY ATTORNEY'S OFFICE | 4"LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH |  $1.426.26 $1,996.00 $1,060.00 NO BID $1,211.00
CEPTION
TEAL SQUARE
MAYOR ENTRY 5 MAYOR'S OFFICE 4" LETTERs | CASTALUMINUM, o) 196 97 $1,100.00 $742.00 NO BID $906.00
DARK BROWN
MAYURS UFFICE CITY
ELEVATOR DIRECTORY COUNCIL OFFICES CITY APPROX. SINTRA WITH 14
o 7 MANAGER'S OFFICE CITY | 24" X 24" ACRYLIC CAP, $534.40 $560.00 NO BID NO BID $265.00
ATTORNEY'S OFFICE, APPROX. 24" X 4"
DIRECTIONAI S
TOTAL COST - PART 2 $19,655.26 $28,414.40 $13,356.00 NO BID $15,360.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|V

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE
EL PASO
CREATIVE MAILBOX
DESIGN, LLC DBA gﬁég:ggféﬁgg AUE’&SLE?;;E'CE THE INK HOUSE KNIGHT SIGN
CREATIVE SIGN GRAPHICS SYSTEMS PRINTING CO. INDUSTRIES, INC.
T?AI:IISF!(:NEL EL PASO, TX INCORPORATED EL PASO, TX TUSCALOOSA, AL
’ EL PASO, TX
PART 3 - OFFICE/ROOM INDENTIFICATION AND MISCELLANEOUS SIGNAGE
SIGN TYPE SIZE QTY CoST cosT cosT cosT COST
OFFICE NAME PLAQUES 11" X8" 120 $78.91 $60.00 NO BID $79.00 $118.00
TOTAL COST $9,469.20 $7,200.00 $0.00 $9,480.00 $14,160.00
CONFERENCE ROOM PLAQUES R
(SLIDING; VACANT / IN USE) 11" X8 20 $78.91 $92.00 NO BID $134.00 $134.00
TOTAL COST $1,578.20 $1,840.00 $0.00 $2,680.00 $2,680.00
SYMBOL / UTILITY SIGNS ADA 8"X8* 50 $59.38 $72.50 NO BID $70.00 $90.00
TOTAL COST $2,969.00 $3,625.00 $0.00 $3,500.00 $4,500.00

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO All-America City
BID TABULATION FORM ‘|||l'

2010

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013

Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

EL PASO
CREATIVE MAILBOX
DESIGN, LLC DBA gﬁé‘g:é’;gféﬁgg AUEMSL?&F\EICE THE INK HOUSE KNIGHT SIGN
CREATIVE SIGN GRAPHICS SYSTEMS PRINTING CO. INDUSTRIES, INC.
Tli\EMs;iNFsL EL PASO, TX INCORPORATED EL PASO, TX TUSCALOOSA, AL
' EL PASO, TX
PART 3 - OFFICE/ROOM INDENTIFICATION AND MISCELLANEOQOUS SIGNAGE
SIGN TYPE SIZE QTY COST COST COST CoSsT COST
DESK PLAQUES INCLUDING STANDS 10" X4" 100 $47.07 $75.00 NO BID $49.00 $58.00
TOTAL COST $4,707.00 $7,500.00 $0.00 $4,900.00 $5,800.00
DESK PLAQUES INCLUDING STANDS 10" X4" 50 $45.20 $75.00 NO BID $44.00 $58.00
TOTAL COST $2,260.00 $3,750.00 NO BID $2,200.00 $2,900.00
TOTAL COST - PART 3 $20,983.40 $23,915.00 NO BID $22,760.00 $30,040.00
$19,655.26 $28,414.40 $13,356.00 NO BID $15,360.00
TOTAL COST - PART 2 BIDDER'S PRICE
$13,356.00
TOTAL COST - PART 1 $36,403.00 $40,830.90 NO BID NO BID $22,662.00
$77,041.66 $93,160.30 $13,356.00 $22,760.00 $68,062.00
TOTAL COST - (PARTS 1’ 2’ 3) BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$94,660.30 $13,356.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE




Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Extrzd

All-America City

!I”IV

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department:. GENERAL SERVICES

CREATIVE MAILBOX
DESIGN, LLC DBA
CREATIVE SIGN
DESIGNS
TAMPA, FL

DBARCO INC. DBA
CHEEPER SIGNS &
GRAPHICS
EL PASO, TX

EL PASO
AUTOMATED OFFICE
& INDUSTRIAL
SYSTEMS
INCORPORATED
EL PASO, TX

THE INK HOUSE
PRINTING CO.
EL PASO, TX

KNIGHT SIGN
INDUSTRIES, INC.
TUSCALOOSA, AL

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING
THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S)
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE

x]

x]

[x]

x]

]

OR NET - 30 DAYS

CONTRACT: ADD 25 %
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL I:l |:| E l:’
TERM OF THE CONTRACT: ADD 37%
NO OPTION OFFERED |:| I:I I:I I:I D
5% - 10 DAYS
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS | LEFT BLANK | NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES ENO []

YESE No [ ]

ves[ no[ |

Visa or Mastercard

ves[ |no[ |

YES[ X | NOI:I

Within consecutive calendar days.

approvals no
exceptions

LEFT BLANK
Only
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 50 - Lead time is 3-
6 weeks after
45 60 21 90

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE




Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

\ I l I l /
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department:. GENERAL SERVICES

PDN SSL, LLC
DBA SUPERIOR
SIGN & LIGHTING
EL PASO, TX
PART 1 - EXTERIOR SIGNAGE
DESCRIPTION REF
FIGURE # TEXT QTY COosT COosT COosT COosT COSsT
1STFLOOR DEPARTMENT | —
MAIN ENTRANCE
PRIMARY SIGN CITY 1
FABRICATION AND CITY HALL ! $11,467.00
INSTALLATION
MAIN ENTRANCE
SECONDARY SIGN AND EXECUTIVE CENTER 1 $4,850.00
INSTALLATION
MONUMENT SIGN CITY 1
FABRICATION AND CITY HALL 1 $14,906.00
INSTALLATION EXECUTIVE CENTER
BUILDING REAR LIGHT
BOX
(FREEWAY VISIBLE) CITY 1 1 $8,007.00
FABRICATION AND
INSTALLATION
TOTAL COST - PART 1 $39,230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE




Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City

\l”'!

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

PDN SSL, LLC
DBA SUPERIOR
SIGN & LIGHTING
EL PASO, TX
PART 2 - INTERIOR SIGNAGE
1st FLOOR DEPARTMENTS F|(% # TEXT DIMENSIONS MEDIA COST COST COST COSsT COST
HUMAN RESOURCES &
HUMAN RESOURCES . CAST ALUMINUM,
FINANCEL SERVICES |5 FINANCIAL SERVICES | 4 LETTERS | “pARK BROWN $1,047.00
HUMAN RESOURCES & CAST ALUMINUM,
FINANCIAL SERVICES | 6 PUANNRESDRNCES | 4" LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH | $1,047.00
RECEPTION TEAL SQUARE
MUNICIPAL CLERK . CAST ALUMINUM,
CNTRY 5 MUNICIPAL CLERK o LeTTERs | O $476.00
CAST ALUMINUM,
tinebocil 6 MUNICIPAL CLERK 4" LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH | $476.00
TEAL SQUARE
. CAST ALUMINUM,
PURCHASINGENTRY | 5 PURCHASING 4 LETTERs | Do LRE I $340.00
CAST ALUMINUM,
Priviarie 6 PURCHASING 4" LETTERS | DARKBROWNWITH | $340.00
TEAL SQUARE
CITY COUNCIL . CAST ALUMINUM,
CHAMBERS ENTRY 5 | CITYCOUNCIL CHAMBERS | 4" LETTERs | Chor -l $646.00
ELEVATOR DIRECTORY | MUNICIPAL CLERK, ’;:,P)Tgi(,; ioheed $811.00
1st FLOOR PURCHASING DIRECTIONALS ’ :

APPROX. 24" X 4"

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Isl

DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE




Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
ill-lllma’ica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department:. GENERAL SERVICES

PDN SSL, LLC
DBA SUPERIOR
SIGN & LIGHTING
EL PASO, TX
PART 2 - INTERIOR SIGNAGE
2nd FLOOR DEPARTMENTS F|(% # TEXT DIMENSIONS MEDIA COST COST COST COSsT COST

CITY COUNCIL . CAST ALUMINUM,

CITY COUNCIL ENTRY 5 REPRESENTATIVES aLETTERs | O $884.00
. . CAST ALUMINUM,

CITY MANAGERENTRY | 5 CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE | 4"LETTERS | [ tCiiy $646.00
CAST ALUMINUM,

C'Pé(mmgﬁ'a 6 CITY MANAGER'S OFFICE | 4"LETTERS | DARK BROWN WITH $646.00

TEAL SQUARE

. . CAST ALUMINUM,

CITY ATTORNEYENTRY | 5 CITY ATTORNEY'S OFFICE | 4LETTERS | b 0l $680.00
CAST ALUMINUM,

C'gég%%':l“ 6 CITY ATTORNEY'S OFFICE | 4" LETTERS | DARK BROWN WITH $680.00

TEAL SQUARE

. . CAST ALUMINUM,

MAYOR ENTRY 5 MAYOR'S OFFICE aLETTERS | $442.00

MAYURS UFFICE CITY

ELEVATOR DIRECTORY COUNCIL OFFICES CITY APPROX. SINTRA WITH 14

amarloos |7 MANAGER'S OFFICE CITY | 24" X 24" ACRYLIC CAP, $811.00
ATTORNEY'S OFFICE, APPROX. 24" X 4"

DIRECTIONAI'S
TOTAL COST - PART 2 $9,972.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Isl

DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE




Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
|V
2010
Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE
PDN SSL, LLC
DBA SUPERIOR
SIGN & LIGHTING
EL PASO, TX
PART 3 - OFFICE/ROOM INDENTIFICATION AND MISCELLANEOUS SIGNAGE
SIGN TYPE SIZE QTY CoST cosT cosT cosT COST
OFFICE NAME PLAQUES 11" X8" 120 $177.00
TOTAL COST $21,240.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
CONFERENCE ROOM PLAQUES wygn
(SLIDING; VACANT / IN USE) 1"xs 2 $177.00
TOTAL COST $3,540.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SYMBOL / UTILITY SIGNS ADA 8"X8* 50 $150.00
TOTAL COST $7,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

10



Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013

Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
|V
2010
Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

PDN SSL, LLC
DBA SUPERIOR
SIGN & LIGHTING
EL PASO, TX
PART 3 - OFFICE/ROOM INDENTIFICATION AND MISCELLANEOQOUS SIGNAGE
SIGN TYPE SIZE QTY COST COST COST cosT COST
DESK PLAQUES INCLUDING STANDS 10" X4" 100 $110.00
TOTAL COST $11,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
DESK PLAQUES INCLUDING STANDS 10" X4" 50 $110.00
TOTAL COST $5,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST - PART 3 $48,780.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST - PART 2 $9,972.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST - PART 1 $39,230.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST - (PARTS 1, 2, 3) $97,982.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE

11




NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 19, 2013
Project Name: CITY HALL INTERIOR & EXTERIOR SIGNAGE

CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso

All-America City

VIlIlV

2010

Solicitation #: 2013-229
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

PDN SSL, LLC
DBA SUPERIOR
SIGN & LIGHTING
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING

THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S)
EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE
CONTRACT:

[x]

[ ]

[ ]

[]

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

]

NO OPTION OFFERED

[ ]

]
[

|
(]

(L]

PAYMENT TERMS:

1% - 10 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES |Z|N0 |:

YES |:|NO |:

YES DO I:

YES |:|N0 |:

YES |:|NO |:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within consecutive calendar days.

10

BIDS SOLICITED: 11 BIDS RECEIVED: 6

BIDS LOCAL: 4

NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: 6/26/2013

2013-229 CITY HALL INTERIOR EXTERIOR SIGNAGE - GENERAL SERVICE

12



