CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS

El Paso

Al-Rmerieatily

-

2010

BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 7, 2013

Solicitation #: 2013-256

Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

AINING CONPARISONS AND EQUAL RS
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

L c i NTROI .
ADAPCQ, INC. LARKE MOS”Q‘JLCJ TO CONTROL UNlVAR ES
SANFORD, FL ROSELLE, IL DALLAS, TX
ITEM DESCRIFTION Eim;ED UNIT OF UNIT PRIGE | TOTALANNUAL | S6MONTHS | )\ oo |TOTALANNUAL|  SSMONTHS | - opyce | TOTALANNUAL| 36 MONTIHS
. MEASURE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. QUANTITY ~
' : 55 _ A »
] . LARVACIDE OIL 16 GALLON | $557.20 $8,915.20. | $26,745.60 $825.00 $13,200.00 | $39,600.00 $367.95 $5,887.20 | $17,661.60
: v DRUM )
DRUMS i /DR BIDDER'S PRICE | BIDDER'S PRICE
. $8,923.20 $26,769.60
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME BVA 2 CLARKE COCO BEAR KONTROL LARVICIDE OIL
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 70589-1 8329-93 #73748-10
VARVACIDE GRANULES
(LARVACIDE AGENT - 100 40 1. BAG| $322.00 | $32,200.00 | $96,600.00 | $322.00 | $32,200.00 | $96,600.00 $114.00 $11,400.00 | $34,200.00
2. | METHOPRENE GROWTH ' . ~
REGULATOR) BAGS |
$114.00 /IBG
ALTOSID XRG -
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ALTOSID SBG ZOECON ALTOSID XR-G ALTOSID SBG
_ ALTOSID XRG 2724-561; - —
EPA REGISTRATION NO. ALTOSID SBG 2724-489 2724-451 #2724-489
VARVACIDE GRANULES '
AGENT-BACILLUS . , . o L _ .
; . ) 150 40 Ib. BAG| $203.20 30,480.00 91,440.00 80.40 12,060.00 36,180.00 88.47 13,270.50 | $39,811.50
3. SPHAERICUS (SOIL s $ s $ s s $ $ $
‘ AGS
BACTERIUM) B *IBG
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME SPHERATAX SPH 50 VALENT BIOSCIENCES VECTOBAC G TEKNAR G VALENT
§4268-2 , —
v *PLEASE SEE ATTACHED MANUFACTURER LETTER 73049-10 EPA #73049-403
EPA REGISTRATION NO. iy ety

APPROVED BY: \4/ CVW %ﬂa/
oate:_8/¢3/1 '

2013-256 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

Fl Paso

Ali-fimeticatily

»

2010

BID ITEM: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS
BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 7, 2013

Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

Solicitation #: 2013-256

UNIVARES

APPROVED BY:V)/ k N
DATE: ?[ 2/1%

ADAPCO, 'N C. CLARKE MoslilllélTO CONTROL
SANFORD, FL ROSELLE, iL DALLAS, TX
o = N\\wxéxATE'rD' g @&c&‘?&
STIM v -
ITEM UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL | 36 MONTHS TOTAL ANNUAL| 36 MONTHS TOTAL ANNUAL| 36 MONTHS
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL || oo | UNITPRICE | 0 oniee™ | rotavprice | UNTPRICE | price | TotaLprice | UNTPRICE PRICE | TOTAL PRICE
NO. QUANTITY
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULF
FOGGER) ADULTICIDE 4%- 55 _
i 10% (RESMETHRIN & 18 GALLON || $6,521.90 | $104,350.40 | $313,051.20 | $2,943.05 | $47,088.80 | $141,266.40 | $928.95 $14,863.20 | $44,589.60
. DRUM
PIPERONYL BUTOXIDE) DRUMS DR
READY TO USE
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME SCOURGE 4% +12% CLARKE BIOMIST 3+15 UNIVAR KONTROL 4-4
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 432-716 EPA #73748-4
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULV)
FOGGER AEROSOL: 55
5 ADULTICIDE 19/3% 24 GALLON | $1,648.90 | $39,573.60 | $118,720.80 | $1,980.00 | $47,520.00 | $142,560.00 | $1,533.95 | $36,814.80 | $110,444.40
. - » DRUM :
(CHLORPYRIFOS) READY TO | prums * DR
USE
YROFOS 1.5 ULV . _
. ' _ *550 GL'S OR MORE CLARKE MOSQUITOMIST 1.5 CONTROL SOLUTIONS PYROFOS 1.5
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME <550 GL'S $1993.75 PER 55 GL DRUM.
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 53883-251 EPA #53883-251
E S B e S e b O G R D SRR Y R R R
(ITEMS 1-5) ANNUAL GRAND TOTAL $215,519.20 $152,068.80 $82,235.70
BIDDER'S PRICE $215,527.20 BIDDER'S PRICE $82,235.57 |
(ITEMS 1-5) 36 MONTHS GRAND TOTAL $646,557.60 $456,206.40 $246,707.10
' BIDDER'S PRICE $646,581.60 L
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-256 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES



L i 1 Lot

El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO ez
BID TABULATION | ]

2010

VBID ITEM: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS ' Solicitation #: 2013-256
BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 7, 2013 ' : Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
(i R K i i 5

CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL
" NG
ROSELLE, iL

ADAPCO, INC.
SANFORD, FL

UNIVAR ES
DALLAS, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. ’

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE / Q ‘ X
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT. -

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED 'P'RIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY , . ' . . : «
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES vo [ ] ves [x] N0 [ ] ves [x] o | ]
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: ' - .

o . * 3-5 ARO 1-5
Within ___consecutive calendar days.
Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal- **24 . .

**ADDITIONAL FREIGHT CHARGES MAY BE REQUIRED FOR 24‘ H RS . 48

Order in cases Of Emergency_ DELIVERY OF EMERGENCY ORDERS REQUIRED OVERNIGHT

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: M/"V‘ ) \

DATE: %[ 13/13 : 2013-256 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES 3



- El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO bt
BID TABULATION [}

2010

BID ITEM: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS . Solicitation #: 2013-256
BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 7, 2013 ’ Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS . .
DALLAS, TX DALLAS, TX
! (ALTERNATE)
ITEM DESCRIPTION Eiﬂm}f” UNITOF ||\ beicp | TOTAL ANNUAL | 36MONTHS | oo e [TOTAL ANNUAL| 36 MONTHS Ut;lIT price |TOTALANNUAL| 36 MONTHS
NO MEASURE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE
, QUANTITY
55 . |
i LARVACIDE OIL 16 GALLON | $558.25 $8,932.00 $26,796.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
. : DRUM
DRUMS -
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ' BVA-2
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 70589-1BVA 2 MOSQUITO LARVICIDE OIL
VARVACIDE GRANULES
(LARVACIDE AGENT - . . ) o '
1 40 Ib. BAG| $322.00 32,200.00 6,600.00 114.00 11,400.00 ,200.0 . . .
2. METHOPRENE GROWTH 00 $ $ ' $9 $ $11,400 $34,200.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
REGULATOR) BAGS .
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME WELLMARK ALTOSID XRG WELLMARK ALTOSID SBG
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 2724-451 EPA REGISTRATION #2724-489
VARVACIDE GRANULES
AGENT-BACILLUS ; . . o
150 40 Ib. BAG| $225.60 33,840. 101,520. 319.38 7,907. ,721. 0.00 . .
3. SPHAERICUS (SOIL | $225 $ 0.00 | $101,520.00 | $319.3 $4 00 | $143,721.00 $ $0.00 $0.00
BACTERIUM) BAGS
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ALL PRO SUSTAIN MBG VALENT BIOSCIENCES VECTOLEX CG
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 769-992 EPA REGISTRATION #73049-20

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

. APPROVED BY: ‘4/¢

DATE: 9/13(13 ‘ 2013-256 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES 4



| S— | S WP G W R

_ El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO fmj
BID TABULATION | Wi

2010
BID ITEM: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS Solicitation #: 2013-256
BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 7, 2013 Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS i
DALLAS, TX DALLAS, TX
' (ALTERNATE)
: . .
ITEM UNIT OF TOTAL ANNUAL | 36 MONTHS TOTAL ANNUAL| 36 MONTHS - TOTAL ANNUAL| 36 MONTHS
NO DESCRIPTION Q’tm’T’I‘TLY measure | UNIT PRICE PRICE ToraLprice || UNITPRICE PRICE ToTAL PRICE | UNIT PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULF
FOGGER) ADULTICIDE 4%- 55
4 10% (RESMETHRIN & 16 GALLON | $928.95 | $14,863.20 | $44,589.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
) PIPERONYL BUTOXIDE) DRUMS DRUM
READY TO USE
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ALL PRO EVOLVER 4-4
EPA REGISTRATION NO. 769-982
ULTRA LOW VOLUME (ULV)
FOGGER AEROSOL: 55 A
5 ADULTICIDE 19/3% 24 GALLON | $1,566.95 | $37,606.80 | $112,82040 | NOBID | NOBID NO BID $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
. DRUM
(CHLORPYRIFOS) READY TO | prums
: USE ,
BIDDER'S BRAND / NAME ALL PRO VECTOFOS 1.5 ULV
ISTRATION NO 53883-251-769
R § EEL R R R T R AL R
(ITEMS 1-5) ANNUAL GRAND TOTAL $127,442.00 $59,307.00
BIDDER'S PRICE - NOT LISTED
(ITEMS 1-5) 36 MONTHS GRAND TOTAL $382,326.00 $177,921.00
BIDDER'S PRICE - NOT LISTED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual awardlexecu-tion of contract.

4
APPROVED BY: l/y ‘7/
DATE: ?Z '3 l !g 2013-256 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES 5



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-fAmericaly

a

2010

BID ITEM: MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS
BID OPENING DATE: AUGUST 7, 2013

gk

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. 4

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF
THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE
ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

Solicitation #: 2013-256

Department: ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

'J.C. EHRLICH CO., INC. dba
TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
‘ DALLAS, TX

J.C. EHRLICH CO., INC. dba
TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS
DALLAS, TX
(ALTERNATE)

Jorder in cases of emergency.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS: ) NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY ;

PROCUREMENT GARD: ves [x] wo || YES No [ ] ves [ | N0 [ ]
BI.DD.ER S PROMISEF) DELIVERY: LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ____hours or overnight after receipt of verbal AS SPECIFIED AS SPECIlFlED

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS RECEIVED: 5

BIDS LOCAL: 2

NO BID: 0

APPROVED BY: V]/'y-
DATE: 3{ /?Z l 3

BIDS SOLICITED: 7
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2013-256 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS - ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES




