
ITEM

NO.

1. 600 $15.89 $9,534.00 $28,602.00 $15.99 $9,594.00 $28,782.00 

2. 400 $15.89 $6,356.00 $19,068.00 $14.95 $5,980.00 $17,940.00 

 B idder's Price 

$2,990.00 

B idder's Price

$8,970.00

3. 60 $15.89 $953.40 $2,860.20 $15.99 $959.40 $2,878.20 

4. 20 $15.89 $317.80 $953.40 $14.95 $299.00 $897.00 

5. 1000 $12.99 $12,990.00 $38,970.00 $11.99 $11,990.00 $35,970.00 

6. 80 $11.99 $959.20 $2,877.60 $11.99 $959.20 $2,877.60 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

D100

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

WOMEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN 

BLOUSE SS - FRENCH BLUE

MEN'S POLO SHIRT - FRENCH BLUE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER L508 FRENCH BLUE PORT 5230

LADIES POLO SHIRT - FRENCH BLUE

L500 PORT FRENCH BLUE D112W

K500P PORT FRENCH BLUE

5509 FRENCH BLUE PORT 1245

L618 FRENCH BLUE PORT 5280

DESCRIPTION

WOMEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT 

LS - FRENCH BLUE

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014

GROUP I - SUN METRO COACH OPERATOR / TRANSIT SUPERVISOR UNIFORMS

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

MEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT LS 

- FRENCH BLUE

MEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT SS 

- FRENCH BLUE

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

5608 FRENCH BLUE PORT 1280

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

Solicitation #:  2014-061BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 1



ITEM

NO.

7. 900 $18.59 $16,731.00 $50,193.00 $16.95 $15,255.00 $45,765.00 

8. 60 $19.00 $1,140.00 $3,420.00 $16.95 $1,017.00 $3,051.00 

9. 200 $17.47 $3,494.00 $10,482.00 $16.95 $3,390.00 $10,170.00 

10. 15 $17.00 $255.00 $765.00 $16.95 $254.25 $762.75 

11. 60 $16.49 $989.40 $2,968.20 $15.99 $959.40 $2,878.20 

12. 20 $16.49 $329.80 $989.40 $15.99 $319.80 $959.40 

NO BID

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

WOMEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN 

BLOUSE LS - WHITE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP SS37WD 5280

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 8468 8473

MEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT LS 

- WHITE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP SS360BWD 1280

NO BID

MEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO SHORT - 

NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIES LR542NV 2475

WOMEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO SHORT - 

NAVY

NO BID

NO BID

2568

WOMEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO PANT - 

NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 8568 8568

NO BID

MEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO PANT - 

NAVY

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIES 2112372NV

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 2



ITEM

NO.

13. 60 $14.99 $899.40 $2,698.20 $11.75 $705.00 $2,115.00 

14. 20 $14.99 $299.80 $899.40 $11.75 $235.00 $705.00 

15. 100 $15.99 $1,599.00 $4,797.00 $16.75 $1,675.00 $5,025.00 

16. 60 $18.99 $1,139.40 $3,418.20 $16.75 $1,005.00 $3,015.00 

17. 20 $3.75 $75.00 $225.00 $3.75 $75.00 $225.00 

18. 10 $3.99 $39.90 $119.70 $5.90 $59.00 $177.00 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

WOMEN'S T.V. CROSS TIE - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER TIEL0DN CT10

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP PT39 841PL

MEN'S CLIP-ON TIE - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER TIE20DN CL22

NO BID

MEN'S EASY FIT PLEATED PANT - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP PT32NV 741P

WOMEN'S EASY FIT PLEATED PANT - 

NAVY

NO BID

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PORT K420P K500

WOMEN'S 50/50 PIQUE SPORT SHIRT SS - 

WHITE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PORT L420 L500

NO BID

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

MEN'S 50/50 PIQUE SPORT SHIRT SS - 

WHITE
NO BID

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 3



ITEM

NO.

19. 100 $26.94 $2,694.00 $8,082.00 $19.98 $1,998.00 $5,994.00 

20. 100 $23.98 $2,398.00 $7,194.00 $18.99 $1,899.00 $5,697.00 

21. 100 $69.99 $6,999.00 $20,997.00 $28.99 $2,899.00 $8,697.00 

22. 150 $33.99 $5,098.50 $15,295.50 $14.25 $2,137.50 $6,412.50 

23. 250 $6.39 $1,597.50 $4,792.50 $3.39 $847.50 $2,542.50 

24. 20 $6.39 $127.80 $383.40 $3.39 $67.80 $203.40 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BASEBALL CAP - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER OTTO 31-924

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PORT JP54 J305 & L305

BASEBALL CAP - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER OTTO 31-924

NO BID

JACKET - MEN'S & WOMEN'S

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PORT J777 TJ15

WINDBREAKER - MEN & WOMEN

NO BID

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER 920 EDWARDS 790 565 & 465

SWEATER VEST - MEN'S & WOMEN'S

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER 921 EDWARDS 791 791 & 461

NO BID

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

SWEATER - MEN'S & WOMEN'S NO BID

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 4



ITEM

NO.

25. 150 $6.79 $1,018.50 $3,055.50 $2.49 $373.50 $1,120.50 

26. 20 $6.79 $135.80 $407.40 $2.49 $49.80 $149.40 

27. 60 $38.99 $2,339.40 $7,018.20 $71.99 $4,319.40 $12,958.20 

28. 5 $38.99 $194.95 $584.85 $71.99 $359.95 $1,079.85 

29. 60 $15.29 $917.40 $2,752.20 $14.99 $899.40 $2,698.20 

30. 5 $15.29 $76.45 $229.35 $14.99 $74.95 $224.85 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

VEST - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 4490 7490

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER TACT 8000B 3830

VEST - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 4490 7490

NO BID

BLAZER - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER TACT 8000N 3830

BLAZER - BLACK

NO BID

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PORT & CO CP90 CP94

BEANIE - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PORT & CO CP90 CP94

NO BID

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

BEANIE - NAVY NO BID

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 5



ITEM

NO.

31. 100 $51.00 $5,100.00 $15,300.00 $33.99 $3,399.00 $10,197.00 $35.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 

32. 20 $51.00 $1,020.00 $3,060.00 $33.99 $679.80 $2,039.40 $35.00 $700.00 $2,100.00 

33. 50 $46.99 $2,349.50 $7,048.50 $39.99 $1,999.50 $5,998.50 $44.49 $2,224.50 $6,673.50 

34. 200 $38.00 $7,600.00 $22,800.00 $33.50 $6,700.00 $20,100.00 $39.49 $7,898.00 $23,694.00 

35. 5 $13.79 $68.95 $206.85 $8.75 $43.75 $131.25 

36. 5 $13.79 $68.95 $206.85 $8.75 $43.75 $131.25 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ASCOT - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS WV50 FL60

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER SR4115 SR4015 GRABBER G0016

ASCOT - CHARCOAL

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS WV50L FL60

NO BID

6" MAXIMUM HEAVY DUTY WORK 

BOOTS

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DW6125 DW6125 EUROSTAR 255080

ALL BLACK ATHLETIC SHOES

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER WEINBREMER 8324-6111 SR8105 GRABBER G1120

SHOES - WOMEN'S

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER WEINBREMER 534-6135 SR6105 GRABBER G120

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

SHOES - MEN'S

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 6



ITEM

NO.

37. 5 $25.99 $129.95 $389.85 $22.99 $114.95 $344.85 

38. 120 $24.49 $2,938.80 $8,816.40 $20.88 $2,505.60 $7,516.80 

39. 50 $24.49 $1,224.50 $3,673.50 $20.88 $1,044.00 $3,132.00 NO BID

$261,561.60 

Bidder's Price 

$252,592.00

$102,200.05 $14,322.50 

$42,967.50 $306,600.15 

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

3 YEAR GROUP I TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 39:

(Sun Metro)

82BR WRANGLER WP70BKMANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

$87,187.20 

Bidder's Price 

$84,197.20

WRANGLER - BLACK

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ANNUAL TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 39:

(Sun Metro)

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 9799 9799

WRANGLER - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER 82NN WRANGLER WP70NV

NO BID

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

SKIRT - BLACK NO BID

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 7



ITEM

NO.

1. 300 $11.26 $3,378.00 $10,134.00 $8.45 $2,535.00 $7,605.00 

2. 10 $14.99 $149.90 $449.70 $15.95 $159.50 $478.50 

3. 300 $10.15 $3,045.00 $9,135.00 $7.85 $2,355.00 $7,065.00 

4. 150 $9.50 $1,425.00 $4,275.00 $11.99 $1,798.50 $5,395.50 

5. 45 $15.69 $706.05 $2,118.15 $16.99 $764.55 $2,293.65 

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

HOODED SWEATSHIRT (PULLOVER)

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PC78H PORT ST254

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER GILDAN G890 CH100P

SHORT SLEEVE WORK SHIRT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER SP24 REDKAP SS-622

POLO SHIRT WITH POCKET

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER SP14 REDKAP LS6222

LONG SLEEVE DENIM WORK SHIRT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER SP10 PORT SD10

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

LONG SLEEVE WORK SHIRT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX
GROUP II - FLEET DIVISION UNIFORM SPECIFICATIONS

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 8



ITEM

NO.

6. 45 $19.85 $893.25 $2,679.75 $19.99 $899.55 $2,698.65 

7. 201 $4.99 $1,002.99 $3,008.97 $7.75 $1,557.75 $4,673.25 

8. 60 $21.89 $1,313.40 $3,940.20 $21.75 $1,305.00 $3,915.00 

9. 92 $14.39 $1,323.88 $3,971.64 $16.99 $1,563.08 $4,689.24 

10. 92 $24.80 $2,281.60 $6,844.80 $28.99 $2,667.08 $8,001.24 

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NO BID

WORK JACKET

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP JT22NV TJ15

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER TACT 1111B 3100

QUILTED VEST

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP VTZZNV VT22

LINED WINDBREAKER

NO BID

NO BID

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PC782H PORT ST258

T-SHIRT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PC54 PORT PC1500RG

NO BID

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

FULL-ZIP/HOOD SWEATSHIRT

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 9



ITEM

NO.

11. 300 $10.98 $3,294.00 $9,882.00 $14.65 $4,395.00 $13,185.00 

12. 300 $16.27 $4,881.00 $14,643.00 $17.99 $5,397.00 $16,191.00 

13. 300 $13.69 $4,107.00 $12,321.00 $13.75 $4,125.00 $12,375.00 

14. 92 $21.39 $1,967.88 $5,903.64 $18.61 $1,712.12 $5,136.36 

15. 92 $44.17 $4,063.64 $12,190.92 $45.99 $4,231.08 $12,693.24 

NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

NO BID

NO BID

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

INSULATED COVERALL

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP CT30 CT30NV

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP CT10 541C2

JEAN-CUT PANT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER REDKAP PT50 PD50DW

COVERALL

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PT20NV REDKAP PT60

INDUSTRIAL CARGO PANTS - RELAXED 

FIT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIES 2112372NV PT88

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

NO BID
INDUSTRIAL WORK PANTS - ORIGINAL 

FIT

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

NO BID

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 10



ITEM

NO.

16. 10 $15.49 $154.90 $464.70 $12.95 $129.50 $388.50 

17. 150 $4.87 $730.50 $2,191.50 $3.39 $508.50 $1,525.50 

18. 92 $45.99 $4,231.08 $12,693.24 $39.99 $3,679.08 $11,037.24 $47.49 $4,369.08 $13,107.24 

$119,346.87 

Bidder's Price 

$119,353.00

$39,782.29 

Bidder's Price 

$39,784.29

ANNUAL TOTAL GROUP II TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 18:

(Sun Metro)
$38,949.07 $4,369.08 

STEEL TOE BOOTS

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIES DW6125 DW6125

$13,107.24 

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

3 YEAR GROUP II TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 18:

(Sun Metro)
$116,847.21 

EUROSTAR 282433

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIES 9393ANB C993RNB

BASEBALL TYPE CAP

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER OTTO 31-924

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

NO BID

NO BID

INDUSTRIAL PANTS - DENIM JEAN

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 11



THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

10-20 10 10

8 48 8

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

LEFT BLANKLEFT BLANK___% - 30 DAYS

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

NORTHERN IMPORTS DBA 

WORKWEAR SAFETY SHOES

FORT WORTH, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

       YES                     NO          YES                     NO          YES                     NO   

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

X 

X 

X 

X X 

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 12



ITEM

NO.

1. 600 $15.49 $9,294.00 $27,882.00 $20.60 $12,360.00 $37,080.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $19.49

2. 400 $14.49 $5,796.00 $17,388.00 $19.12 $7,648.00 $22,944.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $18.45

3. 60 $15.49 $929.40 $2,788.20 $21.12 $1,267.20 $3,801.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $19.49

4. 20 $14.49 $289.80 $869.40 $19.15 $383.00 $1,149.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $18.45

5. 1000 $12.55 $12,550.00 $37,650.00 $23.00 $23,000.00 $69,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $15.49

6. 80 $10.99 $879.20 $2,637.60 $23.00 $1,840.00 $5,520.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $12.99

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

MEN'S POLO SHIRT - FRENCH BLUE

WOMEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT 

LS - FRENCH BLUE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 5280-061 REDKAP / SR75FB

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 1280-061 REDKAP / SR70FB

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER SANMAR K500P REDKAP / SK46RB

LADIES POLO SHIRT - FRENCH BLUE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP I - SUN METRO COACH OPERATOR / TRANSIT SUPERVISOR UNIFORMS

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

MEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT LS 

- FRENCH BLUE

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

MEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT SS 

- FRENCH BLUE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 1230-061 REDKAP / SR60FB

WOMEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN 

BLOUSE SS - FRENCH BLUE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 5230-061 REDKAP / SR65FB

SANMAR L500 REDKAP / SK47RB

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 13



ITEM

NO.

7. 900 $19.95 $17,955.00 $53,865.00 $17.94 $16,146.00 $48,438.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $24.90

8. 60 $19.95 $1,197.00 $3,591.00 $22.24 $1,334.40 $4,003.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $23.30

9. 200 $16.78 $3,356.00 $10,068.00 $15.03 $3,006.00 $9,018.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $20.13

10. 15 $16.78 $251.70 $755.10 $22.24 $333.60 $1,000.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $20.13

11. 60 $15.45 $927.00 $2,781.00 $17.11 $1,026.60 $3,079.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $19.45

12. 20 $13.95 $279.00 $837.00 $17.11 $342.20 $1,026.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $16.57

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

WOMEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO PANT - 

NAVY

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

WOMEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN 

BLOUSE LS - WHITE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 5280-000 REDKAP / SR71WH

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

MEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO PANT - 

NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 2575-007 REDKAP / PT88NV

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

MEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO SHORT - 

NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 2475-007 REDKAP / PT66NV

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 8573-007 EDWARDS / 8573

WOMEN'S FLAT FRONT CARGO SHORT - 

NAVY

EDWARDS 8473-007 EDWARDS / 8473

MEN'S BUTTON DOWN POPLIN SHIRT LS 

- WHITE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 1280-000 REDKAP / SR70WH

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 14



ITEM

NO.

13. 60 $13.99 $839.40 $2,518.20 $16.52 $991.20 $2,973.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $14.99

14. 20 $13.99 $279.80 $839.40 $16.52 $330.40 $991.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $14.99

15. 100 $17.50 $1,750.00 $5,250.00 $14.09 $1,409.00 $4,227.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $21.00

16. 60 $18.00 $1,080.00 $3,240.00 $14.09 $845.40 $2,536.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $22.05

17. 20 $1.95 $39.00 $117.00 $2.99 $59.80 $179.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

18. 10 $3.90 $39.00 $117.00 $2.99 $29.90 $89.70 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

MEN'S CLIP-ON TIE - NAVY

MEN'S EASY FIT PLEATED PANT - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 2670-019 REDKAP / PT60NV

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BRODER BROTHERS D113 HARRINTON / M140

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PREMIER PT1202 SBROOME / 90001

WOMEN'S T.V. CROSS TIE - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

MEN'S 50/50 PIQUE SPORT SHIRT SS - 

WHITE

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

WOMEN'S 50/50 PIQUE SPORT SHIRT SS - 

WHITE

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BRODER BROTHERS D113W HARRINTON / M140W

WOMEN'S EASY FIT PLEATED PANT - 

NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 8679-019 REDKAP / PT61NV

SAM BROOME 90156 SBROOME / 00156

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 15



ITEM

NO.

19. 100 $16.99 $1,699.00 $5,097.00 $20.76 $2,076.00 $6,228.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $20.99

20. 100 $14.05 $1,405.00 $4,215.00 $16.05 $1,605.00 $4,815.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $18.25

21. 100 $61.48 $6,148.00 $18,444.00 $49.37 $4,937.00 $14,811.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $65.45

22. 150 $34.60 $5,190.00 $15,570.00 $35.39 $5,308.50 $15,925.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $35.60

23. 250 $3.75 $937.50 $2,812.50 $9.95 $2,487.50 $7,462.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

24. 20 $3.75 $75.00 $225.00 $9.95 $199.00 $597.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

SWEATER VEST - MEN'S & WOMEN'S

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

BASEBALL CAP - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BRODER BROTHERS M800-BK PORT AUTHORITY / C813

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

SWEATER - MEN'S & WOMEN'S

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 265-007 EDWARDS / 565

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

JACKET - MEN'S & WOMEN'S

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER PORT AUTHORITY J777 REDKAP / JN30

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 165-007 EDWARDS / 165

WINDBREAKER - MEN & WOMEN

PORT AUTHORITY J730 PORT AUTHORITY / J730

BASEBALL CAP - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BRODER BROTHERS M800-NV PORT AUTHORITY / C813

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 16



ITEM

NO.

25. 150 $3.75 $562.50 $1,687.50 $6.50 $975.00 $2,925.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

26. 20 $3.75 $75.00 $225.00 $6.50 $130.00 $390.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

27. 60 $34.60 $2,076.00 $6,228.00 $45.17 $2,710.20 $8,130.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $40.60

28. 5 $34.60 $173.00 $519.00 $45.17 $225.85 $677.55 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $40.60

29. 60 $14.05 $843.00 $2,529.00 $16.04 $962.40 $2,887.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $17.50

30. 5 $14.05 $70.25 $210.75 $16.04 $80.20 $240.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $17.50

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

VEST - NAVY

BLAZER - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER TACT SQUAD 8000-NV EDWARDS / 3500

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BRODER BROTHERS 1500NV PORT AUTHORITY / C900

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS 4490-007 EDWARDS / 165

VEST - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

BEANIE - NAVY

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

BEANIE - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BRODER BROTHERS 1500BK PORT AUTHORITY / C900

BLAZER - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER TACT SQUAD 8000-BK EDWARDS / 3500

EDWARDS 7490-010 EDWARDS / 165

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 17



ITEM

NO.

31. 100 $29.05 $2,905.00 $8,715.00 $51.95 $5,195.00 $15,585.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

32. 20 $73.95 $1,479.00 $4,437.00 $51.95 $1,039.00 $3,117.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

33. 50 $33.95 $1,697.50 $5,092.50 $69.95 $3,497.50 $10,492.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

34. 200 $29.95 $5,990.00 $17,970.00 $49.95 $9,990.00 $29,970.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

35. 5 $8.89 $44.45 $133.35 $9.94 $49.70 $149.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

36. 5 $8.89 $44.45 $133.35 $9.94 $49.70 $149.10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

SHOES - WOMEN'S

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

ASCOT - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS ST60-007 EDWARDS / 5760

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

SHOES - MEN'S

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER ROTHCO 5085 ROCKY / 2034

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

6" MAXIMUM HEAVY DUTY WORK 

BOOTS

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER THOROGOOD ROCKY / 6167

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BATES E00769 ROCKY / 234

ALL BLACK ATHLETIC SHOES

GRABBERS G0016 ROCKY / 20341

ASCOT - CHARCOAL

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER EDWARDS ST60-019 EDWARDS / 5760

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 18



ITEM

NO.

37. 5 $19.95 $99.75 $299.25 $22.93 $114.65 $343.95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

38. 120 $22.90 $2,748.00 $8,244.00 $15.95 $1,914.00 $5,742.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

39. 50 $22.90 $1,145.00 $3,435.00 $19.77 $988.50 $2,965.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

3 YEAR GROUP I TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 39:

(Sun Metro)
$279,416.10 $350,662.20 $0.00 

WRANGLER - BLACK

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER WRANGLER 82BK EDWARDS / 2290

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

SKIRT - BLACK

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

EDWARDS 9799-010 EDWARDS / 9799

WRANGLER - NAVY

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER WRANGLER 82NV REDKAP / PT50NV

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

ANNUAL TOTAL GROUP I TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 39:

(Sun Metro)
$93,138.70 $116,887.40 $0.00 

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 19



ITEM

NO.

1. 300 $16.75 $5,025.00 $15,075.00 $16.82 $5,046.00 $15,138.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$18.37

2. 10 $20.55 $205.50 $616.50 $21.76 $217.60 $652.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3. 300 $15.30 $4,590.00 $13,770.00 $15.29 $4,587.00 $13,761.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$16.68

4. 150 $9.25 $1,387.50 $4,162.50 $17.98 $2,697.00 $8,091.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $11.45

5. 45 $10.75 $483.75 $1,451.25 $14.96 $673.20 $2,019.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $16.40

LONG SLEEVE DENIM WORK SHIRT

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX
GROUP II - FLEET DIVISION UNIFORM SPECIFICATIONS

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

LONG SLEEVE WORK SHIRT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER RED KAP SD78 REDKAP / SD78DN

SHORT SLEEVE WORK SHIRT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIE WS574 REDKAP / ST62NV

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIE WL574 REDKAP / ST52NV

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

POLO SHIRT WITH POCKET

BRODER BROTHERS G890NV REDKAP / SK28NVMANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

HOODED SWEATSHIRT (PULLOVER)

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER SANMAR PC78H HANES / P170

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 20



ITEM

NO.

6. 45 $14.55 $654.75 $1,964.25 $19.75 $888.75 $2,666.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $20.35

7. 201 $4.45 $894.45 $2,683.35 $6.95 $1,396.95 $4,190.85 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $7.49

8. 60 $21.45 $1,287.00 $3,861.00 $24.44 $1,466.40 $4,399.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

Oversize $25.40

9. 92 $13.45 $1,237.40 $3,712.20 $20.65 $1,899.80 $5,699.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

10. 92 $28.45 $2,617.40 $7,852.20 $48.78 $4,487.76 $13,463.28 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER BRODER BROTHERS G800NV PORT & COMPANY / PC55

LINED WINDBREAKER

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

GILDAN / 18600

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

QUILTED VEST

RED KAP VT22NV REDKAP / VT22NV

T-SHIRT

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

FULL-ZIP/HOOD SWEATSHIRT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER SANMAR PC78ZH

TACT SQUAD 1111NV SPORTTEK / JS71

WORK JACKET

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIE TJ15DN REDKAP / JN30NV

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 21



ITEM

NO.

11. 300 $12.25 $3,675.00 $11,025.00 $13.30 $3,990.00 $11,970.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

12. 300 $17.30 $5,190.00 $15,570.00 $17.95 $5,385.00 $16,155.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

13. 300 $13.70 $4,110.00 $12,330.00 $15.08 $4,524.00 $13,572.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

14. 92 $28.30 $2,603.60 $7,810.80 $25.19 $2,317.48 $6,952.44 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

15. 92 $45.75 $4,209.00 $12,627.00 $48.72 $4,482.24 $13,446.72 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

INDUSTRIAL CARGO PANTS - RELAXED 

FIT

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

INDUSTRIAL WORK PANTS - ORIGINAL 

FIT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIE LP812

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIE 211-2372NV REDKAP / PT88NV

JEAN-CUT PANT

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER RED KAP PT50NV REDKAP / PT50NV

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

REDKAP / PT20NV

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

COVERALL

DICKIE 48799DN REDKAP / CT10NV

INSULATED COVERALL

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER RED KAP CT30NV REDKAP / CT30NV

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 22



ITEM

NO.

16. 10 $12.50 $125.00 $375.00 $12.95 $129.50 $388.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

17. 150 $3.95 $592.50 $1,777.50 $9.50 $1,425.00 $4,275.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

18. 92 $33.95 $3,123.40 $9,370.20 $69.95 $6,435.40 $19,306.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

BASEBALL TYPE CAP

DESCRIPTION
ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL Qty. 

X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

INDUSTRIAL PANTS - DENIM JEAN

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER DICKIE 9393NB REDKAP / PD60PW

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

PRICE PER 

UNIT

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(EST ANNUAL 

QTY. X PRICE PER 

UNIT)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL 

X 3 YEARS)

STEEL TOE BOOTS

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER THOROGOOD ROCKY / 6167

MANUFACTURER / PART NUMBER OTTO COMPANY 19-059 PORT AUTHORITY / C813

$42,011.25 $52,049.08 $0.00 

3 YEAR GROUP II TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 18:

(Sun Metro)
$126,033.75 $156,147.24 $0.00 

ANNUAL TOTAL GROUP II TOTAL - ITEMS 1 THRU 18:

(Sun Metro)

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____

DATE: __1/22/14________  2014-061 UNIFORMS - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) / GENERAL SERVICES 23



THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BID ITEM:  UNIFORMS Solicitation #:  2014-061

BID OPENING DATE:  JANUARY 8, 2014 Department: MASS TRANSIT & GENERAL SERVICES

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

      YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

10 10

8

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

       YES                     NO   

8

BIDS SOLICITED:   18                                           BIDS RECEIVED:   5                                     BIDS LOCAL:   13                                              NO BID:   0      

SUNCITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

NET - 30 DAYS
2% - 10 DAYS    1% - 20 DAYS

0% - 30 DAYS   NET - 30 DAYS

X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:____/s/_____
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