CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-Ame
\ I I

2010

rica City

I!

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS
BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ABM JANITORIAL SERVICES -

ACE GOVERNMENT SERVICES LLC

ADEFTO BUILDING & GROUNDS

SECTION A. BID FORM. ITEM No. 3)

BIDDER'S PRICE $371.55

SOUTH CENTRAL, INC. SERVICES INC.
' EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESAEI\N’IS;E p ESTIMATED 3 ESALIMSXE D ESTIMATED 3 ESALIMSXE D ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL || MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL || MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3]
. (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
1. CLEANING SERVICES - MUNICIPAL $7,266.24 $87,194.88 | $261,584.64 || $4,437.00 $53,244.00 | $159,732.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
SERVICE CENTER COMPLEX BIDDER'S PRICE PRICE
PRICE $7,268.72 $87,224.64 $261,673.92
$ HOURLY RATE x 120 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $13.92 $8.50 NO BID
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $7,266.24 $4,437.00 NO BID
SECTION A. BID FORM. ITEM No.1)
BIDDER'S PRICE $7,268.72
CLEANING SERVICES- MUNICIPAL
2. SERVICE CENTER ADMINISTRATION $5,258.28 | $63,099.36 | $189,298.08 | $2,958.00 | $35,496.00 | $106,488.00 | NO BID NO BID NO BID
BUILDING
$ HOURLY RATE x 80 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = §$ MONTH $15.11 $8.50 NO BID
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $5,258.28 $2,958.00 NO BID
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 2)
3. $371.53 $4,458.36 $13,375.08 $166.39 $1,996.65 $5,989.95 $234.90 $2,818.80 $8,456.40
CLEANING SERVICES - DELTA CORRAL BIDDER'S
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICE
PRICE $371.55 |PRICE $4,458.60 $13,375.80
$ HOURLY RATE x 4 %2 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $18.98 $8.50 $12.00
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $371.53 $166.39 $234.90

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ABM JANITORIAL SERVICES - ADEFTO BUILDING & GROUNDS
SOUTH CENTRAL, INC. ACE GOVEET%EA';LSTEEVICES LLC SERVICES INC.
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ESAEI\N’IGXE D ESTIMATED 3 Ei\EhN’IS;E D ESTIMATED 3 Ei\TNmNnSXII.E D ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL || MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL | MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO. AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3}
(Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
4A. CLEANING SERVICES - NORTHEAST $1,077.06 $12,924.72 $38,774.16 $739.50 $8,874.00 $26,622.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CORRAL BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
BIDDER'S PRICE PRICE
PRICE $1,077.12 $12,925.44 $38,776.32
$ HOURLY RATE x 20 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $12.38 $8.50 NO BID
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $1,077.06 $739.50 NO BID
SECTION A. BID FORM. ITEM No. 4A)
BIDDER'S PRICE $1,077.12
4B. CLEANING SERVICES- NORTHEAST $741.76 $8,901.12 $26,703.36 $443.70 $5,324.40 $15,973.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BIDDER'S
CORRAL BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICE
PRICE $741.73 |PRICE $8,900.76| $26,702.28
$ HOURLY RATE x 12 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $14.21 $8.50 NO BID
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $741.76 $443.70 NO BID
SFCTION A RID FORM. ITFM No_ 4R)
BIDDER'S PRICE $741.73
5. CLEANING SERVICES - DELTA LAND $368.53 $4,422.36 $13,267.08 $147.90 $1,774.80 $5,324.40 $208.80 $2,505.60 $7,516.80
BIDDER'S
MANAGEMENT CORRAL BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICE
PRICE $368.45 |PRICE $4,421.40 $13,264.20
$ HOURLY RATE x 4 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH =$ MONTH $21.18 $8.50 $12.00
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $368.53 $147.90 $208.80
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM NO. 5)
BIDDER'S PRICE $368.45

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The info}&lranp%tio%ré coQtained }n/ this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
: S

DB

DATE: __1/9/14

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City
\ l I /

2010

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS
BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ABM JANITORIAL SERVICES - ADEFTO BUILDING & GROUNDS
SOUTH CENTRAL, INC. ACE GOVEET%EA'\;LSTEEVICES LLC SERVICES INC.
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
ESAEI\N’IGXE D ESTIMATED 3 EiEhNASXE D ESTIMATED 3 Ei\TNmNnSZII.E D ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL | MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL | MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO. AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3}
(Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
6. CLEANING SERVICES-LOWER VALLEY $518.09 $6,217.08 $18,651.24 $221.85 $2,662.20 $7,986.60 $313.20 $3,758.40 $11,275.20
LAND MANAGEMENT CORRAL BIDDER'S
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICE
PRICE $518.13 |PRICE $6,217.56 $18,652.68
$ HOURLY RATE x 6 HOURS/WEEK x
4.35 WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $19.85 $8.50 $12.00
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $518.09 $221.85 $313.20
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 6)
BIDDER'S PRICE $518.13
ANNUAL TOTAL (|TE|\/|S 1-6) $187,217.88 $109,372.05 $9,082.80
BIDDER'S PRICE $187,247.76 BIDDER'S PRICE $106,709.88
3 YEAR TOTAL (|TE|\/|S ]_-6) $561,653.64 $328,116.15 $27,248.40
BIDDER'S PRICE $561,743.28 BIDDER'S PRICE $320,129.64

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Isl

1/9/14

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

ABM JANITORIAL SERVICES - ADEFTO BUILDING & GROUNDS
SOUTH CENTRAL, INC. ACE GOVERETN;?;LSTE;V'CES LLC SERVICES INC.
EL PASO, TX ’ EL PASO, TX
THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION EI .
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), X X El
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.
NO OPTION OFFERED. El
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY |z| D E I:I |:| IZI
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NO YES NO YES NO

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS Solicitation #: 2014-070
BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013 Department: GENERAL SERVICES
GOODWILL INDUSTRIES OF JAKINSKY INTERNATIONAL, INC.
CAREFREE JANITORIAL SERVICES '
EL PASO. TX EL PASO INC. FREEDOM JANITORIAL SERVICES
' EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESAEI\N’IS;ED ESTIMATED 3 ESAEZISXE D ESTIMATED 3 ESATNIm?;E D ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO. AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3]
(Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
1. CLEANING SERVICES - MUNICIPAL $4,671.90 $56,062.80 | $168,188.40 || $5,924.70 $71,096.40 | $213,289.20 || $5,220.00 $62,640.00 | $187,920.00
SERVICE CENTER COMPLEX BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
BIDDER'S PRICE PRICE
PRICE $4,672.00|  $56,064.00 $168,192.00
$ HOURLY RATE x 120 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $8.95 $11.35 $10.00
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $4,671.90 $5,924.70 $5,220.00
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No.1)
) CLEANING SERVICES- MUNICIPAL
. SERVICE CENTER ADMINISTRATION $3,114.60 $:L§E’;§O $];3];[2);|52:§O $3,949.80 $47,397.60 | $142,192.80 $3,132.00 $37,584.00 | $112,752.00
BUILDING BIDDER'S PRICE PRICE BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
PRICE $3,115.00|  $37,380.00 $112,140.00 PRICE $ PRICE $ PRICE $
$ HOURLY RATE x 80 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $3,114.60 $3,949.80 $3,132.00
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 2)
3. $215.33 $2,583.96 $7,751.88 $222.18 $2,666.12 $7,998.35 $215.33 $2,583.90 $7,751.70
CLEANING SERVICES - DELTA CORRAL
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
PRICE $215.00 | PRICE $2,580.00| PRICE $7,740.00] PRICE $222.19 |PRICE $2,666.26|PRICE $7,998.78
$ HOURLY RATE x 4 %2 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $11.00 $11.35 $11.00 $9.00 HR?
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $215.33 $222.18 $215.33
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 3)
BIDDER'S PRICE $222.19
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 1/9/14 2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

ElP

aso

All-America City

\ll

20

|V

10

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

Solicitation #:
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

2014-070

GOODWILL INDUSTRIES OF JAKINSKY INTERNATIONAL, INC.
CAREFREE JANITORIAL SERVICES '
EL PASO TX EL PASO INC. FREEDOM JANITORIAL SERVICES
' EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESAEI\N’IS;E p ESTIMATED 3 ESALIMSXE D ESTIMATED 3 ESATNIm?;II.E D ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL | MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL | MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO. AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3]
(Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
4A. CLEANING SERVICES - NORTHEAST $804.75 $9,657.00 $28,971.00 $987.45 $11,849.40 | $35,548.20 $913.50 $10,962.00 | $32,886.00
CORRAL BIDDER'S
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICE
PRICE $805.00 |PRICE $9,660.00 $28,980.00
$ HOURLY RATE x 20 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.25 $11.35 $10.50 $8.00 HR?
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $804.75 $987.45 $0.00
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 4A)
4B. CLEANING SERVICES- NORTHEAST $511.56 $6,138.72 $18,416.16 $592.47 $7,109.64 $21,328.92 $417.60 $5,011.20 $15,033.60
BIDDER'S
CORRAL BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICE
PRICE $512.00 |PRICE $6,144.00 $18,432.00
$ HOURLY RATE x 12 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.80 $11.35 $8.00 $7.50 HR?
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $511.56 $592.47 $417.60
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 4B)
5. CLEANING SERVICES - DELTA LAND $191.40 $2,296.80 $6,890.40 $197.49 $2,369.88 $7,109.64 $191.40 $2,296.80 $6,890.40
MANAGEMENT CORRAL
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
PRICE $191.00 |PRICE $2,292.00| PRICE $6,876.00
$ HOURLY RATE x 4 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH =$ MONTH $11.00 $11.35 $11.00 $9.00 HR?
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $191.40 $197.49 $191.40
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM NO. 5)
BIDDER'S PRICE $197.45

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

IV

2010

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

Solicitation

#: 2014-070

CAREFREE JANITORIAL SERVICES

GOODWILL INDUSTRIES OF

JAKINSKY INTERNATIONAL, INC.

BIDDER'S PRICE $352,044.00

BIDDER'S PRICE $438,132.18

EL PASO INC. FREEDOM JANITORIAL SERVICES
EL PASO, TX
’ EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESAE:IIIS;E D ESTIMATED 3 ESATI:IImSXE D ESTIMATED 3 ESATPIIIxS;E D ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL | MONTHLY AMOUNT YEARTOTAL | MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3}
. (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
6. CLEANING SERVICES-LOWER VALLEY $268.83 $3,225.96 $9,677.88 $296.24 $3,554.82 $10,664.46 $300.15 $3,601.80 $10,805.40
LAND MANAGEMENT CORRAL BIDDER'S
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S PRICE
PRICE $269.00 |PRICE $3,228.00| PRICE $9,684.00| PRICE $3,554.88|  $10,664.64
$ HOURLY RATE x 6 HOURS/WEEK x
4.35 WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $10.30 $11.35 $11.50 $9.00 HR?
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $268.83 $296.24 $300.15
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 6)
ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1-6) $117,340.44 $146,043.86 $124,679.70
BIDDER'S PRICE $117,348.00 BIDDER'S PRICE $146,043.66
3 YEAR TOTAL (ITEMS 1-6) $352,021.32 $438,131.57 $374,039.10

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

\l”l!

2010

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

CAREFREE JANITORIAL SERVICES
EL PASO, TX

GOODWILL INDUSTRIES OF
EL PASO INC.
EL PASO, TX

JAKINSKY INTERNATIONAL, INC.
FREEDOM JANITORIAL SERVICES
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

_

NONE STATED

_
]
]

PAYMENT TERMS:

2% - 10 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

3% - 10 DAYS
2% - 20 DAYS
0% - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES E NO D

YES D NO E

YES m NO D

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

El

Paso

All-America City

2010

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

LUCY'S CLEANING SERVICES

STAR-CLEAN LLC

THE EAGLE JANITORIAL

SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 3)

BIDDER'S PRICE $204.55

SERVICES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
ESAE“N"S;ED ESTIMATED 3 EsAmSXED ESTIMATED 3 ESAL'mIED ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO. AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3|  AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3]
(Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
1. CLEANING SERVICES - MUNICIPAL $4,959.00 | $59,508.00 | $178,524.00 | $4,176.00 | $50,112.00 | $150,336.00 | $5,454.90 | $65,458.80 | $196,376.40
SERVICE CENTER COMPLEX
$ HOURLY RATE x 120 HOURS/WEEK X 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.50 $8.00 $10.45
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $4,959.00 $4,176.00 $5,454.90
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No.1)
CLEANING SERVICES- MUNICIPAL
2. SERVICE CENTER ADMINISTRATION $3,393.00 | $40,716.00 | $122,148.00 | $2,871.00 | $34,452.00 | $103,356.00 | $3,636.60 | $43,639.20 | $130,917.60
BUILDING
$ HOURLY RATE x 80 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.75 $8.25 $10.45
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $3,393.00 $2,871.00 $3,636.60
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 2)
3. | CLEANING SERVICES - DELTA CORRAL $190.86 $2,290.28 $6,870.83 $234.90 $2,818.80 $8,456.40 $204.56 $2,454.72 $7,364.16
BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
PRICE $204.55 |PRICE $2,454.70|PRICE $7,364.11
$ HOURLY RATE x 4 % HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.75 $12.00 $10.45
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $190.86 $234.90 $204.56

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

)

2010

/

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS
BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

Solicitation

Department: GENERAL SERVICES

#: 2014-070

LUCY'S CLEANING SERVICES STAR-CLEAN LLC THE EASGELREVJIQEISTORIAL
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX
ESAE“N"SXED ESTIMATED 3 EsAmSXED ESTIMATED 3 ESAL'mXED ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO. AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3]
(Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
4A.| CLEANING SERVICES - NORTHEAST $848.25 $10,179.00 | $30,537.00 | $761.25 $9,135.00 | $27,405.00 | $909.15 $10,909.80 | $32,729.40
CORRAL BIDDER'S
PRICE $913.50
$ HOURLY RATE x 20 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.75 $8.75 $10.45
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $848.25 $761.25 $909.15
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 4A)
CLEANING SERVICES- NORTHEAST
4B. $508.95 $6,107.40 | $18,322.20 $495.90 $5,950.80 | $17,852.40 $545.49 $6,545.88 | $19,637.64
CORRAL
$ HOURLY RATE x 12 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.75 $9.50 $10.45
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $508.95 $495.90 $545.49
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 4B)
5. CLEANING SERVICES - DELTA LAND $169.65 $2,035.80 $6,107.40 $208.80 $2,505.60 $7,516.80 $181.83 $2,181.96 $6,545.88
MANAGEMENT CORRAL
$ HOURLY RATE x 4 HOURS/WEEK x 4.35
WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.75 $12.00 $10.45
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $169.65 $208.80 $181.83
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM NO. 5)

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14 2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'l

2010

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

LUCY'S CLEANING SERVICES

STAR-CLEAN LLC

THE EAGLE JANITORIAL

BIDDER'S PRICE $403,389.39

SERVICES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
' ' EL PASO, TX
ESAEL"SXED ESTIMATED 3 EsAmS;ED ESTIMATED 3 ESAL'mIED ESTIMATED 3
ITEM LOCATION MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL MONTHLY AMOUNT YEAR TOTAL
NO. AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3| AMOUNT (Annual Amountx 3  AMOUNT (Annual Amount x 3]
(Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years) (Monthly Amount x Years)
12) 12) 12)
6. | CLEANING SERVICES-LOWER VALLEY $254.48 $3,053.70 $9,161.10 $313.20 $3,758.40 | $11,275.20 $272.75 $3,273.00 $9,819.00
LAND MANAGEMENT CORRAL BIDDER'S BIDDER'S BIDDER'S
PRICE $272.74 |PRICE $3,272.94| PRICE $9,818.82
$ HOURLY RATE x 6 HOURS/WEEK x
4.35 WEEKS/MONTH = $ MONTH $9.75 $12.00 $10.45
(HOURLY RATE = VENDOR'S RATE PER HOUR, INCLUDING WAGES,
PROFIT, INSURANCE, ETC)
(AFTER PERFORMING CALCULATIONS, INPUT MONTHLY RATE IN $254.48 $313.20 $272.75
SECTION A, BID FORM, ITEM No. 6)
BIDDER'S PRICE $272.74
ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1-6) $123,890.18 $108,732.60 $134,463.36
BIDDER'S PRICE $100,511.10 BIDDER'S PRICE $134,463.28
3 YEAR TOTAL (ITEMS 1-6) $371,670.53 $326,197.80 $403,390.08

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

[

2010

BID ITEM: JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS

BID OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 11, 2013

Solicitation #: 2014-070
Department: GENERAL SERVICES

THE EAGLE JANITORIAL
LUCY'S CLEANING SERVICES STAR-CLEAN LLC SERVICES
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY
GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE
TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:
ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION EI |
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), X X X
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION '
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.
NO OPTION OFFERED. |
PAYMENT TERMS: 2%-10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS 3%- 20 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY D m E D E
PROCUREMENT CARD: YES NO YES NO VES NO

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 52

BIDS RECEIVED:

9

BIDS LOCAL: 41

NO BID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __1/9/14

2014-070 JANITORIAL SERVICES-MUNICIPAL SERVICE CENTERS AND CORRALS - GENERAL SERVICES
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