
ITEM

NO.

1. 3250 $12.99 $42,217.50 $126,652.50 $10.65 $34,612.50 $103,837.50 $10.34 $33,605.00 $100,815.00 

2. 260 $12.99 $3,377.40 $10,132.20 $14.65 $3,809.00 $11,427.00 $10.34 $2,688.40 $8,065.20 

3. 3250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.34 $33,605.00 $100,815.00 

BID ITEM:  SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

Department: DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

HOURLY 

RATE

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

ALL PRO SECURITY SERVICES, 

LTD

SOUTHFIELD, MI

AZAR SECURITY SERVICES INC.

EL PASO, TX

Solicitation #:  2014-073

BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 18, 2013

THE DIAMOND GROUP

DALLAS, TX

ADMINISTRATION

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

SATURDAY SERVICES

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES 

(AS NEEDED BASIS)

$136,784.70 $115,264.50 

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

HOURS

DESCRIPTION

TILLMAN

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

HOURLY 

RATE

GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1-3):

HOURLY 

RATE

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

$209,695.20 

APPROVED BY:        /s/      

DATE:    1/29/2014    2014-073 SECURITY GUARD SERVICES DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH 1



THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:

THE DIAMOND GROUP

DALLAS, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

       YES                     NO           YES                     NO   

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

NET - 30 DAYSNET - 30 DAYS1.0% - 10 DAYS

Solicitation #:  2014-073

BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 18, 2013

BID ITEM:  SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

Department: DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH

ALL PRO SECURITY SERVICES, 

LTD

SOUTHFIELD, MI

AZAR SECURITY SERVICES INC.

EL PASO, TX

      YES                     NO   

X X 

X 

X 

X X X 

APPROVED BY:        /s/      

DATE:    1/29/2014    2014-073 SECURITY GUARD SERVICES DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH 2



ITEM

NO.

1. 3250 $11.70 $38,025.00 $114,075.00 $13.77 $44,752.50 $134,257.50 $10.66 $34,645.00 $103,935.00 

 B idder's Price 

$44,753.00 

B idder's Price

$134,259.00

2. 260 $11.70 $3,042.00 $9,126.00 $13.77 $3,580.20 $10,740.60 $10.66 $2,771.60 $8,314.80 

 B idder's Price 

$3,580.00 

B idder's Price

$10,740.00

3. 3250 $11.70 $38,025.00 $114,075.00 $13.77 $44,752.50 $134,257.50 $10.66 $34,645.00 $103,935.00 

 B idder's Price 

$44,753.00 

B idder's Price

$134,259.00

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SATURDAY SERVICES

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES 

(AS NEEDED BASIS)

TILLMAN

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1-3): $237,276.00 $216,184.80 

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

HOURLY 

RATE

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

ADMINISTRATION

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

FIDELIS PROTECTIVE SERVICES

EL PASO, TX

G4S SECURE SOLUTIONS (USA) 

INC.

JUPITER, FL

MIKE GARCIA MERCHANT 

SECURITY, LLC

EL PASO, TX

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

HOURS

HOURLY 

RATE

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

HOURLY 

RATE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  SECURITY GUARD SERVICES Solicitation #:  2014-073

BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 18, 2013 Department: DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH

$279,255.60 

Bidder's Price 

$279,258.00

APPROVED BY:        /s/      

DATE:    1/29/2014    2014-073 SECURITY GUARD SERVICES DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH 3



THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:
       YES                     NO         YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

FIDELIS PROTECTIVE SERVICES

EL PASO, TX

G4S SECURE SOLUTIONS (USA) 

INC.

JUPITER, FL

MIKE GARCIA MERCHANT 

SECURITY, LLC

EL PASO, TX

6% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  SECURITY GUARD SERVICES Solicitation #:  2014-073

BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 18, 2013 Department: DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH

X X 

X 

X X X 

APPROVED BY:        /s/      

DATE:    1/29/2014    2014-073 SECURITY GUARD SERVICES DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH 4



ITEM

NO.

1. 3250 $10.39 $33,767.50 $101,302.50 $21.00 $68,250.00 $204,750.00 $11.76 $38,220.00 $114,660.00 

2. 260 $10.39 $2,701.40 $8,104.20 $21.00 $5,460.00 $16,380.00 $11.76 $3,057.60 $9,172.80 

3. 3250 $10.39 $33,767.50 $101,302.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

SATURDAY SERVICES

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES 

(AS NEEDED BASIS)

TILLMAN

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

GRAND TOTAL (ITEMS 1-3): $210,709.20 $221,130.00 $123,832.80 

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

HOURLY 

RATE

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

ADMINISTRATION

UN-ARMED SECURITY GUARD SERVICES

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL 

HOURS

HOURLY 

RATE

ANNUAL TOTAL 

(ESTIMATED 

ANNUAL HOURS 

X HOURLY RATE)

3-YEAR TOTAL 

(ANNUAL TOTAL X 3 

YEARS

HOURLY 

RATE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  SECURITY GUARD SERVICES Solicitation #:  2014-073

BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 18, 2013 Department: DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH

RUIZ PROTECTIVE SERVICE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

TAC-ONE SECURITY 

INCORPORATED

PORTLAND, OR

U. S. SECURITY ASSOCIATES, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

APPROVED BY:        /s/      

DATE:    1/29/2014    2014-073 SECURITY GUARD SERVICES DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH 5



THE CITY AT IS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE

OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF

THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE

ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PAYMENT TERMS:

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

PROCUREMENT CARD:
       YES                     NO         YES                     NO          YES                     NO    

BIDS SOLICITED:  27                                 BIDS RECEIVED:  9                                        BIDS LOCAL:  20                                                NO BID:  0       

NOTE:  This is a Best Value Procurement.  Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

RUIZ PROTECTIVE SERVICE, INC.

EL PASO, TX

TAC-ONE SECURITY 

INCORPORATED

PORTLAND, OR

U. S. SECURITY ASSOCIATES, 

INC.

EL PASO, TX

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID ITEM:  SECURITY GUARD SERVICES Solicitation #:  2014-073

BID OPENING DATE:  DECEMBER 18, 2013 Department: DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH

X 
X 

X 

X 

X X X 

APPROVED BY:        /s/      

DATE:    1/29/2014    2014-073 SECURITY GUARD SERVICES DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC HEALTH 6


