Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

ANDERSON FEED COMPANY

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,
INC.

CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
50 LB BAG
175 BAGS
1. WILD HERBIVORE PLUS 8,750 LBS. $29.83 $261,012.50
MAZURI #5XK4, 50 |Ib. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
8,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,220.25
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 528W "REPLACED 52K4"
~1000 tab/can
50 canisters
Marine Tabs $227.26 $11,363,000.00
NO BID ’ ’ NO BID
2 MAZURI #5TWX 50,000 Tabs lcan
50,000 Tabs Bidder's Price-$11,363.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5TWX /1811966
50 LB BAG
_ 60 BAGS
3. Flamingo Complete 3,000 LBS. $66.95 $200,850.00
MAZURI #5644, 50 Ib. BAG NOBID per bag NO BID
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,170.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5644
50 LB BAG
_ 60 BAGS
4. Flamingo Breeder 3,000 LBS. $77.27 $231,810.00
MAZURI #5645, 50 Ib. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,636.20
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5645
50 LB BAG
150 BAGS
5. Ratite 7,500 LBS. $16.52 $123,900.00 $25.84 $193,800.00 NO BID
MAZURI #5647, 50 |Ib. BAG per bag
7,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,478.00 7,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,876.00
BRAND: NUZU RATITE MAINTENANCE MAZURI
STOCK# 7504 5647

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
All*AmeﬂEacHi
‘ump
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

APPROVED BY: /sl

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO

DATE: 3/13/2014

ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. PREMIER NUTRIE?;NAL PRODUCTS,
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
o ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY. UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
25 LB BAG - 300 BAGS
6. Rodent Diet 7,500 LBS. $16.75 $125,625.00 $17.18 $128,850.00 NO BID
MAZURI #5663, 25 |Ib. BAG per bag
7,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,512.50 7,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,154.00
BRAND: KENT 19% RODENT 50# B09 MAZURI
STOCK# 7433 5663
25LB BAG - 25 BAGS
7. Ferret Diet 625 LBS. NO BID $35.06 $21,912.50 $39.00 $24,375.00
MAZURI #5M08, 25 |b. BAG per bag
625 LBS. Bidder's Price-$876.50 625 LBS. Bidder's Price-$819.00
BRAND: MAZURI ZUPREEM PREMIUM FERRET DIET
STOCK# SMO08 69550, 30 LB. BAG
1 Liter bottle - 50 LITERS
8. Emcelle 50 LITERS $135.00 $6,750.00 $132.72 $6,636.00 NO BID
MAZURI #10111 per liter
50 LITERS 50 LITERS Bidder's Price-$6,636.00
BRAND: STUART PRODUCTS MAZURI
STOCK# 10111
50 LB BAG - 300 BAGS
9. Herbivore ADF 16 15,000 LBS. $17.73 $265,950.00 $23.09 $346,350.00 NO BID
MAZURI #5648, 50 Ib. BAG per bag
15,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,319.00 15,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$6,927.00
BRAND: NUZU HERBIVORE HI-PRO MAZURI 5648
STOCK# 7543 5648
50 LB BAG - 40 BAGS
10. Llama Supplement 2,000 LBS. $20.58 $41,160.00 $24.84 $49,680.00 NO BID
MAZURI #5M17, 50 |Ib. BAG per bag
2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$823.20 2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$993.60
BRAND: NUZU ALPACA OMEGA FIBER MAZURI
STOCK# 6934 SM17
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exred
4
BID TABULATION FORM "Iy
2010
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2014-179
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014 Department: ZOO
PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
SHAWNEE, KS
'TEM ITEM DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT PRICE
TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
50 LB BAG - 350 BAGS
11. Elephant Supplement 17,500 LBS. $29.08 $508,900.00 $26.33 $460,775.00 NO BID
MAZURI #5666, 50 Ib. BAG per bag
17,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$10,178.00 17,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$9,215.50
BRAND: NUZU SUEQA HERBIVORE MAZURI
STOCK# 7538 5666
25 LB BAG - 15 BAGS
12. Cricket Food, Hi calcium 375 LBS. $95.45 $35,793.75
MAZURI #5M38, 25 Ib. BAG NOBID per bag NO BID
375 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,431.75
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5M38
25 LB BAG - 50 BAGS
13. Guinea Pig diet 1,250 LBS. NO BID $15.75 $19,687.50 $10.43 $13,037.50
MAZURI #5664, 25 |Ib. BAG per bag
1,250 LBS. Bidder's Price-$787.50 1,250 LBS. Bidder's Price-$657.09
BRAND: MAZURI ZUPREEM NATURE'S PROMISE FOR GUINEA PIGS
STOCK# 5664 97500, 20 LB. BAG
5 LB Container - 30 Containers
14. Reptovite Mineral Supplement 150 LBS. $60.00 $9,000.00
51b. CONTAINER NO BID per can NOBID
150 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,800.00
BRAND: Z00 MED
STOCK# REPTOVILE
50 LB BAG - 12 BAGS
15. Laboratory Rabbit Diet HF 600 LBS. $22.24 $13,344.00
PURINA #5326, 50 Ib. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
600 LBS. Bidder's Price-$266.88
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# 5326

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 3



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,

ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
o ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
N 3 . .
50 LB BAG - 35 BAGS
16. Enrich 32 Horse 1,750 LBS. $26.98 $47,215.00
PURINA, 50 Ib. BAG NO BID et bag NO BID
1,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$944.30
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# ENRICH PLUS RELACED "ENRICH 32"
25 LB BAG - 20 BAGS
17. Chinchilla Diet 500 LBS. NO BID $16.68 $8,340.00 $14.25 $7,125.00
MAZURI #5M01, 25 Ib. BAG per bag
500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$333.60 500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$356.25
. ZUPREEM NATURE'S PROMISE FOR
BRAND: MAZURI CHINCHILLAS
STOCK# SM01 98500, 20 LB. BAG
25 LB BAG - 60 BAGS
18. Insectivore 1,500 LBS. $33.68 $50,520.00
MAZURI #5MKS8, 25 |b. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
1,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,020.80
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SMK8
50 LB BAG - 100 BAGS
19. Gamebird Layena Crumbles 5,000 LBS. $15.90 $79,500.00 $20.35 $101,750.00 NO BID
PURINA #5438, 50 |b. BAG per bag
5,000 LBS. Bidder's Price $1,590.00 5,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,035.00
. BLUESEAL HOME FRESH MULTI FLOCK
BRAND: BREEDER PELLETS PURINA
STOCK# 3471 5438
50 LB BAG - 200 BAGS
20. Senior Equine 10,000 LBS. $17.75 $177,500.00 $20.41 $204,100.00 NO BID
PURINA, 50 Ib. BAG per bag
10,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,550.00 10,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,082.00
BRAND: NUZU STABUL 1 PLUS PURINA
STOCK# 7552 352Q

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso

All-America City

\llllr
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC ’
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
50 LB BAG - 12 BAGS
21. Corn, Cracked 600 LBS. $11.74 $7,044.00
50 Ib. BAG NO BID er bag NO BID
600 LBS. Bidder's Price-$140.88
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# L52M
20 LB BAG - 200 BAGS
22. Omnivore Chow 4,000 LBS. NO BID $28.67 $114,680.00 $15.48 $61,920.00
ZUPREEM, 20 Ib. BAG per bag
4,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,734.00 4,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,096.00
BRAND: ZUPREEM
STOCK# ZUPREEM OMNIVORE
50 LB BAG - 15 BAGS
23. Water Fowl Maintenance 3,750 LBS. $36.01 $135,037.50
MAZURI #5642, 50 |b. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
3,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,700.75
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5642
50 LB BAG - 800 BAGS
24. Wild Herbivore Diet, Hi Fiber 40,000 LBS. $16.55 $662,000.00 $26.11 $1,044,400.00 NO BID
MAZURI #5ZF1, 50 Ib. BAG per bag
40,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$13,240.00 40,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$20,888.00
BRAND: NUZU LO-PRO MAZURI
STOCK# 7542 5ZF1
33 LB BAG - 84 BAGS
25, Exotic Canine 2,750 LBS. $34.00 $93,500.00
MAZURI #5M52, 50 |b. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
2,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,856.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SMN2 REPLACES SMSZ

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO



CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
illlilmeril:a City
2010

Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,

ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
50 LB BAG - 50 BAGS
26. Crane Maintenance 2,500 LBS. $35.21 $88,025.00
MAZURI #5646, 50 Ib. BAG NOBID per bag NO BID
2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,760.50
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5646
50 LB BAG - 10 BAGS
27. Parrot Seed Mix 500 LBS. NO BID $45.28 $22,640.00 NO BID
50 1b. BAG per bag
500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$452.80
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# 63928
25 LB BAG - 72 BAGS
28. Finch Seed Mix 1,800 LBS. NO BID $26.20 $47,160.00 NO BID
50 1b. BAG per bag
1,800 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,886.40
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# 62021
50 LB BAG - 8 BAGS
29. Sunflower Seeds 400 LBS. NO BID $34.25 $13,700.00 NO BID
50 1b. BAG per bag
400 LBS. Bidder's Price-$274.00
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# 1459
50 LB BAG - 55 BAGS
30. Peanuts, Raw in Shell 2,750 LBS. NO BID $87.50 $240,625.00 NO BID
50 Ib. BAG per bag
2,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,812.50
BRAND: JONES SEED
STOCK# PEANUT

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

El Paso
All-America City
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014 Department: ZOO
PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC ’
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
50 LB BAG - 8 BAGS
31. Bran 400 LBS. NO BID $21.85 $8,740.00 NO BID
50 Ib. BAG © per bag °
400 LBS. Bidder's Price-$174.80
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# 2671026-106
10 LB BAG - 12 BAGS
32. IAMS Less Active Cat Food 120 LBS. $20.00 $2,400.00
IAMS, 10 Ib. BAG NO BID b NO BID
120 LBS. Bidder's Price-$240.00
BRAND: IAMS
STOCK# IAMS LESS ACTIVE
25 LB BAG - 180 BAGS
33. Browse Biscuits 4,500 LBS. $33.41 $150,345.00
MAZURI #5MA4, 25 |b. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
4,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$6,013.80
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SMA4
25 LB BAG - 24 BAGS
34. Growth & Repro. Primate 600 LBS. $21.31 $12,786.00
MAZURI #5MA1, 25 |b. BAG NO BID per bag NOBID
600 LBS. Bidder's Price-$511.44
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SMA1
6x15 bags per case - 10 cases
35. Iguana Diet 90 LBS. $45.30 $4,077.00
MAZURI #5M35, 6/case NOBID per case NOBID
90 LBS. Bidder's Price-$453.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5E07 SAME AS SM35
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: __3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
iul«lnmeril:a City
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC ’
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
20 LB BAG - 8 BAGS
36. Koi Pond Nuggets 160 LBS. $28.71 $4,593.60
MAZURI #5M78, 20 Ib. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
160 LBS. Bidder's Price-$229.68
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SM78
per brick - per brick - 20 bricks
37. Salt Bricks 20 BRICKS NO BID $3.00 $60.00 NO BID
BRICK per brick
20 BRICKS
BRAND: MORTONS
STOCK# SB4
50 LB BAG - 60 BAGS
38. Sheep Loco 3,000 LBS. $27.07 $81,210.00
NO BID NO BID
MAZURI #5655, 50 |b. BAG © per bag ©
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,624.20
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 5655
25 LB BAG - 100 BAGS
30. Tortoise Diet 2,500 LBS. $27.35 $68,375.00
MAZURI #5M21, 25 Ib. BAG NOBID per bag NO BID
2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,735.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SM21
50 LB BAG - 1 BAGS
40. Rolled Oats 50 LBS. $18.12 $906.00
50 Ibs. PER BAG NO BID ooy NO BID
50 LBS. Bidder's Price-$18.12
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# LSK7

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO




CITY OF EL PASO

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
illl-lnmeril:al:ilv
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC ’
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION EAS’\':'N(%?I\-( UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
50 LB BAG - 50 BAGS
41. Water Fowl Breeder 2,500 LBS. $15.90 $39,750.00 $38.08 $95,200.00 NO BID
MAZURI #5640, 50 Ibs. BAG per bag
2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$795.00 2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,904.00
. BLUESEAL HOME FRESH MULTI FLOCK
BRAND: BREEDER PELLETS MAZURI
STOCK# 3471 5640
50 LB BAG - 6 BAGS
42. Calcium Carbonate 300 LBS. $15.25 $4,575.00
50 Ibs. PER BAG NO BID oo NO BID
300 LBS. Bidder's Price-$91.50
BRAND: CALCIUM
STOCK# CALCIUM CARBONATE
50 LB BAG - 2 BAGS
43. Oatmeal 100 LBS. $25.00 $2,500.00
50 Ibs. PER BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
100 LBS. Bidder's Price-$50.00
BRAND: OATMEAL
STOCK# OATMEAL
50 LB BAG - 6 BAGS
44, Oyster Shell 300 LBS. NO BID $15.20 $4,560.00 NO BID
50 Ibs. PER BAG ° per bag °
300 LBS. Bidder's Price-$91.20
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# 2653340
per kg - 150 kg
Gel, Bird Zulife 150
45, ! $22.72 $3,408.00
MAZURI #5ME4 KILOGRAMS NO BID ver kg NO BID
150 KILOGRAMS Bidder's Price-$3,408.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SME4 / 22722
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014
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Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,

ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
per kg - 150 kg
46. Gel, Callitrichid Diet 150 $22.26 $3,339.00
MAZURI #5M15 KILOGRAMS NG BID per kg NO BID
150 KILOGRAMS Bidder's Price-$3,339.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SM1S
1 Canister~4000 Tab-1 Canister
47. Tablets, Vita Zu Bird 4,000 $113.63 $454,520.00
MAZURI #5M25 TABLETS NO BID per can NO BID
4,000 TABLETS Bidder's Price-$113.63
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SM2S / 7537
1 Canister 1000 Tab -1 Canister
48. Tablets, Mammal Vitamin 1,000 $138.17 $138,170.00
MAZURI #5M26 TABLETS NO BID per tab NO BID
1,000 TABLETS Bidder's Price-$138.17
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SM26 / 7539
1 Tube = 80 Grams 36 Tubes
49. Thiamine - E 2,880 $19.53 $56,246.40
MAZURI #10112, 80 GRAMS GRAMS NO BID per 10 NO BID
2,880 GRAMS Bidder's Price-$703.08
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 10112
24 BLOCKS
50. Trace Black 24 BLOCKS $12.25 $294.00
BLOCK NO BID per block NO BID
24 BLOCKS Bidder's Price-$294.00
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# MB40

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO
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CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

SN2 BID TABULATION FORM
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014
PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
25 LB BAG - 6 BAGS
51. Turtle Diet, Freshwater 150 LBS. $41.66 $6,249.00
MAZURI #5M87, 25 |b. BAG NO BID per bag NO BID
150 LBS. Bidder's Price-$249.96
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SM87
T0 LB container - 14
Containers
52. Vionate Mineral Supplements 140 LBS. $75.56 $10,578.40
10 Ib. CONTAINER NO BID per can NO BID
140 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,057.84
BRAND: VIONATE
STOCK# VIONATE 10
50 LB BAG - 275 BAGS
53. Zebra Pellets 13,750 LBS. $17.73 $243,787.50 $27.21 $374,137.50 NO BID
MAZURI #5662, 50 Ib. BAG per bag
13,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,875.75 13,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$7,482.75
BRAND: NUZUHERBIVORE HI-PRO MAZURI
STOCK# 7563 5662
40 LB BAG - 150 BAGS
54. Petting Zoo $28.04 $168,240.00
MAZURI #5295, 40 Ib. BAG 6,000 LBS. NO BID per bag NO BID
6,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,206.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# 529S
per kg - 1-kg
Ce De Egg 1
55. KILOGRAM KILOGRAM NO BID $15.75 $15.75 NO BID
1 KILOGRAM Bidder's Price-$15.75
BRAND: CE DE EGG
STOCK# CE DE EGG
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
11

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exteed
BID TABULATION FORM 11N

2010
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2014-179
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014 Department: ZOO
PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC ’
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
per kg - 4-kg
56. Gel, Aquati Omnivore Diet 4 $25.93 $103.72
MAZURI #5294, KG KILOGRAMS NO BID per kg NO BID
4 KILOGRAMS Bidder's Price-$103.72
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# S294 / 7062
24 CANS/ CASE - 75 CASES
57. Canned Primate $41.35 $3,101.25 $11.40 $855.00
ZUPREEM, 24/case 75 CASES NO BID per case
75 CASES Bidder's Price-$3,101.25 75 CASES
BRAND: ZUPREEM ZUPREEM PRIMATE DIET CANNED
STOCK# ZUPREEM CAN PRIMALE 69300, 12 CANS PER CASE-14.5 0z CAN
24 CANS/ CASE - 50 CASES
58. Canned Marmoset $41.35 $2,067.50 $11.40 $570.00
ZUPREEM, 24/case 50 CASES NO BID per case
50 CASES Bidder's Price-$2,067.50 50 CASES
BRAND: ZUPREEM ZUPREEM MARMOSET DIET CANNED
STOCK# ZUPREEM MARMOSET 69200, 12 CANS PER CASE 14.5 oz CAN
20 LB BAG - 150 BAGS
59. Primate Dry Maintenance $38.47 $115,410.00 $19.40 $58,200.00
ZUPREEM, 20 Ib. BAG 3,000 LBS. NO BID per bag
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,770.50 3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,910.00
BRAND: ZUPREEM ZUPREEM PRIMATE DIET DRY
STOCK# ZUPREEM PRIMATE 69850, 20 LB. BAG
35LB BAG - 15 BAGS
60. Fruit Blend $76.29 $38,145.00 $41.00 $20,500.00
ZUPREEM, 20 |b. BAG S00LBS. NOBID per bag
500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,144.35 500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$615.00
. ZUPREEM FRUIT BLEND FOR LARGE
BRAND: ZUPREEM PARROTS
STOCK# ZUPREEM FRUIT 84350, 35 LB. BAG

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 12




CITY OF EL PASO

[ J
BID TABULATION FORM "y
2010
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2014-179
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014 Department: ZOO
PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC ’
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
’ ’ SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION I?S’tll'Ng?'b UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
20 LB BAG - 100 BAGS
61. |Natural / Canaries-Finch / Softbill (Low Iron) $47.65 $95,300.00 $24.75 $49,500.00
ZUPREEM, 20 |b. BAG 2,000 LBS. NOBID per bag
2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,765.00 2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,475.00
BRAND: ZUPREEM ZUPREEM NATURAL FOR PARAKEETS
STOCK# NATURAL CANARIES 91500, 20 LB. BAG
20 LB BAG - 25 BAGS
62. | Natural / Parrot / Conure / Softhill Low Iron $49.65 $24,825.00 $24.75 $12,375.00
ZUPREEM, 20 |b. BAG S00LBS. NO BID per bag
500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,241.25 500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$618.75
] ZUPREEM NATURAL FOR
BRAND: ZUPREEM PARROTS/CONURES
STOCK# NATURAL PARROT 93500, 20 LB. BAG
50 LB BAG - 35 BAGS
63. Equine Enrich Plus $29.98 $52,465.00
PURINA #35ML 50 Ib. BAG 1,750 BAGS NOBID per bag NO BID
1,750 BAGS Bidder's Price-$1,049.30
BRAND: PURNIA
STOCK# ENRICH PLUS
50 LB BAG - 25 BAGS
64. Goat, Honor Show Chow $13.69 $17,112.50 $20.22 $25,275.00
PURINA #597J 50 Ib. BAG 1,250 BAGS per bag NOBID
1,250 BAGS 1,250 BAGS Bidder's Price-$505.50
BRAND: NUZU 18% GOAT DEVELOPER 20R PURINA
STOCK# 6848 597J
25 LB BAG - 300 BAGS
65. Mini-Pig, Adult $12.42 $93,150.00 $13.88 $104,100.00
MAZURI #5 Z91 25 Ib. BAG 7,500 BAGS per bag NOBID
7,500 BAGS 7,500 BAGS Bidder's Price-$4,164.00
BRAND: SUANNA PRO ADVERT 20 LBS. MAZURI
STOCK# 5791
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 13




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM ‘
2010
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2014-179
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014 Department: ZOO
PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
SHAWNEE, KS
'TEM ITEM DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UNIT PRICE
TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
25LB BAG - 350 BAGS
66. Mini-Pig, Youth $15.12 $132,300.00
MAZURI # 5790 25 |b. BAG 8,750 BAGS NG BID per bag NO BID
8,750 BAGS Bidder's Price-$5,292.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SZ90
40 0z BAG - 200 BAGS
67. Timothy Hay 200 BAGS $7.86 $1,572.00 $7.00 $1,400.00 $4.21 $842.00
40 oz. BAG per bag
200 BAGS 200 BAGS 200 BAGS
BRAND: KAYTEE TIMOTHY 48 oz. OXBOW ZUPREEM NATURIi‘l\;sROMISE TIMOTHY
STOCK# OXBOW40 99060, 3-40 0z. BAGS PER CASE
25 LB BAG - 200 BAGS
68. Primate Cinnamon $36.16 $180,800.00
MAZURI #5M1S 50 Ib. BAG 5,000 LBS. NO BID per bag NO BID
5,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$7,232.00
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SMIS ONLY COME IN A 25Ib BAG
50 LB BAG - 50 BAGS
69. Alfalfa Cubes $17.12 $42,800.00
1" cube 50 Ib. BAG 2,500 LBS. NO BID ber bag NO BID
2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$856.00
BRAND: PURINA
STOCK# 59ZM
40 LB BAG - 2 BAGS
70. Timothy Cubes $12.01 $600.50
1" cube 50 Ib. BAG SOLBS. NO BID per bag NO BID
50 LBS. Bidder's Price-$24.02
BRAND: STANLEE
STOCK# 1580-40021-0-0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 14




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

All-America City

BID TABULATION FORM "
2010
Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2014-179
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014 Department: ZOO
PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,
ANDERSON FEED COMPANY LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. INC
CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX )
SHAWNEE, KS
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. . .
per kg - per kg
Gel, Aquatic 25
71. ' $28.25 $706.25
MAZURI # 5M70 KILOGRAMS NO BID per kg NO BID
25 KILOGRAMS
BRAND: MAZURI
STOCK# SM70
50 LB BAG - 35 BAGS
72. Rabbit Chow Complete 1750 LB NO BID $17.20 $30,100.00 $12.56 $21,980.00
PURINA #530J 50 Ib. BAG /50 LBS. © per bag
1,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$602.00 1,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,105.28
BRAND- PURINA ZUPREEM NA;XI;EI_SF SPROMISE FOR
STOCK# 530J 95500, 20 LB. BAG
40 LB BAG - 25 BAGS
73. Avian Breeder parrot/conure $66.56 $66,560.00 $48.95 $48,950.00
ZUPREEM #75600 40 Ib. 1,000 LBS. NOBID per bag
1,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,664.00 1,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,223.75
] ZUPREEM AVIAN BREEDER NATURAL
BRAND: ZUPREEM FOR PARROTS/CONURES
STOCK# 75600 75600, 40 LB. BAG
40 LB BAG - 50 BAGS
74. Avian Breeder cockatiel > LB NO BID $66.56 $133,120.00 $48.95 $97,900.00
ZUPREEM #76600 40 Ib. 000 LBS. © per bag
2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,328.00 2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,447.50
] ZUPREEM AVIAN BREEDER NATURAL
BRAND: ZUPREEM FOR COCKATIELS
STOCK# 76600 76600, 40 LB. BAG
40 LB BAG - 20 BAGS
75. Avian Breeder fruit blend $74.98 $59,984.00 $52.32 $41,856.00
ZUPREEM #78600 40 Ib. 800 LBS. NO BID per bag
800 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,499.60 800 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,046.40
] ZUPREEM AVIAN BREEDER FRUIT BLEND
BRAND: ZUPREEM FOR PARROTS/CONURES
STOCK# 78600 78600, 40 Ib. BAG

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 15




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

ANDERSON FEED COMPANY

CHANA, IL HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX

LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC.

PREMIER NUTRITIONAL PRODUCTS,
INC.
SHAWNEE, KS

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON
THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[ ]

[ ]

NO OPTION OFFERED

X x|

[]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES [ ] NO[X]

YES [ x| NO [ ]

YES [ | NO [X]

|IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
WILD HERBIVORE PLUS
1. MAZURI #5XK4, 50 |b. BAG 8,750 LBS. $33.10 $289,625.00
8,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,792.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Marine Tabs
2. MAZURI #5TWX 50,000 Tabs $236.23 $11,811,500.00
50,000 Tabs Bidder's Price-$11,812.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Flamingo Complete
3. MAZURI #5644, 50 |b. BAG 3,000 LBS. $78.66 $235,980.00
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,719.60
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Flamingo Breeder
4, MAZURI #5645, 50 |b. BAG 3,000 LBS. $91.31 $273,930.00
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,478.60
BRAND:
STOCK#
Ratite
5. MAZURI #5647, 50 |b. BAG 7,500 LBS. $28.20 $211,500.00
7,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,230.00
BRAND:
STOCK#

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: ZOO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. : :
Rodent Diet
6. MAZURI #5663, 25 Ib. BAG 7,500 LBS. $19.33 $144,975.00
7,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,899.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Ferret Diet
7. MAZUR| #5M08, 25 Ib. BAG 625 LBS. $41.26 $25,787.50
625 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,031.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Emcelle
8. MAZURI #10111 50 LITERS $137.95 $6,897.50
50 LITERS Bidder's Price-$689.75
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Herbivore ADF 16
9. MAZUR| #5648, 50 Ib. BAG 15,000 LBS. $24.82 $372,300.00
15,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$7,446.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
10 Llama Supplement 2,000 LBS $26.97 $53,940.00
’ MAZURI #5M17, 50 Ib. BAG ’ ' ’ ’ )
2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,078.80
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
Elephant Supplement
11. MAZUR| #5666, 50 Ib. BAG 17,500 LBS. $30.15 $527,625.00
17,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$10,552.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Cricket Food, Hi calcium
12. MAZUR| #5M38. 25 Ib. BAG 375 LBS. $100.35 $37,631.25
375 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,505.25
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Guinea Pig diet
13. MAZURI #5664. 25 Ib. BAG 1,250 LBS. $17.57 $21,962.50
1,250 LBS. Bidder's Price-$878.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Reptovite Mineral Supplement
14. 5 1b. CONTAINER 150 LBS. $57.20 $8,580.00
150 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,716.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Laboratory Rabbit Diet HF
15. PURINA #5326, 50 Ib. BAG 600 LBS. $18.99 $11,394.00
600 LBS. Bidder's Price-$455.76
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
iulilmeril:acilv
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
Enrich 32 Horse
16. PURINA, 50 Ib. BAG 1,750 LBS. $28.37 $49,647.50
1,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$992.95
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Chinchilla Diet
17. MAZURI #5MO1, 25 Ib. BAG 500 LBS. $18.71 $9,355.00
500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$374.20
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Insectivore
18. MAZURI #5MK8, 25 Ib. BAG 1,500 LBS. $39.58 $59,370.00
1,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,374.80
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Gamebird Layena Crumbles
19. PURINA #5438, 50 Ib. BAG 5,000 LBS. $20.80 $104,000.00
5,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,080.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
20 Senior Equine 10,000 LBS $19.98 $199,800.00
’ PURINA, 50 Ib. BAG ’ ’ ’ ’ ’
10,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,996.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Is!
DATE: 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 20
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
illl-lnmeril:al:ilv
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
Corn, Cracked
21. 50 Ib. BAG 600 LBS. $10.48 $6,288.00
600 LBS. Bidder's Price-$125.76
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Omnivore Chow
22. ZUPREEM. 20 Ib. BAG 4,000 LBS. $24.78 $99,120.00
4,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,956.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Water Fowl Maintenance
23. MAZURI #5642. 50 Ib. BAG 3,750 LBS. $40.68 $152,550.00
3,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,051.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Wild Herbivore Diet, Hi Fiber
24. MAZURI #5ZF1, 50 Ib. BAG 40,000 LBS. $28.53 $1,141,200.00
40,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$22,824.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Exotic Canine
25. MAZURI #5M52. 50 Ib. BAG 2,750 LBS. $38.46 $105,765.00
2,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,115.30
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Is!
DATE: _ 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 21




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
i\ll-lnmeril:a City
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
Crane Maintenance
26. MAZUR| #5646, 50 |b. BAG 2,500 LBS. $39.70 $99,250.00
2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,985.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Parrot Seed Mix
27. 50 Ib. BAG 500 LBS. $34.20 $17,100.00
500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$342.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Finch Seed Mix
28. 50 Ib. BAG 1,800 LBS. $30.49 $54,882.00
1,800 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,097.64
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Sunflower Seeds
29. 50 Ib. BAG 400 LBS. $41.24 $16,496.00
400 LBS. Bidder's Price-$329.92
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
30. Peanggs‘l;aé"’A'g Shell 2,750 LBS. $77.93 $214,307.50
' 2,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,286.15 2,750 LBS. 2,750 LBS.
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Is!
DATE: _ 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 22




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
i\ll-lnmerica City
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
Bran
31. 50 Ib. BAG 400 LBS. $13.43 $5,372.00
400 LBS. Bidder's Price-$107.44
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
IAMS Less Active Cat Food
32. IAMS, 10 |b. BAG 120 LBS. NO BID
BRAND:
STOCK#
Browse Biscuits
33. MAZURI #5MAA4. 25 Ib. BAG 4,500 LBS. $38.56 $173,520.00
4,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$6,940.80
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Growth & Repro. Primate
34. MAZURI #5MAL, 25 Ib. BAG 600 LBS. $23.71 $14,226.00
600 LBS. Bidder's Price-$569.04
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Iguana Diet
35. MAZUR| #5M35, 6/case 90 LBS. $49.68 $4,471.20
90 LBS. Bidder's Price-$496.80
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
“lll-lnmeril:acilv
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
Koi Pond Nuggets
36. MAZURI #5M78, 20 Ib. BAG 160 LBS. $32.48 $5,196.80
160 LBS. Bidder's Price-$259.84
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Salt Bricks
37. BRICK 20 BRICKS $3.78 $75.60
20 BRICKS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Sheep Loco
38. MAZURI #5655, 50 Ib. BAG 3,000 LBS. $29.71 $89,130.00
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,782.60
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Tortoise Diet
39. MAZURI #5M21, 25 Ib. BAG 2,500 LBS. $31.13 $77,825.00
2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,113.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Rolled Oats
40. 50 Ibs. PER BAG 50 LBS. $14.85 $742.50
50 LBS. Bidder's Price-$14.85
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
i\ll«lnmerica City
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
Water Fowl Breeder
41. MAZURI #5640, 50 Ibs. BAG 2,500 LBS. $43.22 $108,050.00
2,500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,161.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Calcium Carbonate
42. 50 Ibs. PER BAG 300 LBS. NO BID
BRAND:
STOCK#
Oatmeal
43, 50 Ibs. PER BAG 100 LBS. NO BID
BRAND:
STOCK#
Oyster Shell
44. 50 Ibs. PER BAG 300 LBS. $23.46 $7,038.00
300 LBS. Bidder's Price-$140.76
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
45, Gel, Bird Zulife 150 $23.61 $3,541.50
MAZURI #5ME4 KILOGRAMS
150 KILOGRAMS Bidder's Price-$3,541.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-179

Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
46. Gel, Callitrichid Diet 150 $16.99 $2.548.50
MAZURI #5M15 KILOGRAMS
150 KILOGRAMS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
47. Tablets, Vita Zu Bird 4,000 $116.95 $467,800.00
MAZURI #5M25 TABLETS
4,000 TABLETS Bidder's Price-$1,637.30
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
MAZURI #5M26 TABLETS
1,000 TABLETS Bidder's Price-$143.62
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
49. Thiamine - E 2,880 $19.84 $57,139.20
MAZURI #10112, 80 GRAMS GRAMS
2,880 GRAMS Bidder's Price-$714.24
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Trace Black
50. BLOCK 24 BLOCKS $8.92 $214.08
24 BLOCKS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014
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nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso

Ali-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
Turtle Diet, Freshwater
51. MAZUR| #5M87. 25 Ib. BAG 150 LBS. $48.69 $7,303.50
150 LBS. Bidder's Price-$292.14
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Vionate Mineral Supplements
52. 10 Ib. CONTAINER 140 LBS. $54.71 $7,659.40
140 LBS. Bidder's Price-$765.94
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Zebra Pellets
53. MAZURI #5662. 50 Ib. BAG 13,750 LBS. $29.88 $410,850.00
13,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$8,217.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Petting Zoo
54. MAZURI #5295, 40 Ib. BAG 6,000 LBS. $31.60 $189,600.00
6,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,740.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Ce De Egg 1
55.
KILOGRAM KILOGRAM NG BID
BRAND:
STOCK#
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
“lll-lnmeril:acilv
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.

EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
56. Gel, Aquati Omnivore Diet 4 $34.95 $139.80
MAZURI #5294, KG KILOGRAMS
4 KILOGRAMS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Canned Primate
57. ZUPREEM, 24/case 75 CASES $18.25 $1,368.75
Ics. - 75 CASES
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Canned Marmoset
58. ZUPREEM, 24/case 50 CASES $1.52 $76.00
/can - 50 CASES
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Primate Dry Maintenance
59. ZUPREEM, 20 Ib. BAG 3,000 LBS. $34.78 $104,340.00
3,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$5,217.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Fruit Blend
60. ZUPREEM, 20 Ib. BAG 500 LBS. $31.71 $15,855.00
500 LBS. bidder's Price-$792.25
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso

All-America City

l’

Solicitation #: 2014-179

Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. EST. QTY.
Natural / Canaries-Finch / Softbill (Low Iron)
61. ZUPREEM, 20 Ib. BAG 2,000 LBS. $35.85 $71,700.00
2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$3,585.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Natural / Parrot / Conure / Softbill Low Iron
62. ZUPREEM, 20 |b. BAG S00LBS. $35.85 $17,925.00
500 LBS. Bidder's Price-$896.25
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Equine Enrich Plus
63. PURINA #35ML 50 Ib. BAG 1,750 BAGS $28.37 $49,647.50
1,750 BAGS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Goat, Honor Show Chow
64. PURINA #5973 50 Ib. BAG 1,250 BAGS $22.70 $28,375.00
1,250 BAGS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Mini-Pig, Adult
65. MAZURI # 5 791 25 Ib. BAG 7,500 BAGS $15.28 $114,600.00
7,500 BAGS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/13/2014

2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
i\ll-lllmeril:a City
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. : :
Mini-Pig, Youth
66. MAZURI # 5790 25 |b. BAG 8,750 BAGS $18.65 $163,187.50
8,750 BAGS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Timothy Hay
67. 40 0z. BAG 200 BAGS $5.53 $1,106.00
200 BAGS
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
68 Primate Cinnamon 5,000 LBS $41.94 $209,700.00
) MAZURI #5M1S 50 Ib. BAG ' ' ’ ' '
5,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$4,194.00
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Alfalfa Cubes
69. 1" cube 50 Ib. BAG 2,500 LBS. NO BID
BRAND:
STOCK#
Timothy Cubes
70. 1" cube 50 Ib. BAG S0LBS. NG BID
BRAND:
STOCK#

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

3/13/2014
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014

El Paso
iulilmeril:acilv
2010
Solicitation #: 2014-179
Department: Z0OO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
NO. ' '
71 Gel, Aquatic 25 $29.28 $732.00
MAZURI # 5M70 KILOGRAMS
25 KILOGRAMS Bidder's Price-$29.28
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Rabbit Chow Complete
72. PURINA #530J 50 Ib. BAG 1,750 LBS. $18.36 $32,130.00
1,750 LBS. Bidder's Price-$642.60
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Avian Breeder parrot/conure
73. ZUPREEM #75600 40 Ib. 1,000 LBS. $59.23 $59,230.00
1,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,480.75
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Avian Breeder cockatiel
74. ZUPREEM #76600 40 Ib. 2,000 LBS. $59.23 $118,460.00
2,000 LBS. Bidder's Price-$2,961.50
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
Avian Breeder fruit blend
75. ZUPREEM #78600 40 Ib. 800 LBS. $67.41 $53,928.00
800 LBS. Bidder's Price-$1,348.20
BRAND: LEFT BLANK
STOCK# LEFT BLANK
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Is]
DATE: _ 3/13/2014 2014-179 ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) - EL PASO ZOO 31




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO All-America City
BID TABULATION FORM 1

2010

Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC. (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2014-179
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 26, 2014 Department: ZOO

VALLEY FEED & SUPPLY INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON
THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF
THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), D D
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED X

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD: YES I:I NO Izl YESI:I NO I:I YES I:I NO I:I

|IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 16 BIDS RECEIVED: 4 BIDS LOCAL: 8 NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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