
BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM  - Flat Rate % DISCOUNT  - Flat Rate % DISCOUNT  -  55.823  % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________   MSRP  

B8747 INCLUDES SOFT TRAUMA PLATE

XP4111A SCA2014MSRP

OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

- HILITE CARRIER

ORIGINAL

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

 - HILITE CARRIER

ALTERNATE #1

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

AUSTIN, TX

AX111A

                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

POINT BLANK/PACA POINT BLANK/PACA SECOND CHANCE

3/17/2014 3/17/2014 1/1/2014
B4819 INCLUDES TRAUMA PLATE PER

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

X X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 1



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM  - Flat Rate % DISCOUNT  - Flat Rate % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________
B8747

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BY819 INCLUDES TRAUMA PLATE PER

XP111A

3/17/2014 3/17/2014

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

POINT BLANK/PACA POINT BLANK/PACA LEFT BLANK                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

- HILITE CARRIER

ORIGINAL

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

 - HILITE CARRIER

ALTERNATE #1

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

AUSTIN, TX

AX111A

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 2



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM  - Flat Rate % DISCOUNT  - Flat Rate % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

3:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

LEFT BLANK

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

- HILITE CARRIER

ORIGINAL

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

 - HILITE CARRIER

ALTERNATE #1

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

AUSTIN, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

POINT BLANK/PACA POINT BLANK/PACA LEFT BLANK                   Price List or Catalog

SOFT TRAUMA 5X8 5X8 PLATE 9LRB

3/17/2014 3/17/2014

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 3



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

4:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

YES NO YES NO YES NO

N/A NO BID

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

AUSTIN, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

- HILITE CARRIER

ORIGINAL

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

 - HILITE CARRIER

ALTERNATE #1

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

N/A NO BID LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK

                   Price List or Catalog

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)

OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.
X X X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 4



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $1,547.00 $1,231.00 $1,240.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $755.75 $563.79 $547.79

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $1,547.00 $1,231.00 $1,240.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $755.75 $563.79 $547.79

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $38.00 $38.00 $135.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $20.00 $20.00 $59.64

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): N/A NO BID $135.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): N/A NO BID $59.64

NUMBER OF BOXES & SAMPLES SUMMITED BY BIDDER 1 BOX - 2 SAMPLES - 3 PLATES

AX111A INCLUDES SOFT XP111A INCLUDES SOFT TRAUMA PLATE

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

AUSTIN, TX

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

- HILITE CARRIER

ORIGINAL

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

 - HILITE CARRIER

ALTERNATE #1

SECOND CHANCE MR01 LEVEL 111A

DESCRIPTION:
(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

DESCRIPTION:
(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

B4819 BP747 SCA-MR01-3A-U

B4819 BP747 SCA-MR01-3A-M

XP111A INCLUDES SOFT TRAUMA PLATE SECOND CHANCE MR01 LEVEL 111A

(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

N/A NO BID IMPAC-HT

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

AX111A TRAUMA PLATE

DESCRIPTION:

5X8 PLATE 5X8 PLATE IMPAC-HT

DESCRIPTION:

BP183 SOFT   B9182 HARD BP183 SOFT   BP182 HARD 1001665

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

N/A NO BID 1001665

2 BOXES - 5 SAMPLES 2 BOXES - 5 SAMPLES

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 5



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

45 45 45

           NO

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

24

        YES

PAYMENT TERMS:

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

        YES

0 - N/A - Body armor is custom 

& requires time to produce.

0 - N/A - Body armor is custom & 

requires time to produce.

        YES            NO            NO

NET - 30 DAYS

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

- HILITE CARRIER

ORIGINAL

GALLS, LLC

LEXINGTON, KY

 - HILITE CARRIER

ALTERNATE #1

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

AUSTIN, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

X 

X 

X 

X X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 6



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     -         % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________                __________ __________

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK

DIAMOND BACK TACTICAL DIAMOND BACK TACTICAL ARMOR EXPRESS                   Price List or Catalog

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #1

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

US CAVALRY

RADCLIFF, KY

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ORIGINAL

X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 7



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

LEFT BLANK

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK                   Price List or Catalog

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #1

US CAVALRY

RADCLIFF, KY

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ORIGINAL

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 8



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

3:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

LEFT BLANK

ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ORIGINAL

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #1

US CAVALRY

RADCLIFF, KY

LEFT BLANKLEFT BLANK

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK                   Price List or Catalog

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 9



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

4:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

YES NO YES NO YES NO

                   Price List or Catalog

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)

OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE

US CAVALRY

RADCLIFF, KY

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #1

LEFT BLANKLEFT BLANKLEFT BLANK

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ORIGINAL

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

X X X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 10



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $1,672.60 $1,075.00 $1,748.07

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $886.48 $569.75 $1,585.25

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $1,765.03 $1,177.57 $1,748.07

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $935.47 $624.11 $1,585.25

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK $104.99

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK $94.49

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK N/A

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK N/A

DESCRIPTION:

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK N/A

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DESCRIPTION:

SYNERGY 111A PACKAGE FEMALE NFORCE 111A PACKAGE FEMALE 40268/40733

DESCRIPTION:

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK 40746

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK

SYNERGY 111A PACKAGE NFORCE 111A PACKAGE 40268/40733

V-SYN3A-DCC-M-12 V-NFR3A-DCC-M-12 ARMOR EXPRESS REVOLUTION

ARMOR EXPRESS REVOLUTION

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

LEFT BLANK LEFT BLANK N/A

NUMBER OF BOXES & SAMPLES SUMMITED BY BIDDER NO SAMPLES SUMMITED

DESCRIPTION:

SORT TRAUMA PACK

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

V-SYN3A-DCC-F-10/12 V-NFR3A-DFS-F-10/12

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ORIGINAL

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #1

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

US CAVALRY

RADCLIFF, KY

(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

2 SAMPLES 2 SAMPLES

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 11



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

45

24 24 N/A

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
        YES            NO         YES            NO         YES

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

           NO

45 45

PAYMENT TERMS:

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ORIGINAL

GLOBAL UNIFORM 

SOLUTIONS

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #1

US CAVALRY

RADCLIFF, KY

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

X 

X 

X X X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 12



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

SURVIVAL ARMOR                   Price List or Catalog

3/1/2013

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 13



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

SECOND CHANCE BODY 

ARMOR                   Price List or Catalog

8/1/2013

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 14



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT

3:   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

POINT BLANK BODY ARMOR                   Price List or Catalog

4/2/2013

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 15



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT

4:   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________

YES NO

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

LEFT BLANK

BODY ARMOR, AND ACCESSORIES

LEFT BLANK

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)

OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 16



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $499.00 $590.00 $563.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $499.00 $590.00 $563.00

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $499.00 $590.00 $563.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $499.00 $590.00 $563.00

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $80.00 $18.00 $82.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $80.00 $18.00 $82.00

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $80.00 $18.00 $82.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $80.00 $18.00 $82.00

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING SURVIVAL ARMOR POINT BLANK SECOND CHANCE

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #2

DESCRIPTION:
(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(MALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

SURVIVAL ARMOR POINT BLANK SECOND CHANCE

LT-3A KXP3A XP3A

DESCRIPTION:
(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

(FEMALE) PROTECTIVE BODY 

ARMOR(1)

SURVIVAL POINT BLANK SECOND CHANCE

LT-3A KXP3A XP3A

DESCRIPTION:
TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION

 DEVICE 5" X 8"

SURVIVAL POINT BLANK SECOND CHANCE

F7 SOFT TRAMA PLATE IMPACT HT 7X9

DESCRIPTION:
TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

TRAUMA REDUCTION 

DEVICE 6" X 8"

SURVIVAL POINT BLANK SECOND CHANCE

L7 SOFT TRAMA PLATE IMPACT HT 7X9

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NUMBER OF BOXES & SAMPLES SUMMITED BY BIDDER 3 BOXES - 4 SAMPLES 3 BOXES - 4 SAMPLES 3 BOXES - 4 SAMPLES

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

ORIGINAL

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

ALTERNATE #1

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 17



BID ITEM:   BODY ARMOR BID # 2014-201

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 19, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & 

TACTICAL GEAR

EL PASO, TX

WILL EXTEND WITH 

APPROPRIATE PRICE INCREASE.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
        YES            NO

45

48

BIDS SOLICITED:   26                                BIDS RECEIVED:   9                                    BIDS LOCAL:   6                                         NO BID:   0           

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:     4/22/2014      2014-201 BODY ARMOR- POLICE DEPARTMENT 18


