
BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -_45__ % DISCOUNT

1:   +   15     % MARKUP   +    18    % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ MFG  __________

TS1

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

UNIFORMS

TACT SQUAD TACT SQUAD FECHHEIMER BROTHERS

WHOLESALE

                   Price List or Catalog

11/2013 3/26/14 1/2014

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 1



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - _35__ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -_28__ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

RETAIL

1/1/14 1/2014

UNIFORMS

ELBECO MANUFACTURING NO BID ELBECO                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 2



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -_40__ % DISCOUNT

3:   +  10        % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

UNIFORMS

FLYING CROSS / 

FECHHEIMER
NO BID TACT SQUAD                   Price List or Catalog

WHOLESALE 

4/1/14 2014

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 3



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -_43__ % DISCOUNT

4:   +   20     % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

YES NO YES NO YES NO

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

BLAUER MANUFACTURING NO BID HORACE SMALL                   Price List or Catalog

DISTRIBUTOR PRICE

1/2014

UNIFORMS

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)

OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.
X X X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 4



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $31.00 $11.99 $49.99

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $37.20 $14.15 $30.99

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $62.00 $26.00 $299.99

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $71.30 $30.68 $224.99

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $29.10 $27.50 $68.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $18.92 $32.45 $37.40

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $27.15 $24.50 $36.95

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $29.87 $28.91 $22.17

BLAUER K500LSP XS-XL

MB300

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

PROPPER F5315-72

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

DESCRIPTION:
POLO SHIRT, w/POCKET, 

LONG SLEEVE

POLO SHIRT, w/POCKET,

 LONG SLEEVE

POLO SHIRT, w/POCKET, 

LONG SLEEVE

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

DESCRIPTION: MOTORCYCLE PANTS MOTORCYCLE PANTS MOTORCYCLE PANTS

B708 10317EP

LS8149 K500LSP  F5315-72

B708 UNITED UNIFORM

FLYING CROSS T7004 TACT SQUAD

WORK SHIRT,

 LONG SLEEVE, MALE

TROUSERS, BDU TROUSERS, BDU TROUSERS, BDU

ELBELO U F803 FECHHEIMER 34W7886Z

DESCRIPTION:

TACT SQUAD

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

U1110 F803 34W7886Z

WORK SHIRT, 

LONG SLEEVE, MALE

WORK SHIRT, 

LONG SLEEVE, MALE

3900 T7004 T7010

DESCRIPTION:

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 5



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

10-20 45 45

           NO

% - 30 DAYS 1% - 10 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY

48

        YES

PAYMENT TERMS:

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

        YES

8 24

        YES            NO            NO

NET - 30 DAYS

BAZAAR UNIFORMS & MEN'S 

STORE

EL PASO, TX

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

INTERNATIONAL LAUNDRY 

SERVICES, INC.

EL PASO, TX

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

EL PASO, TX

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

X 

X X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 6



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     -_38__ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   +          % MARKUP   +   14     % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

(Alternate 1)

EL PASO, TX

SUN CITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

UNIFORMS

PROPPER HORACE SMALL                   Price List or Catalog

2014 PRICE LIST

1/2014

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 7



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     -_35__ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   +          % MARKUP   +   20     % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

(Alternate 1)

EL PASO, TX

SUN CITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

UNIFORMS

5.11 5.11 TACTICAL                   Price List or Catalog

2014

2014 PRICE LIST

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 8



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     -_25__ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

3:   +          % MARKUP   +   18     % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

(Alternate 1)

EL PASO, TX

SUN CITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

UNIFORMS

UNITED UNIFORM PROPPER INTERNATIONAL                   Price List or Catalog

2014

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 9



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

NET NET NET

ITEM     -_____ % DISCOUNT     -       % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

4:   +          % MARKUP   +   20     % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

YES NO YES NO YES NO

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

(Alternate 1)

EL PASO, TX

SUN CITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

UNIFORMS

NO BID LIBERTY LEVEL 2                   Price List or Catalog

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)

OF EACH CATALOG/PRICE LIST ARE

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

X X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 10



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

1. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $49.99 $20.75

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $30.99 $23.40

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

2. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $299.99 $78.00

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $224.99 $93.60

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

3. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $68.00 $14.45

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $37.40 $15.54

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: 

4. BIDDER PART NUMBER:

PRICE LIST COST BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (IF APPLICABLE): $36.95 $19.90

CITY'S COST  AFTER DISCOUNT/MARK-UP (NET): $22.17 $23.48

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

(Alternate 1)

EL PASO, TX

SUN CITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

DESCRIPTION:
POLO SHIRT, w/POCKET, 

LONG SLEEVE

POLO SHIRT, w/POCKET,

 LONG SLEEVE

POLO SHIRT, w/POCKET, 

LONG SLEEVE

PROPPER F5315-72 LIBERT 788

F5315-72 788

DESCRIPTION: MOTORCYCLE PANTS MOTORCYCLE PANTS MOTORCYCLE PANTS

UNITED UNIFORM 5.11 MOTOR BREECHES 74407

10317EP 74407

DESCRIPTION:
WORK SHIRT, 

LONG SLEEVE, MALE

WORK SHIRT, 

LONG SLEEVE, MALE

WORK SHIRT, 

LONG SLEEVE, MALE

FECHHEIMER 34W7886Z LIBERTY 771 MNV

34W7886Z 771MNV

DESCRIPTION: TROUSERS, BDU TROUSERS, BDU TROUSERS, BDU

TACT SQUAD PROPPER F5201

T7010 F5201

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 11



BID ITEM:  POLICE UNIFORMS BID # 2014-214

DEPARTMENT:  EL PASO POLICE

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED.

PROCUREMENT CARD:
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal

order in cases of emergency

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:    MARCH 26, 2014

PREMIER UNIFORM & TACTICAL 

GEAR

(Alternate 1)

EL PASO, TX

SUN CITY PUBLIC SAFETY & 

SUPPLY LLC

EL PASO, TX

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
2% - 10 DAYS    1% - 20 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT BY
        YES            NO         YES            NO         YES

BIDS SOLICITED:           29                        BIDS RECEIVED:             4                         BIDS LOCAL:           16                                 NO BID:        0      

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

           NO

45 45

48 24

X X 

X X 

APPROVED BY:         /s/        

DATE:      4/22/2014      2014-214 POLICE UNIFORMS - EL PASO POLICE DEPARTMENT 12


