Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Alt-AmericaGity

g?

e

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Depariment: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOCUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION

EL PASO, TX

EL PASO UMPIRES ASSOCIATION

EL PASO, TX

Not To Estimated Unit of TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
: Annual WMeasure COST COST COST CcosT
NO. DESCRIPTION E)é(:)i:d (Games Per (Officials {Per Official) (Formula: AXxBxC = . T;OJ %l; - (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= {{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3}
(Per Game) Year) required )per Total cost) { om;Ya(;ar #o tal()ears - Total cost) Year Total)
game) .
A s C_ D L D__
1.| VOLLEY BALL - OFFICIAL $22.00 '; 2200 |1 NOBID NO BID NO BID $22.00 $48,400.00 | $145,200.00
2. VOLLEY BALL- ASSIGNER | $3.00 | 220’0"@ 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $6,600.00 $19,800.00
GROUP 1 - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $55,000.00 | $165,000.00

GROUR2: HOCKEY

1] HOCKEY - OFFICIAL $1,"f'°¢‘ | 20 o | nommD NO BID NO BID $14.00 $3,500.00 | $10,500.00
2.| HOCKEY - SCORE KEEPER $1°°0 250 I 1 NO BID NO BID NOBID |  $10.00 $2,500.00 | §7,500.00
3. HOCKEY - ASSIGNER 3300 | 20 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 §750.00 | $2,250.00

GROUP 2 (items 1 thru 3) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $6,750.00 | $20,250.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: H . Peﬁg
DATE: CQ;I\' lﬂ

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CiTY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION . EL PASO Ug‘_P;'ZES%A.?)? OCIATION
EL PASO, TX ’
ot L ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TOTA A 3 YEAR TA
Annual (Officials CcOoST COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION E)é?sid (Ga'r:::g Ifer required per {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = (Fomlgg)él;ears . (Per Official) (Formuta: AxBx C= |(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
{Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) 3 Yt;ar Total) Total cost) . Year Total)
1. | INDOOR SOCCER OFFICIAL | $3100 | 1175 | 1 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $31.00 $36,425.00 | $109,275.00
o, | [NDOORSOCCER-SCORE | o500 | 4975 | 1 | wosmD NO BID NO BID $10.00 $11,750.00 | $35,250.00
KEEPER , fEEh
3. | INDOOR SOCCER - ASSIGNER | $3.00 | 1175 | 1. NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $352500 | $10,575.00
4. | OUTDOOR SOCCER OFFICIAL | $3400 | 500 | 1 | ~NOBID NO BID NO BID $34.00 $17,00000 | $51,000.00
G ' ey Bidder's Price
L $510,000.00
OUTDOOR SOGCER - LR e
5,  ASSIGNER _ $3.qq 500 | 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $1,500.00 |  $4,500.00
6. | OUTSOCCER-LINEJUDGE | $1500 | 50 | 1 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $15.00 §7,500.00 | $22,500.00
GROUP 3 (items 1 thru 6) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $77,700.00 | $233,100.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaiuated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: L\ . &(\'6\,
pate: {p =14

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Departmeni: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SCUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO Ué‘"LP",'}\ES%A%fOC'AT'ON
EL PASO, TX ’
GROUP:4::BASKETBALL
Unit of
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TOTAL ANNUAL ‘3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual |  (Officials COST COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION E)é(;i:d (Games Per feqUiTEda per (Per Official) (Formula: AXxBxC = . TOTAaL _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3}
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) ( omlzu;\é:'?m;(;ars— Total cost) Year Total)
A c D c D
1. COMRETITIVE - BASKETBALL $18.00 2300 g NOBID NO BID NO BID $18.00 $82,800.00 $248,400.00
OFFICIAL : : : S
COMPETITIVE BASKETBALL - | . | .| =
2. 'SCORE KEEPER v$10f00 \’ 2300 / ‘ 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.00 $23,000.00 $69,000.00
COMPETITIVE BASKETBALL - e
3. ASSIGNER k $i§f00 : 2300  1 & NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $6,900.00 $20,700.00
4. | RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL | o) 0 | gg9 | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.00 $16,800.00 | $50,400.00
OFFICIAL Sl - B
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL | .. | | .
5. " SCOREKEEPER $1000 : 80.0‘ s i NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.00 $8,000.00 $24,000.00
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL - Dr
6. ASSIGNER .$2‘.00 .’ 800 - _ 1__ “‘ NG BID NOBID NO BID $2.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00
GROUP 4 (Items 1 thru 6) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $139,100.00 | $417,300.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shaii be evaluated to detérmine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: P‘."eﬁa.
paTE: | o-11-14 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 3
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO UEIV:_P;FIR\%%A%? OCIATION
EL PASO, TX ’
it of TO NNU TOTAL ANNUAL
NotTo | Estimated | Measure < TAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR
Annual |  (Officials COST COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION E)éceed (G:n'(::l ser requi:e: per (Per Official) (Formula: AXxBx C= T_OTAL _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= {(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
ost Year) game) Total cost) (Formula: D x 3 Years = Total cost) Year Total)
{Per Game) 3 Year Total)
A B C D C D
1. 8 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $29.00 | 250 _ 1 : NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. 8 & UNDER ASSIGNER : $3.00  250 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. 10 & UNDER OFFICIAL $27.00 300 -2 NO BID NO BID NO BIiD NO BID NO BID NO BID
4., 10 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 | = 300 i 1 = NQ BID NC BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
5. 12 & UNDER OFFICIAL $27.00 | 250 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. 12 & UNDER ASSIGNER $300 | 250 .| 1 | wNomID NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: This ié a Best Value Procurement. Price a.nd othér factdrs shvall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

WRewe

DATE: LQ “1\-1M

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO U;"ﬂ':i%”‘?f“'”““
EL PASO, TX ’
Unit of
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TOTALANNUAL| 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual (Official COST COST COST cosT 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eé(;(::d (G:;g: ger requi:::}fer {Per Official) (Formula: AxBxC= (FormIz?[;rx Asi\-(ears - {Per Official) (Formula: AxBxC = (FOfmUi?;al::?:’tYleafs =3f
(Per Game). Year) game}) Total cost) 3 Year Total) Total cost) otal)
T T A T oo e e e i A B e TR C, R ™ D — C o — D
7. 14 & UNDER OFFICIAL $2800 | - 200 »_: 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. 14 & UNDER OFFICIAL $300 [ 200 | 1| wNoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
9. 16 & UNDER OFFICIAL $28.00 | 200 | 2 | NOBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10. 16 & UNDER ASSIGNER §300 | 200 | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11.] 18 & UNDER OFFICIAL $28.00 | 100 2 | NOBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12. 18 ‘& UNDER ASSIGNER : $3.00 1100 ' 1 Z NO BID NO BiD NO BiD NO BID NO BiD NO BID
GROUP & (ltems 1 thru 12) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID NO BID

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaiuated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED bY; W\ Pevia

DATE: __| g~ n“\q

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

:

2l

I

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO Ug’_”;‘:i%’\ffoc”\“o”
EL PASO, TX ’
Unit”o'fu TAL ANNUAL 0 NUAL
Not To | Estimated | Measure TOTAL AN 3 YEAR TOTAL AN
Annual | (Officia COST cosT COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eé(;es:d (G;rl:l::s ger requir:; Psef (Per Official) (Formula: AxBxC= TI.O[;T Aél; - (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
{Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) (F°"m; Yae-ar #omt)!ars = Total cost) Year Total)
N S _A__| B I D | C i I
LEAGUE & PLAYOFFS - il .
1. OFFICIAL $23.00 -5300". -1 $21.00 $111,300.00 | $333,900.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID
LEAGUE & PLAYOFFS 3 SR A
2. ASSIGNER $3'00_: ‘ :-5300 . : _1  : NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. | TOURNAMENT (1) - OFFICIAL ,$23'.,00 100 | 1 : NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. | TOURNAMENT (1) - ASSIGNER $3.00 ; 100 A NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
5. | TOURNAMENT (2) - OFFICIAL . $20;00 o100 - : 2 NG BiD NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID
6. | TOURNAMENT (2) - ASSIGNER | $3;00 100 £e 1 ‘ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: This IS a Best Vaiue Procurement. Pri’ce and.other factors shall be evaiuated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ]4. Q‘Q ﬁ«,
DATE: LQ‘%\\“\“\

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION




El aso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM |1

2010

Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014 Solicitation #: 2014-315
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS Departmeni: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PAss%ggggssvfsss"roléin?%gmplRE EL PASO UMPIRES ASSOCIATION
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
“Uﬁit of :
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TOTALANNUAL|  3YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual (Officials CcosT . COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. . DESCRIPTION E)é(;es:d (Games Per required per {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = Tol;r A!; ~ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = {(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
‘ (Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) (FOm;$éar ? :talt)ears = Total cost) Year Total)
R A | B | ¢ | D R
7.| ONEFITCHIOURNAMENT | w000 | 100 | 1 | wosi NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. ONF ;gggggggg;mm $1000 | 100 | 1| nNoBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9. | ONE P'ngsrgﬁggAMEm $300 | 100 | 1 | wnoBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP 6 (items 1 thru 9) - GRAND TOTAL $111,300.00 | $333,900.00 NO BID
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

-
APPROVED BY: \,L ' Pf nev

DATE: _{ 0~ )~ ‘ L\ 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO

D TABULATION FORM

Il

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Depariment: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO UE“’I'_PI'DT\';%A]?)?OC'AT'ON
EL PASO, TX ’
Unit of LA ]
NotTo | Estimated | peasure TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual (Officials COST COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eé(:)é;d (Garr‘nes Per feQIﬁTE:iaPeT {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = . 1;0;‘. A!; - (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = |(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3}
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) { Om;ytarﬁta];ars_ Total cost) Year Total)
A B S . — S N— —
1. 8 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $25.00 | | 200° g 1 ‘ NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00
2. 8 & UNDER - ASSIGNER ‘ $3,00 200 k B NO BiD NO BID NO BiD $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
3. 10 & UNDER OFFICIAL $000 | 10 | 2 | wosD NO BID NO BID $30.00 | $10,20000 | $30,600.00
4. 10 & UNDER ASSIGNER $300 | 170 | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $510.00 $1,530.00
5. 12 & UNDER OFFICIAL $3>'1.00 : 470 2 NO BID NO BID NO BiD $31.00 $10,540.00 $31,620.00
6. 12 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00. : 170 1 k NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $510.00 $1,530.00
NOTE: This ié a Best Value Procurement. Priceband other factors shail'be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The informatibn contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: U}P{ﬁw
2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 8
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
oect Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CiTY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

i

El aso

All-Bmericatit

|k

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE

~EL PASO, TX

SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION

EL PASO UMPIRES ASSQCIATION

EL PASO, TX

Unit of
Not To Estimated | WMeasure TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual |  (Officil COST COST coSsT COST 3 YEAR TOTAL

NO. DESCRIPTION Eé(:::d (Ga'r‘nr:g ra'er requirgda :er (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= . TOI;”:‘; _ {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§

(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) { om;;éar¥otal§ars- Total cost) Year Total)
7. 14 & UNDER OFFICIAL $32.00. 210 | - 21"? NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.00 $13,440.00 $40,320.00
8. 14 & UNDERASSIGNER | $300 | 210 | 1 | nNOBID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $630.00 $1,890.00
9. 16 & UNDER OFFICIAL $34.00° | 100 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.00 $6,800.00 | $20,400.00
10. 16 & UNDER OFFICIAL $3.00 | 100 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $300.00 $900.00

GROUP 7 (Items 1 thru 10) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $48,530.00 $145,590.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: H P‘Q na
pate: Lo © (Y

| ‘ | T

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

All-imerica

I

2010

Soiicitation #: 2014-315
Depariment: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASC SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION

EL PASO, TX

EL PASO UMPIRES ASSOCIATION

EL PASO, TX

Unit of T
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TOTALANNUAL| 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual | (Officiat cosT COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eé‘:)esid (szme;I l?er require; :51' {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= . T;OJAI; _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
(Per Game) Year) game) : Total cost) ¢ orm; Ya\e:ar¥;alt)aars— Total cost) Year Total)
1. 'MITE - OFFICIAL $30.00 | 500 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.00 $45,000.00 | $135,000.00
2. MITE - ASSIGNER $3.00 | 500 | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00
3. 'MINOR OFFICIAL $31.00 | 500 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.00 $46,500.00 | $139,500.00
4, MINOR - ASSIGNER $3.00 | 500 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00
5. | INTERMEDIATE - OFFICIAL | $31.00-| 500 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $31.00 $46,500.00 | $139,500.00
: ’ : : Bidder's Price
$137,500.00
6. | INTERMEDIATE - ASSIGNER | $300 | 500 | 1 | NOBD NO BID NO BID $3.00 $1,500.00 | $4,500.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated 0 defermine an awardee.
The informatipn contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contraci.

APPROVED BY: u . E-&ﬂa
pate: Le- (-1 Y

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Projet Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Departimient: PARKS AND RECREATION

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actuai award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: __ M. ?‘Qr)a
pare:__lg =11 ~1Y

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO Ug]_PFI&g%A%? OCIATION
EL PASO, TX ’
- | Unit 0% | TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
NotTo | Estimated | Measure AL 3YEAR !
Annual |  (Officia COST COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eé‘:‘:d {Games Per requi:g:f:er (Per Official) (Formula: AxBxC= TQJAL _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) (Form;:;:ar ;(_:t;z)ears . Total cost) Year Total)
A1 B ¢ LI N c | D
7. MAJOR - OFFICIAL $34.00 100 3"; NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.00 $10,200.00 $30,600.00
8. MAJOR - ASSIGNER $3.00 100 : 1. NO BID NO BID NO BIiD $3.00 $300.00 $900.00
9. TOURNAMENT - OFFICIAL $3400 56 . |4 NO BiD NG BID NO BID $34.00 $6,800.00 $20,400.00
10. TOURNAMENT - ASSIGNER -$3.00 : 50 : ' 1 % NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.60 $150.00 $450.00
. : Bidder's Price Bidder's Price
$1,500.00 $4,500.00
GROUP 8 (ltems 1 thru 10) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $159,950.00 | $479,850.00
Bidder's Price Bidder's Price
. $164,000.00 $492,000.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

El Paso

-Amem:a lm

L1

2010
Solicitation #: 2014-315

Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO UNIPIRES ASSOCIATION
EL PASOC, TX ?
: ',UIC.aTOilRNAMEN_T,S:BAS_EBAL ASKETBA T
Unit of
Not To Estimated | [easure TOTAL ANNUAL 3YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Exceed | Annual (Officials COoST COST TOTAL COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Cost {Games Per required per (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = Formula: D x 3 Years = (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |(Formula: Dx 3 Years =3
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) ( Ol'm;l Ya‘(::ar;otal;!ars— Total cost) Year Total)
A B c D [ D
: e o Bidder's Price Bidder's Price
$900.00 $2,700.00
2. ONE COMPLEX or FACILITY | $1_50.00. [ [1 ; 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $450.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00
: A Bidder's Price | Bidder's Price
$1,500.00 $4,500.00
3.| MULTIPLE COMPLEXES or | $300.00 0 | 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $450.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00
FACILITIES ER S Bidder's Price | Bidder's Price
$3,000.00 $9,000.00
GROUP 9 (items 1 thru 3) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $9,090.00 | $27,270.00
Bidder's Price | Bidder's Price
$5,400.00 $16,200.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Q.Oent«.
DATE: in-f -1

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO a
BiD TABULATION FORM ?éégéy

2010

Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

Solicitation #: 2014-315
< Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

EL PASO SOUTHWEST USSSA UMPIRE
SOFTBALL ASSOCIATION EL PASO UMPIRES ASSOCIATION

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE

ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,
BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE

WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE

SELECTED OPTIONS.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF
EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT

PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE D ‘:)
EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT L]
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE
EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED. I:I

PAYMENT TERMS: _ NET - 30 DAYS % - 20 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYNIENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: , YES L] NO ves | ] NO

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

" APPROVED BY: M? .’6&.

DATE: LQ" n-' ‘ t" 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 13
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Bid

Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014

CITY OF EL. PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

An-RmesicaGity

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
Not To Estimated Unit of TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual | M COST COST CcOST costT |3 YEARTOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eé‘:;id (Ga'l"'nr;g :er (ggfigie (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = . 1;01;]- l%’; _ {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
(Per Game) Year) required)per . Total cost) ( orm; Yale;ar ;otaliars = Total cost) Year Total)
game]
A B ol D o D
1.| VOLLEYBALL-OFFICIAL | $2200 | 2200 | 1 | $2100 | $4620000 | $138,600.00 $0.00 $0.00
2. VOLLEY BALL- ASSIGNER $3.00 2200 1 $3.00 $6,600.00 $19,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 1 - GRAND TOTAL $52,800.00 $158,400.00 $0.00 $0.00
. Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
.GROUP:2: HOCKEY.*
1. HOCKEY - OFFICIAL ‘$14.00 » 250 “ , =4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
2. HOCKEY - SCORE KEEPER $10.00 | 250 | 1 NC BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
3. HOCKEY - ASSIGNER $300 | 250 | 1 | wNoBD NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 2 (items 1 thru 3) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. ,
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: L\ JPena

DATE: LQ:'\")"‘

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

Al-Bmesicaliy

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AMD RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
SOCCER _ Bl
Unit of . N
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TOTALANNUAL| 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual (Officials COST COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION E)ézzid (Ga?n:g Per requir:d per (Per Official) {Formula: AxBxC= . TOI;TASI; _ {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = |{Formula: D x 3 Years = 3§
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) { orm; Yae;ariotal;ears_ Total cost) Year Total)
A B C D [ D
T ; — AAAAAAAAAAAAA e s —————— o T SR BTy
1. | INDOOR SOCCER OFFICIAL $31.00 1175 1. NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
INDOOR SOCCER - SCORE | .. I v )
2. KEEPER $10}.00 | 1175 13, : NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
3. | INDOOR SOCCER - ASSIGNER | - $3.00 1175 1 NO BiD NC BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
4. | OUTDOOR SOCCER OFFICIAL ,$34.00 ~ 500 o ' NOBID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
OUTDOOR SOCCER - | | S '
5. ASSIGNER $3,oo | ’5_00 e 1 NG BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
6. | OUTSOCCER-LINEJUDGE | $1500 | 500 | 1. | WNOBID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 3 (ltems 1 thru 8) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shail be evaiuated 10 dotermine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does noft constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: H . P*Qﬁ—ct
pate:_ Lo = 11=14

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid

Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS _

Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014

CiTY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

%lé&menca Gty

2010

°

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
geasin U TAL ANNUAL
NotTo | Estimated | Wieasure TOTALANNUAL| 3 YEAR T0
Annual (Officials COSsT COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTlON Eé(;es:d (Ga?-nes Per feqUill'eld per (Per Official) {Formula; AxBxC= - TOJA‘; _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3}
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) ( onn3u ;éar.?;a;ars— Total cost) Year Total)
R . S - L S — SR —
COMPETITIVE -BASKETBALL | . | .. | _
1. OFFICIAL $18.00 f 23(?0 ’ »2. NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
COMPETITIVE BASKETBALL - || . , e :
2. SCORE KEEPER .$10.oq 2800 | 1 NO BiD NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
COMPETITIVE BASKETBALL- | . | |
3. " ASSIGNER $3.0Q : 2300. ; 1 _ NO BID NO BID NOBID $0.00 $0.00
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL i , Rl
4, . OFFICIAL $21700 - 800 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL -| - | e
5. ' SCOREKEEPER $10.00 | 800‘, B : 1 NO BiD NO BID NO BiD ~ $0.00 $0.00
RECREATIONAL BASKETBALL - Lt .
6. ASSIGNER : $200 e 8‘0_0 : w i NO BID NO BID NO BiD $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 4 (ltems 1 thru 6) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $0.00 $0.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and .other factors shall be evaiuated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: B . M&,

pate: Lo~ \&-"L\

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

ll—nmencacily

pIlL

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Depariment: PARKS AND RECREATION

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: L& PXAEW
pate:_lg - }\—\"‘

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
it of AL AL TOTAL ANNUAL
Not To Estimated | Weasure TOTAL ANNU 3 YEAR AL Al
Annual |  (Officia cOST COST COoST coSsT 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eé(:)esid (Garr‘ng:l ger requi:z::er {Per Official) (Formula: AxBxC= | _ -I:OJA:;!; _ {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) { orm;';éar ?otal;ars = Total cost) Year Total)
1. 8 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $29.00 - 250 :  1 2 $29.060 $7,250.00 ?21,750.(?0 $0.00 $0.00
: Bidder's Price
R $21,715.00
2. 8 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 250 ”i‘:“ : $3.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $0.00 $0.00
3. 10; & UNDER OFFICIAL ‘$2/7.00 300 : .2’ - $27.00 $16,200.00 $48,600.00 $0.00 $0.00
4, 10 & UNDER ASSIGNER v $3.00 ©300 ¢ 1 $3.00 $900.00 $2,760.00 $0.00 $0.00
5. 12 & UNDER OFFICIAL $2700 250 2:-1’ ' $27.60 $13,500.00 $40,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
6. 12 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 | 280 | 1 $3.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $0.00 $0.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Prfce and other factors shaii be evaluated {c determine an awardee.

17
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

: All-Americatily
31D TABULATION FORM \ %%gg f
. 2010
Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014 Solicitation #: 2014-315
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
- GROUP5: GIRL'S FAST PITCH SOFTB T
ot TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TA 3YEAR
1 Annual |  (Officials COoSsT cosT - COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. - DESCRIPTION Eé?s:d (Garr::: ger required per {Per Official) (Formula: AXxBx C = . IIODT él;‘ - (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= {(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3}
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost} ¢ om13u \Zar?o{al‘;am— Total cost) Year Total)
7. 14 & UNDER OFFICIAL $28.00 | 200 2 $28.00 $11,200.00 | $33,600.00 $0.00 $0.00
8. 14 & UNDER OFFICIAL “$3.00 | 200 | 1 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
9. 16 & UNDER OFFICIAL $2800 | 200 | 2 | $28.00 $11,200.00 | $33,600.00 $0.00 $0.00
10.|  16.& UNDER ASSIGNER $300 | 200 | 1 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
1. 18 & UNDER OFFICIAL :szs.oo' 00| 2 $28.00 $5,600.00 | $16,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
12.|  18& UNDER ASSIGNER $300 | 100 |1 | $300 $300.00 $900.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 5 (Items 1 thru 12) - GRAND TOTAL $68,850.00 | $206,550.00 $0.00 $0.00
Bidder's Price
' LEFT BLANK

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated (o defermine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: L\;-Q@\TC L

DATE: ( 0-\ S" l q 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 18
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Pas

14
it

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
GROUP 6: SLOW.PI e
e of OTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
NotTo | Estimated | Heasure TOTAL 3 YEAR
A ici 0ST COST COST COST 3YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Exceed (Garr:g: s:r re(rgifrz:l:er (Pg Official) (Formula: A xiB xC= TOTAL {Per Official) (Formula:OASx BxC= [{Formula:Dx3 Years= SF
Cost Year) game) Total cost) {Formula: D x 3 Years = Total cost) Year Total)
(Per Game) 3 Year Total)
A ) B C D C D
LEAGUE & PLAYOFFS - SO A
1. OFFICIAL $23_.00 5300 » 1 ; $22.00 $116,600.00 | $349,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
LEAGUE & PLAYOFFS ’ g :

2. " ASSIGNER $300 | 5300 i $2.50 $13,250.00 $39,750.00 $0.00 $0.00
3. | TOURNAMENT (1)- OFFICIAL | $23.00 | 100 | 1 $22.00 $2,200.00 |  $6,600.00 $0.00 $0.00

4. | TOURNAMENT (1) - ASSIGNER v$3.00' 2 1060 o 17 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 $0.00 $0.00

5. | TOURNAMENT {2) - OFFICIAL $20.’00 100 oL ' oy $19.00 $3,800.00 $11,400.00 $0.00 $0.00

6. | TOURNAMENT (2) - ASSIGNER $3‘.00 ; 100 ; 1 i $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 $0.00 $0.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Precurement. Price and other fadtors shai‘l be evaiuated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \-1 Penia
DATE: B 0\J ]'S (’CI Q ‘ aq\ 61 0 } “‘ 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 19
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CITY OF EL PASG
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

Soiicitation #: 2014-315

Departmeni: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
GROUP.6: SL:OW:PITCH'SOFTBAL : :
Unit of
NotTo | Estimated | Weasure TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
: Annual |  (Officia COsT COST COST cosT 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. - DESCRIPTION Exceed (Games Per TEQUi:z:::e" (P:; Official) (Formula: AxBxC= TOTAL _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years =34
Cost Year) game} Total cost) {Formule: Dx 3 Vears = Total cost) Year Total)
(Per Game) 3 Year Total)
ONE PITCH TOURNAMENT win e ‘ .
7. ; OFFICIAL $20.00 . 100 . 1 . $19.00 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 $0.00 $0.00
ONE PITCH TOURNAMENT o _
8. SCOREKEEPER $1000 | 100 | | 1 $10.00 $1,000.00 | $3,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
ONE PiTCH TOURNAMENT e : S SO '
8. " ASSIGNER $00 )00 e A $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 $0.00 $0.00
2
GROUP 6 (items 1 thru 9) - GRAND TOTAL §139,850.00 | $418,950.00 $0.00 $0.00
‘ Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaiuated {o determine an awardee,
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: B P‘e na
DATE: 12-0. \ I'S.Qd LQ - 9-‘-\" aON 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 20
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CiTY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Solicitation #: 2014-315
P Depariment: PARKS AND RECREATION
TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
e [
N it of L AL ANNUAL
Not To Estimated | Measure TOTAL ANNUA 3YEAR TOT, A
Annual | (offcia coST COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION Eg:::d (Ga':\':g :er requi:e:ia:er {Per Official) (Formula: AXBx C = TI.OEAI; _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBxC= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3}
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) (F°'m;;éar ;:&al‘;m - Total cost) Year Total)
A B S D — S L —
1. 8 & UNDER - OFFICIAL $25.00 200 - A $24.80 $4,800.00 $14,400.00 $0.00 $0.00
2. 8 & UNDER - ASSIGNER $300 | 200 | 1 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
3. 10 & UNDER OFFICIAL $3000 170 2 $29.00 $9,860.00 $29.580.00 $6.00 $6.00
4. 10 & UNDER ASSIGNER = $3.00 S 170 f 1 $3.00 $510.00 $1,530.00 $0.00 $0.00
5. 12 & UNDER OFFICIAL $31.00 ' 170 2 $30.00 $10,200.00 $30,600.00 $0.00 $0.00
6. 12 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00 : 170 N 1‘ $3.00 $510.006 $1,530.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price énd other factors shall be evaluated 1o determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: “ »()‘(’.ﬁw

pate:_Le= 11— !

2014-315 SPORTS OFFiCIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Departiment: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4

EL PASO, TX

. Unit of
NotTo | Estimated | feasure TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual (Officials COST--~ COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION E)é‘::d (Ga'r‘n‘::l Fa’er requirenla per {Per Official) (Formula: AxBxC= | 'l;OI;I'ﬁ;% _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
: (Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) ( °”"; Ya:ar)'l('otal)ears- Total cost) Year Total)
A B C D c D
7. 14 & UNDER OFFICIAL $32.00 S210 » 2 $31.00 $13,020.00 $39,060.00 $0.00 $0.00
8. 14 & UNDER ASSIGNER $3.00° 210 1 $3.00 $630.00 $1,890.00 $0.00 $0.00
9. 16 & UNDER OFFICIAL 334.00 100 20 $32.06 $6,400.00 _$19‘,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
10. 16 & UNDER OFFICIAL ‘ $3.00 - | 100 1 $3.00 $300.00 $900.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 7 (ltems 1 thru 10) - GRAND TOTAL $46,830.00 | $140,490.00 $0.00 $0.00
Bidder's Price
: LEFT BLANK
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shail be evaluated to dete

rmine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _L‘m
pATE: _{g—{| — !"\

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

1 Paso

&
Al-Aimesicatity

|15

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
it of (0] wot]l avee | ot L ANNUAL
NotTo | Estimated | WMeasure TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTA NUA
Annual (Official: coSsT COST COST COST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION E)é(;esid (Garrlnl::ser requir:da :er {Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C = . 1;0[3- As% ~ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |(Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
(Per Game) Year) game) Totatcost) | orm;Yaéariota;ars'A Total cost) Year Total)
A B C D C D
1. -MITE - OFFICIAL -$30.00 » 500 3 - NO BiD NO BID NQ BID $0.00 $0.00
2. MITE - ASSIGNER $3.60v 17500 : 1 NO BID NO BID NO BiD $0.00 $0.00
3. MINOR OFFICIAL $31.00 |+ 500 : 3 NO BiD NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
4, MINOR - ASSIGNER "~ $3.00 -500 I NO BID NOBID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
5. INTERMEDIATE - OFFICIAL $3100 ;k 500 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
6. INTERMEDEATE - ASSIGNER $3.00: | ? 500 : 1 e NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Proéurement. Price and other factérs shail ‘be evaiuated {o determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabuiation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: H . !)‘Qﬁ(«.
DATE: k" ‘ !v— ‘q

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

All-AmericaCity

©

2010

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Departmeni: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4

EL PASO, TX

Unit of
Not To | Estimated | Neasure TOTAL ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual | (Officia cosT COST coST cosT 3 YEAR TOTAL

NO. DESCRIPTION Eé(;iid (Garr‘n[:g ser requir::f:er {Per Official) (Formula: AXBx C = . T;Or;rpa‘!\? _ (Per Official) (Formula: AxBx C= |{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3f
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) { om;;éar:‘otal;ars_ Total cost) Year Total)
7. MAJOR - OFFICIAL §3400 | 100 | 3 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
8. MAJOR - ASSIGNER $3.00 - 100 . 1 NO BID NO BiD NO BID $0.00 $0.00
9. TOURNAMENT - OFFICIAL $34,00 50 4 _ MO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $0.00
10. TOURNAMENT - ASSIGNER +$3.00- 50| 1 NO BID NG BIiD NO BID $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 8 (items 1 thru 10) - GRAND TOTAL NO BID $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated fo determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information oniy and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ' &

DATE: Q'\l-'lq

2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION
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CiTY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014 Solicitation #: 2014-315
Project Name: SPORTS OFFICIALS _ _ Department: PARKS AND RECREATION
TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX
GROUP.9: UIC TOURNAMENTS-BASEBAI L LLEYBALL
Unit of
NotTo | Estimated | Measure TOTALANNUAL|  3VEAR TOTAL ANNUAL
Annual (Offciat COST cosT COST COoST 3 YEAR TOTAL
NO. DESCRIPTION E)C“;e;d (Ga?nl:: ger require;:er (Per Official) {Formula: AXxBxC= TOTAL - (Per Official) {Formula: AxBx C= {{Formula: Dx 3 Years = 3§
(Per Game) Year) game) Total cost) (Fonn;lYaé 3 ; ; ;(l;ears = Total cost) Year Total)
A LBl C S SR WSO W S———
1. SINGLE FILED or GYM $5000 | 2 | 1 | s50.00 $160.00 $300.00 $0.00 $0.00
2. | ONE COMPLEX or FACILITY | $i50.00 | ~ 10 = | 1»" o $150.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
MULTIPLE COMPLEXES or .
4 B (S
3. FACILITIES 3300.00°) 0.1\ 1 | #0000 $3,000.00 | $9,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
GROUP 9 (ltems 1 thru 3) - GRAND TOTAL 9460000 | $13,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ridder's Price
' EEFT BLANK

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awargoe.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: 1} ‘Ej—)(\,

DATE: Q utl 1 Bt | q 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 25
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El Paso
kAL

CiTY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date: MAY 21, 2014

Solicitation #: 2014-315
Project Name: S

PORTS OFFICIALS < Department: PARKS AND RECREATION

TEXAS ASA - DISTRICT 4
EL PASO, TX

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE

ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,
BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE

WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE

SELECTED OPTIONS. ‘

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF
EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT - D
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE I:]
EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT D D
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE
EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

NO OPTION OFFERED. l:‘

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYNIiENT BY
PROCUREMENT CARD: . YES | ] wo YES | | NO [ ]

BIDS SOLICITED: 7 BIDS RECEIVED: 0 BIiDS LOCAL: 7 NOBID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shail be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabuiation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: H v &E | AW

DATE: ‘_.e "l ] - ‘ q 2014-315 SPORTS OFFICIALS - PARKS AND RECREATION 26




