Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART A: LABOR RATE
SERVICE LABOR RATE - AUTOMOBILE
1. REGULAR HOURS $15.00 $14.00
per hour per hour
SERVICE LABOR RATE - BUS
2. REGULAR HOURS $15.00 $14.00
per hour per hour
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP | TMC [9100'S]
Eimssz SERVEET'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'};::T"EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=0)
(D) (A) (8) (CxD=E) (A) B) (CxD=E)
1. 25x31v," SIDE WINDOW 102-040395 80 $67.00 $15.00 $6,560.00 $58.00 $14.00 $5,760.00
Bidder's Price
$72.00
2. [15%x39" |EXIT DOOR BOTH HALVES || G1000842 5 $51.00 $15.00 $330.00 $49.00 $14.00 $315.00
Bidder's Price
$63.00
3. | 20x52" SIDE BOTTOM G1012318 10 $96.00 $15.00 $1,110.00 $82.00 $14.00 $960.00
DESTINATION SIGN Bidder's Pri
idder's Price
$96.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

11/3/2014

Is]

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP | TMC [9100'5]
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERV:;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) @) (CxD=E)
4. | 11xs52" |[SIDEUPPERDESTINATION| 41410317 10 $45.00 $15.00 $600.00 $42.00 $14.00 $560.00
SIGN POOT T
Bidder's Price
$56.00
5. | 13%2x | ENTRANCE DOORFRONT | 4005157 10 $35.00 $15.00 $500.00 $22.00 $14.00 $360.00
281" & REAR UPPER PV
Bidder's Price
$36.00
6. | 13vx2s | ENTRANCEDOORFRONT | 54005157 5 $35.00 $15.00 $250.00 $20.00 $14.00 $170.00
& REAR MIDDLE T
Bidder's Price
$34.00
7. | 9x13w | ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT | 54005155 5 $35.00 $15.00 $250.00 $12.00 $14.00 $130.00
& REAR LOWER P
Bidder's Price
$26.00
8. | 39xa3 WINDSHIELD LH G1001422 10 $164.00 $15.00 $1,790.00 $105.00 $14.00 $1,190.00
Bidder's Price
$119.00
9. | 39xa3 WINDSHIELD RH G1001426 10 $164.00 $15.00 $1,790.00 $105.00 $14.00 $1,190.00
Bidder's Price
$119.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP | TMC [9100'S]
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERV';:T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
10. | 19x36" DRIVERS REAR HALF G1007237 5 $57.00 $15.00 $360.00 $48.00 $14.00 $310.00
GLASS . , .
Bidder's Price
$62.00
11. | 21x3e" | PRIVERSFRONTHALF | 541007232 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $56.00 $14.00 $350.00
GLASS . , .
Bidder's Price
$70.00
12. || 15%x84 [DESTINATION SIGN FRONT| G1011174 5 $120.00 $15.00 $675.00 $102.00 $14.00 $580.00
Bidder's Price
$116.00
13. || NONE | ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT | G1005156 5 $120.00 $15.00 $675.00 $102.00 $14.00 $580.00
Bidder's Price
$116.00
GROUP | TOTAL $15,290.00 $12,455.00
Bidder's Price - $985.00
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: ves | ] NO [x] ves [ ] no (x|

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

All-America City

BID TABULATION FORM N
> 2010
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014 Solicitation #: 2015-116
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER 9400'S
SERVICE LABOR
TEM | e DESCRIPTION PN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUMEONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) A) (8) (CxD=E) A) B) (CxD=E)
1. 28%x31" SIDE WINDOW GLASS 6320251 20 $78.00 $15.00 $1,860.00 $69.00 $14.00 $1,660.00
Bidder's Price
$83.00
2. 271:‘ X ' EMERGENCY WINDOW 6320240 30 $65.00 $15.00 $2,400.00 $56.00 $14.00 $2,100.00
28% Bidder's Price
$70.00
3. 12x26" EXIT DOOR GLASS 110988 5 $35.00 $15.00 $250.00 $14.00 $14.00 $140.00
Bidder's Price
$28.00
4. 18%2"x56 SIDE BOTTOM 6320257 5 $93.00 $15.00 $540.00 $79.00 $14.00 $465.00
DESTINATION SIGN Bidder's Price
$93.00
5. | 10vsx56 [|SIDE UPPER DESTINATION| 6350556 5 $35.00 $15.00 $250.00 $34.00 $14.00 $240.00
SIGN Bidder's Price
$48.00
6. | L7 x | ENTRANCEDOORUPPER | 0p7441 5 $81.00 $15.00 $480.00 $69.00 $14.00 $415.00
53% GLASS Bidder's Price
$83.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 4




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP II NEW FLYER 9400'S

SERVICE LABOR SERVICE LABOR
EiTr:hNnSXED RATE TOTAL COST RATE TOTAL COST
TEM | e DESCRIPTION PN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUMEONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) @) (CxD=E)
7. | 12x17va" ENTRANCE DOOR 027442 5 $35.00 $15.00 $250.00 $10.00 $14.00 $120.00
BOTTOM GLASS Bidder's Price
$24.00
8. | 39x48" | WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE | 8112389 10 $185.00 $15.00 $2,000.00 $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
Bidder's Price
$134.00
9. | 39x3s" | WINDSHIELD, STREET 8112388 10 $140.00 $15.00 $1,550.00 $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
SIDE Bidder's Price
$134.00
10. [ 18x33%" | PRIVER'SSIDEFRONT & | 5347503 5 $50.00 $15.00 $325.00 $39.00 $14.00 $265.00
REAR Bidder's Price
$53.00
11. | 8%x38" | DRIVER'S SIDE UPPER 6309009 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $14.00 $14.00 $140.00
Bidder's Price
$28.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP II NEW FLYER 9400'S

E,SORZISXED SERVE:T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV';:TLEABOR TOTAL COST
TEM | e DESCRIPTION PN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUMEONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
12. | 12x73%" [FRONT DESTINATION SIGN| 100521 5 $120.00 $15.00 $675.00 $59.00 $14.00 $365.00
Bidder's Price
$73.00
GROUP Il TOTAL $10,855.00 $8,590.00
Bidder's Price - $851.00
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: ves [ | NO [x] ves | | wno  [x]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO m
BID TABULATION FORM )

2010

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014 Solicitation #: 2015-116
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Ill NEW FLYER [2004]
SERVICE LABOR
ITEM SIZE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) A) (8) (CxD=E) A) B) (CxD=E)
1. N/A UPPER GLASS 6322119 5 $115.00 $15.00 $650.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00
2. N/A LOWER GLASS 6319225 5 $140.00 $15.00 $775.00 $120.00 $14.00 $670.00
Bidder's Price
$134.00
3. N/A LOWER FIXED GLASS 6317979 5 $190.00 $15.00 $1,025.00 $79.00 $14.00 $465.00
Bidder's Price
$93.00
4, N/A UPPER GLASS DEST SIGN 6317524 5 $120.00 $15.00 $675.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00
5. N/A LOWER FIXED GLASS, 6322122 5 $140.00 $15.00 $775.00 $105.00 $14.00 $595.00
EMERGENCY . . ;
Bidder's Price
$119.00
6. N/A LOWER FIXED GLASS 6326096 5 $85.00 $15.00 $500.00 $79.00 $14.00 $465.00
Bidder's Price
$93.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 7




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

El Paso
All-America City
|
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
E,SOLH\N"SXED SERVEE ABOR | 1oTAL cosT SERVEE LABOR | 1oTaL cosT
TEM | e DESCRIPTION PN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUMEONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
7. N/A SASH GLASS 6320859 5 $60.00 $15.00 $375.00 $48.00 $14.00 $310.00
Bidder's Price
$62.00
8. N/A SASH GLASS 6322127 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00
9. N/A SASH GLASS 6322081 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00
10. N/A SASH GLASS 6322121 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00
11. N/A SASH GLASS 6326097 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00
12. N/A GLASS SASH 6322121 5 $70.00 $15.00 $425.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT



Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

‘IIIIV

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
SERVICE LABOR
ITEM || g1zE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(0) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)
13. N/A DOOR GLASS EXIT 063575 5 $80.00 $15.00 $475.00 $42.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$56.00
14. N/A GLASS BOTTOM ENTR 111255NFA 5 $55.00 $15.00 $350.00 $28.00 $14.00 $210.00
Bidder's Price
$42.00
15. N/A DRIVER'S ASSY SASH 6321806 5 $70.00 $15.00 $425.00 $48.00 $14.00 $310.00
Bidder's Price
$62.00
16. N/A GLASS, FRONT DEST SIGN 23244 5 $75.00 $15.00 $450.00 $48.00 $14.00 $310.00
Bidder's Price
$62.00
GROUP Il TOTAL $8,500.00 $5,575.00
Bidder's Price - $925.00
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: ves [ ] No [x] ves [ ] no [x]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT



Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
mem | s DESCRIPTION o |ESTMATEDAWNAL | CocrEiCh | msSUME N (1) Houk ® (COSTEAGH) | (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR ®
NO. REGULAR FROM PART A) _ REGULAR FROM PART A) _
@ ® ®) (he820) ® ®) (h+820)
(CxD=E) (CxD=E)
UPPER STATIONARY 6305163 10 $40.00 $15.00 $550.00 $24.00 $14.00 $380.00
Bidder's Price
$34.00
1. I I | et | L Bl e B I el IECEE R R R R
LOWER SLIDING 6000601 10 $65.00 $15.00 $800.00 $53.00 $14.00 $670.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326181 10 $40.00 $15.00 $550.00 $24.00 $14.00 $380.00
Bidder's Price
$34.00
2. N I T s T B et T I o e e e
LOWER SLIDING 6326182 10 $65.00 $15.00 $800.00 $53.00 $14.00 $670.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326177 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $24.00 $14.00 $190.00
Bidder's Price
$38.00
3. I I | e | Bl B T I il IR e EEE LR
LOWER SLIDING 6326178 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $53.00 $14.00 $335.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326179 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $24.00 $14.00 $190.00
Bidder's Price
$38.00
4. N I | T | T L e [ B
LOWER SLIDING 6326180 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $53.00 $14.00 $335.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Is!
DATE: 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 10

11/3/2014




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
ESTIMATED ANNUAL UNIT PRICE SERVICE LABOR RATE TOTA('E;:OST UNIT PRICE SERVICE LABOR RATE TOTA('E)COST
ITEM (COST EACH) (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR (COST EACH) (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR
NG, SIZE DESCRIPTION PIN PURC“AS(i)QUA"T'TY REGULAR FROM PART A) A+B=0) REGULAR FROM PART A) (A+B=0)
(A) ®) (CxD=E) (A 8) (CxD=E)
UPPER STATIONARY 6326183 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $24.00 $14.00 $190.00
Bidder's Price
$38.00
5. N/A || == e e e e | R
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $53.00 $14.00 $335.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $24.00 $14.00 $190.00
Bidder's Price
$38.00
6. N/A || e e e e ] e | =
LOWER SLIDING 6326186 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $53.00 $14.00 $335.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $65.00 $14.00 $395.00
Bidder's Price
$79.00
7. N/A || e e e e e ] e | e
LOWER SLIDING 6326185 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $65.00 $14.00 $395.00
Bidder's Price
$79.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326177 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $38.00 $14.00 $260.00
Bidder's Price
$52.00
8. N/A || e e e e | el
LOWER SLIDING 6326178 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $53.00 $14.00 $335.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Is!
DATE: 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 11

11/3/2014




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Erer s
BID TABULATION FORM ML

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
e | e eseRPTION e | e | seeeons | T durence | seveeusonre | g
NO. REGULAR FROM PART A) _ REGULAR FROM PART A) _
(D) (A) ®) (A+B=C) ) B) (A+B=C)
(CxD=E) (CxD=E)
UPPER STATIONARY 6326179 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $24.00 $14.00 $190.00
Bidder's Price
$38.00
9. N/A | s e e | | e
LOWER SLIDING 6326180 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $53.00 $14.00 $335.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326183 10 $40.00 $15.00 $550.00 $24.00 $14.00 $380.00
Bidder's Price
$38.00
10. N s | e L | e e | B e EETTET LRy IR e e e e R R e
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 10 $65.00 $15.00 $800.00 $53.00 $14.00 $670.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 10 $40.00 $15.00 $550.00 $24.00 $14.00 $380.00
Bidder's Price
$34.00
11. N/A | s e e | | e
LOWER SLIDING 6326185 10 $65.00 $15.00 $800.00 $53.00 $14.00 $670.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 5 $40.00 $15.00 $275.00 $24.00 $14.00 $190.00
Bidder's Price
$38.00
12. NIA || e e e e e | e
LOWER SLIDING 6326186 5 $65.00 $15.00 $400.00 $53.00 $14.00 $335.00
Bidder's Price
$67.00
13. N/A DESTINATION SIGN 501-8703- 5 $75.00 $15.00 $450.00 $31.00 $14.00 $225.00
Bidder's Price
$45.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: __ 11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 12




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
"1
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERVEE ABOR | 1oTAL cosT SERVEE LABOR | 7oTaL cosT
ITEM SIZE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) B) (CxD=E)
14, N/A C/S WINDSHIELD 1086?803' 10 $750.00 $15.00 $7,650.00 N/A N/S N/S
15. N/A R/S WINDSHIELD 1086827803' 10 $750.00 $15.00 $7,650.00 N/A N/S N/S
16. N/A ENTRANCE DOOR-UPPER | 5019118.06 10 $65.00 $15.00 $800.00 $36.00 $14.00 $500.00
Bidder's Price
$50.00
17. N/A ENTRANCE DOOR-LOWER || 5019119.06 10 $40.00 $15.00 $550.00 $14.00 $14.00 $280.00
Bidder's Price
$28.00
18. N/A EXIT DOOR 5019118.09 10 $50.00 $15.00 $650.00 $36.00 $14.00 $500.00
Bidder's Price
$50.00
GROUP IV TOTAL $28,550.00 $10,240.00
Bidder's Price - $1,427.00
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: ves [ ] NO [x] ves [ ] no [x]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT

13




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP V- NEW F

LYER 14400 & 14600

SERVICE LABOR
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUMEONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) @) (CxD=E)
1. n/A  |WINDSHIELD, STREETSIDE| 518461 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $600.00 $14.00 $6,140.00
72% GREEN TINT o
Bidder's Price
$614.00
2. | wna | WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE || 598467 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $600.00 $14.00 $6,140.00
72% GREEN TINT o
Bidder's Price
$614.00
3. N/A FLUSH WINDOW 509057 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
ASSEMBLY, DRIVER'S oS
Bidder's Price
$134.00
4. N/A GLASS, FIXED 6mm 6392158 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
72% GREEN oS
Bidder's Price
$134.00
5. N/A GLASS, DRIVER'S SASH || 5459514 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
6mm 72% GREEN . o
Bidder's Price
$134.00
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
6. N/A EMERGENCY FIXED FRONT 507274 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
STREETSIDE Bidder's Price
$134.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

ONE STOP GLASS

EL PASO, TX

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP V- NEW F

LYER 14400 & 14600

SERVICE LABOR
ITEM | gizE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUMEONE (1) () UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)
7. N/A GLASS, FIXED 6mm 9% 6412863 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
8. N/A EMERGENCY SIDE 532875 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
DESTINATION SIGN Bidder's Price
$134.00
9. N/A  |CLASS, UPPERFIXED 6mmi 5465597 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
89% CLEAR DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
10. N/A GLASS, LOWER FIXED 6444552 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
6mm 9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
11. N/A NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532749 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $82.00 $14.00 $960.00
IN/FIXED Bidder's Price
$96.00
12. | NA GLASS, FULL FIXED 6444553 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
6mm 9% GRAY . S
Bidder's Price
$134.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP V - NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
SERVICE LABOR
EiTh:I\NnSXED o TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM SIZE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) @) (CxD=E)
13. N/A GLASS, SASH 6mm 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
FLUSH WINDOW
14, N/A | ASSEMBLY EMERGENCY 532748 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
TIP-IN/FIXED Bidder's Price
$134.00
15. N/A || GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm || 5444553 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
16. N/A GLASS, SASH 6mm 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
62,28 x| FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
17. eo X NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532751 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.00 $14.00 $830.00
35.12 IN/FIXED 62.28x35.12 Bidder's Price
$83.00
18. N/A || GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm || 5444555 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $72.00 $14.00 $860.00
9% GRAY DN
Bidder's Price
$86.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

ONE STOP GL

ASS

EL PASO, TX

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP V- NEW F

LYER 14400 & 14600

SERVICE LABOR
EinhNﬂSXED RATE TOTAL COST SERV:;:AETLEABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | sizE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)
19. N/A GLASS, SASH 6mm 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $90.00 $14.00 $1,040.00
9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$104.00
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
20. N/A NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532752 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $82.00 $14.00 $960.00
IN/FIXED SS TRANSITION Bidder's Price
$96.00
21. N/A || GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm || g/ 44556 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $82.00 $14.00 $960.00
9% GRAY PERE
Bidder's Price
$96.00
22. N/A GLASS, SASH 6mm 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
23. N/A NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532754 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $109.00 $14.00 $1,230.00
IN/FIXED CS TRANSITION Bidder's Price
$123.00
24, N/A || GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm || ¢4 44557 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

ONE STOP GLASS

EL PASO, TX

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP V- NEW F

LYER 14400 & 14600

SERVICE LABOR
ITEM |l g1zE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)
25. N/A GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
FLUSH WINDOW
26. N/A ASSEMBLY, SIDE 532753 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $109.00 $14.00 $1,230.00
DESTINATION SIGN Bidder's Price
$126.00
27. N/A GLASS, LOWER FIXED 6412870 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
6mm 9% GRAY DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
28. N/A  |CLASS, UPPERFIXED 6mmi 5395555 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
89% CLEAR DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
29. N/A WINDOW-HPR/FIXED 538817 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
EGRESS DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00
30. N/A || WINDOW-HPR/FIXED NON- | 538314 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
EGRESS DT
Bidder's Price
$134.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

|

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

ONE STOP GLASS
EL PASO, TX

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP V- NEW F

LYER 14400 & 14600

Eims\;fD SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
TEM | gzE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
31. N/A || WINDOW-HPR/FIXED NON- | 538515 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $120.00 $14.00 $1,340.00
EGRESS R
Bidder's Price
$134.00
GROUP V TOTAL NO BID $48,490.00
Bidder's Price - $4,849.00
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: ves [ | wo [ ] ves ]~ [x]

GRAND TOTAL

GROUPS I-V TOTAL

$63,195.00
Bidder's Price - NO BID

$85,350.00
Bidder's Price - $9,037.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
i\lli\meﬁca City
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

H & J ALAMO AUTO GLASS ONE STOP GLASS

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE
TERM OF THE AGREEMENT FOR TWO [2], ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE.
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT LEFT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD: YES I:' BLANK NO I:I YES E NOI:l
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: LEFT BLANK 72 HRS
Within _ consecutive calendar days. '
Within ____ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal LEFT BLANK 72 HRS

order in cases of emergency.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT

20




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
i\ll-ﬂmevica Bil;
Up
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART A: LABOR RATE
SERVICE LABOR RATE - AUTOMOBILE
NOT AVAILABLE
1. REGULAR HOURS $40.00
per hour per hour
SERVICE LABOR RATE - BUS Offering sale of parts c.JnIy. We_do not offer
Labor/Installation services.
NOT AVAILABLE
2. REGULAR HOURS $40.00
per hour per hour
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP | TMC [9100'S]
Eimssz SERVEET'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'};::T"EABOR TOTAL COST
TEM I sizE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASsUMEONE () (€ UNITPRICE | (ASsuME ONE (1) €
" QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (8) (CxD=E) (A) ®8) (CxD=E)
1. | 25x31%" SIDE WINDOW 102-040395 80 $109.00 $40.00 $11,920.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. 15%x39" | EXIT DOOR BOTH HALVES | G1000842 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. | 20x52" SIDE BOTTOM G1012318 10 $139.00 $40.00 $1,790.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
DESTINATION SIGN

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

11/3/2014

Is]

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP | TMC [9100'5]
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERV:;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) @) (CxD=E)
4. || 11x52" |S'PE UPPEEIEEST'NAT'ON G1012317 10 $109.00 $40.00 $1,490.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. | 13%2x | ENTRANCE DOORFRONT | 4005157 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
281" & REAR UPPER
6. | 13vx2s | ENTRANCEDOORFRONT | 54005157 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
& REAR MIDDLE
7. | 9x13w | ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT | 54005155 5 $59.00 $40.00 $495.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
& REAR LOWER
8. | 39xa3" WINDSHIELD LH G1001422 10 $209.00 $40.00 $2,490.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9. | 39xa3" WINDSHIELD RH G1001426 10 $209.00 $40.00 $2,490.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP | TMC [9100'S]
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERV';:T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) @) (CxD=E)
10. || 19x36" DR'VERGSLF;ES/;R HALF G1007237 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11. | 21x36" DR'VERELFE;JS'\‘T HALF 1 61007232 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12. | 15%x84 |DESTINATION SIGN FRONT| G1011174 5 $189.00 $40.00 $1,145.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13. | NONE | ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT | G1005156 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP | TOTAL $26,535.00 NO BID
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: ves [] o [x] ves | | no [ ]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER 9400'S
E,SOLH\N"SXED SERV:;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
TEM | e DESCRIPTION PN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUMEONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO: QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
1. [ 28%x31"| SIDE WINDOW GLASS 6320251 20 $109.00 $40.00 $2,980.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. 227;;‘ * | EMERGENCY WINDOW | 6320240 30 $109.00 $40.00 $4,470.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7
3. | 12x26" EXIT DOOR GLASS 110988 5 $49.00 $40.00 $445.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. | 18%"x56 SIDE BOTTOM 6320257 5 $129.00 $40.00 $845.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
DESTINATION SIGN
5. | 101x56 [|S'PE UPPE;EEST'NAT'ON 6320256 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. | 17%x | ENTRANCEDOORUPPER | 57444 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
531" GLASS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER 9400'S
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERV:;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
7. | 12x17vr ENTRANCE DOOR 027442 5 $49.00 $40.00 $445.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
BOTTOM GLASS
8. || 39x48" | WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE | 8112389 10 $249.00 $40.00 $2,890.00 $129.00 $0.00 $1,290.00
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
9. | 39x3s" | WINDSHIELD, STREET 8112388 10 $249.00 $40.00 $2,890.00 $129.00 $0.00 $1,290.00
SIDE A
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
10. | 18x33%" DR'VER'SRSI;EA)E FRONT & | 5307503 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11. | 8%x38" | DRIVER'S SIDE UPPER 6309009 5 $49.00 $40.00 $445.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.

ELIZABETH, NJ

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP II NEW FLYER 9400'S

Eims\;fD SERVEE ABOR | 1oTAL cosT SERVIEE LABOR | 1oTaL cosT
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne: QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
12. | 12x73%" |[FRONT DESTINATION SIGN 100521 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP Il TOTAL $18,190.00 $2,580.00

Bidder's Price - LEFT BLANK

OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED:

YES I:I NO

[x]

YES |:| NO D

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

El Paso

All-America City

VIIIIV

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERV:;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST SERV'I;::T'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
1. N/A UPPER GLASS 6322119 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. N/A LOWER GLASS 6319225 5 $159.00 $40.00 $995.00 $79.95 $0.00 $399.75
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
3. N/A LOWER FIXED GLASS 6317979 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. N/A  ||UPPER GLASS DEST SIGN | 6317524 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 $39.95 $0.00 $199.75
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
5. N/A LOWER FIXED GLASS, 6322122 5 $159.00 $40.00 $995.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EMERGENCY
6. N/A LOWER FIXED GLASS 6326096 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERVEE ABOR | 1oTAL cosT SERVIEE LABOR | 1oTaL cosT
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne: QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
7. N/A SASH GLASS 6320859 5 $99.00 $40.00 $695.00 $38.85 $0.00 $194.25
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
8. N/A SASH GLASS 6322127 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4'x18"
44% Gray
9. N/A SASH GLASS 6322081 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10. N/A SASH GLASS 6322121 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4'x18"
11. N/A SASH GLASS 6326097 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12. N/A GLASS SASH 6322121 5 N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
SERVICE LABOR
EiTr\:hNnSXED RATE TOTAL COST SERVI,;::TLEABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM || g1zE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(0) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)
13. N/A DOOR GLASS EXIT 063575 5 N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID
14. N/A GLASS BOTTOM ENTR 111255NFA 5 N/A N/A N/A $24.75 $0.00 $123.75
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
15. N/A DRIVER'S ASSY SASH 6321806 5 N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID
16. N/A GLASS, FRONT DEST SIGN 23244 5 N/A N/A N/A NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP Il TOTAL $8,045.00 $917.50
Bidder's Price - LEFT BLANK

OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED:

YES |:| NO

x]

YES |:| NO

[]

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
e | e eseRPTION | | e seneeiaonne | drenee | senoceueonmute | g
NO. REGULAR FROM PART A) _ REGULAR FROM PART A) _
(D) (A) ®) (A+B=C) ) B) (A+B=C)
(CxD=E) (CxD=E)
UPPER STATIONARY 6305163 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 $35.55 $0.00 $355.50
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
1. N | et T et L | I IEEEEEE R LR L P e e
LOWER SLIDING 6000601 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 $59.95 $0.00 $599.50
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
UPPER STATIONARY 6326181 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2. N e | s T ] Bl DT | B
LOWER SLIDING 6326182 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326177 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
3. N e | DT e I e L | B el IEEEEEEEEEE R
LOWER SLIDING 6326178 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326179 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4. N e | D s e e Il L | e
LOWER SLIDING 6326180 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: _ 11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 30




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

Department:

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-116
MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
TEM ESTIMATED ANNUAL UNIT PRICE SERVICE LABOR RATE TOTA('E)COST UNIT PRICE SERVICE LABOR RATE TOTA('E)COST
(COST EACH) (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR (COST EACH) (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR
NO. SIZE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE QUANTITY REGULAR FROM PART A) _ REGULAR FROM PART A) _
(D) (A) ®) (A+B=C) ) B) (A+B=C)
(CxD=E) (CxD=E)
UPPER STATIONARY 6326183 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5. N/A || e e e e e | e | = oo
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 5 $229.00 $40.00 $1,345.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6. N/A || == e e e e | R
LOWER SLIDING 6326186 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7. N/A || e e e e e ] e | e
LOWER SLIDING 6326185 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326177 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8. N/A || e e e e | el
LOWER SLIDING 6326178 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bidder's Price
$645.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Is!
DATE:  11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 31




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
TOTAL COST TOTAL COST
e | e eseRPTION | | e sensne | g durence | seveeusonre | g
NO. REGULAR FROM PART A) _ REGULAR FROM PART A) _
(D) (A) ®) (A+B=C) ) B) (A+B=C)
(CxD=E) (CxD=E)
UPPER STATIONARY 6326179 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9. [ N I I [UNUNUNNNUNIINE ENNRNUNRN ESERRSEI [UHNIRNUNNEY PN | NSRS PIRRNONRNON | ————
LOWER SLIDING 6326180 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326183 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
10. N et e B | I B | e I e e
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 10 $229.00 $40.00 $2.690.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11. N I el | B | I B B B T
LOWER SLIDING 6326185 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1.290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
UPPER STATIONARY 6326184 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12. N e D B | I B B I B et
LOWER SLIDING 6326186 5 $89.00 $40.00 $645.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
oU1l-6/1US-
13. N/A DESTINATION SIGN A4 5 $109.00 $40.00 $745.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE:  11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 32




CITY OF EL PASO El Paso

BID TABULATION FORM !lll"
Solicitation #: 2015-116
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP IV NABI (2007)
EiTr\:hNnS,IED SERVII?/ETIEABOR TOTAL COST SERVI,?,ET'EABOR TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO- QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) ) (CxD=E)
14. N/A C/S WINDSHIELD 108(-)817803- 10 $450.00 $40.00 $4,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
15. N/A R/S WINDSHIELD 108(-)827803- 10 $450.00 $40.00 $4,900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
16. N/A ENTRANCE DOOR-UPPER || 5019118.06 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 $37.45 $0.00 $374.50
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
17. N/A ENTRANCE DOOR-LOWER || 5019119.06 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 $29.65 $0.00 $296.50
Bidder's Price
LEFT BLANK
18. N/A EXIT DOOR 5019118.09 10 $89.00 $40.00 $1,290.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP IV TOTAL $37,555.00 $671.00
Bidder's Price - $37,455.00 Bidder's Price - LEFT BLANK
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED: ves []  wno  [X] ves ]~ []

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP V - NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EiTh:I\NnSXED SERVEE ABOR | 1oTAL cosT SERVIEE LABOR | 1oTaL cosT
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne: QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR

FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)

(D) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)

WINDSHIELD, STREETSIDE
1. N/A 729% GREEN TINT 518461 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE
2. N/A 2% GREEN TINT 518462 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW
3. N/A ASSEMBLY. DRIVER'S 509057 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLASS, FIXED 6mm
4. N/A o9 GREEN 6392158 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLASS, DRIVER'S SASH
5. N/A S 720 GREEN 6429514 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
6. N/A EMERGENCY FIXED FRONT 507274 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STREETSIDE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

VIIIIV

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP V - NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
SERVICE LABOR
ITEM |l g1zE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(0) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)
0,
7. N/A GLASS, FGI>|;EAI3(6mm 9% 6412863 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
8. N/A EMERGENCY SIDE 532875 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DESTINATION SIGN
GLASS, UPPER FIXED 6mm
9. N/A 89% CLEAR 6405597 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLASS, LOWER FIXED
10. N/A 6mm 9% GRAY 6444552 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
11. N/A NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532749 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
IN/FIXED
GLASS, FULL FIXED
12. N/A 6mm 9% GRAY 6444553 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014

2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

\ l l I l /
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP V - NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
SERVICE LABOR
ESTRAATED o TOTAL COST SERVIEE LABOR | 1oTaL cosT
ITEM SIZE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNIT PRICE (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
Ne: QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) B) (CxD=E)
13. N/A GLASS, SASH 6mm 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9% GRAY
FLUSH WINDOW
14. N/A ASSEMBLY EMERGENCY 532748 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TIP-IN/FIXED
15. N/A GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 6444553 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9% GRAY
GLASS, SASH 6mm
16. N/A 9% GRAY 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6228 x || FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
17. 3é 12 NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532751 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
: IN/FIXED 62.28x35.12
18. N/A GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 6444555 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9% GRAY
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE:  11/3/2014 2015-116 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS - MASS TRANSIT 36




Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP V - NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
SERVICE LABOR
ITEM || g1zE DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(0) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)

19. N/A GLASS, SASH 6mm 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9% GRAY

FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
20. N/A NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532752 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
IN/FIXED SS TRANSITION

21. N/A GLASS, FULL FIXED émm 6444556 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9% GRAY

GLASS, SASH 6mm
22. N/A 9% GRAY 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
23. N/A NON-EMERGENCY TIP- 532754 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
IN/FIXED CS TRANSITION

24. N/A GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 6444557 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9% GRAY

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS GROUP V - NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
SERVICE LABOR

ITEM I gizg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE | UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1 (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR

b FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)

(0) (A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) (B) (CxD=E)

0,
25. N/A GLASS, SGARiI—:(Gmm 9% 6444554 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW
26. N/A ASSEMBLY, SIDE 532753 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
DESTINATION SIGN
GLASS, LOWER FIXED
27. N/A 6mm 9% GRAY 6412870 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GLASS, UPPER FIXED 6mm
28. N/A 89% CLEAR 6392255 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
29. N/A WINDOW-HPR/FIXED 538817 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EGRESS

30. N/A WINDOWI_EHGPRRéZI;(ED NON- 538816 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014

nformation only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014

Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS

EL PASO, TX

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
ELIZABETH, NJ

PART B: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS

GROUP V- NEW F

LYER 14400 & 14600

SERVICE LABOR SERVICE LABOR
CANMAL RATE TOTAL COST RATE TOTAL COST
ITEM | gzg DESCRIPTION PIN PURCHASE UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E) UNITPRICE | (ASSUME ONE (1) (E)
NO. QUANTITY (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR (COST EACH) HOUR REGULAR
FROM PART A) (A+B=C) FROM PART A) (A+B=C)
(D) A) (B) (CxD=E) (A) 8) (CxD=E)
31. N/A WINDOWI'EHGP;éZ;ED NON-I 538815 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP V TOTAL NO BID NO BID

OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED:

YES D NO

[ ]

YES D NO

[ ]

GRAND TOTAL

GROUPS I-V TOTAL

$90,325.00
Bidder's Price - $90,225.00

$4,168.50
Bidder's Price - $604.10

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is]

11/3/2014
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Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 15, 2014
Project Name: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-116
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC.
EL PASO, TX ELIZABETH, NJ
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE
TERM OF THE AGREEMENT FOR TWO [2], ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT
PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE.
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD: YES IXI NO I:I YES IXl NOI:l
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 14 LEFT BLANK
Within _ consecutive calendar days.
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal 48 LEFT BLANK

order in cases of emergency.

BIDS SOLICITED: 15 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 4

BIDS RECEIVED: 3

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 3

NO BID: O

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 11/3/2014
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