CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

AAA PEST CONTROL, INC. BEST PEST CONTROL CO.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) (c) (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEARTOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
DEVELOP / MAINTAIN AN INTEGRATED PEST
1. MANAGEMENT PLAN 1 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $10,800.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
(If included in the basic service, then circle PER YEAR INCLUDED syrs PER YEAR INCLUDED svrs
"INCLUDED.") YEAR VEAR
MONTHLY PEST CONTROL SERVICES: VENDOR
SHALL PROVIDE ALL PERSONNEL, MATERIALS,
TRANSPORTATIN, AND EQUIPMENT NECESSARY TO
) PROVIDE TWO SITE VISITS / SERVICES / PER
MONTH, WHICH WILL INCLUDE: 24 $300.00 $7,200.00 $21,600.00 $475.00 $11,400.00 $34,200.00
*SPRAYING, IN ACCORDANCE WITH (IAW) SCOPE OF
WORK. PER SERVICE CALL YEAR 3YRs PER SERVICE CALL YEAR 3YRs
*RODENT BAIT STATION MAINTENANCE IAW SCOPE
OF WORK
*INSPECTION FOR PEST DETECTION IAW SCOPE OF BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
WORK $36,000 $10,800
ADDITIONAL SITE VISITS (as needed): FEE PER VISIT
3. (if included in the basic service, then circle 8 $40.00 $320.00 $960.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
"INCLUDED.") YRLY ESTIMATED || (Biidder states.)PER 3YRS 3YRS
NORMAL TURNAROUND RESPONSE TIME AFTER FREQUENCIES HOUR YEAR YEAR
RECEIPT OF ORDER: 24 HOURS FEE PER VISIT FEE PER VISIT
INCLUDED INCLUDED
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 2/11/15 2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO 1




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTRO

L

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542

Department: ZOO

AAA PEST CONTROL, INC.

BEST PEST CONTROL CO.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) (c) (A) (c) ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
AFTER HOURS or URGENT/EMERGENCY SERVICE-FEE
4. PER VISIT (if included in the basic service, then circle 4 $60.00 $240.00 $720.00 $85.00 $340.00 $1.020.00
"INCLUDED") PER HOUR
MAXIMUM TURNAROUND RESPONSE TIME AFTER YEAR 8 YRS YEAR 3YRS
RECEIPT OF ORDER: 24 HOURS YRLY ESTIMATED FEE PER VISIT FEE PER VISIT
FREQUENCIES INCI UDED INCI UDED
5. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - RAT SNAP TRAPS 20 $2.50 $50.00 $150.00 $5.00 $100.00 $300.00
(not included in monthly fee) CASES PER TRAP YEAR 3YRS PER TRAP YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $506.00 $1518.00 $1200 $3600
6. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - RAT BAIT STATIONS 36 $2.50 $90.00 $270.00 $10.00 $360.00 $1,080.00
(notincluded in monthly fee) YRLZ;SJL’,".'F’;TED PER BAIT STATION YEAR 3 YRS PER BAIT STATION YEAR 3YRS
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
48N an %242 70
7. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - RAT GLUE BOARDS 6 $1.25 $7.50 $22.50 $2.00 $12.00 $36.00
(notincluded in monthly fee) CASES PER GLUE BOARDS YEAR 3YRS PER GLUE BOARDS YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE , BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $342.00 €10%6.00 BIDDER'S PRICE $576

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 2/11/15

Is/

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO

$1728



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

AAA PEST CONTROL, INC.

BEST PEST CONTROL CO.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) () (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEARTOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
8. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - MOUSE SNAP TRAPS 6 $0.63 $3.78 $11.34 $1.75 $10.50 $31.50
(nOt included in monthly fee) CASES PER TRAP YEAR 3 YRS PER TRAP YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE , .
AMOUNTS $250.80 $752.40 BIDDER'S PRICE $252|BIDDER'S PRICE $576|
9. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - MOUSE GLUE BOARDS 6 $0.35 $2.10 $6.30 $0.50 $3.00 $9.00
(not included in monthly fee) CASES PER GLUE BOARD YEAR 3 YRS PER GLUE BOARD YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE . .
AMOUNTS $145.90 $42770 BIDDER'S PRICE $216 |BIDDER'S PRICE $648]
10. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - FLY _GLUE STICKS 280 $6.00 $1,680.00 $5,040.00 $8.00 $2,240.00 $6,720.00
R e | PER GLUE sTICK YEAR avRs PER GLUE STICK YEAR avRs
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
K160 00 $£5040 00
11. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - FLY BAGS 8 $6.00 $48.00 $144.00 $6.00 $48.00 $144.00
CASES PER BAG YEAR 3 YRS PER BAG YEAR 3YRs
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $1040.00 g1 20.00
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 2/11/15 2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO 3




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

AAA PEST CONTROL, INC.

BEST PEST CONTROL CO.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
B) (A) (C) (A) (C) ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEARTOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
12. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - GENTROL (IGR) 12 $1.90 $22.80 $68.40 INCL. $0.00 $0.00
ROACH CONTROL DEVICE
CASES PER DEVICE YEAR 3 YRS PER DEVICE YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $410.00 $1230.00
13.|| PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - ROACH BAIT STATIONS 2 $0.53 $1.06 $3.18 INCL. $0.00 $0.00
BAGS PER BAIT STATION YEAR 3 YRS PER BAIT STATION YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $40.00 $120.00
14. PEST CONTROL SSU T:L(I:Eﬁ - WASP FREEZE 1 $9.25 $9.25 $27.75 $10.00 $10.00 $30.00
(spray can)
CASE PER 200z SPRAY CAN YEAR 3 YRS PER 200z SPRAY CAN YEAR 3YRS
YRLZ;nggTED 2:?,'3 ﬁ:? 'S PRICE :;26'3 ﬁg's PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE $120|BIDDER'S PRICE $360
15. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - BTI DUNKS 1 $1.00 $1.00 $3.00 $1.25 $1.25 $3.75
CASE PER DUNK YEAR 3YRS PER DUNK YEAR 3YRS

YRLY ESTIMATED
AMOUNTS

BIDDER'S PRICE

$105.00

BIDDER'S PRICE
$315.00

BIDDER'S PRICE $125

BIDDER'S PRICE $375

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

AAA PEST CONTROL, INC.

BEST PEST CONTROL CO.

EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) (c) (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEARTOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
16. 1 $2.00 $2.00 $6.00 $4.25 $4.25 $12.75
PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - ALTOSID BRIQUETTES
CASE PER BRIQUETTE YEAR 3YRs PER BRIQUETTE YEAR 3YRs
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE . BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $205.00 $615.00 BIDDER'S PRICE $935|¢5 805
17. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - 565 XLO INSECTICIDE 2 $20.00 $40.00 $120.00 $25.00 $50.00 $150.00
(not included in Monthly fee) CASES PER 200z CAN YEAR 3 YRS PER 200z CAN YEAR 3YRS

YRLY ESTIMATED

BIDDER'S PRICE

BIDDER'S PRICE

BIDDER'S PRICE $300

BIDDER'S PRICE $900

AMOUNTS $504.00 $1512.00
$13,317.49 $39,952.47 $14,579.00 $43,737.00
GRAND TOTAL ITEMS (1-17)
YEAR 3 YRS YEAR 3YRS
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$13.181.60 $39,544.80 $18.112 $54,336

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/11/15

2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
<@ %]

Tl

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

AAA PEST CONTROL, INC.
EL PASO, TX

BEST PEST CONTROL CO.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

x]

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES |x| NOo [ |

YES | X NO | |

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/11/15

2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO



El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

DAW PEST CONTROL ORKIN INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) () (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
DEVELOP / MAINTAIN AN INTEGRATED PEST
1. MANAGEMENT PLAN 1 NO BID $0.00 $0.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
(If included in the basic service, then circle
"INCLUDED.") PER YEAR INCLUDED YEAR 3YRS PER YEAR INCLUDED YEAR 3YRS
MONTHLY PEST CONTROL SERVICES: VENDOR
SHALL PROVIDE ALL PERSONNEL, MATERIALS,
TRANSPORTATIN, AND EQUIPMENT NECESSARY TO
5 PROVIDE TWO SITE VISITS / SERVICES / PER
MONTH, WHICH WILL INCLUDE: 24 $1,975.00 $47,400.00 $142,200.00 $192.00 $4,608.00 $13,824.00
*SPRAYING, IN ACCORDANCE WITH (IAW) SCOPE OF
WORK. PER SERVICE CALL YEAR 3YRS PER SERVICE CALL YEAR 3 YRS
*RODENT BAIT STATION MAINTENANCE IAW SCOPE
OF WORK
*INSPECTION FOR PEST DETECTION IAW SCOPE OF
WORK
ADDITIONAL SITE VISITS (as needed): FEE PER VISIT
3. (ifincluded in thect:)asic serv)ice, then circle 8 $100.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
"INCLUDED."
YRLY ESTIMATED FEE PER VISIT FEE PER VISIT
NORMAL TURNAROUND RESPONSE TIME AFTER FREQUENCIES INCLUDED YEAR YRS INCLUDED YEAR YRS
RECEIPT OF ORDER: 24 HOURS
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 2/11/15 2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO 7




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

YRLY ESTIMATED
AMOUNTS

BIDDER'S PRICE $390

BIDDER'S PRICE
$1170.00

48 ea per case-47.04

LELCESC

DAW PEST CONTROL ORKIN INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) (c) (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEARTOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
AFTER HOURS or URGENT/EMERGENCY SERVICE-FEE
4 PER VISIT (if mclude“d in the baS"IC service, then circle 4 $200.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
INCLUDED") s <
FEE PER VISIT FEE PER VISIT
MAXIMUM TURNAROUND RESPONSE TIME AFTER INCLUDED YEAR 3YRS INCLUDED YEAR 3YRS
RECEIPT OF ORDER: 24 HOURS YRLY ESTIMATED
FREOUENCIES
5. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - RAT SNAP TRAPS 20 $1.75 $35.00 $105.00 $1.53 $30.60 $91.80
(notincluded in monthly fee) CASES PER TRAP YEAR 3 YRS PER TRAP YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED . BIDDER'S PRICE 12 ea per case - 18.36 |BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS BIDDER'S PRICE $700] 6210000 per case $367.20 $1101.60
6. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - RAT BAIT STATIONS 36 $20.00 $720.00 $2,160.00 $8.95 $322.20 $966.60
(notincluded in monthly fee) R oA TEP | PER BAIT STATION YEAR svrs PER BAIT STATION YEAR svrs
6 BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
per case $322 20 K966 60
7. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - RAT GLUE BOARDS 6 $1.35 $8.10 $24.30 $0.98 $5.88 $17.64
(notincluded in monthly fee) CASES PER GLUE BOARDS YEAR 3 YRS PER GLUE BOARDS YEAR 3YRs

BIDDER'S PRICE
$282 24

BIDDER'S PRICE
584672

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/11/15

2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

DAW PEST CONTROL ORKIN INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) () (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
8. | PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - MOUSE SNAP TRAPS 6 $1.25 $7.50 $22.50 $0.40 $2.40 $7.20
(not included in monthly fee) CASES PER TRAP YEAR 3YRS PER TRAP YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 72 ea per case - BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $270.00 $810.00 28.80 per case $172.80 $518.40
9. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - MOUSE GLUE BOARDS 6 $0.35 $2.10 $6.30 $0.20 $1.20 $3.60
(not included in monthly fee) CASES PER GLUE BOARD YEAR 3YRS PER GLUE BOARD YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 74 per case - BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $151.20 $453.60 14.80 per case $88.80 $266.40
YRLY ESTIMATED
AMOUNTS PER GLUE STICK YEAR 3YRS PER GLUE STICK YEAR 3YRS
24 per case
78.24 per case
11. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - FLY BAGS 8 $5.00 $40.00 $120.00 $4.60 $36.80 $110.40
CASES PER BAG YEAR 3 YRS PER BAG YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 24 per case - BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $960.00 $2880.00 110.40 per case $883.20 $2649.60
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 2/11/15 2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO 9




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL

BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

DAW PEST CONTROL ORKIN INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) (. (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COST PER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEARTOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
12. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - GENTROL (IGR) 12 $1.50 $18.00 $54.00 $1.40 $16.80 $50.40
ROACH CONTROL DEVICE CASES PER DEVICE YEAR 3 YRS PER DEVICE YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 20 eain a box - BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $360.00 $1080.00 6 boxes in & cae $2016.00 $6048.00
: ' 168.00 per case ' )
13.| PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - ROACH BAIT STATIONS 2 $0.83 $1.66 $4.98 $0.63 $1.26 $3.78
BAGS PER BAIT STATION YEAR 3 YRS PER BAIT STATION YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 60 ea per bog BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $144.00 $432.00 37.80 per bag $75.60 $226.80
14. PEST CONTROL SSU }::L(I:Eli - WASP FREEZE 1 $8.33 $8.33 $24.99 $6.30 $6.30 $18.90
(spray can)
CASE PER 200z SPRAY CAN YEAR 3YRS PER 200z SPRAY CAN YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 12 ea per case - 75.60 |BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $100.00 $300.00 per case $75.60 $226.80
15. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - BTI DUNKS 1 $1.66 $1.66 $4.98 N/A $0.00 $0.00
CASE PER DUNK YEAR 3YRS PER DUNK YEAR 3YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE (same as altosid
AMOUNTS $100.00 $300.00 below)
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO 10




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

DAW PEST CONTROL ORKIN INC.
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
(B) (A) () (A) () ESTIMATED
ESTIMATED EXTENDED (3) THREE
YEARLY UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED |EXTENDED (3) THREE UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED YEAR TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED COST PER YEAR YEAR TOTAL COST PER YEAR (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED
FREQUENCIES (A) X (B) = TOTAL (C) X 3 = ESTIMATED (A) X (B) = TOTAL EXTENDED (3) THREE
EXTENDED COSTPER | EXTENDED (3) THREE EXTENDED COST PER YEAR TOTAL
YEAR YEAR TOTAL YEAR
NO.
16. 1 $2.00 $2.00 $6.00 $1.79 $1.79 $5.37
PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - ALTOSID BRIQUETTES
CASE PER BRIQUETTE YEAR 3YRs PER BRIQUETTE YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 100 per case - 179.00 |BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $200.00 $600.00 per case $179.00 $537.00
17. PEST CONTROL SUPPLIES - 565 XLO INSECTICIDE 2 $21.00 $42.00 $126.00 $13.50 $27.00 $81.00
(not included in Monthly fee) CASES PER 200z CAN YEAR 3 YRS PER 200z CAN YEAR 3 YRS
YRLY ESTIMATED BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE 12 ea per case - BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
AMOUNTS $500.00 $1500.00 162.00 per case $324.00 $972.00
$2,344.02
$51,006.35 $153,019.05 $5,973.03 $17,919.09
GRAND TOTAL ITEMS (1-17)
YEAR 3 YRS YEAR 3 YRS
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$54,715.20 $164,145.60 $10,307.44 $30,922.32
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
e &)

i

2010

BID ITEM: PEST CONTROL
BID OPENING DATE: JANUARY 28, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-542
Department: ZOO

DAW PEST CONTROL

EL PASO, TX

ORKIN INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

x]

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER AGREES TO ACCEPT PAYMENT
BY PROCUREMENT CARD:

YES

X

NO | |

YES

X

NO | |

BIDS SOLICITED: 16 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 169

BIDS RECEIVED: 4

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 4

NO BID: O

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 2/11/15

2015-542 PEST CONTROL - ZOO

12



