CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.| GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
TEM OTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZL TreC|  UNIT PRICE QETTJ%@EQTLC are.x AR oA UNIT PRICE | (65T AWNOAL Y. ittmiiistiond
NO.
1. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 $107.00 $21,400.00 $64,200.00 $56.00 $11,200.00 $33,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, PBF 5X7 + BDL3-X GTE PBA-1010ADA
2. PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" x 12" 200 $123.26 $24,652.00 $73,956.00 $56.00 $11,200.00 $33,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, PBF9X12 + BDL3-X GTE PBA-1020ADA
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 $12.19 $2,438.00 $7,314.00 $6.00 $1,200.00 $3,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, 800-87 GTE PS

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.




Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

2010

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

. DESCRIPTION EZTU :,\';‘T"#i"‘ UNIT PRICE QETTE@E&%?E &Iﬁﬁﬁlﬁlﬁ; UNIT PRICE ég{’l‘:@a’;%mt 5@35?5 TZ‘S\-II.-QI;)

NO.

4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" x 12" 200 $15.94 $3,188.00 $9,564.00 $8.50 $1,700.00 $5,100.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, 800H-86 GTE

5. ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER 150 $106.69 $16,003.50 $48,010.50 $88.00 $13,200.00 $39,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SK-0203 GTE HPBA-1150

6. MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 200 $75.44 $15,088.00 $45,264.00 $88.00 $17,600.00 $52,800.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

PELCO, AS3009-SS-84-PNC

GTE RM-1000C

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.| GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
7. HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS 150 $20.75 $3,112.50 $9,337.50 $15.00 $2,250.00 $6,750.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-4038-P29 GTE CF-260
8. HARDWARE HORIZONTAL SLIP TEE 150 $21.38 $3,207.00 $9,621.00 $10.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00
(STEEL)
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0474-P29 GTE TF-250RR
9. HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE 200 $10.06 $2,012.00 $6,036.00 $9.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0357-PNC GTE PBH-425

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

. DESCRIPTION EZTU :,\';‘T"#i"‘ UNIT PRICE QETTE@E&%?E &Iﬁﬁﬁlﬁlﬁ; UNIT PRICE ég{’l‘:@a’;%mt 5@35?5 TZ‘S\-II.-QI;)

NO.

10. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE 220 $11.63 $2,558.60 $7,675.80 $8.00 $1,760.00 $5,280.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0454-PNC GTE PBH-420

11. ADA ROUNV[\)”l_T_:SZt' FB)tJJ;gg:\SSEMBLY 210 $80.46 $16,896.60 $50,689.80 $26.00 $5,460.00 $16,380.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, BDL3 + PBC-X GTE PBH-ADA

12. SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL 150 $33.38 $5,007.00 $15,021.00 $90.00 $13,500.00 $40,500.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-3106-P29 GTE PTSA-200

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

. DESCRIPTION EZTU :,\';‘T"#i"‘ UNIT PRICE QETTE@E&%?E &Iﬁﬁﬁlﬁlﬁ; UNIT PRICE ég{’l‘:@a’;%mt 5@35?5 TZ‘S\-II.-QI;)

NO.

13. ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" x 15 100 $260.13 $26,013.00 $78,039.00 $180.00 $18,000.00 $54,000.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL POLARA, PB-5100-15 CPI

14. 90 DEGREE ALUM ELBOW 200 $9.94 $1,988.00 $5,964.00 $9.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0457-P29 GTE EF-240

15. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) 150 $6.31 $946.50 $2,839.50 $6.00 $900.00 $2,700.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0309-2.13 GTE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.] GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
ITEM
DESCRIPTION EZTU :,\';‘T"#i"‘ UNIT PRICE QETTE@E&%?E g%ﬁﬁﬁlﬁlﬁ; UNIT PRICE (AEETT}:@EF{LE}QI’-‘ 5@35’25 TZ‘S\-II.-QI;)
NO.
16. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $4.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0448-PNC GTE CN-H-150A
17. SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) 200 $0.44 $88.00 $264.00 $0.25 $50.00 $150.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, FS-3217-SS (none stated)
18. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $4.06 $812.00 $2,436.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0443 GTE CN-H-150A

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.] GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
ARLINGTON, TX NEWBURGH, NY
TEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZTU :,\';‘T"#?L UNIT PRICE (EST. ANNUAL ar.x (mﬁﬁ‘ﬁls\{ﬁ';) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:"I*TN;’QLC%TY-X g»ﬁﬁf TZSI’X\';)
NO.
19. GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE 200 $0.25 $50.00 $150.00 $0.50 $100.00 $300.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0354 GTE RW-150
20. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE 200 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SE-0448 GTE
21. BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL 250 $125.75 $31,437.50 $94,312.50 $118.00 $29,500.00 $88,500.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO, SP-1014-TX GPI

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

ITEM
EST. ANNUAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL

o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)

12" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
22. w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 800 $13.75 $11,000.00 $33,000.00 $12.50 $10,000.00 $30,000.00

FLAT PAINT INSIDE HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL McCAIN, M19278 GTE TV-12-A7

18" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW

23. w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.00 $1,300.00 $3,900.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE IN HOOD.

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

GTE TV-12-A7-EXT

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
-

k * |
nerica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department. TRANSPORTATION

|

CONSOLIDATED TRAFFIC CONTROLS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX

GENERAL TRAFFIC EQUIPMENT CORP
NEWBURGH, NY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

x]

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days

21

30

Within hours or overnight after receipt of

verbal order in cases of emergency.

24

(none stated)

J'F BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.
L

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
1. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 $53.00 $10,600.00 $31,800.00 $39.75 $7,950.00 $23,850.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2011-08 CH/TP PB-S10-823-Y
2. PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" x 12" 200 $70.00 $14,000.00 $42,000.00 $66.00 $13,200.00 $39,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL SE-2013-08 CH/TP PB-S10-B43-Y
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.25 $2,250.00 $6,750.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL N/A SIGN & SUPPLY R10-46 5X7.75
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

10



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
TEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZ‘L :§#$¢L UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ;;\\III\ITN;JFI:ILC %TY. X (ZLE':‘FTZ_SIQ; UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:‘II\ITN;JQLC %TY. X (imiﬁf TE'S\-[QIQ)

NO.

4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" x 12" 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.25 $2,250.00 $6,750.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL N/A SIGN & SUPPLY R10-4b-9X12

5. ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER 150 $98.00 $14,700.00 $44,100.00 $58.25 $8,737.50 $26,212.50
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SK-0230 CH/TP 6113 *PAINT YELLOW

6. MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 200 $65.00 $13,000.00 $39,000.00 $59.00 $11,800.00 $35,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO AB-3009-62-SS CH/TP 5624

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

11



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
7. HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS 150 $19.50 $2,925.00 $8,775.00 $13.00 $1,950.00 $5,850.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4038 CHITP 5860
8. HARDWARE HORIZONTAL SLIP TEE 150 $20.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $11.00 $1,650.00 $4,950.00
(STEEL)
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4092-SBE CH/TP 2750 * PAINT YELLOW
9. HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE 200 $9.50 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 $7.25 $1,450.00 $4,350.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0357 CH/TP 5357

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

12




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
10. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE 220 $11.00 $2,420.00 $7,260.00 $7.25 $1,595.00 $4,785.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4071 CH/TP 5358
11. ADA ROUND PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 210 $49.00 $10,290.00 $30,870.00 $16.00 $3,360.00 $10,080.00
WITH 2" PLUNGER
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2149-08 CH/TP PB-S10-300Y
12. SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL 150 $31.00 $4,650.00 $13,950.00 $37.00 $5,550.00 $16,650.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-3106 CH/TP 2583 *PAINT YELLOW

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

13




Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

$7.50

ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
TEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZ‘L :§#$¢L UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ;;\\III\ITN;JFI:ILC %TY. X (ZLE':‘FTZ_SIQ; UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:‘II\ITN;JQLC %TY. X (imiﬁf TE'S\-[QIQ)
NO.
13. ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" x 15' 100 $248.00 $24,800.00 $74,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO PB-5100-15 + PB-5402-PNC (none stated)
14. 90 DEGREE ALUM ELBOW 200 $9.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $11.00 $2,200.00 $6,600.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0457-DS-PNC CH/TP 4366 *PAINT YELLOW
15. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) 150 $6.00 $900.00 $2,700.00

$1,125.00

$3,375.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

PELCO SE-0309-2-13

FLEM / TP 7245

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

14



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC. TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
TEM OTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZL TreC|  UNIT PRICE QETTJ%@EQTLC are.x AR oA UNIT PRICE | (65T AWNOAL Y. ittmiiistiond

NO.

16. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $3.75 $750.00 $2,250.00 $2.90 $580.00 $1,740.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-044-M1 CHITP 232

17. SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) 200 $0.45 $90.00 $270.00 $0.29 $58.00 $174.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO FS-3217-SS DELTA /TP 5271

18. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $3.75 $750.00 $2,250.00 $3.00 $600.00 $1,800.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0443 CH/TP 4290

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

15



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
TEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZ‘L :§#$¢L UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ;;\\III\ITN;JFI:ILC (E))TY.X (ZLE':‘FTZ_SIQ; UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:‘II\ITN;JQLC g)TY.x (imiﬁf TE'S\-[QIQ)
NO.
19. GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE 200 $0.23 $46.00 $138.00 $0.45 $90.00 $270.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0354 CH/TP 2127
20. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE 200 $2.75 $550.00 $1,650.00 $1.90 $380.00 $1,140.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4088 CH/TP 231
21. BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL 250 $118.00 $29,500.00 $88,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

MANUFACTURER & MODEL

PELCO SP-1014-TX

(none stated)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

16



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

2010

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.

ARLINGTON, TX CONROE, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
o DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
12" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
22. w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 800 $10.45 $8,360.00 $25,080.00 $15.15 $12,120.00 $36,360.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL ECONOLITE E8265P1-12 TP 5540 UNIVERSAL FIT ALL MANUF. EARS NOT CL
18" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
23. w/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
FLAT PAINT INSIDE IN HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL N/A (none stated)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
[ - -

me ?I.v

||V
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586

Department. TRANSPORTATION

|

PARADIGM TRAFFIC SYSTEMS, INC.
ARLINGTON, TX

TRAFFIC PARTS, INC.
CONROE, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[ ]

NO OPTION OFFERED

X

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days

30-45

3-73

Within hours or overnight after receipt of

verbal order in cases of emergency.

30-45

72

J'F BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.
L

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX
TEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZ‘L :§#$¢L UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ;;\\III\ITN;JFI:ILC (E))TY.X (ZLE':‘FTZ_SIQ; UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:‘II\ITN;JQLC g)TY.x (imiﬁf TE'S\-[QIQ)
NO.
1. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 LEFT BLANK $6,486.00 $19,458.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0246-PNC
2. PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 9" x 12" 200 LEFT BLANK $3,700.00 $11,100.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2013-PNC
3. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 5" x 7" 200 LEFT BLANK $3,358.00 $10,074.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PECO SF-1004-02

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO bt
BID TABULATION FORM

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX
TEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION EZTU :,\';‘T"#i"‘ UNIT PRICE (EST. ANNUAL ar.x g%ﬁﬁﬁlﬁlﬁ; UNIT PRICE (ESTJ:‘?'TN;’QLCS)TY- X g»ﬁﬁf Tlﬁf’i';)

NO.
4. PUSH BUTTON SIGNS 9" x 12" 200 $16.79 $3,358.00 $10,074.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SF-1004-08
5. ADJUSTABLE MAST ARM HANGER 150 $70.71 $10,606.50 $31,819.50

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO AB-3051-PNE
6. MAST ARM MOUNT SIGNAL BRACKET 200 $70.71 $14,142.00 $42,426.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO AB-3009-62-SS-PNC

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION 20



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ‘,\JI"TNFL,’F’:I'&%TY'X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ':‘TTNFL,’QLCS)TY' X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
7. HARDWARE - SERRATED CROSS 150 $23.00 $3,450.00 $10,350.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4093-NPT-SBE-P29
8. HARDWARE HORIZONTAL SLIP TEE 150 $15.00 $2,250.00 $6,750.00
(STEEL)
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4092-P29
9. HUB 8" FOR MAST ARM POLE 200 $14.14 $2,828.00 $8,484.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0445-DS-PNC

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

21




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
10. HUB 4" FOR 4" POLE 220 $14.00 $3,080.00 $9,240.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-0445-DS-PNC
11. ADA ROUND PUSH BUTTON ASSEMBLY 210 $61.00 $12,810.00 $38,430.00
WITH 2" PLUNGER
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-2149-08-P29
12. SLIPFITTER FOR TWO WAY SIGNAL 150 $47.57 $7,135.50 $21,406.50
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-3311-P29

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
DESCRIPTION S UANTITY | UNITPRICE (T, ANNUAL GTY. PAGAIE o UNITPRICE | (EsT. ANNUAL QTY.x oA TOTAL X

NO.
13.| ALUMINUM PEDESTAL POLE 4" x 15' 100 $212.80 $21,280.00 $63,840.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO PB-5100-15-PNE
14, 90 DEGREE ALUM ELBOW 200 $13.14 $2,628.00 $7,884.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4091-P29
15. NIPPLE, ALL THREAD (ALUM) 150 $13.14 $1,971.00 $5,913.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SE-4204-14-PNE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX

TEM BT ANNUAL ANNUAL TOTAL | 3 vEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL | 5 vEnR TOTAL
‘o. DESCRIPTION QuanTiTy | UNTPRICE T T Pacy | @NNUALTOTALX3) UNIT PRICE T AT PR | (anNUALTOTALX )
16. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $16.57 $3,314.00 $9,942.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
17. SCREW, SET SOC HD (STAINLESS) 200 $10.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
18. HEX, NIPPLE 200 $16.57 $3,314.00 $9,942.00

MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

/sl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/;\\]’;‘TNSFI;LCSTY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
19. GASKET, 70 DURO NEOPRENE 200 $15.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
20. CAP, OCTAGONAL CLOSURE 200 $69.00 $13,800.00 $41,400.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO
21. BASE, ALUMINUM SQUARE SIGNAL 250 $125.00 $31,250.00 $93,750.00
BIDDER'S LIST BIDDER'S PRICE
$25,000.00 $75,000.00
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO 1014-TX-PNC

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS

Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department: TRANSPORTATION

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC

HOUSTON, TX
ITEM ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL
EST. ANNUAL 3 YEAR TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ,;\\lrI\jTNFL’jF/:It%Ty_x (ANNUAL TOTAL x3) UNIT PRICE (ESTLJ/:III\ITNFL,JQLCS)TY.X (ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
NO.
12" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
22.| wW/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 800 $28.40 $22,720.00 $68,160.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO SM-1034-P29
18" VEHICLE TUNNEL VISOR YELLOW
23. | wW/UNIVERSAL CLIP ALUMINUM BLACK 50 $28.00 $1,400.00 $4,200.00
FLAT PAINT INSIDE IN HOOD.
MANUFACTURER & MODEL PELCO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15

2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS
Bid Opening Date: FEBRUARY 4, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
-

k * |
nerica City
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-586
Department. TRANSPORTATION

|

WILDCAT ELECTRIC SUPPLY, INC
HOUSTON, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

x|

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

__ %~-30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within ___ consecutive calendar days

(none stated)

Within hours or overnight after receipt of

verbal order in cases of emergency.

(none stated)

|IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 6 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 0

BIDS RECEIVED:

5

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0

NO BID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/9/15 2015-586 TRAFFIC SIGNAL COMPONENTS - DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

27




