CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587

Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

ELITE WASH DETAIL
EL PASO, TX

EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &
DIESEL
EL PASO, TX

PART A: REPAIR SERVICE RATE

SHOP BILLING RATE:

SHOP BILLING RATE:

BODY TECH

$75.00 PERHOUR

$40.00 PER HOUR

FRAME TECH

$75.00 PERHOUR

$40.00 PER HOUR

PART B: PART PRICING

ITEM ESTIMATED| = A'\'IE;JL“I’_'P;_TC')EPAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED AI\IIEI\?JIA'\IA_A'\IT(E'IPAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL MEASURE PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ty XU':T'TC;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF:T;_? EPER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
AUTOCAR
1. DOOR STRIKER EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.59 $57.54 $172.62
3080560 OR EQUAL
AUTOCAR
2. DOOR SHELL R/H EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID $4,583.00 $22,915.00 $68,745.00
A5001101-001 OR EQUAL
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: /sl
DATE: __03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 1




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

ELITE WASH DETAIL

EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &

DIESEL
EL PASO, TX
! EL PASO, TX
Cont. PART B: PART PRICING
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = AI\IIEI\?JL'\I/I_A:I:F(EEAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED A,\'f:JL"I"_fg_:?AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | I SF | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNT'TY @y XU‘:\IRI'II'(;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;\JRI-:'()'JE PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
PETERBILT
3. BACK PLATE 20- 5 EACH $93.25 $466.25 $1,398.75 $94.51 $472.55 $1,417.65
18151 OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
PETERBILT
4. BUMPER 15- 5 EACH $683.28 $3,416.40 $10,249.20 $1,234.94 $6,174.70 $18,524.10
06399E15100000 OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
INTERNATIONAL
5. SUPPORT 3997006C1 5 EACH $82.26 $411.30 $1,233.90 $75.76 $378.80 $1,136.40
OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
INTERNATIONAL
6. SHIELD 4009785C91 5 EACH $138.88 $694.40 $2,083.20 $110.15 $550.75 $1,652.25
OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
FREIGHTLINER
7. A22-58515-004 MIRROR CASE 5 EACH $443.13 $2,215.65 $6,646.95 $237.17 $1,185.85 $3,557.55
ASSEMBLY R/H OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: __03/23/2015

/sl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &
ELITE WASH DETAIL
EL PASO, TX DIESEL
! EL PASO, TX
Cont. PART B: PART PRICING
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = AI\IIEI\?JL'\I/I_A:I:F(EEAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED A,\'f:JL"I"_fg_:?AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | = “F | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNT'TY @y XUF;\IRI-:-(;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;\lRI_Ir(;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
STERLING
8. PLASTIC DOOR CLIP 60 EACH $11.98 $718.80 $2,156.40 $0.47 $28.20 $84.60
AFJSTP1109 OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
FORD
9. DOOR PANEL RETAINER 110 EACH $11.98 $1,317.80 $3,953.40 $0.33 $36.30 $108.90
N802900-S OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED)
$9,240.60 $27,721.80 $31,799.69 $95,399.07
PART B TOTAL (ITEMS 1-9)

ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
(NONE STATED) (NONE STATED)

PART C: PAINTING SERVICE

ALL DIRECT AND INDIRECT COSTS FOR PAINT, PAINTING
MATERIALS AND LABOR WILL BE BILLED AT:

$100.00 PER HOUR

$40.00 PERHOUR

PART D: MECHANICAL REPAIR SERVICE RATES

THE VENDOR WILL BILL THE CITY FOR ONLY LABOR

$75.00 PERHOUR $50.00 PERHOUR

COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE MECHANICAL REPAIRS
IDENTIFIED ABOVE:

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __ 03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 3



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso
[ - -

i

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

ELITE WASH DETAIL
EL PASO, TX

EP LIBERTY COMPLETE AUTO &
DIESEL
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

NON-STATED

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

]

x]

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

10% - 10 DAYS
5% - 20 DAYS
2% - 30 DAYS
NET - 30 DAYS

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: _ 03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 4




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

Department:

El Paso

All-America City

\ '
i
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-587
FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC
EL PASO, TX

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
BORDER INTERNATIONAL
EL PASO, TX

PART A: REPAIR SERVICE RATE

SHOP BILLING RATE:

SHOP BILLING RATE:

BODY TECH $53.00 PER HOUR $70.00 PER HOUR
FRAME TECH $55.00 PER HOUR $70.00 PER HOUR
PART B: PART PRICING
ITEM ESTIMATED| = A'\'IE;TL"I’_'P;_T E1'_3AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED Ar\'f:Tl\"l"_f E_I'?AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | SPIL S | PRICE PER UNIT UAL TO EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT UAL TO EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNT'TY @y XUILRI-:-C):E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;\lRI_II_?E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
AUTOCAR
1. DOOR STRIKER 6 EACH $15.96 $95.76 $287.28 $15.99 $95.94 $287.82
3080560 OR EQUAL
AUTOCAR
2. DOOR SHELL R/H 5 EACH $3,795.00 $18,975.00 $56,925.00 $3,501.10 $17,505.50 $52,516.50
A5001101-001 OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015

APPROVED BY: /sl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587

Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
BORDER INTERNATIONAL

EL PASO, TX
! EL PASO, TX
Cont. PART B: PART PRICING
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = AI\IIEI\?JL'\I/I_A:I:F(EEAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED A,\'f:JL"I"_fg_:?AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | = “F | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNT'TY @y XU‘:\IRI'II'(;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;\JRI-:'()'JE PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
PETERBILT
3. BACK PLATE 20- 5 EACH $101.55 $507.75 $1,523.25 $78.64 $393.20 $1,179.60
18151 OR EQUAL
PETERBILT
4. BUMPER 15- 5 EACH $1,203.48 $6,017.40 $18,052.20 $958.99 $4,794.95 $14,384.85
06399E15100000 OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
5. SUPPORT 3997006C1 5 EACH $78.44 $392.20 $1,176.60 $73.90 $369.50 $1,108.50
OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
6. SHIELD 4009785C91 5 EACH $115.85 $579.25 $1,737.75 $103.99 $519.95 $1,559.85
OR EQUAL
FREIGHTLINER
7. A22-58515-004 MIRROR CASE 5 EACH $231.14 $1,155.70 $3,467.10 $197.00 $985.00 $2,955.00
ASSEMBLY R/H OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015

APPROVED BY: /sl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587

Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
BORDER INTERNATIONAL

EL PASO, TX
! EL PASO, TX
Cont. PART B: PART PRICING
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = AI\IIEI\?JL'\I/I_A:I:F(EEAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED A,\'f:JL"I"_fg_:?AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL MEASURE PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNTITY @ty XUTI'T‘):E PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;:T%:E PER | (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
STERLING
8. PLASTIC DOOR CLIP 60 EACH $22.00 $1,320.00 $3,960.00 $1.18 $70.80 $212.40
AFJSTP1109 OR EQUAL 50 UNITS BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$44.00 $132.00
FORD
9. DOOR PANEL RETAINER 110 EACH $44.80 $4,928.00 $14,784.00 $2.49 $273.90 $821.70
N802900-S OR EQUAL BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
100 UNITS $89.60 $268.80
$33,971.06 $101,913.18 $25,008.74 $75,026.22
PART B TOTAL (ITEMS 1-9)
ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
T $27.856.66 $68.569.98 (NONE STATED) (NONE STATED)

PART C: PAINTING SERVICE

ALL DIRECT AND INDIRECT COSTS FOR PAINT, PAINTING
MATERIALS AND LABOR WILL BE BILLED AT:

$26.00 PERHOUR

$70.00 PERHOUR

PART D: MECHANICAL REPAIR SERVICE RATES

THE VENDOR WILL BILL THE CITY FOR ONLY LABOR
COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE MECHANICAL REPAIRS
IDENTIFIED ABOVE:

$75.00 PERHOUR

$82.00 PER HOUR

NOT

. This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors s

hall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __03/23/2015

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso
[ - -

i

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

LEWIS BODY SHOP, INC
EL PASO, TX

RJ BORDER INTERNATIONAL LP dba
BORDER INTERNATIONAL
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

x]

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

.2% - 10 DAYS

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: _ 03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 8



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

Department:

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587

FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.
EL PASO, TX

PART A: REPAIR SERVICE RATE

SHOP BILLING RATE:

SHOP BILLING RATE:

BODY TECH

$87.00 PERHOUR

$0.00 PER HOUR

FRAME TECH

$87.00 PERHOUR

$0.00 PER HOUR

PART B: PART PRICING

ITEM ESTIMATED| = A'\'IE;JL“I’_'P;_TC')EPAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED AI\IIEI\?JIA'\IA_A'\IT(E'IPAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | SPIL S | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNT'TY @y XUILRI-:-C):E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;\lRI_II_?E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
AUTOCAR
1. DOOR STRIKER 6 EACH $12.98 $77.88 $233.64 $0.00 $0.00
3080560 OR EQUAL
AUTOCAR
2. DOOR SHELL R/H 5 EACH $3,300.01 $16,500.05 $49,500.15 $0.00 $0.00
A5001101-001 OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015

APPROVED BY: /sl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

Department:

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587

FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.

EL PASO, TX
Cont. PART B: PART PRICING
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = AI\IIEI\?JL'\I/I_A:I:F(EEAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED A,\'f:JL"I"_fg_:?AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | I SF | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNT'TY @y XU‘:\IRI'II'(;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;\JRI-:'()'JE PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
PETERBILT
3. BACK PLATE 20- 5 EACH $126.73 $633.65 $1,900.95 $0.00 $0.00
18151 OR EQUAL
PETERBILT
4. BUMPER 15- 5 EACH $1,506.25 $7,531.25 $22,593.75 $0.00 $0.00
06399E15100000 OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
5. SUPPORT 3997006C1 5 EACH $92.45 $462.25 $1,386.75 $0.00 $0.00
OR EQUAL
INTERNATIONAL
6. SHIELD 4009785C91 5 EACH $136.03 $680.15 $2,040.45 $0.00 $0.00
OR EQUAL
FREIGHTLINER
7. A22-58515-004 MIRROR CASE 5 EACH $289.43 $1,447.15 $4,341.45 $0.00 $0.00

ASSEMBLY R/H OR EQUAL

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: __03/23/2015

APPROVED BY: /sl

2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION

10




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-587

Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.

EL PASO, TX
Cont. PART B: PART PRICING
ITEM ESTIMATED| |\ = AI\IIEI\?JL'\I/I_A:I:F(EEAL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED A,\'f:JL"I"_fg_:?AL 3 YEAR ESTIMATED
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL | I SF | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL | PRICE PER UNIT EXTENDED TOTAL
NO. QUNT'TY @y XUF;\IRI-:-(;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3) @y XUF;\lRI_Ir(;E PER (ANNUAL TOTAL X 3)
STERLING
8. PLASTIC DOOR CLIP 60 EACH $0.34 $20.40 $61.20 $0.00 $0.00
AFJSTP1109 OR EQUAL
FORD
9. DOOR PANEL RETAINER 110 EACH $0.15 $16.50 $49.50 $0.00 $0.00
N802900-S OR EQUAL
PART B TOTAL (ITEMS 1-9) $27,369.28 $82,107.84 $0.00 $0.00
ANNUAL TOTAL 3 YEAR TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL | 3 YEAR TOTAL

PART C: PAINTING SERVICE

ALL DIRECT AND INDIRECT COSTS FOR PAINT, PAINTING
MATERIALS AND LABOR WILL BE BILLED AT:

$87.00 PERHOUR

$0.00 PER HOUR

PART D: MECHANICAL REPAIR SERVICE RATES

THE VENDOR WILL BILL THE CITY FOR ONLY LABOR
COSTS ASSOCIATED WITH THE MECHANICAL REPAIRS
IDENTIFIED ABOVE:

$87.00 PERHOUR

$0.00 PER HOUR

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: __ 03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 11




CITY OF EL PASO :
BID TABULATION FORM |

Project Name: HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 4, 2015

El Paso
[ - -

2.
nerica City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-587
Department: FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE

TRUCK ENTERPRISES INC.
EL PASO, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

]

NO OPTION OFFERED

X

PAYMENT TERMS:

3% - 10 DAYS

BIDS SOLICITED: 21 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 21

BIDS RECEIVED:

5

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5 NO BID: O

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: _ 03/23/2015 2015-587 HEAVY DUTY VEHICLE BODY REPAIR AND PAINTING - FACILITIES AND FLEET MAINTENANCE - FLEET DIVISION 12



