El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIE THWEST AUTO GLA
NABI PARTS, LLC us S Sou ST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP | TMC [9100's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | MAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)

NO. (B)

1. SIDE WINDOW 25" x 31 14" 102-040395 40 80 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $11,120.00
2. EXIT DOOR BOTH HALVES 15 14" x 39" B1000842 1 5 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $695.00

3. SIDE BOTTOM DESTINATION SIGN 20" x 52" B1012318 5 10 NO BID NO BID $159.00 $1,590.00
4. SIDE UPPER DESTINATION 11" x 52" B1012317 5 10 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $1,390.00
5. ENTRANCE DggEEI;RONT & REAR 1312" x 2812" | B1005152 5 10 NO BID NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
6. ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT & REAR 1315 "x25" | B1005157 1 5 NO BID NO BID $129.00 $645.00

MIDDLE
7. ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT & REAR 9"x 13 15" B1005155 1 5 NO BID NO BID $99.00 $495.00
LOWER
8. WINDSHIELD LH 39" x 43" B1001422 5 10 NO BID NO BID $239.00 $2,390.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP | TMC [9100's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (C)
NO. (B)
9. WINDSHIELD RH 39" x 43" G1001426 5 10 NO BID NO BID $239.00 $2,390.00
10. DRIVERS REAR HALF GLASS 19" x 36" G1007237 1 5 NO BID NO BID $129.00 $645.00
11. DRIVERS FRONT HALF GLASS 21" x 36" G1007232 1 5 NO BID NO BID $149.00 $745.00
12. DESTINATION SIGN FRONT 151" x 84 G1011174 1 5 NO BID NO BID $229.00 $1,145.00
13. ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT none G1005156 1 5 NO BID NO BID $129.00 $645.00
GROUP | ANNUAL TOTAL NO BID NO BID $25,185.00
GROUP | 3-YR TOTAL NO BID NO BID $75,555.00

(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

APPROVED BY: /sl

3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

illl-lnmeﬂca City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [9400's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) CoST (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
MIN | MAX (A) () (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)
1. SIDE WINDOW GLASS 2815 x 31" 6320251 10 20 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $2,780.00
2. EMERGENCY WINDOW 27v4 x 2834" 6320240 15 30 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $4,170.00
3. EXIT DOOR GLASS 12 x 26" 110988 1 5 NO BID NO BID $89.00 $445.00
4. SIDE BOTTOM DESTINATION SIGN 18 12" x 56 6320257 1 5 NO BID NO BID $159.00 $795.00
5. SIDE UPPER DESTINATION SIGN 10 ¥2 x 56 6320256 1 5 NO BID NO BID $129.00 $645.00
6. ENTRANCE DOOR UPPER GLASS 17 14 x 53 027441 1 5 NO BID NO BID $149.00 $745.00
7. | ENTRANCE DOOR BOTTOM GLASS 12 x 174" 027442 1 5 NO BID NO BID $89.00 $445.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [9400's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (C)
NO. (B)
8. WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE 39 x 48" 5 10 NO BID NO BID $289.00 $2,890.00
9. WINDSHIELD, STREET SIDE 39 x 38" 5 10 NO BID NO BID $289.00 $2,890.00
10. DRIVER'S SIDE FRONT & REAR 18x 3334 " 1 5 NO BID NO BID $129.00 $645.00
11. DRIVER'S SIDE UPPER 814 x 38" 1 5 NO BID NO BID $89.00 $445.00
12. FRONT DESTINATION SIGN 12 x 7314" 1 5 NO BID NO BID $149.00 $745.00
GROUP Il ANNUAL TOTAL NO BID NO BID $17,640.00
GROUP Il 3-YR TOTAL NO BID NO BID $52,920.00
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

illl-lnmeﬂca City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)

BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) CoST (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
MIN | MAX (A) () (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)
1. UPPER GLASS N/A 6322119 1 5 NO BID $68.72 $343.60 $129.00 $645.00
2. LOWER GLASS N/A 6319225 1 5 NO BID $129.63 $648.15 $199.00 $995.00
3. LOWER FIXED GLASS N/A 6317979 1 5 NO BID $94.81 $474.05 $139.00 $695.00
4, UPPER GLASS DEST SIGN N/A 6317524 1 5 NO BID $61.70 $308.50 $129.00 $645.00
5. | LOWER FIXED GLASS, EMERGENCY N/A 6322122 1 5 NO BID $122.22 $611.10 $189.00 $945.00
6. LOWER FIXED GLASS N/A 6326096 1 5 NO BID $105.48 $527.40 $139.00 $695.00
7. SASH GLASS N/A 6320859 1 5 NO BID $66.60 $333.00 $129.00 $645.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM T
2010
BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2015-616
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (C)
NO. (B)
8. SASH GLASS N/A 6322127 1 5 NO BID $65.51 $327.55 $129.00 $645.00
9. SASH GLASS N/A 6322081 1 5 NO BID $54.29 $271.45 $129.00 $645.00
10. SASH GLASS N/A 6322121 1 5 NO BID $65.29 $326.45 $289.00 $1,445.00
11. SASH GLASS N/A 6326097 1 5 NO BID $128.35 $641.75 $289.00 $1,445.00
12. GLASS SASH N/A 6322121 1 5 NO BID $65.29 $326.45 $289.00 $1,445.00
13. DOOR GLASS EXIT N/A 63575 1 5 NO BID $93.75 $468.75 $289.00 $1,445.00
14, GLASS BOTTOM ENTR N/A 111255NFA | 1 5 NO BID $10.88 $54.40 $289.00 $1,445.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 6




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (€) (A) (€) (A) (€)
NO. (B)
15. DRIVER'S ASSY SASH N/A 6321806 1 5 NO BID $217.09 $1,085.45 $289.00 $1,445.00
16. GLASS, FRONT DEST SIGN N/A 232434 1 5 NO BID $277.68 $1,388.40 $289.00 $1,445.00
GROUP Il ANNUAL TOTAL NO BID $8,136.45 $16,670.00
BIDDER'S PRICE
$15,920.00
GROUP IlII 3-YR TOTAL NO BID $24,409.35 $50,010.00
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3) BIDDER'S PRICE $24,409.14 BIDDER'S PRICE
$47,760.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE:  3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 7




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)

BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV NABI (2007) A003 NOT INCLUDED
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
[ MIN | mAX | (A) (€) (A) (€) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
DRIVERS WINDOW ASSY 5011808 $2,769.00 $27,690.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
1. UPPER STATIONARY N/A 6305163 5 10 $206.71 $2,067.10 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
LOWER SLIDING 6000601 $267.54 $2,675.40 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-010 $3,678.13 $36,781.30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
2. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7951 5 10 $236.43 $2,364.30 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
LOWER SLIDING 633-7955 $235.86 $2,358.60 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-020 $3,272.25 $16,361.25 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
3. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 6326083 1 5 $276.14 $1,380.70 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING 633-7923 $462.00 $2,310.00 NO BID $149.00 $745.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-030 $4,103.00 $20,515.00 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
4, UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-9087 1 5 $269.29 $1,346.45 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING 633-9088 $327.86 $1,639.30 NO BID $149.00 $745.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-040 $2,643.75 $13,218.75 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
5. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7973 1 5 $207.71 $1,038.55 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 $639.29 $3,196.45 NO BID $269.00 $1,345.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-050 $4,173.86 $20,869.30 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
6. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 1 5 $225.14 $1,125.70 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING 633-9089 $246.71 $1,233.55 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-060 $4,003.88 $20,019.40 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
7. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 1 5 $225.14 $1,125.70 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING| 633-7968 $198.14 $990.70 NO BID $129.00 $645.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

illl-lnmeﬂca City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV NABI (2007) A003 NOT INCLUDED
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) COST
[ MIN | MAX | (A) () (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-070 $3,272.25 $16,361.25 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
8. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 6326083 1 5 $276.14 $1,380.70 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING 633-7923 $462.00 $2,310.00 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-080 $3,924.75 $19,623.75 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
9. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-9087 1 5 $269.29 $1,346.45 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING 633-9088 $327.86 $1,639.30 NO BID $149.00 $745.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-090 $2,643.75 $26,437.50 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
10. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7973 5 10 $207.71 $2,077.10 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 $639.29 $6,392.90 NO BID $269.00 $2,690.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-100 $4,003.88 $40,038.80 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
11. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 5 10 $225.14 $2,251.40 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
LOWER SLIDING 6337968 $198.14 $1,981.40 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-110 $3,652.13 $18,260.65 NO BID $0.00 $0.00
12. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 1 5 $225.14 $1,125.70 NO BID $129.00 $645.00
LOWER SLIDING 633-9089 $246.71 $1,233.55 NO|B|D $129.00 $645.00
13. DESTINATION SIGN N/A 501-8703-001 1 5 $326.09 $1,630.45 NO |BID $149.00 $745.00
|
14. (repf;l:ezv:régz%%& B) N/A 70001-41607 5 10 $354.60 $3,546.00 NO |BID $490.00 $4.900.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP IV NABI (2007) A003 NOT INCLUDED
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) CoST (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT
MIN | MAX (A) () (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)
R/S WINDSHIELD
15. (replaced 100-8703-002B) N/A 70001-41608 5 10 $354.60 $3,546.00 NO BID $490.00 $4,900.00
ENTRANCE DOOR-UPPER
16. (replaced 5019118.06) N/A 5019118.07 5 10 $59.40 $594.00 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
ENTRANCE DOOR - LOWER
17. (replaced 5019119.06 N/A 5019119.02 5 10 $53.69 $536.90 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
18. EXIT DOOR N/A 5019118.09 5 10 $64.10 $641.00 NO BID $129.00 $1,290.00
BIDDER'S PRICE
$645.00
GROUP IV ANNUAL TOTAL $333,262.30 NO BID $37,455.00
BIDDER'S PRICE
$36,810.00
GROUP IV 3-YR TOTAL $999,786.90 NO BID $112,365.00
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3) BIDDER'S PRICE
$110,430.00
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl
DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 10




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | MAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
WINDSHIELD, STREETSIDE 72%
1. GREEN TINT N/A 518461 1 5 NO BID $245.66 $1,228.30 NO BID
0,
2. | WINDSHIELD, CUT'T,??'DE 72% GREEN N/A 518462 1 5 NO BID $421.73 $2,108.65 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
3. DRIVER'S N/A 50057 1 5 NO BID $2,431.85 $12,159.25 NO BID
4. | GLASS, FIXED 6mm 72% GREEN N/A 6392158 1 5 NO BID $1,347.65 $6,738.25 NO BID
' [
5. | CGLASS, DRWZ%::,?SH 6mm 72% N/A 6429514 1 5 NO BID $377.21 $1,886.05 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
6. EMERGENCY FIXED FRONT N/A 507274 1 5 NO BID $2,315.65 $11,578.25 NO BID
STREETSIDE
7. GLASS, FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 5412863 1 5 NO BID $1,467.23 $7,336.15 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

11




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
MIN | MAX (A) () (A) () (A) (c)
NO. (B)
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
8. | EMERGENCY SIDE DESTINATION N/A 532875 1 5 NO BID $2,869.37 $14,346.85 NO BID
SIGN
9. | GLASS, UPPER FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6405597 1 5 NO BID $113.67 $568.35 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, NON-
10. EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED NIA 6444552 1 5 NO BID $1,283.01 $6,415.05 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, NON-

11. EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED N/A 632749 1 5 NO BID $3,824.43 $19,122.15 NO BID

12. || GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444553 1 5 NO BID $1,914.41 $9,572.05 NO BID

13. GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444554 1 5 NO BID $1,401.39 $7,006.95 NO BID

FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
14. EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED N/A 532748 1 5 NO BID $4,556.19 $22,780.95 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

12




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

illl-lnmeﬂca City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616

Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) CoST (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT
MIN | MAX (A) () (A) () (A) (c)

NO. (B)

15. | GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444553 1 5 NO BID $1,914.41 $9,572.05 NO BID

16. GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444554 1 5 NO BID $1,401.39 $7,006.95 NO BID

FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
17. NON-EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED 62.28x35.12 532751 1 5 NO BID $4,537.40 $22,687.00 NO BID
62.28x35.12
18. | GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444555 1 5 NO BID $1,577.95 $7,889.75 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
20.| NON-EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED SS N/A 532752 1 5 NO BID $4,916.91 $24,584.55 NO BID
TRANSITION
251 GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444556 1 5 NO BID $1,556.72 $7,783.60 NO BID
BIDDER'S PRICE
$7,833.60

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

13




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | MAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (C)
NO. (B)
22. GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444554 1 5 NO BID $1,401.39 $7,006.95 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, NON-
23. EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED CS N/A 532754 1 5 NO BID $4,371.76 $21,858.80 NO BID
TRANSITION
24.| GLASS, FULL FIXED 6MM 9% GRAY N/A 6444557 1 5 NO BID $1,566.72 $7,833.60 NO BID
25. GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444554 1 5 NO BID $1,401.39 $7,006.95 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, SIDE
26. DESTINATION SIGN N/A 532753 1 5 NO BID $2,407.78 $12,038.90 NO BID
27. ||GLASS, LOWER FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6412870 1 5 NO BID $1,430.52 $7,152.60 NO BID
0,
2g.| CLASS, UPPEGRR%){(ED Gmm 89% N/A 6392255 1 5 NO BID $233.50 $1,167.50 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

14




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

NABI PARTS, LLC NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
DELAWARE. OH CANADA ULC INC.
’ WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (C)
NO. (B)
29. WINDOW-HPR/FIXED EGRESS N/A 538817 1 5 NO BID $4,252.09 $21,260.45 NO BID
30. || WINDOW-HPR/FIXED NON-EGRESS N/A 538816 1 5 NO BID $4,082.93 $20,414.65 NO BID
31.| WINDOW-HPR/FIXED NON-EGRESS N/A 538815 1 5 NO BID $4,175.07 $20,875.35 NO BID
GROUP V ANNUAL TOTAL NO BID $328,986.90 NO BID
BIDDER'S PRICE $329,036.90
GROUP V 3-YR TOTAL NO BID $986,960.70 NO BID
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3) BIDDER'S PRICE $987,110.70
3-YR TOTAL GRAND TOTAL
$999,786.90 $1,011,370.05 $290,850.00
ALL GROUPS BIDDER'S PRICE $337,173.35 BIDDER'S PRICE $ NO BID
YES NO YES NO YES NO
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED
I:I NONE MARKED I:I E I:I D NONE MARKED I:I

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 15




El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO ‘l”"
BID TABULATION FORM 2010
BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2015-616
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES SOUTHWEST AUTO GLASS,
CANADA ULC INC.
WINNIPEG, MB EL PASO, TX

NABI PARTS, LLC
DELAWARE, OH

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED E X
PAYMENT TERMS: NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS NET 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 60-75

. . 7 LEFT BLANK
Within ___ consecutive calendar days. *IF NOT IN STOCK
Within __ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in 48

96 LEFT BLANK

cases of emergency. *IF NOT IN STOCK

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.
A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 16




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP | TMC [9100's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
1. SIDE WINDOW 25" x 31 14" 102-040395 40 80 NO BID
2. EXIT DOOR BOTH HALVES 155" x 39" | B1000842 1 5 NO BID
3. | SIDE BOTTOM DESTINATION SIGN 20" x 52" B1012318 5 10 NO BID
4. SIDE UPPER DESTINATION 11" x 52" B1012317 5 10 NO BID
¢ | ENTRANCEDOORFRONT&REAR | 12 . e v 1005152 5 10 NO BID
UPPER
6. | ENTRANCEDOORFRONT&REAR | 15, w55 | By005157 1 5 NO BID
MIDDLE
ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT & REAR . .
7. LOWER 9"x 1314 B1005155 1 5 NO BID
8. WINDSHIELD LH 39" x 43" B1001422 5 10 NO BID

NOTE: THe informatiomcortaimedinthis bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE:

3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP I TMC [9100's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT
MIN | MAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
9. WINDSHIELD RH 39" x 43" G1001426 5 10 NO BID
10. DRIVERS REAR HALF GLASS 19" x 36" G1007237 1 5 NO BID
11. DRIVERS FRONT HALF GLASS 21" x 36" G1007232 1 5 NO BID
12. DESTINATION SIGN FRONT 157%" x 84 G1011174 1 5 NO BID
13. ENTRANCE DOOR FRONT none G1005156 1 5 NO BID
GROUP | ANNUAL TOTAL NO BID
GROUP I 3-YR TOTAL NO BID
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)

NOTE: Tdpphf@m@gtion contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 18




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [9400's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | MAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
1. SIDE WINDOW GLASS 2812 x 31" 6320251 10 20 NO BID
2. EMERGENCY WINDOW 27v4 x 2834" | 6320240 15 30 NO BID
3. EXIT DOOR GLASS 12 x 26" 110988 1 5 NO BID
4. | SIDEBOTTOM DESTINATIONSIGN | 184" x 56 6320257 1 5 NO BID
5. | SIDE UPPER DESTINATION SIGN 10 V5 x 56 6320256 1 5 NO BID
6. | ENTRANCE DOOR UPPER GLASS 17 v4 x 53 027441 1 5 NO BID
7. | ENTRANCE DOOR BOTTOM GLASS | 12x 174" 027442 1 5 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

19




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

illl-lnmerlca City
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [9400's]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
MIN | MAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
8. WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE 39 x 48" 5 10 $119.00 $1,190.00
9. WINDSHIELD, STREET SIDE 39 x 38" 5 10 $119.00 $1,190.00
10. DRIVER'S SIDE FRONT & REAR 18x 3334 " 1 5 NO BID
11. DRIVER'S SIDE UPPER 814 x 38" 1 5 NO BID
12. FRONT DESTINATION SIGN 12x 734" 1 5 NO BID
GROUP Il ANNUAL TOTAL $2,380.00
GROUP Il 3-YR TOTAL $7.140.00
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 20

DATE: 3/11/15




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION FORM T
2010
BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2015-616
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
1. UPPER GLASS N/A 6322119 1 5 NO BID
2. LOWER GLASS N/A 6319225 1 5 $87.95 $439.75
3. LOWER FIXED GLASS N/A 6317979 1 5 NO BID
4. UPPER GLASS DEST SIGN N/A 6317524 1 5 $39.95 $199.75
5. | LOWER FIXED GLASS, EMERGENCY N/A 6322122 1 5 NO BID
6. LOWER FIXED GLASS N/A 6326096 1 5 NO BID
7. SASH GLASS N/A 6320859 1 5 $42.75 $213.75

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 21




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO Exsxvd
BID TABULATION FORM T
2010
BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2015-616
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
“MIN | MAX | (A) () (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)
8. SASH GLASS N/A 6322127 1 5 NO BID
9. SASH GLASS N/A 6322081 1 5 NO BID
10. SASH GLASS N/A 6322121 1 5 NO BID
11. SASH GLASS N/A 6326097 1 5 NO BID
12. GLASS SASH N/A 6322121 1 5 NO BID
13. DOOR GLASS EXIT N/A 63575 1 5 NO BID
14. GLASS BOTTOM ENTR N/A 111255NFA 1 5 $27.25 $136.25

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 22




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO e
BID TABULATION FORM \ '

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2015-616
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ

GROUP Il NEW FLYER [2004]

EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
MIN | MAX | () (c) (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)
15. DRIVER'S ASSY SASH N/A 6321806 1 5 NO BID
16. GLASS, FRONT DEST SIGN N/A 232434 1 5 NO BID
GROUP Il ANNUAL TOTAL $989.50

GROUP Il 3-YR TOTAL

$2,968.50
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 23




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

I

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)

BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ

GROUP IV NABI (2007)

EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) COST
MIN | MAX | (A) () (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)

DRIVERS WINDOW ASSY 5011808 NO BID

1. UPPER STATIONARY| N/A 6305163 5 10 $23.15 $231.50

LOWER SLIDING 6000601 $49.85 $498.50
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-010 NO BID
2. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7951 5 10 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 633-7955 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-020 NO BID
3. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 6326083 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 633-7923 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-030 NO BID
4. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-9087 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 633-9088 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-040 NO BID
5. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7973 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-050 NO BID
6. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 633-9089 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-060 NO BID
7. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING| 633-7968 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE: 3/11/15

Isl

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)

BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP IV NABI (2007)
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-070 NO BID
8. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 6326083 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 633-7923 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-080 NO BID
9. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-9087 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 633-9088 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-090 NO BID
10. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7973 5 10 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 6322683 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-100 NO BID
11. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 5 10 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 6337968 NO BID
WINDOW ASY 507-2642-110 NO BID
12. UPPER TRANSOM N/A 633-7964 1 5 NO BID
LOWER SLIDING 633-9089 NO BID
13. DESTINATION SIGN N/A 501-8703-001 1 5 NO :BID
|
C/S WINDSHIELD

14. (replaced 100-8703-001B) N/A 70001-41607 | 5 10 NO|BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N
2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP IV NABI (2007)
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | mAX (A) (C) (A) (c) (A) (C)
NO. (B)
R/S WINDSHIELD
15. (replaced 100-8703-002B) N/A 70001-41608 5 10 NO BID
ENTRANCE DOOR-UPPER
16. (replaced 5019118.06) N/A 5019118.07 5 10 $39.45 $394.50
ENTRANCE DOOR - LOWER
17. (replaced 5019119.06 N/A 5019119.02 5 10 NO BID
18. EXIT DOOR N/A 5019118.09 5 10 NO BID
GROUP IV ANNUAL TOTAL $1,124.50
BIDDER'S PRICE $394.50
GROUP IV 3-YR TOTAL $3.373.50
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3) BIDDER'S PRICE $1,183.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO s
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE PIN QTY (COST EACH) COST (COST EACH) coSsT (COST EACH) CoST
MIN | MAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
WINDSHIELD, STREETSIDE 72%
1. GREEN TINT N/A 518461 1 5 NO BID
, | WINDSHIELD, CURBSIDE 72% GREEN NIA 518462 1 5 NG BID
TINT
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
3. DRIVER'S N/A 50057 1 5 NO BID
4. | GLASS, FIXED 6mm 72% GREEN N/A 6392158 1 5 NO BID
GLASS, DRIVER'S SASH 6mm 72%
5. GREEN N/A 6429514 1 5 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
6. EMERGENCY FIXED FRONT N/A 507274 1 5 NO BID
STREETSIDE
7. GLASS, FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 5412863 1 5 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
MIN | MAX ») c) ®) ) ) c)
NO. (B)
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
8. | EMERGENCY SIDE DESTINATION NIA 532875 | 1 | 5 NO BID
SIGN
9. | GLASS, UPPER FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY | NIA 6405597 | 1 | 5 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, NON-
10-1 " EMERGENCY TIP-INIFIXED NiA baddssz 1 1| 8 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, NON-

111 EMERGENCY TIP-INIFIXED NA 632749 1) 8 NO BID

12. | GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY NIA 6444553 | 1 | 5 NO BID

13.|  GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY NIA 6444554 | 1 | 5 NO BID

FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
141 EMERGENCY TIP-INIFIXED NiA Ss2ras ) 1 105 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) CoST (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT
MIN | MAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
15. | GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444553 1 5 NO BID
16. GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444554 1 5 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
17. NON-EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED 62.28x35.12 532751 1 5 NO BID
62.28x35.12
18. | GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444555 1 5 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY,
20. || NON-EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED SS N/A 532752 1 5 NO BID
TRANSITION
21.| GLASS, FULL FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444556 1 5 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO i
BID TABULATION FORM N

2010

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600
EST ANNUAL
PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT
MIN | MAX | () (c) (A) () (A) ()
NO. (B)
22. GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444554 1 5 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, NON-
23. EMERGENCY TIP-IN/FIXED CS N/A 532754 1 5 NO BID
TRANSITION
24.| GLASS, FULL FIXED 6MM 9% GRAY N/A 6444557 1 5 NO BID
25. GLASS, SASH 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6444554 1 5 NO BID
FLUSH WINDOW ASSEMBLY, SIDE
26. DESTINATION SIGN N/A 532753 1 5 NO BID
27. ||GLASS, LOWER FIXED 6mm 9% GRAY N/A 6412870 1 5 NO BID
0,
2g.| CLASS, UPP'EGRRQ\)((ED 6mm 89% N/A 6392255 | 1 5 NO BID

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-616
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID)
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ
GROUP V NEW FLYER 14400 & 14600

EST ANNUAL

PURCHASE UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL TOTAL
ITEM DESCRIPTION SIZE P/IN QTY (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) cosT (COST EACH) coSsT

MIN | MAX (A) (c) (A) (c) (A) (c)
NO. (B)
29. WINDOW-HPR/FIXED EGRESS N/A 538817 1 5 NO BID
30. | WINDOW-HPR/FIXED NON-EGRESS N/A 538816 1 5 NO BID
31. | WINDOW-HPR/FIXED NON-EGRESS N/A 538815 1 5 NO BID

GROUP V ANNUAL TOTAL NO BID
GROUP YV 3-YR TOTAL NO BID
(ANNUAL TOTAL x 3)
3-YR TOTAL GRAND TOTAL
$13,482.00
ALL GROUPS BIDDER'S PRICE $14,224.50
YES NO YES NO YES NO
OEM DOCUMENTATION SUBMITTED
I:I NONE MARKEDI:I I:I I:I I:I I:I

NOTE: R@@)Hbf\%wlon con/g9|ned in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DATE: 3/11/15

2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)
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El Paso

All-America City

CITY OF EL PASO ‘l”"
BID TABULATION FORM 2010
BID ITEM: BUS WINDSHIELDS & GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) Solicitation #: 2015-616
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 25, 2015 Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

TRANSLITE ENTERPRISES, INC
ELIZABETH, NJ

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND
THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN
NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION X
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED I:I I:I

PAYMENT TERMS: NET- 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

Within __ consecutive calendar days.

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in
cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.

A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.

96

BIDS SOLICITED: 17 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 5 BIDS RECEIVED: 4 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 1 NO BID: 0O
NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 3/11/15 2015-616 BUS WINDSHIELDS GLASS REPLACEMENTS (RE-BID) - MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO) 32




