Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015
Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT

DOOLEY TACKABERRY, INC.

SHREVEPORT, LA LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX
ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. COAT, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $960.00 $192,000.00 $1,132.00 $226,400.00 $1,196.25 $239,250.00
EA
HONEYWELL FIRST RESPONDER
MANUFACTURER GLOBE LION APPAREL (MORNING PRIDE)
MODEL NUMBER METRO COAT - K4781-G CSTMIF LTO-34C3 TAILS
2. PANTS, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $560.00 $112,000.00 $812.00 $162,400.00 $845.80 $169,160.00
PAIR
HONEYWELL FIRST RESPONDER
MANUFACTURER GLOBE LION APPAREL (MORNING PRIDE)
MODEL NUMBER METRO PANT - K4781-G PSDMI/F LTO-34C3 PANTS
3. HELMENT, FIRE FIGHTER 300 $190.00 $57,000.00 $206.00 $61,800.00 $281.45 $84,435.00
EA
MANUFACTURER MSA SAFETY LION APPAREL PHENIX TECHNOLOGY, INC.
MODEL NUMBER 664 INVADER LFH3910S TC3003D-ESS
NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an award

ee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT



Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015

Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT

DOOLEY TACKABERRY, INC.

MODEL NUMBER

PN1301400

SHREVEPORT, LA LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX
ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
4. HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT 250 $34.25 $8,562.50 $39.50 $9,875.00 $33.85 $8,462.50
EA
MANUFACTURER LIFELINERS MAJESTIC FIRE APPAREL | MAJESTIC |F|I\|RcE APPAREL,
MODEL NUMBER 9723ES-PL23 PACII-P84 Pac Il 3-PLY (P84 MATERIAL)
5. GLOVES, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 400 $115.00 $46,000.00 $84.30 $33,720.00 $105.75 $42,300.00
PAIR
HONEYWELL FIRST
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL SUPER GLOVE LION APPAREL RESPONDER
MODEL NUMBER GL-SGKCG LPG927 GL-SGKCG SUPER GLOVE
6. BOOTS, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $295.00 $59,000.00 $318.00 $63,600.00 $364.25 $72,850.00
PAIR
MORNING PRIDE PRO
MANUFACTURER GLOBE HAIX WARRIGTON
STRUCTURAL SHADOW- 501605 BT5007

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015
Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
1
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT

DOOLEY TACKABERRY, INC.

SHREVEPORT, LA LUBBOCK, TX DEER PARK, TX
ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
7. | SUSPENDERS, HEAVY DUTY, 8 POINT DYNA 200 $30.00 $6,000.00 $28.50 $5,700.00 $53.50 $10,700.00
BACK OR EQ UAL *Suspenders are included with pants at
EA no additional charge
MANUFACTURER GLOBE LION APPAREL HONEYWELL FIRST

RESPONDER

BLACK PADDED H-BACK

SP-DFQ-TR-P ("INCL W/PANTS AT

MODEL NUMBER RIP CORD SB342 NO ADD'L CHARGE)
TOTAL ANNUAL ITEMS NO. 1 THRU NO. 7 $480,562.50 $563,495.00 $627,157.50
BIDDER'S PRICE $2,880.85*

3 YR TOTAL ITEMS NO. 1 THRU NO. 7

$1,441,687.50

$1,690,485.00

$1,881,472.50
BIDDER'S PRICE $627,157.50*

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2015 2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015
Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

CASCO INDUSTRIES, INC
SHREVEPORT, LA

DACO FIRE EQUIPMENT
LUBBOCK, TX

DOOLEY TACKABERRY, INC.
DEER PARK, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING

THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER
THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[]

[]

[]

NO OPTION OFFERED E E E
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET- 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

. . 30 45-60
Within __ consecutive calendar days. 30

NOTE: If bidder does not specify an earlier delivery, the City's required delivery shall prevail. Adelivery date later than the City's required may be cause for rejection of the bid.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015

Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

DOOLEY TACKABERRY,
INC.
(Alternate Bid)
DEER PARK, TX

FREIGHTLINER OF ARIZONA
LLC
TOLLESON, AZ

JETS FIRE & SAFETY dba
DELTA INDUSTRIAL
SERVICE & SUPPLY
PORT NECHES, TX

ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. COAT, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $1,098.95 $219,790.00 $927.38 $185,476.00 $1,050.00 $210,000.00

EA
MANUFACTURER INNOTEX, INC VERIDIAN, LTD HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER INNO6000X-C CVNG-814-D26-42-GBT TXELPS00227
2. PANTS, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $818.60 $163,720.00 $594.99 $118,998.00 $760.00 $152,000.00
PAIR
MANUFACTURER INNOTEX, INC. VERIDIAN, LTD HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER INNO6000X-P TVNG-814-D26-41-GBT TXELPS00228
3. HELMENT, FIRE FIGHTER 300 $172.00 $51,600.00 NO BID NO BID $167.95 $50,385.00
EA
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL FIRST HONEYWELL

RESPONDER

MODEL NUMBER

LIT FORCE LOW RIDER

LITEFORCE LR

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:

DATE:

Is/

4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015

Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
1
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

DOOLEY TACKABERRY,
INC.
(Alternate Bid)
DEER PARK, TX

FREIGHTLINER OF ARIZONA
LLC
TOLLESON, AZ

JETS FIRE & SAFETY dba
DELTA INDUSTRIAL
SERVICE & SUPPLY
PORT NECHES, TX

ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED || UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
4. HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT 250 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.00 $6,000.00

EA
MANUFACTURER NO BID MAJESTIC
MODEL NUMBER NO BID P84 PAC Il
5. GLOVES, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 400 $95.25 $38,100.00 NO BID NO BID $78.00 $31,200.00
PAIR
MANUFACTURER INNOTEX CORP GLOVE CRAFTERS INC.
MODEL NUMBER INNO795 FA-G-1020
6. BOOTS, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $294.10 $58,820.00 NO BID NO BID $270.00 $54,000.00
PAIR
WEINBRENNER MFG
MANUFACTURER (THOROGOOD) COSMAS
MODEL NUMBER 804-6389 (KNOCKDOWN) CMF141

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

4/29/2015

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015
Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

DOOLEY TACKABERRY,
INC.
(Alternate Bid)
DEER PARK, TX

FREIGHTLINER OF ARIZONA
LLC
TOLLESON, AZ

JETS FIRE & SAFETY dba
DELTA INDUSTRIAL
SERVICE & SUPPLY
PORT NECHES, TX

ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED || UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
7. | SUSPENDERS, HEAVY DUTY, 8 POINT DYNA 200 $42.55 $8,510.00 $23.53 $4,706.00 $34.50 $6,900.00

BACK OR EQUAL EA *Suspenders are included with pants at
no additional charge
MANUFACTURER INNOTEX, INC. VERIDIAN, LTD HONEYWELL
MODEL NUMBER HBP VB-52DH-W-W SP-DFQP
TOTAL ANNUAL ITEMS NO. 1 THRU NO. 7 $540,540.00 $309,180.00 $510,485.00
BIDDER'S PRICE *$2,521.45
3YRTOTAL ITEMS NO. 1 THRU NO. 7 $1,621,620.00 $927,540.00 $1,531,455.00

BIDDER'S PRICE *$540,540.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015
Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso
All-America City
1
2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

DOOLEY TACKABERRY,
INC.
(Alternate Bid)
DEER PARK, TX

FREIGHTLINER OF ARIZONA
LLC
TOLLESON, AZ

JETS FIRE & SAFETY dba
DELTA INDUSTRIAL
SERVICE & SUPPLY
PORT NECHES, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING

THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER
THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

]

**2 ADD'L YEARS FOR INNOTEX
COAT/PANT/SUSPENDERS ONLY

[]

[]

[x]

NO OPTION OFFERED E E
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS NONE STATED
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

30-45 30 30

Within consecutive calendar days.

NOTE: If bidder does not specify an earlier delivery, the City's required delivery shall prevail. Adelivery date later than the City's required may be cause for rejection of the bid.

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015

Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

1

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

MUNICIPAL EMERGENCY

SERVICES, INC. sggEEEéN\(/:\/ "
HOUSTON, TX '
ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED || UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
1. COAT, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $1,450.00 $290,000.00 $829.10 $165,820.00
EA
VIKING LIFE SAVING
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL EQUIPMENT
MODEL NUMBER LT041BTTZ PS1126 (CUSTOMIZED)
2. PANTS, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $1,015.00 $203,000.00 $556.37 $111,274.00
PAIR
VIKING LIFE SAVING
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL EQUIPMENT
MODEL NUMBER LTO041BTTZ PS1160 (CUSTOMIZED)
3. HELMENT, FIRE FIGHTER 300 $174.00 $52,200.00 $181.37 $54,411.00
EA
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL PHENIX
MODEL NUMBER MES01400615, 18, 20 & 21 PHE 003-ESS

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

4/29/2015

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015

Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

MUNICIPAL EMERGENCY

SERVICES, INC. sﬁgEEEéN\(/:\/ "
HOUSTON, TX '
ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED || UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
4. HOOD, FLASHOVER, KNIT 250 $31.50 $7,875.00 $36.72 $9,180.00
EA
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL MAJESTIC
MODEL NUMBER HD-NLNL-SQ PAC Il PBI
5. GLOVES, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 400 $108.20 $43,280.00 $65.69 $26,276.00
PAIR
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL GLOVE CRAFTERS
MODEL NUMBER GL-SGKCG RAIDER
6. BOOTS, PROTECTIVE, STRUCTURAL 200 $235.30 $47,060.00 $235.00 $47,000.00
PAIR
MANUFACTURER COSMAS THOROGOOD
MODEL NUMBER TITAN 804-6369 POWER HV

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement.

Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an award

ee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE:

4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT

10




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015
Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

1

2010

Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

MUNICIPAL EMERGENCY

SERVICES, INC. SL;EEEEEIN\(/:\/ "
HOUSTON, TX '
ANNUAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
'LEM DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED || UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED | UNIT PRICE | EXTENDED
' QUANTITY PRICE PRICE PRICE
SUSPENDERS, HEAVY DUTY, 8 POINT DYNA
2 27.7 40. : 7,676.
7. BACK OR EQUAL Evo $27.70 $5,540.00 $38.38 $7,676.00
MANUFACTURER HONEYWELL HONEYWELL or VIKING
8 POINT DYNA BACK or
MODEL NUMBER SP-DF VIKING PADDED H-BACK
TOTAL ANNUAL ITEMS NO. 1 THRU NO. 7 $648,955.00 $421,637.00

3 YR TOTAL ITEMS NO. 1 THRU NO. 7

$1,946,865.00

$1,264,911.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT

11




Bid Opening Date: APRIL 22, 2015
Project Name: STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010
Solicitation #: 2015-803
Department: EL PASO FIRE

MUNICIPAL EMERGENCY
SERVICES, INC.
HOUSTON, TX

UNFIRE INC.
SPOKANE, WA

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING

THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT
SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER
THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM
OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE
OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXIPRATION OF THE ORIGINAL
TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[]

]

NO OPTION OFFERED [x] [ ] ]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET -30 DAYS NET -30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: 30

60 EXCEPT TURNOUTS WHICH WILL

Within consecutive calendar days.

BE 45-60 DAYS

NOTE: If bidder does not specify an earlier delivery, the City's required delivery shall prevail. Adelivery date later than the City's required may be cause for rejection of the bid.

BIDS SOLICITED: 18 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 7

BIDS RECEIVED: 8

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0

NO BIDS: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 4/29/2015

2015-803 STRUCTURAL FIREFIGHTING CLOTHING - FIRE DEPARTMENT

12




