CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

200F

BID TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS
BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015

BID NO: IFB 2015.974
DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUGTION MANAGEMENT

A & M CONSTRUCTION ALLIED PAVING COMPANY ARMOR CONSTRUCTION GO. ING.
CHAPARRAL, NM EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 of 8 BIDDER 2 of 8 BIDDER 3 of 8
rent| ESTIMATED UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT
£ | quanTmy | UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF [TEM PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE {Qty X Unit Price} PRICE (Qty X Unit Price)
{In Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures)
REMOVE CURB & GUTTER
' $1,494.00
1, 200 LE | NeLUDES S AWCUT, COMPLETE REMOVAL $17.50 $3,500.00 $3.94 $788.00 $7.47 o
DISPOSAL AND CLEAN UP PRICE $1 493 75
REMOVE ASPHALT PAVEMENT
$1,968.00
2 260 SY | INCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL 1087 $2,334.00 $10.89 ¥2,178.00 $9.84 .
CONTRACTOR'S
AND CLEAN UP PRICE $1,968.75
REMOVE CONCRETE SIDEWALK
3. 100 SY | \NCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL $21.60 $2,160.00 $10.89 $1,089.00 $8.50 $650.00
AND CLEAN UP
REMOVE REINFORCED CONCRETE SIDEWALK
725.
4 100 SY | INCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL $25.50 $2,550.00 $10.89 $1,089.00 $7.25 $725.00
AND CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $4,359.38
STANDARD CURB & GUTTER
5. 200 LF INCLUDES SAWCUT, EXCAVATION, $28.00 $5,600.00 $9.90 $1,980.00 $21.80 $4,360.00
SUBGRADE PREPARATION, REINFORCEMENT,
EXPANSION MATERIAL, CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $4,359.,38
REMOVE LANDSCAPING ROCKS, SODDING
6. 150 SE T INCLUDES SAWCUT, COMPLETE REMOVAL $7.50 $1,125.00 %0.55 $82.50 $8.34 CONTSZAii;'sg
DISPOSAL AND CLEAN UP PRICE $534 95
ROLLED CURB & GUTTER
7. 20 LF |INCLUDES SAWCUT, EXCAVATION, SUBGRADE $50.00 $1,000.00 $0.90 $198.00 $46.86 $937.20]
PREPARATION, REINFORCEMENT, EXPANSION CONTRACTOR'S
MATERIAL, CLEAN UP. PRICE 5937 19
; /’}
Approved By: m«}éﬁ
Date: I /ST 2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS Page 1 of 8



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS

BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015

BID NO: IFB 2015-974

DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT

A & M CONSTRUCTION

ALLIED PAVING COMPANY

ARMOR CONSTRUCTION CO. INC,

CHAPARRAL, NM EL PASO, TX EL PASC, TX
BIDDER 1 of 8 BIDDER 2 of 8 BIDDER 3 0f8
UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT
I TEN # Eg;'j“NATTE\? UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qey X Unit Price) PRICE (Gity X Unit Price) PRIGE (Qy X Unit Price)
{In Figures) (In Figures) (in Figures) {In Figures) (In Flg}ures) {in Figures)
CONCRETE STEM WALL
8. 50 F | INCLUDES ALL MATERIAL, EXCAVATION, GUT $70.00 $3,500.00 $5.80 $204.50 $14.98 $749.00
AND FILL, SAWCUT, SUBGRADE
PREPARATION, INSTALLATION, AND CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $749.06
WHEELCHAIR RAMP
{SEE DETAIL R-4)
9. 20 EA [INCLUDES ALL MATERIAL, INSTALLATION, AND $1,100.00 $22,000.00 $831.36 $16,627.20 $64.39 $1,287.80
CLEAN UP. IF ASPHALT IS DAMAGED, USE
ASPHALT PATCH PAVING AS SHOWN ON CONTRACTOR'S
DETAIL 5-2 PRICE $1,287 81
ASPHALT PAVEMENT 2" THICK, TYPE ¢
10. 40 sy INCLUDES SAWCUT, 8" 2-5AC BASE & 6" $70.00 $2,800.00 $16.80 $792.00 $39.73 $1,589.20]
SUBGRADE PREP/?:F?..E‘ESE,PCOMPACTION AND CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $1,589.06
TRUNCATED DOMES
1. 10 5Y INCLUDFS COMPLETE INSTALLMENT OF NO BID NO BID $136.62 $1,366.20 $192.78 $1,927.80
TRUNCATED DOMES DETECTABLE !
WARNINGS CONTRACTOR'S
) PRICE 1,827.81
- CONCRETE DRIVEWAY-
INCLUDES 6" THICK CONCRETE, SAWCUT
) ; : 1,330.00
12. 100 Y EXCAVATION, FORMS, SUBGRADE NG BID NO BID $36.26 $3,626.00 $13.30 $1.3
PREPARATION, REINFORCEMENT, EXPANSION CONTRACTOR'S
MATERIAL, AND CLEAN UP. PRICE $1,320.60

Approved By: ﬁ

Date: 3@1(3&"

2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS

Page 2 of 9



CITY OF EL. PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

IpID TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK iMPROVEMENTS

BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015

BID NO: IF8 2015974

DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT

A &M CONSTRUCTICN

ALLIED PAVING COMPANY

ARMOR CONSTRUCTION CO. INC,

CHAPARRAL, NM EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 of 8 BIDDER 2 of 8 BIDDER 3 of 8
LINIT 8iD TOYAL AMGUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BiD TOTAL AMOUNT
IFEM # ESETG’:%? UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION GF ITEM PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE (Qty X Unit Price)
(In Figures) {In Figures} {in Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures) {in Figures)
CONCRETE SIDEWALKS
INCLUDES 4" THICK CONCRETE, ADJUSTMENT
13. 800 5Y OF WATER METER BOXES IF NECESSARY, NO BID NG BID $30.28 $24,232.00 $39.93 $31,044.00
EXCAVATION, CUT AND FILL, SAWCUT,
SUBGRADE PREPARATION, FORMS
: CONTRACTOR'S
EXPANSION JOINTS, AND CLEAN UP PRICE $31,046.88
SUM TOTAL BASE BID [ (ITEMS 1-13} $46,569.00 $54,342.40 $50,213.00
LAST PAGE NOT,| CONTRACTOR'S|
SUBMITTED PRICE 549,708.75

AMENDMENTS 1, 2, &3 ACKNOWLEDGED:

NO

NO

YES

BID BOND SUBMITTED

NO

YES

YES

]
Approved y:(‘ B
Date: :

2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS
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CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

S-Anunica ity

L

20010

BID TITLE: ATEAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS BID NO: IFE 2015974
BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015 DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT
BLAGK STALLION CONTRAGTORS, KEYSTONE GG, LLC. MARTINEZ BROS. GONTRACTORS,
INC. EL PASO, TX LLC
EL PASO, TX ‘ EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 of 8 BIDDER 5 of 8 BIDDER 6 of 8
e | ESTIMATED UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT
¢ | quanTiTy | UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Gty X Unit Price) PRICE (Qty X Unit Price) PRICE (Qty X Unit Price)
{in Figures) {In Figures)} (In Figures) (in Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures)
REMOVE CURB & GUTTER
1, 200 LF | |NCLUDES SAWGCUT. COMPLETE REMOVAL $7.00 $1,400.00 $15.16 $3,232.00 $5.00 $1,000.00
DISPOSAL AND CLEAN Up CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $3,231.87
REMOVE ASPHALT PAVEMENT
$3,560.00
2 200 SY | |NCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL $15.00 $3,000.00 $17.50 N $12.00 $2,400.00
AND CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $3,500.86
REMOVE CONCRETE SIDEWALK
$3,223.00
3. 100 SY INGLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL. DISPOSAL $15.00 $1,500.00 $32.23 ‘ $12.00 $1,200.00
AND GLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $3,223.36
REMOVE REINFORCED CONCRETE SIDEWALK
$3,223.00
4. 100 sY INCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL $20.00 $2.000.00 $32.23 $18.00 $1,8G0.00
AND CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $3,223.38
STANDARD CURB & GUTTER
5, 200 LF INCLUDES SAWCUT, EXCAVATION, $12.00 $2,400.00 $18.84 $3,768.00 $17.00 $3,400.00
SUBGRADE PREFARATION, REINFORCEMENT,
EXPANSION MATERIAL, CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $3,767.79
_ _ _ REMOVE LANDSGAPING ROCKS, SODDING | _ _ _ _ | o
822.00
6. 150 SF | INCLUDES SAWCUT, COMPLETE REMOVAL $1.00 $150.00 $5.48 ) ' 8150 $225.00
DISPOSAL AND CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $821.39
ROLLED CURB & GUTTER
7 20 LF |INCLUDES SAWCUT, EXCAVATION, SUBGRADE $12.00 $240.00 $18.94 $378.80 $20.00 $400.00]
PREPARATION, REINFORCEMENT, EXPANSION CONTRACTOR'S
MATERIAL, CLEAN UP, PRICE $378.71

2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

¥l raso
Al-fuennrico Eizy
| § g a 7

2074

IB|D TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS BIGO NO: IFB 2015974
BiD DATE: JUNE 18, 2015 DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT
BLACK STALLION CONTRACTORS, KEYSTONE GG, LLC. MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS,
INC. EL PASO, TX LLc
EL PASO, TX ' EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 of 8 BIDDER 5 of 8 BIDDER 6 of 8
UNIT BID TOTAL AMCUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BiD TOTAL AMOUNT
ITEM # E{;"EI}QHNJ‘;E?E UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE {Qty X Urit Price)
{in Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures) {In Figures) (in Figures)
CONCRETE STEM WALL
8. 50 LF | INCLUDES ALL MATERIAL, EXCAVATION, CUT $15.00 $750.00 $14.48 $724.00 $22.00 $1,100.00
AND FILL, SAWCUT, SUBGRADE
PREPARATION, INSTALLATION, AND GLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $724.07;
WHEELCHAIR RAMP
(SEE DETAIL R-4)
9. 20 EA |INCLUDES ALL MATERIAL, INSTALLATION, AND $860.00 $17.000.00 $879 51 $17,500.20 $1,035.00 $20,700.00
CLEAN UP. IF ASPHALT 1S DAMAGED, USE
ASPHALT PATCH PAVING AS SHOWN ON CONTRACTORS
DETAIL §-2 PRICE $17.590.14
ASPHALT PAVEMENT 2° THICK, TYPE C
10, 40 Sy | INCLUDES SAWCUT, 6" 2-SAC BASE & 6" $30.00 $1,200.00 $98.42 $3,036.80 $160.00 $6,400.00
SUBGRADE PREPARATION, COMPACTION AND CONTRACTOR'S
CLEANUP PRICE $3.936.64
TRUNGATED DOMES
1. 10 SY | INCLUDES COMPLETE INSTALLMENT OF $100.00 $1,000.00 $218.57 $2,185.70 $250.00 $2,500.00]
TRUNCATED DOVES DETECTABLE CONTRACTOR'S
: PRICE $2,185.73
CONCRETE DRIVEWAY |
INCLUDES & THICK CONCRETE, SAWCUT, $5,303.00
12. 106 Sy EXOAVATION. oS, Sonamate $40.00 $4,000.00 $53.03 $68.00 $6,800.00
PREPARATION, REINFORCEMENT, EXPANSION CONTRACTOR'S
MATERIAL, AND CLEAN UP. PRICE 55,303 24
Approved B @ﬂ
AT 2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS Page 5 of 9



CITY OF EL. PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

£l Paso

[ e e

AI-AlhaLen Sty
1K

200

IEHD TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS

BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015

BID NO: IFB 2015974
DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT

BLACK STALLION CONTRACTORS,

KEYSTONE GC, LLC.

MARTINEZ BROS. CONTRACTORS,

NG, LLC
EL PASO, TX ELPASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 of 8 BIDDER 5 of 8 BIDDER 6 of 8
UNIT BID TOTAL AMQUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT
ITEM # ESJTN%I’TI?‘? UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE {Qity X Unit Price) PRICE (Qty X Unit Price)
{In Figures) (in Figures}) (tn Figures) {in Figuras} {In Figures) {In: Figures)
CONCRETE SIDEWALKS
INCLUDES 4" THICK CONCRETE, ADJUSTMENT
13. 800 Y OF WATER METER BOXES IF NECESSARY, $35.00 $28,000.00 $44.93 $35,944.00 $56.00 $44,800.00
EXCAVATION, CUT AND FILL, SAWCUT,
SUBGRADE PREPARATION, FORMS
EXPANSION JOINTS, AND CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $35,340.65
SUM TOTAL BASE BID I (ITEMS 1-13} $62,640.00 $83,830.50 $92,725.00
CONTRACTOR'S
_PRICE 553,827,795

AMENDMENTS 1, 2, &3 ACKNOWLEDGED:

NIA

NIA

NO

BID BOND SUBMITTED

NO

NO

NO

Approved y:(5
Date: & ;‘.50/

2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS

Page 6 of 8




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Tl Pasao

Al-Aduarica iy

ik

2040

|BID TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS

BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015

BID NO: IFB 2015-974

DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT

SETCON LLC VERTEX CONTRAGTORS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 7 of 8 BIDDER 8 of 8
UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT
ITEM| ESTIMATED o o o
# QUANTITY UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION GF ITEM PRICE {Qty X Unit Price} PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE {Qty X Unit Price)
{in Figures) (In Figures) {In Figures) (in Figures) (In Figures) (In Figures)
REMOVE CURB & GUTTER
T 200 Y] INCLUDES SAWCUT, COMPLETE REMOVAL $4.43 $856.00 $4.00 $800.00
DISPOSAL AND CLEAN UP
REMOVE ASPHALT PAVEMENT
2 200 SY 1 INCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL $6.17 $1,234.00 $5.00 $1.000.00
AND CLEAN UP
REMOVE CONCRETE SIDEWALK
3. 100 5Y | INCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL $12.34 $1,234.00 $9.00 $900.00
AND CLEAN UP
REMOVE REINFORCED CONCRETE SIDEWALK
4 100 SY | INCLUDES A COMPLETE REMOVAL, DISPOSAL $15.23 $1,523.00 $9.00 $900.00
AND CLEAN UP
STAQNDARD CURB & GUTTER
5. 260 LF INCLUDES SAWCUT, EXCAVATION, $12.92 $2,584.00 $14.00 $2,800.00
SUBGRADE PREPARATICN, REINFORCEMENT,
EXPANSION MATERIAL, CLEAN UP
REMOVE LANDSCAPING ROCKS, SODDING
6. 150 SE 1 INCLUDES SAWCUT, COMPLETE REMOVAL $4.88 $732.00 $1.50 $225.00
DISPOSAL AND GLEAN UP
ROLLED CURB & GUTTER
7. 20 LF |INCLUDES SAWCUT, EXCAVATION, SUBGRADE $11.30 $226.00 $11.00 $220.00
PREPARATION, REINFORGEMENT, EXPANSION
MATERIAL, CLEAN UP.

Approved By~
Date: & /38

2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS
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CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

LT Paso

Mz Gity

BID TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VUI.CAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS
BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015

BiD NO: IFB 2015-974

DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT

SETCON LLC VERTEX CONTRACTORS, LLLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 7 of 8 BIDDER 8 of 8
UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT
ITEM # ES;TNJ?I-E‘? UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE [Qity X Unit Price)} PRICE (Qty X Unit Price} PRICE (Qty X Unit Price)
{in Figures} (In Figures) {in Figures) (In Figures) {In Figures) (in Figures)
CONCRETE STEM WALL
8. 50 LF INCLUDES ALL MATERIAL, EXCAVATION, CUT %7 .61 $380.50 $11.00 3550.00
AND FILL, SAWCUT, SUBGRADE
PREPARATION, INSTALLATION, AND CLEAN UP CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $2,283.00
WHEELCHAIR RAMP
{SEE DETAIL R-4}
9. 20 EA |INCLUDES ALL MATERIAL, INSTALLATION, AND $514.00 $10,280.00 $520.00 $10,400.00
CLEAN UP. IF ASPHALT IS DAMAGED, USE
ASPHALT PATCH PAVING AS SHOWN ON
DETAIL 5-2
ASPHALT PAVEMENT 2" THICK, TYPE C
10. 40 sy INCLUDES SAWCUT, 8" 2-SAC BASE & 6" $32.13 $1,285.20 $49.00 $1,860.00
SUBGRADE PREPACT-/E;IISTJ,PCOMPACTION AND CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $1,285.00
TRUNCATED DOMES
11. 10 SY INCLUDES COMPLETE INSTALLMENT OF $161.91 $1,619.10 $175.00 $1,750.00
TRUNCATED DCMES DETECTABLE
WARNINGS.
-~ CONCRETE DRIVEWAY
INCLUDES 86" THICK CONCRETE, SAWCUT, : ;
12. 100 Sy EXCAVATION, FORMS, SUBGRADE $36.52 $3,652.00 $38.00 $3,800.00
PREPARATION, REINFORCEMENT, EXPANSION
MATERIAL, AND CLEAN UP,
Approved
Date: (o 2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS Page 8 of 9




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

I 1Pasao

Al-tasirica Cigy

i’

2040

BID TITLE: ATLAS, TITANIC & VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS
BID DATE: JUNE 18, 2015

BID NO: IFB 2015-974

DEPARTMENT: ENGINEERING & CONSTRUCTION MANAGEMENT

SETCON LLC VERTEX CONTRACTORS, LLLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 7 of 8 BIDDER 8 of 8
UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT BID TOTAL AMOUNT
ESTIMATED
ITEM ) QUANTITY UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qty X Unit Price) PRICE (Qty X Unit Price) PRICE {Qty X Unit Price)
{In Figures} {In Figures} {In Figures) {in Figures) {In Figures) {in Figures)
CONCRETE SIDEWALKS
INCLUDES 4" THICK CONCRETE, ADJUSTMENT
13 800 SY | OF WATER METER BOXES IF NECESSARY, $26.56 $21,248.00 $27.00 §21,600.00
EXCAVATION, CUT AND FILL, SAWCUT,
SUBGRADE PREPARATICN, FORMS
EXFPANSION JOINTS, AND CLEAN UP
SUM TOTAL BASE BID { {ITEMS 1-13) $46,883.80 $46,905.00
CONTRACTOR'S
PRICE $48,78§.1
AMENDMENTS 1, 2, &3 ACKNOWLEDGED: NIA NiA
BIC BOND SUBMITTED YES NO
Approved
Date: 2015-974 ATLAS TITANIC AND VULCAN SIDEWALK IMPROVEMENTS Page 8 of 8




