
Project Name: PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS Solicitation #:  2016-007

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 30, 2015 Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

1. $114.45 $11,445.00 $34,335.00 $228.80 $22,880.00 $68,640.00 $190.00 $19,000.00 $57,000.00

pkg of 2
Bidder's Price 

$11,440
Bidder's Price $34,320

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

2. $98.70 $4,935.00 $14,805.00 $199.60 $9,980.00 $29,940.00 $165.00 $8,250.00 $24,750.00

pkg of 2 Bidder's Price $4,990 Bidder's Price $14,970
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

*

3. $1.23 $738.00 $2,214.00 $73.20 $43,920.00 $131,760.00 $120.00 $72,000.00 $216,000.00

pkg Bidder's Price $732 Bidder's Price $2,196
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

*

4. $7.29 $36,450.00 $109,350.00 $109.80 $549,000.00 $1,647,000.00 $170.00 $850,000.00 $2,550,000.00

pkg 
Bidder's Price 

$36,600

Bidder's Price 

$109,800

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

*

5. $4.89 $146,700.00 $440,100.00 $146.40 $4,392,000.00 $13,176,000.00 $230.00 $6,900,000.00 $20,700,000.00

pkg
Bidder's Price 

$146,400

Bidder's Price 

$439,200

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

VISITAPE BRAND (ALL)

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.
*Flint Trading interprets the unit of measure to be by 

linear foot.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.
*Flint Trading interprets the unit of measure to be by 

linear foot.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.
*Flint Trading interprets the unit of measure to be by 

linear foot.

FLINT TRADING, INC.

THOMASVILLE, NC

UNIT 

PRICE

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

(Total Annual Price 

x 3)

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE
DESCRIPTION

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

9'10" STRAIGHT ARROW

UNIT 

PRICE

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

EST. 

ANNUAL  

QTY

100

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)(Total Annual Price x 3)

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME

50

EA

EA

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME FLINT

VISITAPE BRAND (2 PER PKG) FLINT

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

5,000

EA

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME

VISITAPE BRAND (60 LINEAL FT PER PKG) FLINT

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME

4" X 1' WHITE 600

EA

24" X 1' WHITE

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

8' RIGHT TURN ARROW

VISITAPE BRAND (2 PER PKG)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

(Total Annual Price x 

3)

POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC

VALLEY FORGE,  PA

UNIT 

PRICE

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF 

TEXAS, INC.

SAN MARCO,  TX

VISITAPE BRAND (15 LINEAL FT PER PKG) FLINT

16" X 1' WHITE 30,000

EA

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (30 LINEAL FT PER PKG) FLINT

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/______

DATE: _______10/12/15______  2016-007 PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS 1



Project Name: PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS Solicitation #:  2016-007

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 23, 2015 Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

6. $163.87 $16,387.00 $49,161.00 $163.80 $16,380.00 $49,140.00 $260.00 $26,000.00 $78,000.00

ea.
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

7. $68.13 $3,406.50 $10,219.50 $375.05 $18,752.50 $56,257.50 $550.00 $27,500.00 $82,500.00

pkg of 5
Bidder's Price 

$3,750.50

Bidder's Price 

$11,251.50

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

8. $42.47 $2,123.50 $6,370.50 $94.25 $4,712.50 $14,137.50 $140.00 $7,000.00 $21,000.00

pkg of 2
Bidder's Price 

$2,356.25

Bidder's Price 

$7068.75

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

9. $14.07 $1,407.00 $4,221.00 $141.05 $14,105.00 $42,315.00 $220.00 $22,000.00 $66,000.00

pkg of 10
Bidder's Price 

$1,410.50

Bidder's Price 

$4,231.50

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

10. $0.63 $882.00 $2,646.00 $207.20 $290,080.00 $870,240.00 $2.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00

pkg Bidder's Price $2,072 Bidder's Price $6,216
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

VISITAPE BRAND (10 PER PKG)

FLINT TRADING, INC.

THOMASVILLE, NC

UNIT 

PRICE

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC

VALLEY FORGE,  PA

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF 

TEXAS, INC.

SAN MARCO,  TX

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (140 PER PKG) FLINT

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

(Total Annual Price 

x 3)

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

(Total Annual Price x 

3)

DESCRIPTION
 TOTAL 

ANNUAL PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

VISITAPE BRAND (1 PER PKG) FLINT

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price) (Total Annual Price x 3)

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME

EST. 

ANNUAL  

QTY

UNIT 

PRICE

100

4'X2' BIKE SYMBOL

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (5 PER PKG) FLINT

6' X 2' BIKE LANE 

STRAIGHT ARROW
EA

50

EA

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (2 PER PKG) FLINT

24" YIELD LANE

 (SHARK'S TEETH)

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME FLINT

8' "ONLY" LETTERING 100

EA

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

5" X 5" BUNDY RPM 

ADHESIVE WHITE
1,400

EA

50

EA

APPROVED BY: ___/s/______

DATE: _______10/12/15______  2016-007 PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS 2



Project Name: PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS Solicitation #:  2016-007

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 23, 2015 Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

11. $0.63 $882.00 $2,646.00 $207.20 $290,080.00 $870,240.00 $2.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00

pkg Bidder's Price $2,072 Bidder's Price $6,216
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

12. $108.62 $2,172.40 $6,517.20 $239.20 $4,784.00 $14,352.00 $350.00 $7,000.00 $21,000.00

pkg of 2 Bidder's Price $2,392 Bidder's Price $7,176
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

13. $227.48 $2,274.80 $6,824.40 $227.50 $2,275.00 $6,825.00 $360.00 $3,600.00 $10,800.00
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

14. $162.50 $1,625.00 $4,875.00 $162.50 $1,625.00 $4,875.00 $260.00 $2,600.00 $7,800.00
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

15. $313.72 $3,137.20 $9,411.60 $313.30 $3,133.00 $9,399.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00
Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

(Total Annual Price 

x 3)

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

FLINT TRADING, INC.

THOMASVILLE, NC

UNIT 

PRICE

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price) (Total Annual Price x 3)

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

(Total Annual Price x 

3)

EST. 

ANNUAL  

QTY

FLINT

8' "STOP" LETTERING

EA

10

EA

FLINT

6'6"X20' RXR

 (RAILROAD CROSSING)

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (1 PER PKG) FLINT

10

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

8' "AHEAD" LETTERING

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (1 PER PKG)

DESCRIPTION

10

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC

VALLEY FORGE,  PA

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

5" X 5" BUNDY RPM 

ADHESIVE YELLOW
1,400

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (1 PER PKG)

EA

EA

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF 

TEXAS, INC.

SAN MARCO,  TX

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (2 PER PKG) FLINT

EA

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (140 PER PKG) FLINT

48" X 48" HANDICAP SYMBOL 

WHITE ON BLUE
20

APPROVED BY: ___/s/______

DATE: _______10/12/15______  2016-007 PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS 3



Project Name: PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS Solicitation #:  2016-007

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 23, 2015 Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

ITEM

NO.

16. $253.89 $2,538.90 $7,616.70 $240.50 $2,405.00 $7,215.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

17. $211.61 $3,174.15 $9,522.45 $211.25 $3,168.75 $9,506.25 $340.00 $5,100.00 $15,300.00

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

18. $127.66 $3,191.50 $9,574.50 $281.40 $7,035.00 $21,105.00 $400.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00

pkg of 2
Bidder's Price 

$3,517.50

Bidder's Price 

$10,552.50

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

$243,469.95 $730,409.85 $5,676,315.75 $17,028,947.25 $7,974,650.00 $23,923,950.00

Bidder's Price 

$246,719.50

Bidder's Price 

$740,158.50

Bidder's Price

 "NO BID"

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

(Total Annual Price 

x 3)

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

FLINT TRADING, INC.

THOMASVILLE, NC

UNIT 

PRICE

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT 

(ITEMS 1 - 18)

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME 1 PER PKG. FLINT

PREMARK BY FLINT TRADING, INC.

SHARED LANE SYMBOL

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME

13'2" X 11'6" COMBINATION 

LEFT/STRAIGHT/RIGHT ARROW

MANUFACTURE OR BRAND NAME VISITAPE BRAND (1 PER PKG.)

EA

25

FLINT

8'2" X 11'6" COMBINATION 

LEFT/RIGHT/STRAIGHT ARROW
EA

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price) (Total Annual Price x 3)

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL 

PRICE

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

(Est. Annual Qty, x 

Unit Price)

(Total Annual Price x 

3)

VISITAPE BRAND (2 PER PKG) FLINT

UNIT 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

 TOTAL 

ANNUAL PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC

VALLEY FORGE,  PA

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF 

TEXAS, INC.

SAN MARCO,  TX

3 YR TOTAL 

PRICE

10

EA

15

DESCRIPTION
EST. 

ANNUAL  

QTY

APPROVED BY: ___/s/______

DATE: _______10/12/15______  2016-007 PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS 4



Project Name: PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS Solicitation #:  2016-007

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 23, 2015 Department:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY

GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE

PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS.  THE TERM OF

THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE 

SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND 

CONDITIONS.  THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY 

EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

NO OPTION OFFERED

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or the next morning.

10-14

48

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

FLINT TRADING, INC.

THOMASVILLE, NC

PAYMENT TERMS:

NOTE:  The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PATHMARK TRAFFIC PRODUCTS OF 

TEXAS, INC.

SAN MARCO,  TX

NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

48*
*IN STOCK ITEMS ONLY

N/A

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
14 14

NET - 30 DAYS

POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC

VALLEY FORGE,  PA

BIDS SOLICITED:    45       LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:    0          BIDS RECEIVED:  3              LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:  0                    NO BID:  0

X X 

x 

APPROVED BY: ___/s/______

DATE: _______10/12/15______  2016-007 PREFORMED STREET MARKINGS 5


