
Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

10 $15.00 $69.00 $690.00 $2,070.00 $18.00 $107.08 $1,070.80 $3,212.40

1.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

800 $26.00 $56.95 $45,560.00 $136,680.00 $27.00 $122.99 $98,392.00 $295,176.00

2.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

50 $15.00 $54.00 $2,700.00 $8,100.00 $18.00 $80.23 $4,011.50 $12,034.50

3.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

30 $15.00 $38.00 $1,140.00 $3,420.00 $18.00 $75.89 $2,276.70 $6,830.10

4.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

3 $15.00 $49.00 $147.00 $441.00 $18.00 $76.73 $230.19 $690.57

5.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

27-60 AC DELCO

27PG

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

10

94R-72

AC DELCO 94RPG
2

V31S-5

AC DELCO

ACD1109C

10

65-60

AC DELCO 65A 15

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

 ESTIMATED  

QUANTITY CORE 

CHARGE

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

1

42-60

CONTINENTAL BATTERY CO.

EL PASO,  TX

GVMI INC.

EL PASO, TX

UNIT PRICE

(B)

UNIT PRICE

(B)

CORE 

CHARGE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

NAPA 7594R

NAPA 7234

NAPA 7565

NAPA 7542

NAPA 7527

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 1



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

5 $15.00 $49.00 $245.00 $735.00 $18.00 $120.59 $602.95 $1,808.85

6.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

2 $15.00 $41.00 $82.00 $246.00 $18.00 $69.08 $138.16 $414.48

7.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

10 $15.00 $53.00 $530.00 $1,590.00 $18.00 $70.23 $702.30 $2,106.90

8.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"NO BID"

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

51R60 1

78 PG

GM 78 PG

SIDE POST ONLY

2

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

1

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING

3 YEAR TOTAL $322,273.80

78-DTPS AC

DELCO 78-DTPS

CONTINENTAL BATTERY CO.

EL PASO,  TX

GVMI INC.

EL PASO, TX

 ESTIMATED  

QUANTITY CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

NAPA 7578

NOTE: All items are made in the USA

NOTE: Please see information sheets

 inserted below page 18

BIDDER'S PRICE "NO BID"

$153,282.00

NAPA 75XDT800

NAPA 7551R

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 2



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NO OPTION OFFERED

NET - 30 DAYS

2 7

24 48

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

NET - 30 DAYSPAYMENT TERMS:

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

CONTINENTAL BATTERY CO.

EL PASO,  TX

GVMI INC.

EL PASO, TX

X X 

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 3



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

2 10 $18.00 $119.24 $1,192.40 $3,577.20 $18.75 $105.38 $1,053.80 $3,161.40

1.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

10 800 $22.00 $102.39 $81,912.00 $245,736.00 $30.58 $62.98 $50,384.00 $151,152.00

2.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

15 50 $18.00 $89.28 $4,464.00 $13,392.00 $18.75 $70.65 $3,532.50 $10,597.50

3.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

10 30 $18.00 $77.18 $2,315.40 $6,946.20 $18.75 $68.47 $2,054.10 $6,162.30

4.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

1 3 $18.00 $86.11 $258.33 $774.99 $18.75 $75.00 $225.00 $675.00

5.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

94R-72

AC DELCO 94RPG

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

O'REILLY AUTO ENTERPRISES LLC dba

O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

SPRINGFIELD,  MO

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS LP dba 

RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

EL PASO, TX 

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

 ESTIMATED  

QUANTITY

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPER START 94REXT

V31S-5

AC DELCO

ACD1109C

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPER START 31-5 (T)

CORE 

CHARGE

CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPER START 42 PRM

27-60 AC DELCO

27PG

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPER START 27 PRM

65-60

AC DELCO 65A

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPER START 65PRM

42-60

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CONTINENTAL 94 R

H031-C

65-P

42 P

27 CS

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 4



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

1 5 $18.00 $101.81 $509.05 $1,527.15 $18.75 $70.65 $353.25 $1,059.75

6.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

1 2 $18.00 $77.77 $155.54 $466.62 $18.75 $48.19 $96.38 $289.14

7.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

2 10 $18.00 $89.62 $896.20 $2,688.60 $18.75 $70.65 $706.50 $2,119.50

8.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

*N/A *see request 

for exceptions

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

O'REILLY AUTO ENTERPRISES LLC dba

O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

SPRINGFIELD,  MO

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS LP dba 

RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

EL PASO, TX 

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

 ESTIMATED  

QUANTITY CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

78-DTPS AC

DELCO 78-DTPS

78 PG

GM 78 PG

SIDE POST ONLY

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPERSTART 78 EXT

3 YEAR TOTAL

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPER START 37 / 78 PRM

51R60

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING SUPER START 51 RPRM

$175,216.59

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

$275,108.76
BIDDER'S PRICE *N/A *see request for 

exceptions

78 P

51 RCS

78 P

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 5



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION DISCOUNTS

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
unit price(s),

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

O'REILLY AUTO ENTERPRISES LLC dba

O'REILLY AUTO PARTS

SPRINGFIELD,  MO

RUSH TRUCK CENTERS OF TEXAS LP dba 

RUSH TRUCK CENTER EL PASO

EL PASO, TX 

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
1 7

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS: 2% - 10 DAYS                NET 20 100% - 30 DAYS

48

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

(on most stocked items next day on most non-stocked)

1

X X 

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 6



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

10 $15.00 $107.42 $1,074.20 $3,222.60 $12.00 $97.65 $976.50 $2,929.50

1.

800 $22.50 $75.11 $60,088.00 $180,264.00 $20.00 $57.16 $45,728.00 $137,184.00

2.

50 $15.00 $83.88 $4,194.00 $12,582.00 $12.00 $51.80 $2,590.00 $7,770.00

3.

30 $15.00 $57.49 $1,724.70 $5,174.10 $12.00 $45.99 $1,379.70 $4,139.10

4.

3 $15.00 $113.01 $339.03 $1,017.09 $12.00 $71.19 $213.57 $640.71

5.

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

94R-72

AC DELCO 94RPG
2

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 14/94RC EXIDE

SAM PACKS FIVE STAR FORD, LTC

FARMERS BRANCH,  TX

USD INC.

EL PASO,  TX

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

 ESTIMATED  

QUANTITY CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

V31S-5

AC DELCO

ACD1109C

10

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 31HD EXIDE

65-60

AC DELCO 65A 15

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 65S EXIDE

42-60 10

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 425YR DELCO

27-60 AC DELCO

27PG
1

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 27X EXIDE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

ACDELCO 94RPG

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

ACDELCO ACD1109C

ACDELCO 65A

ACDELCO 42P

ACDELCO 27PG

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 7



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM

NO. MIN MAX

(A)

5 $15.00 $79.87 $399.35 $1,198.05 $12.00 $67.98 $339.90 $1,019.70

6.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,699.50

2 $15.00 $51.29 $102.58 $307.74 $12.00 $45.99 $91.98 $275.94

7.
BIDDER'S PRICE 

$183.96

10 $15.00 $73.49 $734.90 $2,204.70 $12.00 $72.50 $725.00 $2,175.00

8.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

SAM PACKS FIVE STAR FORD, LTC

FARMERS BRANCH,  TX

USD INC.

EL PASO,  TX

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER 

PART NUMBER

 ESTIMATED  

QUANTITY CORE 

CHARGE

UNIT PRICE

(B)

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

CORE 

CHARGE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL

(A x B = C)

3-YR TOTAL

(C x 3 YRS)

78-DTPS AC

DELCO 78-DTPS
1

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 78DTS EXIDE

51R60 1

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 515YR DELCO

78 PG

GM 78 PG

SIDE POST ONLY

2

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER SUBMITTING 785 EXIDE

3 YEAR TOTAL $205,970.28 $156,133.95

ACDELCO 78PG

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDDER'S PRICE $156,721.77

ACDELCO 78DTPS

ACDELCO 51RP

UNIT PRICE

(B)

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 8



Project Name:  BUS BATTERIES Solicitation #:  2016-024

Department:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED:   15       LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:   15          BIDS RECEIVED:   6                LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:    4              NO BID:  0

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  OCTOBER 28, 2015

SAM PACKS FIVE STAR FORD, LTC

FARMERS BRANCH,  TX

USD INC.

EL PASO,  TX

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
7 2

48 12

NO OPTION OFFERED

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X 

X 

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____

DATE:  ____11/4/15____________  2016-024 BUS BATTERIES - MASS TRANSIT 9


