Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015

CITY OF

EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El

Paso

All-America City

'

2010

Solicitation

#: 2016-251

Department: FIRE

AMERICAN TIRE

BRIDGESTONE AMERICAS
TIRE OPERATIONS, LLC

BROADWAY MOTORS

DISTRIBUTORS DBA GCR TIRES & INC.
CARROLLTON, TX SERVICE NO. 829 MIDLAND, TX
EL PASO, TX
ITEM ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
DESCRIPTION ©) ©) ©) ©) ©) )
NO. MINIMUM MAXIMUM B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D
(A B)
12 R 22.5
1. CODE: G-182 RSD 1 100 $499.50 $49,950.00 NO BID $0.00 $560.00 $56,000.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER GOODYEAR G182 #138302669 MICHELIN XDN2 51753
LT 235/ 85R 16
2. CODE: WRANGLER HT 1 10 $131.24 $1,312.40 NO BID $0.00 $112.00 $1,120.00
GOODYEAR WRANGLER HT FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER 4744795500 HT 189718
315/ 80R 22.5
3. CODE: M-860 1 40 $506.13 $20,245.20 NO BID $0.00 $475.00 $19,000.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER BRIDGESTONE M860A #244329 BF GOODRICH ST230 (55458)
225/ 70R 19.5
4. CODE: ST-230 1 150 $203.67 $30.550.50 NO BID $0.00 $238.00 $35.700.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONE FS560+ #227057 BF GOODRICH ST230 (74208)
245/ 70R 19.5
5. CODE: ST-230 1 6 $282.57 $1,695.42 NO BID $0.00 $246.00 $1,476.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER BRIDGESTONE R250F #227295 BF GOODRICH ST230 (89688)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 10/27/15

2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

i\lli\mevlca City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-251

Department: FIRE

BRIDGESTONE AMERICAS
AMERICAN TIRE TIRE OPERATIONS, LLC | BROADWAY MOTORS
DISTRIBUTORS DBA GCR TIRES & INC.
CARROLLTON, TX SERVICE NO. 829 MIDLAND, TX
EL PASO. TX
ITEM TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY] - it prICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
NO MINIMUM MAXIMUM ©) D) ©) ©) ©) ©)
: (A) (B) (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D
11 R 225
6. CODE: DR-444 1 20 $335.99 $6,719.80 NO BID $0.00 $346.00 $6,920.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONE FD691 #241558 BF GOODRICH DR444 (77081)
385/ 65R 22.5
7. CODE: T-839 1 36 $441.40 $15,890.40 NO BID $0.00 $400.00 $14,400.00
ROADMASTER
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONE T839 #294586 RM230WB (93438)
425/ 65R 22.5
8. CODE: T-839 1 16 $503.14 $8,050.24 NO BID $0.00 $465.00 $7,440.00
ROADMASTER
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONE T839 #294594 RM230WB (93442)
445/ 65R 22.5
9. CODE: T-839 1 10 $551.68 $5,516.80 NO BID $0.00 $475.00 $4,750.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONE T839 #204608 A aarey
LT 215/85R 16
10. CODE: TRANFORCE HT 1 16 $98.52 $1,576.32 NO BID $0.00 $102.00 $1,632.00
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER 4189701 HT (189701)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 10/27/15

2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

i\lli\mevlca City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-251

Department: FIRE

AMERICAN TIRE

BRIDGESTONE AMERICAS
TIRE OPERATIONS, LLC

BROADWAY MOTORS

DISTRIBUTORS DBA GCR TIRES & INC.
CARROLLTON, TX SERVICE NO. 829 MIDLAND, TX
EL PASO. TX
ITEM TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
NO MINIMUM MAXIMUM c) (D) ©) (D) ©) (D)
- (A) ®) (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D

LT 245/70R 17

11. CODE: TRANSEORCE HT 1 40 $114.74 $4,589.60 NO BID $0.00 $118.00 $4,720.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONiI;ngFORCE HT FIRESTg_I;Ifl'gI:QJI-\:;FORCE
LT 265/70R 17

12. CODE: TRANSEORCE HT 1 10 $128.68 $1,286.80 NO BID $0.00 $132.00 $1,320.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONE#;&RO?.lgIeSFORCE HT FIRESTg-TfZEg?SI\:;FORCE
LT 235/85R 16

13. TRANSFORCE AT 1 10 $114.46 $1,144.60 NO BID $0.00 $118.00 $1,180.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FIRESTONiI;Rg%I;IgFORCE AT FIRESTg_I;II?l'I;I;é\;;?FORCE

24R 21

14. CODE: XZL 1 10 $2,197.54 $21,975.40 NO BID $0.00 $3,010.00 $30,100.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER B e o 52 MICHELIN X2L (76025)
LT 245/70 R 17

15. CODE: LTX A/S 1 10 $167.51 $1,675.10 NO BID $0.00 $166.00 $1,660.00

PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER

MICHELIN LTX A/S #00644

MICHELIN LTXM52 (00644)

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

10/27/15

2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



El Paso
CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM Wy
> 2010
Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES Solicitation #: 2016-251
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015 Department: FIRE
BRIDGESTONE AMERICAS
AMERICAN TIRE TIRE OPERATIONS, LLC | BROADWAY MOTORS
DISTRIBUTORS DBA GCR TIRES & INC.
CARROLLTON, TX SERVICE NO. 829 MIDLAND, TX
EL PASO, TX
TEM TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY] - it prICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
NO MINIMUM MAXIMUM ©) D) ©) ©) ©) ©)
: A) (B) (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D
P 235/ 70 R 17
16. VOFR: DYNAPRO AS 108S 1 10 $129.27 $1,292.70 NO BID $0.00 $100.00 $1,000.00
HANKOOK RHO03 AS DYANPRO FIRESTONE DESTINATION
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #1008686 LE2 (097776)
17. 12R22.5 G-622 RSD 1 40 $495.84 $19,833.60 NO BID $0.00 $560.00 $22,400.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER GOODYEAR G622 #138302265 MICHELIN XDN2 (51753)
18. LT 235/80R 17 1 10 $114.34 $1,143.40 NO BID $0.00 $116.00 $1,160.00
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER 4191262 HT (191282)
19. LT 245/75R 17 1 40 $118.66 $4,746.40 NO BID $0.00 $121.00 $4,840.00
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER 4207483 HT (207483)
TOTAL SECTION A (ITEMS 1-19) $199,194.68 NO BID $216,818.00
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
$173.471.28 s18841800 |
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ANNUAL PRice| 3 YRTOTAL i nnuaL price| 3 YRTOTAL lannuaL price| 3 YRTOTAL
GRAND TOTAL SECTION A $199,194.68 | $597,584.04 NO BID $0.00 $216,818.00 | $650,454.00
BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE BIDDER'S PRICE
BLEASE SEENOTE 3183412300 $565.254.0000
NOTE: TX\P%QB‘\(/)Eané;\&ion ;:S?ntained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
DATE: 10/27/15 2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-251
Department: FIRE

AMERICAN TIRE
DISTRIBUTORS
CARROLLTON, TX

BRIDGESTONE AMERICAS
TIRE OPERATIONS, LLC
DBA GCR TIRES &
SERVICE NO. 829
EL PASO, TX

BROADWAY MOTORS
INC.
MIDLAND, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

[]

]

NO OPTION OFFERED

[ ]

[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
Within consecutive calendar days

1TO 2

3

Within hours or overnight after receipt of
verbal order in cases of emergency.

24

48

JIF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 10/27/15

2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT




Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-251
Department: FIRE

REDBURN TIRE
COMPANY
SUNLAND PARK, NM
ITEM ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
DESCRIPTION ©) ©) ©) ©) ©) ©)
NO. MINIMUM MAXIMUM B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D
(A) (B)
12R 225
1. CODE: G-182 RSD 1 100 $393.25 $39,325.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #151009 FIRESTONE FD663
LT 235/ 85R 16
2. CODE: WRANGLER HT 1 10 $119.96 $1,199.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #ﬁ*gf\iﬁsiggggif
315/ 80R 22.5
3. CODE: M-860 1 40 $569.89 $22,795.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #244329 BRIDGESTONE M860A
225/ 70R 19.5
4. CODE: ST-230 L 150 $207.43 | $31,114.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER T S e
245/ 70R 19.5
S CODE: ST-230 L 6 $227.50 $1,365.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
#169964 FIRESTONE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER il

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 10/27/15

2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015

El Paso

All-America City

'

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-251
Department: FIRE

REDBURN TIRE
COMPANY
SUNLAND PARK, NM
ITEM TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY] i1 pricE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
NO MINIMUM MAXIMUM ©) D) ) (D) ) (D)
: A (®B) (B)X(C)=D (B)X (C.)=D (B)X(C.)=D
11 R 22.5
6. CODE: DR-444 1 20 $284.16 $5,683.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
#156531 FIRESTONE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FS560 PLUS
385/ 65R 22.5
7 CODE: T-839 1 36 $450.16 $16,205.76 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #294586 FIRESTONE T839
425/ 65R 22.5
8 CODE: T-839 1 16 $511.90 $8,190.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #294594 FIRESTONE T839
445/ 65R 22.5
9 CODE: T-839 1 10 $560.44 $5,604.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #294608 FIRESTONE T839
LT 215/85R 16
10. CODE: TRANFORCE HT 1 16 $103.52 $1,656.32 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
#189701 FIRESTONE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER S RANSEORCE HT

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 10/27/15 2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015

El Paso
i\lli\mevlca City
2010

Solicitation #: 2016-251
Department: FIRE

REDBURN TIRE
COMPANY
SUNLAND PARK, NM

ITEM TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY} i1 pricE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
NO MINIMUM MAXIMUM ©) D) ) (D) ) (D)
. (A) (B) (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D
LT 245/70R 17
11. CODE: TRANSEORCE HT 1 40 $121.13 $4,845.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
#200173 FIRESTONE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER TRANSEORCE AT
LT 265/70R 17
12. CODE: TRANSEORCE HT 1 10 $134.18 $1,341.80 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
#200156 FIRESTONE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER TRANSEORCE HT
LT 235/85 R 16
13. TRANSFORCE AT 1 10 $119.96 $1,199.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
#189633 FIRESTONE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER TRANSFORCE AT
(SAME AS | INF #2)
24R 21
14. CODE: X7ZL 1 10 $2,211.30 $22,113.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
#418951 BRIDGESTONE
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER V-STEEL G-TRACTION
LT 245/70 R 17
15 CODE: LTX A/S 1 10 $121.13 $1,211.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

#200173 FIRESTONE
TRANSFORCE AT
(SAME AS LINE £11)

PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 10/27/15 2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT




El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM NlIL
Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES Solicitation #: 2016-251
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015 Department: FIRE

REDBURN TIRE
COMPANY
SUNLAND PARK, NM

TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ITEM
DESCRIPTION ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY} i1 pricE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL UNIT PRICE ANNUAL
NO MINIMUM MAXIMUM ©) D) ) (D) ) (D)

. A B) (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D (B)X(C)=D

P 235/ 70 R 17
16. VOFR: DYNAPRO AS 108S 1 10 $101.92 $1,019.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

#097776 FIRESTONE

PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER DESTINATION LE2

17. 12R22.5 G-622 RSD 1 40 $368.48 $14,739.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

#248494 FIRESTONE

PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER FS561

18. LT 235/80R 17 1 10 $123.33 $1,233.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

#191265 FIRESTONE

PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER TRANSEORCE AT

19. LT 245/75R 17 1 40 $124.66 $4,986.40 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER #205222 FIRESTONE

TRANSFORCE AT
TOTAL SECTION A (ITEMS 1-19) $185,828.78 $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
ANNUAL PRice| 3 YRTOTAL i nnuaL price| 3 YRTOTAL lannuaL price| 3 YRTOTAL
GRAND TOTAL SECTION A $185,828.78 | $557,486.34 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.
APPROVED BY: __/s/

DATE: 10/27/15 2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT 9




CITY OF EL PASO

El Paso
BID TABULATION FORM o
\ 4
2010
Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES Solicitation #: 2016-251
Bid Opening Date: OCTOBER 14, 2015 Department: FIRE

REDBURN TIRE
COMPANY
SUNLAND PARK, NM

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO
EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED
ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL
BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE
SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE
MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING
THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION I:I |:| l:l
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:
NO OPTION OFFERED |X| l:l I:'
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
. . 24
Within __ consecutive calendar days
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 8

verbal order in cases of emergency.

|IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED: 38 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 32 BIDS RECEIVED: 4 LOCAL BIDSRECEIVED: 1 NOBID: 0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 10/27/15 2016-251 APPARATUS TIRES - FIRE DEPARTMENT 10




