
BID ITEM:  TRAFFIC SIGN FILM BID # 2016-395

DEPARTMENT:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE 

NET NET NET

ITEM     - _____ % DISCOUNT     - ____% DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   + _____  % MARKUP   + ____ % MARKUP   + ____ % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ MFG __________ __________

YES NO YES NO YES NO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

2015 CATALOG

8/1/2014 12/8/2015

TRAFFIC SIGN FILM CATALOG

3M COMPANY REFLECTIVE 

SHEETING OR FILM
MANUFACTURER 3M PRICE LIST                   Price List or Catalog

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

2014 PRICE GUIDE N/A

BID DATE:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

3M COMPANY

ST. PAUL, MN

AVERY DENNISON 

CORPORATION

NILES,  IL

OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.

St. PETERSBURG, FL

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

JAN. 1, 2015

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)
 

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

X 

X 

X 

X 

X X 

X X X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/________

DATE: ____3/17/16_________  2016-395 TRAFFIC SIGN FILM - STREETS and MAINTENANCE 1



BID ITEM:  TRAFFIC SIGN FILM BID # 2016-395

DEPARTMENT:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE 

UNIT OF MEASURE:

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

UNIT OF MEASURE:

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

TYPE C HIGH SPECIFIC INTENSITY 

MICROPRISMATIC REFLECTIVE 

SHEETING, WHITE FRICTION FED, 

PRESSURE SENSITIVE

 36 in. x 50 yds.

TYPE C HIGH SPECIFIC 

INTENSITY MICROPRISMATIC 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING, WHITE 

FRICTION FED, PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE

TYPE C HIGH SPECIFIC 

INTENSITY MICROPRISMATIC 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING, WHITE 

FRICTION FED, PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE

EA

EA

EA

3M #3930 T-6500 3M - 3930

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

DESCRIPTION: 

3M COMPANY

ST. PAUL, MN

AVERY DENNISON 

CORPORATION

NILES,  IL

EA

T-6500

EA

T-6500

OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.

St. PETERSBURG, FL

3M - 3930

DESCRIPTION: 

TYPE C HIGH SPECIFIC INTENSITY 

MICROPRISMATIC REFLECTIVE 

SHEETING, WHITE FRICTION FED, 

PRESSURE SENSITIVE

 30 in. x 50 yds.

TYPE C HIGH SPECIFIC 

INTENSITY MICROPRISMATIC 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING, WHITE 

FRICTION FED, PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE

3M #3930

ITEM

'1.

ITEM

'2.

BID DATE:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

T-6500 39303M #3930

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

$315.00 $337.50 $416.25

$499.50

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $750.00 $768.75 NO BID

TYPE C HIGH SPECIFIC 

INTENSITY MICROPRISMATIC 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING, WHITE 

FRICTION FED, PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE

EA

39303M #3930

$900.00

$378.00

$922.50

$405.00

NO BIDPRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

APPROVED BY: ____/s/________

DATE: ____3/17/16_________  2016-395 TRAFFIC SIGN FILM - STREETS and MAINTENANCE 2



BID ITEM:  TRAFFIC SIGN FILM BID # 2016-395

DEPARTMENT:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE 

UNIT OF MEASURE:

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

UNIT OF MEASURE:

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.

St. PETERSBURG, FL

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

3M #1177NP

EA

3M COMPANY

ST. PAUL, MN

AVERY DENNISON 

CORPORATION

NILES,  IL

OL-2007

DESCRIPTION: 

TRANSPARENT ELECTRONICALLY 

CUTTABLE FILM COLOR GREEN 

FRICTION FED, PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE, 36 in x 50 yds.

TRANSPARENT 

ELECTRONICALLY CUTTABLE 

FILM COLOR GREEN FRICTION 

FED, PRESSURE SENSITIVE, 36 in 

x 50 yds.

TRANSPARENT 

ELECTRONICALLY CUTTABLE 

FILM COLOR GREEN FRICTION 

FED, PRESSURE SENSITIVE, 36 in 

x 50 yds.

OL-2007 1177

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

BID DATE:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

ITEM

'4.

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): NO BID

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          $715.00 $756.00 $949.50

3923

$2,250.00 $2,522.70

$319.50 $387.50

3M #3923 T-7513 3M -3923

3M #3923 T-7513

3M 1177

ITEM

'3.
EA

$621.00 $706.50 NO BID

EAEA

$364.50

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

EA EA

3M #1177NP

DESCRIPTION: 

TYPE E MICROPRISMATIC 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 

FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN 

FRICTION FED PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE, 36 in. x 50 yds.

TYPE E MICROPRISMATIC 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 

FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN 

FRICTION FED PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE, 36 in. x 50 yds.

TYPE E MICROPRISMATIC 

REFLECTIVE SHEETING, 

FLUORESCENT YELLOW-GREEN 

FRICTION FED PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE, 36 in. x 50 yds.

APPROVED BY: ____/s/________

DATE: ____3/17/16_________  2016-395 TRAFFIC SIGN FILM - STREETS and MAINTENANCE 3



BID ITEM:  TRAFFIC SIGN FILM BID # 2016-395

DEPARTMENT:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE 

UNIT OF MEASURE:

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

UNIT OF MEASURE:

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

EA

3M #1172NP    OL-2007

1150

EA

DESCRIPTION: 

DESCRIPTION: 

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

ITEM

'5.

ITEM

'6.

BID DATE:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

OL-2007

$341.25

EA EA

TRANSPARENT ELECTRONICALLY 

CUTTABLE FILM COLOR GREEN 

FRICTION FED, PRESSURE 

SENSITIVE, 30 in. x 50 yds.

TRANSPARENT 

ELECTRONICALLY CUTTABLE 

FILM COLOR GREEN FRICTION 

FED, PRESSURE SENSITIVE, 30 

in. x 50 yds.

OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.

St. PETERSBURG, FL

3M #1150 OL-1000

EA

3M #1150 OL-1000

TRANSPARENT 

ELECTRONICALLY CUTTABLE 

FILM COLOR GREEN FRICTION 

FED, PRESSURE SENSITIVE, 30 

in. x 50 yds.

3M COMPANY

ST. PAUL, MN

3M  1177

TRANSPARENT PROTECTIVE 

GRAFFITI OVERLAY FILM, COLOR 

CLEAR, PRESSURE SENSITIVE,

 30 in. x 50 yds.

TRANSPARENT PROTECTIVE 

GRAFFITI OVERLAY FILM, COLOR 

CLEAR, PRESSURE SENSITIVE,

 30 in. x 50 yds.

TRANSPARENT PROTECTIVE 

GRAFFITI OVERLAY FILM, COLOR 

CLEAR, PRESSURE SENSITIVE,

 30 in. x 50 yds.

$897.00 NO BID

3M #1172NP

3M -1150

$588.75 NO BID

$266.25 $322.50

EA

$517.50

$303.75

AVERY DENNISON 

CORPORATION

NILES,  IL

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

1177

$483.75

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

$303.75 $450.00

APPROVED BY: ____/s/________

DATE: ____3/17/16_________  2016-395 TRAFFIC SIGN FILM - STREETS and MAINTENANCE 4



BID ITEM:  TRAFFIC SIGN FILM BID # 2016-395

DEPARTMENT:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE 

UNIT OF MEASURE:

MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

AVERY DENNISON 

CORPORATION

NILES,  IL

APPLICATION TAPE (Med Tac)

DESCRIPTION: 
PRESPACING TAPE,

 36 in. x 100 yds.

3M COMPANY

ST. PAUL, MN

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

3M #SCPS-2

3M #SCPS-2 APPLICATION TAPE (Med Tac) SCPS - 2

$54.00 $144.00

NO BID

PRESPACING TAPE,

 36 in. x 100 yds.

PRESPACING TAPE,

 36 in. x 100 yds.

3M - SCPS - 2

$2,488.00 $2,588.25 $3,060.50TOTAL (ITEMS (1-7)

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

$117.90

$108.00

ITEM

'7.

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $211.41

EA

OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.

St. PETERSBURG, FL

EAEA

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

BID DATE:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

APPROVED BY: ____/s/________

DATE: ____3/17/16_________  2016-395 TRAFFIC SIGN FILM - STREETS and MAINTENANCE 5



BID ITEM:  TRAFFIC SIGN FILM BID # 2016-395

DEPARTMENT:  STREETS & MAINTENANCE 

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS 

CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS 

BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE 

CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND. 

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED:   5         LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:     0          BIDS RECEIVED:   3            LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:    0             NO BID:   0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

OVERNIGHT

14

72

3M COMPANY

ST. PAUL, MN

AVERY DENNISON 

CORPORATION

NILES,  IL

PAYMENT TERMS:

OSBURN ASSOCIATES, INC.

St. PETERSBURG, FL

NET - 30 DAYSNET - 30 DAYS
1% - 10 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BID DATE:  DECEMBER 16, 2015

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

NO OPTION OFFERED.

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

( - )

14 14

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/________

DATE: ____3/17/16_________  2016-395 TRAFFIC SIGN FILM - STREETS and MAINTENANCE 6


