



## CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ZF FLUIDS FOR TRANSMISSIONS  
Bid Opening Date: MAY 4, 2016

Solicitation #: 2016-717  
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

				C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC EL PASO, TX			C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC (Alternate Bid) EL PASO, TX			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QUANTITY (A)		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL TOTAL (C)	3-YR TOTAL (D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL TOTAL (C)	3-YR TOTAL (D)
			MIN	MAX						
1.	ECOFLUID A LIFE OR APPROVED EQUAL (55 gal drums)	GALLON	20 DRUMS	100 DRUMS	\$3,055.56	\$305,556.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$61,111.20</small>	\$916,668.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$183,333.60</small>	\$2,144.69	\$214,469.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$42,893.80</small>	\$643,407.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$128,681.40</small>
	MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING				ZF ECO FLUID A			MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC ATF		
2.	ECOFLUID A LIFE OR APPROVED EQUAL (250 gal drums)	TOTE	2 TOTES	12 TOTES	\$13,888.90	\$166,666.80 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$27,777.81</small>	\$500,000.40 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$83,333.45 ✓</small>	\$9,748.59	\$116,983.08 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$19,497.18</small>	\$350,949.24 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$58,491.54</small>
	MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING									
<b>3 YEAR TOTAL ITEM 1 &amp; 2</b>						<b>\$1,416,668.40</b> <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$101,667.05</small>			<b>\$994,356.24</b> <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$187,172.94</small>	
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGE OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p> <p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p> <p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>										
					<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		
					<input type="checkbox"/>			<input type="checkbox"/>		
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>					<b>NET 30 - DAYS</b>			<b>NET 30 - DAYS</b>		
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within <u>    </u> consecutive calendar days					2			2		
Within <u>    </u> hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.					24			24		
<p><small>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</small></p>										

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: 5/5/16



## CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ZF FLUIDS FOR TRANSMISSIONS  
Bid Opening Date: MAY 4, 2016

Solicitation #: 2016-717  
Department: MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

				HARBOR DIESEL AND EQUIPMENT, INC. LONG BEACH, CA			PORTER WARNER INDUSTRIES LLC PHOENIX, AZ			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QUANTITY (A)		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL TOTAL (C)	3-YR TOTAL (D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL TOTAL (C)	3-YR TOTAL (D)
			MIN	MAX						
1.	ECOFLUID A LIFE OR APPROVED EQUAL (55 gal drums)	GALLON	20 DRUMS	100 DRUMS	\$2,674.10	\$267,410.00	\$802,230.00	\$10.97	\$1,097.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$60,335.00</small>	\$3,291.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$181,005.00</small>
	MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING									
2.	ECOFLUID A LIFE OR APPROVED EQUAL (250 gal drums)	TOTE	2 TOTES	12 TOTES	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.84	\$130.08 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$32,520.00</small>	\$390.24 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$97,560.00</small>
	MANUFACTURER BRAND SUBMITTING									
<b>3 YEAR TOTAL ITEM 1 &amp; 2</b>						<b>\$802,230.00</b>			<b>\$3,681.24</b> <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$278,565</small>	
<u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u>								*FREIGHT TERMS - FOB NASHVILLE, TN		
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGE OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.										
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:										
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:					<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>			<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		
NO OPTION OFFERED					<input type="checkbox"/>			<input type="checkbox"/>		
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>					<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>			<b>NET - 30</b>		
<b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b>										
Within ___ consecutive calendar days					5-Mar			12		
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.					24 - 48					
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.										
<b>BIDS SOLICITED: 30    LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 26    BIDS RECEIVED: 4    LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 2    NO BID: 0</b>										

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: DATE: 5/5/16