
Project Name: THERMOPLASTIC MATERIAL Solicitation #:  2016-752
Bid Opening Date:  MAY 4, 2016 Department:   STREETS & MAINTENANCE

$29.00 $812,000.00 $2,436,000.00 $31.50 $882,000.00 $2,646,000.00 $27.45 $768,600.00 $2,305,800.00 $35.00 $980,000.00 $2,940,000.00

PER BAG BAG

$17.00 $25,500.00 $76,500.00 $31.50 $47,250.00 $141,750.00 $16.75 $25,125.00 $75,375.00 $21.00 $31,500.00 $94,500.00

PER BAG BAG

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE  

ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,   

BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN  

THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. 

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON  

ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE 

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER  

OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT 

PRICE(S),  IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE  

EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

USTPEXTWH-TXE: Extrusion Thermoplastic in White 

USTPEXTYW-TXE: Extrusion Thermoplastic in Yellow  

DPI: Dura Products Industries Txdot dms-8220 

specification as the standard

SWARCO DIJ - TXDOT  FORMULA
ENNIS PAINT 885202-WHITE 

886441- YELLOW

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

 ESTIMATED  

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT 

PRICE

WHITE AND YELLOW THERMOPLASTIC 

MATERIAL FOR PAVEMENT MARKINGS
28,000

(50 Lb.) Bags

MANUFACTURER  AND MODEL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

CENTERLINE SUPPLY

GRAND PRAIRIE,  TX

DOBIC SUPPLY LLC

AUSTIN,  TX

ENNIS PAINT, INC.

THOMASVILLE,  NC

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

 (aka: THE MRI COMPANY)

EL PASO,  TX

GROUP I - THERMOPLASTIC MATERIAL FOR PAVEMENT MARKINGS

DESCRIPTION 

GROUP II - TYPE 1 GLASS BEAD

TYPE 1 GLASS BEAD 1,500

(50 Lb.) Bags

MANUFACTURER  AND MODEL SWARCO DIJ - TXDOT  FORMULA ENNIS PAINT 651701

USGBTIC-TXE: Glass beads Type-1 

(AASHTO M 247)

DPI: Dura Produts Industries

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS 2% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
14 10 10

10-20
1st order may require 6-7 weeks

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

X X X X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_____

DATE:  __5/9/16_____  2016-752 THERMOPLASTIC MATERIAL - STREETS MAINTENANCE 1



Project Name: THERMOPLASTIC MATERIAL Solicitation #:  2016-752
Bid Opening Date:  MAY 4, 2016 Department:   STREETS & MAINTENANCE

NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.50 $854,000.00 $2,562,000.00 $35.00 $980,000.00 $2,940,000.00

BAG** BAG

$15.00 $22,500.00 $67,500.00 $20.50 $30,750.00 $92,250.00 $25.00 $37,500.00 $112,500.00

.30 per lb BAG BAG

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE  

ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT,   

BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN  

THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. 

THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON  

ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE 

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER  

OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT 

PRICE(S),  IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE  

EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 
verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

UNIT 

PRICE

1,500

(50 Lb.) Bags

MANUFACTURER  AND MODEL

TYPE 1 GLASS BEAD

MANUFACTURER  AND MODEL

 ESTIMATED  

ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

28,000

(50 Lb.) Bags

GROUP II - TYPE 1 GLASS BEAD

DESCRIPTION 

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

POTTER'S AASHTO

SWARCO INDUSTRIES LLC

COLUMBIA,  TN

POTTERS INDUSTRIES, LLC

MALVERN, PA 

GROUP I - THERMOPLASTIC MATERIAL FOR PAVEMENT MARKINGS

WHITE AND YELLOW THERMOPLASTIC 

MATERIAL FOR PAVEMENT MARKINGS

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

POTTERS INDUSTRIES HIGHWAY

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

NO BID

SWARCO  TXDOT SPEC

**THERMOPLASTIC PRICE BASED ON DELIVERY 

OF 880 BAGS PER SHIPMENT**

SWARCO TYPE I

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

SHERWIN-WILLIAMS    W1X0056    Y1X0006

THE SHERWIN-WILLIAMS 

COMPANY

CLEVELAND, OH

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL  

TOTAL 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

TOTAL PRICE

 (x 3 YRS)

NET - 30 DAYS

10 30 DAYS ARO
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:

10

NO OPTION OFFERED

BIDS SOLICITED:  45        LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 0           BIDS RECEIVED:   7               LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:      1        NO BID:  0

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS

72

X 

X 

X 

APPROVED BY: ____/s/_____

DATE:  __5/9/16_____  2016-752 THERMOPLASTIC MATERIAL - STREETS MAINTENANCE 2


