
Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

10 BOTTLES $90.72 $907.20 $2,721.60 $120.32 $1,203.20 $3,609.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

10 BOTTLES $7.99 $79.90 $239.70 $8.09 $80.90 $242.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

5 BOTTLES $61.50 $307.50 $922.50 $46.64 $233.20 $699.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

1000 BOTTLES $4.46 $4,460.00 $13,380.00 $8.50 $8,500.00 $25,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

3000 BOTTLES .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00

3000 BOTTLES $55.86 $167,580.00 $502,740.00 $90.51 $271,530.00 $814,590.00 $0.00 $0.00

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

1.

2.

ITE

M 

No.

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)DESCRIPTION

GROUP I: ANTIBIOTICS

3.

4.

5.

6.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

BIDDER'S BRAND

AMOXICILLIN/CLAVULINIC AC. 

200/28.5 TABS 20 TABS/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND

AMOXICILLIN 500 MG / CAPS

500 CAP/BOTTLE

AMOXICILLIN DROPS 

15 ML/BOTTLES

BIDDER'S PRICE "CALL"GENERIC AUROBINDO

VIRBAC

TEVA

BIDDER'S BRAND

AMOXICILLIN/CLAVULI NIC AC. 

400/57 TABS 20 TABS/BOTTLE

AMOXICILLIN 100 MG/TABS

 500 TAB/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND VIRBAC

AMOXICILLIN 200 MG/ CAPS 

100 CAP/BOTTLE

GENERIC SANDOZBIDDER'S BRAND

BIDDER'S BRAND

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

BIOMOX

SANDOZ

WEST WARD

BIOMOX

TEVA

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 1



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

3000 BOTTLES $4.32 $12,960.00 $38,880.00 $7.88 $23,640.00 $70,920.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 BOTTLES $49.62 $496.20 $1,488.60 $36.72 $367.20 $1,101.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$496.90

7 BOTTLES $54.79 $383.53 $1,150.59 $51.48 $360.36 $1,081.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID

50 BOTTLES $15.07 $753.50 $2,260.50 $24.48 $1,224.00 $3,672.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

20 BOTTLES $165.36 $3,307.20 $9,921.60 $174.40 $3,488.00 $10,464.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

10 BOTTLES $27.34 $273.40 $820.20 $35.10 $351.00 $1,053.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP I: ANTIBIOTICS

WEST WARD

CEPHALEXIN SUSP. 250 MG/5 ML.

100 ML/BOTTLE

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

BIDDER'S BRAND

ORCHARD

AMOXICILLIN/CLAVULI NIC AC.

 SUSP. 400/57   5 ML/BOTTLE

CEPHALEXIN 250 MG./TABS.

500 TAB/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND TEVA

CEPHALEXIN 500 MG./TABS.

500 TAB/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND

HERITAGE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BIDDER'S BRAND ORCHARD

DOXYCLINE 100 MG/TABS

500 TABS/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND WEST WARD

12.

11.

10.

9.

METRONIDAZOLE 250 MG/TAB

500 TAB/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND

8.

7.

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

WEST WARD

RANBAXY

PLEVA

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

WATSON

RANBAXY

WEST WARD

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 2



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

5 BOTTLES $73.28 $366.40 $1,099.20 $82.71 $413.55 $1,240.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

100 TUBES $17.19 $1,719.00 $5,157.00 $6.56 $656.00 $1,968.00 $6.03 $603.00 $1,809.00

360 TUBES .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00

10 JARS $7.10 $71.00 $213.00 $7.78 $77.80 $233.40 $7.76 $77.60 $232.80

150 BOTTLES $12.25 $1,837.50 $5,512.50 $8.73 $1,309.50 $3,928.50 $8.01 $1,201.50 $3,604.50

$195,502.33 $586,506.99 $313,434.71 $940,304.13 $1,882.10 $5,646.30

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$195,503.03

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

METRONIDAZOLE 500 MG/TAB

500 TAB/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND HERITAGE

NEO-POLY-DEX

TUBE 3.5gm

BIDDER'S BRAND AKOM ANIMIMAL HEALTH PERRI

NEO-POLY-DEX

8oz./TUBE

BIDDER'S BRAND

BIDDER'S BRAND NEOGEN CORP VETONE

PENJECT PROCAINE PENICILLIN G 

300,000 UNITS/mL, 250 mL

BIDDER'S BRAND NORBROOK VETONE

HENRY SCHEIN

ASPEN VET

GROUP I (ITEMS 1 - 17) TOTAL AMOUNTS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP I: ANTIBIOTICS

13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

NITROFURAZONE OINTMENT 1 lb

WATSON

FERA

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 3



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

5 BAGS $5.97 $29.85 $89.55 $29.40 $147.00 $441.00 $39.08 $195.40 $586.20

7 EACH $11.40 $79.80 $239.40 $11.36 $79.52 $238.56 $8.74 $61.18 $183.54

7 EACH $10.69 $74.83 $224.49 $12.65 $88.55 $265.65 $9.73 $68.11 $204.33

5 EACH $156.25 $781.25 $2,343.75 $5.90 $29.50 $88.50 $14.03 $70.15 $210.45

10 BOTTLES $6.99 $69.90 $209.70 $7.40 $74.00 $222.00 $5.91 $59.10 $177.30

30 CANS $13.50 $405.00 $1,215.00 $7.49 $224.70 $674.10 $4.69 $140.70 $422.10

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP II:  ANESTHESIA - REQUIRES C2 FORM 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

1.
AMBU BAGS

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0249B JORVET

2.

ANESTHETIC TUBES SMALL

(Hatrix J0248A)

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0248A JORVET

3.

ANASTHETIC TUBES LARGE

(Hatrix J0248A)

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0248C JORVET

4.

ANAESTHESIA BAGS .5, 1, 2 & 3 

LITER

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0249A-C JORVET

5.
ATROPINE INJ. 100 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO JORVET

6.
CHARCOAL CANISTER FILTER

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0304 JORVET

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

AMBU

PEDIATRIC BREATING CIRCUIT 

JORGENSEN

ADULT BREATING CIRCUIT JORGENSEN

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

MEDLINE

AmTECH

PATTERSON VET

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 4



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

5 EACH $383.50 $1,917.50 $5,752.50 $3.87 $19.35 $58.05 $1.33 $6.65 $19.95

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,915.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$5,745.00

240 BOTTLES $28.00 $6,720.00 $20,160.00 $22.76 $5,462.40 $16,387.20 $20.80 $4,992.00 $14,976.00

750 BOTTLES $12.40 $9,300.00 $27,900.00 $6.41 $4,807.50 $14,422.50 $4.89 $3,667.50 $11,002.50

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"DEA Sch III N/B'

BIDDER'S PRICE 

'DEA Sch III N/B'

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"$3,645.00'

BIDDER'S PRICE 

'$10,935.00'

30 BOTTLES $3.89 $116.70 $350.10 $3.66 $109.80 $329.40 $2.45 $73.50 $220.50

50 BAGS $7.50 $375.00 $1,125.00 $8.24 $412.00 $1,236.00 $7.67 $383.50 $1,150.50

30 BOTTLES $27.00 $810.00 $2,430.00 $20.28 $608.40 $1,825.20 $22.02 $660.60 $1,981.80

BIDDER'S PRICE 

'$1,961.80'

$20,679.83 $62,039.49 $12,062.72 $36,188.16 $10,378.39 $31,135.17

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$11,377.33

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$34,131.99

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$10,349.22

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$31,047.67

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP II:  ANESTHESIA - REQUIRES C2 FORM 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

7.

ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE

 10 ASSORTED SIZES

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0835A-R VETONE

8.
ISOFLURANE GAS 250 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO VETONE

9.

KETAMINE 100 MG/ML 

10 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND ZOETIS VETONE

VETONE

11.
SODA LIME BAG 3 lbs/BAG

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0553 VETONE

12.
XYLAZINE 100 MG/ML 50 

ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND AKORN ANIMAL HEALTH VETONE

GROUP II (ITEMS 1 - 12) TOTAL AMOUNTS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

TELEFLEX

HENRY SCHEIN

AmTECH

HENRY SCHEIN

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

ASPEN VET

JORGENSEN

10.
LIDOCAINE INJ 2%, 100 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 5



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

300 TRAYS $125.00 $37,500.00 $112,500.00 $134.85 $40,455.00 $121,365.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MFG CONTRACT"

400 TRAYS $109.00 $43,600.00 $130,800.00 $132.83 $53,132.00 $159,396.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MFG CONTRACT"

1000 TRAYS $96.00 $96,000.00 $288,000.00 $133.76 $133,760.00 $401,280.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MFG CONTRACT"

700 TRAYS $125.00 $87,500.00 $262,500.00 $125.25 $87,675.00 $263,025.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MFG CONTRACT"

100 BOXES $118.00 $11,800.00 $35,400.00 $151.52 $15,152.00 $45,456.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MFG CONTRACT"

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP III: TEST KITS & VACCINES

ITE

M 

No.

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

1.

BORDETELLA 25 DOSES/TRAY

(Nabivac Intra Trac, ADT)

BIDDER'S BRAND MERCK

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

2.

FELINE NOBIVAC HCPCH 

25 DOSES/TRAY

BIDDER'S BRAND MERCK

3.

K9 NOBIVAC DAPPV 25 

DOSES/TRAY

BIDDER'S BRAND

4.

RAB K9 RABVAC 3

50 DOSES/TRAY

BIDDER'S BRAND MERCK

5.
PARVO TEST KITS

BIDDER'S BRAND BIO NOTE INC.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

MERCK

MERCK

MERCK

MERCK

ABAXIS

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 6



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

100 BOXES $375.00 $37,500.00 $112,500.00 $394.88 $39,488.00 $118,464.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MFG CONTRACT"

100 BOXES $38.00 $3,800.00 $11,400.00 $83.52 $8,352.00 $25,056.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MFG CONTRACT"

$317,700.00 $953,100.00 $378,014.00 $1,134,042.00 NO BID NO BID

FELV/FIV TEXT KITS 25/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND ZOETIS

GROUP III (ITEMS 1 - 7) TOTAL AMOUNTS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

6.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP III: TEST KITS & VACCINES

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

7.
HEARTWORM TEST KITS

BIDDER'S BRAND BIO NOTE INC.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

ABAXIS

ABAXIS

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 7



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

30 GALLONS $11.18 $335.40 $1,006.20 $23.40 $702.00 $2,106.00 $13.57 $407.10 $1,221.30

3 BOTTLES $66.00 $198.00 $594.00 $61.09 $183.27 $549.81 $56.49 $169.47 $508.41

30 BOTTLES $1.90 $57.00 $171.00 $1.63 $48.90 $146.70 $1.59 $47.70 $143.10

15 GALLONS $35.00 $525.00 $1,575.00 $19.81 $297.15 $891.45 $18.10 $271.50 $814.50

100 BOTTLES $280.00 $28,000.00 $84,000.00 $293.68 $29,368.00 $88,104.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

320 BOTTLES $4.80 $1,536.00 $4,608.00 $5.25 $1,680.00 $5,040.00 $3.74 $1,196.80 $3,590.40

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP IV: MISCELLANEOUS MEDICINES & RELATED

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

1.
ALCOHOL 70% BUFFERED GALLON

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO      4QTS               VETONE

2.

ANAMAX OINTMENT 240 

ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND MED-PHARMEX INC. VETONE

3.

ARTIFICIAL TEARSARTIFICIAL 

TEARS

(15ml liquid bottle)

BIDDER'S BRAND RUGBY APEXA

4.
BETADYNE SOL GALLON

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO VETONE

5.
CONVENIA INJ. 10 ml/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND ZOETIS VETONE

6.

DEXAMETASONE 2 mg. 

100 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO VETONE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

HENRY SCHEIN

DECHRA VET

MEDLINE

DYNAREX

ZOETIS

PHOENIX PHARMACEUTICALS

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 8



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

20 GALLONS $28.95 $579.00 $1,737.00 $18.52 $370.40 $1,111.20 $16.95 $339.00 $1,017.00

60 BOTTLES $14.65 $879.00 $2,637.00 $53.20 $3,192.00 $9,576.00 $12.11 $726.60 $2,179.80

25 GALLONS $6.00 $150.00 $450.00 $4.83 $120.75 $362.25 $3.86 $96.50 $289.50

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$94.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$282.00

5 CASES $173.52 $867.60 $2,602.80 $56.85 $284.25 $852.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,735.20

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$5,205.60

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

Long Term 

Backorder

48 BAGS $7.50 $360.00 $1,080.00 $4.59 $220.32 $660.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP IV: MISCELLANEOUS MEDICINES & RELATED

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

7.
DERMACHLOR SCRUB 2% GALLON

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO VETONE

8.

EPINEPHRINE 1/1000 

30 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO VETONE

HYDROGEN PEROXIDE GALLON

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

VEDCO

10.

LACTATED RINGERS IV BAGS

1 LITER 

24/CASE

BIDDER'S BRAND HOSPIRAL / ZOETIS 12cs

9.

11.

LACTATED RINGER 

w/5% DEXTROSE IV

SOL. 500 ML/BAG

BIDDER'S BRAND HOSPIRAL / ZOETIS 12cs 1000 ml

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

CHLORHEXIDINE 2%\PATTERSON VET, 

CLIPPER

PATTERSON VET

VEDCO

BBRAUN L7500

BRAUN L7510

(1000mL NOT 500mL) SOLD/CASE of 12EA 

yet priced per EACH BAG

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 9



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

10 BOTTLES $136.81 $1,368.10 $4,104.30 $139.40 $1,394.00 $4,182.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

20 BOTTLES $420.00 $8,400.00 $25,200.00 $246.42 $4,928.40 $14,785.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"AGENCY"

15 BOTTLES $175.99 $2,639.85 $7,919.55 $235.71 $3,535.65 $10,606.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"AGENCY"

5 BOTTLES $185.00 $925.00 $2,775.00 $190.35 $951.75 $2,855.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

5 BOTTLES $106.00 $530.00 $1,590.00 $139.29 $696.45 $2,089.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"CALL"

50 KITS .        $0.00 $0.00 .           $0.00 $0.00 .        $0.00 $0.00

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP IV: MISCELLANEOUS MEDICINES & RELATED

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

12.

PANACUR SUSP. 10%

 100 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND MERK

13.

PRAZIQUANTEL TAB. CANINE

 150 TAB/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND VIRBAC

14.

PRAZIQUANTEL TAB. FELINE 

50 TAB/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND BAYER

15.

PREDNISONE 20 MG/TAB 

1000 TABS/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND PAR

16.

PREDNISONE 5 MG/TAB 

1000 TABS/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND CADISTA

17.
PROVIABLE PROBIOTIC CANINE

 30 ML/KIT

BIDDER'S BRAND

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

MERK

BAYER Droncit 34mg - 50/Bottle

BAYER Droncit 23mg - 50/Bottle

PATTERSON VET

ROXANNE LABS

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 10



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

50 KITS .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00

10 BOTTLES $53.00 $530.00 $1,590.00 $59.50 $595.00 $1,785.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

10 BOTTLES $195.00 $1,950.00 $5,850.00 $220.08 $2,200.80 $6,602.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

5 BOTTLES $230.00 $1,150.00 $3,450.00 $270.90 $1,354.50 $4,063.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

5 PACKAGES $26.00 $130.00 $390.00 $24.00 $120.00 $360.00 $21.84 $109.20 $327.60

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,560.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$4,680.00

100 TUBES $3.20 $320.00 $960.00 $5.44 $544.00 $1,632.00 $2.59 $259.00 $777.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$316.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$948.00

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP IV: MISCELLANEOUS MEDICINES & RELATED

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

18.

PROVIABLE PROBIOTIC CANINE

 30 ML/KIT

BIDDER'S BRAND

19.

RIMADYL 25 MG/TAB 60 

TABS/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND ZOETIS

20.

RIMADYL 75 MG/TAB 180 

TABS/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND ZOETIS

21.

RIMADYL 100 MG/TAB 180 

TABS/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND ZOETIS

22.
SILVER NITRATE STIX 100 CT/PK

BIDDER'S BRAND G.F. HEALTH PRODUCTS VETONE

23.
SUPPLICAL 5 oz

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

ZOETIS

ZOETIS

ZOETIS

GRAFCO

HENRY SCHEIN

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 11



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

25 BOTTLES $158.00 $3,950.00 $11,850.00 $175.05 $4,376.25 $13,128.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

Not Avail 2017

5 BOTTLES $65.00 $325.00 $975.00 $81.90 $409.50 $1,228.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"DISCONTINUED"

$55,704.95 $167,114.85 $57,573.34 $172,720.02 $3,622.87 $10,868.61

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$57,998.55

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$173,995.65

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$3,620.37

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$10,861.11

GROUP IV (ITEMS 1 - 25) TOTAL AMOUNTS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP IV: MISCELLANEOUS MEDICINES & RELATED

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

24.
VETALOG 2 MG/ML 100 ML./BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND BOEHRINGER INGELHEIM

25.

YOBINE 2 MG/ML 

20 ML/BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND AKORN 

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

BOEHRINGER

AKORN

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 12



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

40 ROLLS $6.30 $252.00 $756.00 $5.94 $237.60 $712.80 $5.62 $224.80 $674.40

100 ROLLS $8.20 $820.00 $2,460.00 $16.94 $1,694.00 $5,082.00 $11.13 $1,113.00 $3,339.00

5 CANS $7.30 $36.50 $109.50 $8.94 $44.70 $134.10 $4.60 $23.00 $69.00

5 BLADES $18.99 $94.95 $284.85 $24.65 $123.25 $369.75 $19.30 $96.50 $289.50

5 BOXES $13.32 $66.60 $199.80 $4.61 $23.05 $69.15 $4.23 $21.15 $63.45

30 BOXES $5.25 $157.50 $472.50 $4.19 $125.70 $377.10 $3.08 $92.40 $277.20

$1,427.55 $4,282.65 $2,248.30 $6,744.90 $1,570.85 $4,712.55

6.

SURGICAL MASKS WITH 

EAR LOOP 50/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND OASIS VETONE

GROUP V (ITEMS 1 - 6) TOTAL AMOUNTS

4.
ELECTRIC CLIPPER BLADE #40

BIDDER'S BRAND ANDIS OSTER

5.

SPUNBOUND BOUFFANT 

SURGICAL CAPS 100/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND OASIS VETONE

2.

AUTOCLAVE INDICATOR STRIPS 

100/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND MYDENT INTL. PROPPER

3.
CLIPPER LUBRICANT SPRAY 14 oz.

BIDDER'S BRAND ANDIS KING

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

1.
AUTOCLAVE INDICATOR TAPE 1"

BIDDER'S BRAND MYDENT INTL. 3M

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP V: INSTRUMENTS & REALTED PRODUCTS OR EQUIPMENT 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

HENRY SCHEIN

3M

OSTER KOOL-LUBE 3   14oz

OSTER CRYO-X #40

MEDLINE

DYNAREX

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 13



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

2500 PIECES $0.22 $550.00 $1,650.00 $0.56 $1,400.00 $4,200.00 $0.66 $1,650.00 $4,950.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$568.75

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,706.25

2500 PIECES $0.30 $750.00 $2,250.00 $0.70 $1,750.00 $5,250.00 $0.86 $2,150.00 $6,450.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$779.87

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$3,339.61

5 EACH $4.00 $20.00 $60.00 $6.45 $32.25 $96.75 $10.97 $54.85 $164.55

5 PIECES .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00

10 BOXES $18.00 $180.00 $540.00 $14.08 $140.80 $422.40 $14.32 $143.20 $429.60

25 BOXES $18.32 $458.00 $1,374.00 $12.75 $318.75 $956.25 $19.45 $486.25 $1,458.75

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$305.33

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$916.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$63.75

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$191.25

6.
COTTON BALLS LARGE 1000/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN KENDALL

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

4.
BANDAGE SCISSORS SMALL

BIDDER'S BRAND

5.

COTTON CAST PADDING 4"

 1 ROLL/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND OASIS BSN

2.
AMBER PLASTIC BOTTLE 4 oz

BIDDER'S BRAND OASIS OWENS

3.

BANDAGE SCISSORS LARGE 

(7.5") ECONOMY

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0074A MILTEX

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

1.
AMBER PLASTIC BOTTLE 2 oz

BIDDER'S BRAND OASIS OWEN

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

OASIS

OASIS

MEDSOURCE INT.

OASIS

MCKESSON OR PATTERSON

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 14



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

10 PIECES $4.55 $45.50 $136.50 $11.97 $119.70 $359.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 PIECES $4.55 $45.50 $136.50 $8.55 $85.50 $256.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

20.83/30CT

100 PIECES $2.15 $215.00 $645.00 $0.91 $91.00 $273.00 $0.69 $69.00 $207.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$69.43

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$208.30

10 EACH $12.99 $129.90 $389.70 $7.43 $74.30 $222.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 PIECES $12.99 $129.90 $389.70 $8.15 $81.50 $244.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11.

DOG URINARY CATHETER 

2.0 mm x  500 mm CVET

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

10.

DOG URINARY CATHETER

 1.3 MM x 500 mm CVET

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN

8.

CAT URINARY CATHETER

1.3 mm X 130 mm CVET

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J153P

9.

DISPOSABLE SURGICAL SCRUB 

BRUSHES (with PVP)

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0364 BEC

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

7.

CAT URINARY CATHETER

 1.0 mm x 130 mm CVET

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J153M

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

KRUSE
BUSTER Feline Jackson with Stylet, 3ft x 

JORGENSEN
Buster Jackson at Catheters, 4 Fr

30EA/BOX PRICED PER EACH by 371073

JORGENSEN 

JORGENSEN

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 15



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

10 PIECES $12.99 $129.90 $389.70 $8.15 $81.50 $244.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

10 PIECES $12.99 $129.90 $389.70 $9.18 $91.80 $275.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID

5 BOXES $25.99 $129.95 $389.85 $23.22 $116.10 $348.30 $16.79 $83.95 $251.85

10 BOXES $25.99 $259.90 $779.70 $22.36 $223.60 $670.80 $16.79 $167.90 $503.70

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$83.95

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$251.85

20 PIECES $2.70 $54.00 $162.00 $2.40 $48.00 $144.00 $0.79 $15.80 $47.40

20 PIECES $3.36 $67.20 $201.60 $2.70 $54.00 $162.00 $0.87 $17.40 $52.20
17.

ELIZABETH COLLAR SIZE 10

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0046B VETONE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

15.

ELASTIKON 2" x 2.5 YDS., 

TAPE 6 ROLLS/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND JOHNSON & JOHNSON J&J

16.
ELIZABETH COLLAR SIZE 7  1/2

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0046A VETONE

13.

DOG URINARY CATHETER

 3.3 mm x 500 mm CVET

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN

14.

ELASTIKON TAPE 1" 

12 ROLL/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND JOHNSON & JOHNSON J&J

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

12.

DOG URINARY CATHETER 

2.6mm x 500 mm CVET

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

JORGENSEN

JORGENSEN

J&J

J&J

PATTERSON VET

PATTERSON VET

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 16



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

20 PIECES $3.94 $78.80 $236.40 $3.00 $60.00 $180.00 $1.00 $20.00 $60.00

20 PIECES $4.43 $88.60 $265.80 $4.32 $86.40 $259.20 $1.18 $23.60 $70.80

20 PIECES $4.71 $94.20 $282.60 $4.86 $97.20 $291.60 $1.84 $36.80 $110.40

20 PIECES $5.94 $118.80 $356.40 $5.81 $116.20 $348.60 $2.33 $46.60 $139.80

20 PIECES $6.84 $136.80 $410.40 $6.48 $129.60 $388.80 $2.93 $58.60 $175.80

10 BOXES $5.07 $50.70 $152.10 $14.38 $143.80 $431.40 $1.08 $10.80 $32.40

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$507.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,521.00
23.

GLASS DISPENSING JARS

(2oz. glass dropper bottles)

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO WESTPAK

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

21.
ELIZABETH COLLAR SIZE 25

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0046E VETONE

22.
ELIZABETH COLLAR SIZE 30

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0046F VETONE

19.
ELIZABETH COLLAR SIZE 15

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0046C VETONE

20.
ELIZABETH COLLAR SIZE 20

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0046D VETONE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

18.
ELIZABETH COLLAR SIZE 12  1/2

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0046G VETONE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

PATTERSON VET

PATTERSON VET

PATTERSON VET

PATTERSON VET

PATTERSON VET

HENRY SCHEIN 

12 EACH/BOX

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 17



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

100 EACH $1.45 $145.00 $435.00 $1.16 $116.00 $348.00 $1.15 $115.00 $345.00

10 EACH $1.45 $14.50 $43.50 $1.16 $11.60 $34.80 $1.15 $11.50 $34.50

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$145.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$435.00

10 PIECES .      $0.00 $0.00 .      $0.00 $0.00 .      $0.00 $0.00

20 PIECES $1.63 $32.60 $97.80 $0.99 $19.80 $59.40 $0.91 $18.20 $54.60

20 PIECES $1.63 $32.60 $97.80 $0.99 $19.80 $59.40 $0.91 $18.20 $54.60
28.

IV CATHETER 22 GAGE

BIDDER'S BRAND TERUMO BD

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

27.
IV CATHETER 24 GAGE

BIDDER'S BRAND TERUMO BD

25.

IV FLUID LINE MICRO DRIP: length, 

perhaps a manufacturer and P/N of 

what is preferred

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0468MA EXEL

26.
IV FLUID LINE MICRO DRIP 

BIDDER'S BRAND

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

24.

IV ADMIN SET

(length, drops, # of sites or a 

manufacturer and P/N of what is 

preferred)

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0400A EXEL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

OASIS

OASIS

EXCEL

EXCEL

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________

DATE:  ____9/20/16____________  2016-766 VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS 18



Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

20 PIECES $1.63 $32.60 $97.80 $0.99 $19.80 $59.40 $0.91 $18.20 $54.60

10 EACH $7.75 $77.50 $232.50 $12.30 $123.00 $369.00 $11.38 $113.80 $341.40

100 BOXES $5.65 $565.00 $1,695.00 $4.88 $488.00 $1,464.00 $4.45 $445.00 $1,335.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$458.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,374.00

100 BOXES $5.65 $565.00 $1,695.00 $4.80 $480.00 $1,440.00 $4.58 $458.00 $1,374.00

100 BOXES $5.65 $565.00 $1,695.00 $9.75 $975.00 $2,925.00 $13.75 $1,375.00 $4,125.00

10 PIECES .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00
34.

ORAL DOSING SYRINGES

BIDDER'S BRAND

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

32.

NEEDLES 20 GAGE x 1 ½" 

100 ct/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND BD EXEL

33.

NEEDLES 18 GAGE x 1 ½" 

100 ct/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND BD EXEL

30.

NAIL CLIPPERS

(Andis)

BIDDER'S BRAND ANDIS MILLERS

31.

NEEDLES 20 GAGE x 1" 

100 ct/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND BD EXEL

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

29.
IV CATHETER 20 GAGE

BIDDER'S BRAND TERUMO BD

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

EXCEL

ANDIS 65700

NIPRO

NIPRO

NIPRO

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

10 PIECES $5.00 $50.00 $150.00 $2.62 $26.20 $78.60 $2.40 $24.00 $72.00

/100

3 BOXES $19.75 $59.25 $177.75 $31.75 $95.25 $285.75 $6.41 $19.23 $57.69

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$118.50

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$355.50

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"$1,602.50/250"

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$4,807.50

10 TRAYS $20.00 $200.00 $600.00 $12.26 $122.60 $367.80 $9.48 $94.80 $284.40

5 ROLLS $24.19 $120.95 $362.85 $15.10 $75.50 $226.50 $13.30 $66.50 $199.50

5 BOXES $3.00 $15.00 $45.00 $1.98 $9.90 $29.70 $1.87 $9.35 $28.05

5 BOXES $5.50 $27.50 $82.50 $3.63 $18.15 $54.45 $3.54 $17.70 $53.10
40.

ROLLED GAUZE 4" 12 ROLL/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND DUCAL VETONE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

38.

PRESCRIPTION LABELS

 1000 LAB/ROLL

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO VEDCO

39.
ROLLED GAUZE 2" 12 ROLL/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND DUCAL VETONE

36.
PILL ENVELOPES 1000/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND OASIS ASSBG

37.
PILL COUNTING TRAY

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0697 GRAHAM

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

35.
PILL CUTTERS

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0696 MEDLINE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

MEDLINE

JORGENSEN

GRAHAM-FIELD

VIAPAC / PATTERSON VET

OASIS

OASIS

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

10 ROLLS $4.35 $43.50 $130.50 $3.60 $36.00 $108.00 $3.66 $36.60 $109.80

80 BOXES $23.00 $1,840.00 $5,520.00 $37.51 $3,000.80 $9,002.40 $9.48 $758.40 $2,275.20

80 BOXES $23.00 $1,840.00 $5,520.00 $37.51 $3,000.80 $9,002.40 $9.48 $758.40 $2,275.20

25 CARTRIDGES .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00

25 CARTRIDGES .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00

36 CASES $52.50 $1,890.00 $5,670.00 $44.06 $1,586.16 $4,758.48 $42.20 $1,519.20 $4,557.60
46.

NON-WOVEN SPONES 4x4

 4000 /CASES

BIDDER'S BRAND DUCAL VETONE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

44.
SKIN STAPLES REGULAR

BIDDER'S BRAND

45.
SKIN STAPLES WIDE

BIDDER'S BRAND

42.
SCALPEL #10 100/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0054SA VETONE

43.
SCALPEL #15 100/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0054SD VETONE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

41.
ROLLED COTTON 1 lb./ROLL

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN KENDALL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

OASIS

MILTEX 4-310

MILTEX 4-310

MEDLINE

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

5 EACH $15.00 $75.00 $225.00 $21.60 $108.00 $324.00 $36.09 $180.45 $541.35

5 EACH $15.00 $75.00 $225.00 $21.60 $108.00 $324.00 $81.55 $407.75 $1,223.25

80 CASES $108.00 $8,640.00 $25,920.00 $225.08 $18,006.40 $54,019.20 $439.12 $35,129.60 $105,388.80

5 EACH $4.80 $24.00 $72.00 $6.55 $32.75 $98.25 $6.95 $34.75 $104.25

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$34.77

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$104.31

7 BOXES $50.15 $351.05 $1,053.15 $290.56 $2,033.92 $6,101.76 $113.79 $796.53 $2,389.59

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$796.55

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$2,389.66

10 BOXES $50.15 $501.50 $1,504.50 $315.11 $3,151.13 $9,453.39 $113.79 $1,137.90 $3,413.70
52.

SUTURE PDS II (polydioxanone), 2/0, 

36 CT/BOX (2-0 FS-2 Generic)

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO VETONE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

50.
SUTURE SCISSORS 4.5

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSONE LABS J0076 ALLEGIANCE

51.

SUTURE PDS II (polydioxanone), 4/0, 

36 CT/BOX (4-0 FS-2 Generic)

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO MILTEX

48.

STETHOSCOPE PEDIATRIC -  

Labtron Item #602LB or Similar

BIDDER'S BRAND LABTRON VETONE

49.

SURGICAL GLOVES LATEX PF 

4BOX/CASE

BIDDER'S BRAND ANSELL 3M

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

47.

STETHOSCOPE ADULT - Labtron 

Item #602LB or Similar

BIDDER'S BRAND LABTRON VETONE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

MEDLINE

MEDLINE

DYNAREX

MILTEX EG9-100

ETHICON

ETHICON

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

7 BOXES $50.15 $351.05 $1,053.15 $254.22 $1,779.54 $5,338.62 $41.49 $290.43 $871.29

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$871.38

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$2,614.14

SAME AS ABOVE

7 BOXES $50.15 $351.05 $1,053.15 $304.20 $2,129.40 $6,388.20 $41.49 $290.43 $871.29

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$871.38

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$2,614.14

250 BOXES $50.15 $12,537.50 $37,612.50 $75.87 $18,967.50 $56,902.50 $38.22 $9,555.00 $28,665.00

900 BOXES $50.15 $45,135.00 $135,405.00 $75.65 $68,085.00 $204,255.00 $38.22 $34,398.00 $103,194.00

350 BOXES $50.15 $17,552.50 $52,657.50 $75.60 $26,460.00 $79,380.00 $38.22 $13,377.00 $40,131.00

100 BOXES $50.15 $5,015.00 $15,045.00 $60.80 $6,080.00 $18,240.00 $38.22 $3,822.00 $11,466.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$7,522.50

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$22,567.50

58.

SUTURE SORBOCRYL

 0/0 FS-1, 36"  12 CT/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO PDS II 0/0 VFS-2 24" LONG VETONE FS-L NDLE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

56.

SUTURE SORBOCRYL

 3/0 FS-2, 36"  12 CT/BOX

 NFS-2

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO PDS II 3/0 VFS-2 24" LONG VETONE

57.

SUTURE SORBOCRYL

 2/0 FS-1, 36"  12 CT/BOX

 NFS-2

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO PDS II 2/0 VFS-2 24" LONG VETONE

54.

SUTURE PDS II (POLYDIOXANONE) 

1/0, 36 CT/BOX (0-0 FS-2 Generic)

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO PDS II 0/0 VCP-1 24" LONG #1/0=#0/0 VETONE CP-2 NEEDLE

55.

SUTURE SORBOCRYL

 4/0 FS-2, 36"  12 CT/BOX

 NFS-2

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO PDS II 4/0 VFS-2 24" LONG VETONE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

53.

SUTURE PDS II (POLYDIOXANONE) 

1/0, 36 CT/BOX (1-0 FS-2 Generic)

BIDDER'S BRAND VEDCO PDS II 1/10 VCP-1 24" LONG #1/0=#0/0 VETONE CP-2 NEEDLE

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

EITHICON

EITHICON

HENRY SCHEIN

HENRY SCHEIN

HENRY SCHEIN

HENRY SCHEIN

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

100 BOXES $8.99 $899.00 $2,697.00 $11.79 $1,179.00 $3,537.00 $11.72 $1,172.00 $3,516.00

450 BOXES $11.44 $5,148.00 $15,444.00 $11.12 $5,004.00 $15,012.00 $11.74 $5,283.00 $15,849.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$1,174.00

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$3,522.00

50 BOXES $9.15 $457.50 $1,372.50 $12.70 $635.00 $1,905.00 $12.21 $610.50 $1,831.50

30 BOXES $17.50 $525.00 $1,575.00 $18.42 $552.60 $1,657.80 $13.30 $399.00 $1,197.00

10 EACH $9.75 $97.50 $292.50 $13.20 $132.00 $396.00 $9.54 $95.40 $286.20
63.

TOURNIQUETS

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0130 JORVET

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

62.

SYRINGES 12 ML 

NO NEEDLE 100 CT/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN EXELEXCEL

NYE QUICK-LOCK (JorVet J013)

60.

SYRINGES 3 ML, 21G

100 CT/BOX 1"

BIDDER'S BRAND BD KENDALL

61.

SYRINGES 6ML NO NEEDLE 

100 CT/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN EXEL

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

59.

SYRINGES 1ML - 25G 100CT/BOX

 1" or 5/8"

BIDDER'S BRAND BD EXEL

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

McKESSON

COVIDIAN

COVIDIAN

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

10 PIECES .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00 .       $0.00 $0.00

300 BOTTLES $15.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $17.28 $5,184.00 $15,552.00 $12.95 $3,885.00 $11,655.00

/24

5 BOXES $20.70 $103.50 $310.50 $32.85 $164.25 $492.75 $14.98 $74.90 $224.70

/12

5 BOXES $26.64 $133.20 $399.60 $35.26 $176.30 $528.90 $10.84 $54.20 $162.60

2 BOXES $24.99 $49.98 $149.94 $21.87 $43.74 $131.22 $20.86 $41.72 $125.16

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$312.90

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$938.70

2 BOXES $24.99 $49.98 $149.94 $21.03 $42.06 $126.18 $20.86 $41.72 $125.16

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$312.90

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$938.70

69.

WHITE WATERPROOF TAPE

 2"x10 yds., 6CT/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND COVIDIEN

COVIDIEN

KENDALL

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

67.
VETWRAP 4" 18 ROLL/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND ANDOVER 18/cs VETONE

68.

WHITE WATERPROOF TAPE

 1"x10 yds., 12CT/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND KENDALL

65.

VETBOND - 3M SURGICAL GLUE 

3ML./BOTTLE

BIDDER'S BRAND 3M 3M

66.
VETWRAP 2" 18 ROLL/BOX

BIDDER'S BRAND ANDOVER 36/cs VETONE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

3M

64.
UTILITY SCISSORS

BIDDER'S BRAND

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

3M

3M

COVIDIAN

COVIDIAN

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

40 EACH $10.50 $420.00 $1,260.00 $5.24 $209.60 $628.80 $4.13 $165.20 $495.60

40 EACH $10.69 $427.60 $1,282.80 $8.25 $330.00 $990.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

40 EACH $12.49 $499.60 $1,498.80 $18.68 $747.20 $2,241.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

$115,753.06 $347,259.18 $176,791.75 $530,375.25 $122,039.31 $366,117.93

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$118,947.56

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$356,842.68

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$176,652.92

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$529,958.76

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$120,390.97

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$361,172.96

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VI:  SURGICAL & MEDICAL SUPPLIES 

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

70.
CLOTH DRAPES  24" x 24"

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0256B MEDLINE

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

72.

CLOTH DRAPES 36" x 30" 

WITH 26" FENESTRATION

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0256C

FENESTRATED DRAPE, 20" x X20" 4" x 

3/4

JOR VET SURGICAL DRAPE, 

30" x 36" .7 x 11/4" OPENING

71.

CLOTH DRAPES 12" x 18"

WITH 24" FENESTRATION

BIDDER'S BRAND JORGENSEN LABS J0256A

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

GROUP VI (ITEMS 1 - 72) TOTAL AMOUNTS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

MEDLINE

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

(A) (B) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F) (D) (E ) (F)

300 BOTTLES $59.58 $17,874.00 $53,622.00 $104.80 $31,440.00 $94,320.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

"MAND"

$17,874.00 $53,622.00 $31,440.00 $94,320.00 NO BID NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$0

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$0

$724,641.72 $2,173,925.16 $971,564.82 $2,914,694.46 $139,493.52 $418,480.56

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$702,953.32

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$2,108,859.96

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$971,425.99

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$2,914,277.97

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$137,813.53

BIDDER'S PRICE 

$413,440.59

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

GROUP VII: EUTHANASIA - REQUIRES C2 ORDER FORM

ITE

M 

No.

DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATE

D ANNUAL 

QUANTITY

UNIT OF 

MEASURE

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. 

x 3)

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

1.

PENTOBARBITAL SODIUM 

6 GRAINS/ML 250 ML

BIDDER'S BRAND MED-PHARMEX

GROUPS  I - VII TOTAL AMOUNTS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP VII (ITEM 1) TOTAL AMOUNTS

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

UNIT 

PRICE

ANNUAL 

AMOUNT 

(A x D)

3 YEAR COST

(Annual amt. x 

3)

VORTEC

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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Project Name:  VETERINARY MEDICAL SUPPLIES - ANIMAL CLINICS Solicitation #:  2016-766

Department:  ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO

EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE 

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED

ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL

BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE

SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE

MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING 

THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

ONE (1) ADDITIONAL YEAR AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), 

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION 

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID. 

BIDS SOLICITED:     8          LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:    2          BIDS RECEIVED:   3            LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:   3            NO BID:  0

NET - 30 DAYS1% - 10 DAYS

24

NO OPTION OFFERED

PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Bid Opening Date:  SEPTEMBER 14, 2016

EL PASO VETERINARY SUPPLY

EL PASO,  TX

MWI ANIMAL HEALTH

BOISE, ID

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
3 32 - 7

48

MRI ENTERPRISES, LLC

EL PASO,  TX

X X

X

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_________
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