El Paso

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE Solicitation #: 2016-821
Bid Opening Date: MAY 18, 2016 Department. STREETS & MAINTENANCE

All-America City

FACILITY SOLUTIONS GAGE ELECTRIC CO. TRI-STATE ELECTRIC, LTD

GROUP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX VINTON, TX
PART (A)
ANNUAL
ITEM PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST
TEN ITEM DESCRIPTION ES(;(;%TY PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST s
(A) (B) (¢) (B) (¢) (B) (¢)

1. UP TO 88W FIXTURE - 100W HPS EQUIVALENT 800 NO BID $247.80 $198,240.00 $789.00 $631,200.00
2. | 100w - 110W FIXTURE - 250W HPS EQUIVALENT 250 NO BID $311.52 $77,880.00 $859.00 $214,750.00
3. | 116W - 159W FIXTURE - 400W HPS EQUIVALENT 20 NO BID $495.60 $9,912.00 $916.00 $18,320.00
4. | WOOD POLE STREET LIGHT ARM ADJUSTMENT 25 NO BID $116.00 $2,900.00 $225.00 $5,625.00

#6 XHHW WIRING REPAIR
5. (LINEAR FEET) (LF) 6,000 NO BID $0.50 $3,000.00 $5.00 $30,000.00

#12 THHN WIRING REPLACEMENT (LINEAR FEET)

6. (LF) 1,500 NO BID $0.10 $150.00 $0.50 $750.00
30 AMP 600 VOLT BREAK AWAY FUSE HOLDER

7. REPLACEMENT 100 NO BID $47.14 $4,714.00 $85.00 $8,500.00

8. UP TO 60 AMP 600 VOLT FUSE REPLACEMENT 25 NO BID $17.66 $441.50 $125.00 $3,125.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 7/5/16 2016-821 CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE 1




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE
Bid Opening Date: MAY 18, 2016

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-821
Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE

FACILIT(;(RSO%LFEJTIONS GAGE ELECTRIC CO. | TRI-STATE ELECTRIC, LTD
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX VINTON, TX
PART (A)
ANNUAL
ITEM
TEn L ES(;(;%TY PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST
(A) (B) (¢) (B) (¢) (B) (¢)
9. | TWIST LOCK 600v PHOTOCELL REPLACEMENT 100 NO BID $21.24 $2,124.00 $225.00 $22,500.00
ROAM or APPROVED EQUIVALENT STREET LIGHT
10. L ED NODE REPLACEMENT 50 NO BID $127.44 $6,372.00 $225.00 $11,250.00
11| 2 PvCCONDUIT REP"(ﬁ%EMENT (LINEAR FEET) 200 NO BID $0.80 $160.00 $25.00 $5,000.00
12| 1" PVCCONDUIT REP"(ﬁ%EMENT (LINEAR FEET) 500 NO BID $0.60 $300.00 $25.00 $12,500.00
36" x 6" STREET LIGHT FOUNDATION
13. REPLACEMENT w/REINFORCEMENT 10 NO BID $750.00 $7,500.00 $2,465.00 $24,650.00
14. FIBERGLASS GROUND BOX TYPE AA 10 NO BID $233.64 $2,336.40 $975.00 $9,750.00
15. 6' STEEL STREET LIGHT ARM 20 NO BID $462.00 $9,240.00 $300.00 $6,000.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 7/5/16

2016-821 CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE
Bid Opening Date: MAY 18, 2016

El Paso

All-America City

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-821
Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE

FACILITY SOLUTIONS

GAGE ELECTRIC CO.

TRI-STATE ELECTRIC, LTD

GROUP
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX VINTON, TX
PART (A)
ANNUAL
ITEM
TEn L ES(;(;%TY PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST
(A) (B) (¢) (B) (¢) (B) (¢)
16. 8' STEEL STREET LIGHT ARM 10 NO BID $575.00 $5,750.00 $725.00 $7,250.00
17. 6' GREEN STEEL STREET LIGHT ARM 20 NO BID $523.00 $10,460.00 $650.00 $13,000.00
18. 8' GREEN STEEL STREET LIGHT ARM 10 NO BID $635.00 $6,350.00 $650.00 $6,500.00
6' GREEN STEEL STREET LIGHT ARM w/GREEN
19. STEEL CHANNEL SCROLL 10 NO BID $570.00 $5,700.00 $500.00 $5,000.00
6' WOOD POLE STREET LIGHT
20. ARMW/L - 14" % 6" LAG BOLTS 10 NO BID $50.00 $500.00 $225.00 $2,250.00
21. | 35 WOOD POLE STREET LIGHT (FULL ASSEMBLY) 50 NO BID $2,250.00 $112,500.00 $2,250.00 $112,500.00
2p | S0 STEEL STREET LIGHT POLE REPLACEMENT 20 NO BID $3,044.50 $60,890.00 $2,500.00 $50,000.00

SINGLE ARM (FULLY ASSEMBLY)

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 7/5/16

2016-821 CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE
Bid Opening Date: JUNE 1, 2016

El Paso
el

All-America City

‘III'V

2010

Solicitation #: 2016-821
Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE

FACILITY SOLUTIONS
GROUP

GAGE ELECTRIC CO.

TRI-STATE ELECTRIC, LTD

EL PASO, TX VINTON, TX
EL PASO, TX SO, ON,
PART (A)
ANNUAL
ITEM
TEn ITEM DESCRIPTION Es(;C%TY PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST
(A) (B) (C) (B) () (B) ()
40' STEEL STREET LIGHT POLE REPLACEMENT
23. SINGLE ARM (FULL ASSEMBLY) 20 NO BID $3,870.40 $77,408.00 $3,250.00 $65,000.00
30' STEEL STREET LIGHT POLE REPLACEMENT
24. DOUBLE ARM (FULL ASSEMBLY) 30 NO BID $3,481.00 $104,430.00 $2,650.00 $79,500.00
40' STEEL STREET LIGHT POLE REPLACEMENT
25. SINGLE ARM (FULL ASSEMBLY) 5 NO BID $4,351.40 $21,757.00 $3,550.00 $17,750.00
30' GREEN STANDARD POLE REPLACEMENT
26. SINGLE ARM (FULL ASSEMBLY) 5 NO BID $3,537.65 $17,688.25 $2,300.00 $11,500.00
30' GREEN FLUTED POLE REPLACEMENT SINGLE
27. ARM (FULL ASSEMBLY) 10 NO BID $3,079.80 $30,798.00 $2,600.00 $26,000.00
30' GREEN FLUTED POLE REPLACEMENT DOUBLE
28. ARM (FULL ASSEMBLY) 20 NO BID $3,551.90 $71,038.00 $3,000.00 $60,000.00
STREET LIGHT BREAK AWAY LARGE BASE
29. REPLACEMENT 120 NO BID $190.00 $22,800.00 $750.00 $90,000.00
30.| STREET LIGHT MAIN POWER SOURCE REPAIR 10 NO BID $448.00 $4,480.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 7/5/16

2016-821 CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO El Paso
BID TABULATION FORM meninlmi“;

2010

Project Name: CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE
Bid Opening Date: JUNE 1, 2016

Solicitation #: 2016-821
Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE

FAC”"TgRSO%LPUﬂONS GAGE ELECTRIC CO. | TRI-STATE ELECTRIC, LTD
EL PASO. TX EL PASO, TX VINTON, TX
PART (A)
ANNUAL
ITEM
TN (TEM DESCRIPTION Es(za_C%Ty PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST| PARTS COST |ANNUAL COST
(A) (B) (©) (B) (©) (B) (©)
31, | _ 480 VOLT 60AMP STREET LIGHT MAIN POWER 5 NO BID $3,416.15 $17,080.75 $3,500.00 $17,500.00
SOURCE INSTALLATION WITH 30' CONCRETE POLE SISO PRICE
$27,500.00
32.| STREET LIGHT MAIN POWER SOURCE REMOVAL 10 NO BID $450.00 $4,500.00 $1,550.00 $15,500.00
33.| 5x4x4" SIDEWALK CONCRETE REPLACEMENT 5 NO BID $325.00 $1,625.00 $799.00 $3,995.00
34. |2 POLE 60 AMP 480 VOLT BREAKER REPLACEMENT 10 NO BID $413.00 $4,130.00 $145.00 $1,450.00
60 AMP 240 BOLT COIL CONTRACTOR
35. REPLAGEMENT 10 NO BID $88.50 $885.00 $1,200.00 $12,000.00
36. TRUCK MOUNTED ATTEUATOR (PER DAY) 25 NO BID $425.00 $10,625.00 $600.00 $15,000.00
PART (B) - HOURLY RATE
HOURLY RATE DURING NORMAL BSINESS HOURS - 07:00
1. THROUGH 18:00 MONDAY THRU THURSDAY NO BID $72.00 PAGE NOT ATTACHED
2. | HOURLY RATE DURING AFTER HOUR, WEEKENDS, HOLIDAYS NO BID $108.00
GRAND TOTAL HOURLY RATE AND PARTS TOTOAL COST NO BID $916,844.90
BIDDER'S PRICE "NO BID"

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 7/5/16

2016-821 CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

Project Name: CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 1, 2016

Department:

El Paso
illl-Amelh:acll;
j
Solicitation #: 2016-821
STREETS & MAINTENANCE

FACILITY SOLUTIONS
GROUP
EL PASO, TX

GAGE ELECTRIC CO.
EL PASO, TX

TRI-STATE ELECTRIC, LTD
VINTON, TX

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE
OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

PAGE NOT ATTACHED

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:

X]

[ ]

NO OPTION OFFERED

[ ]

[ ]

[ ]

PAYMENT TERMS:

NET - 30 DAYS

1% - 10 DAYS

NET - 30 DAYS

BIDS SOLICITED: 10 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:

6

BIDS RECEIVED: 3

LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:

2 NO BID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: Isl

DATE: 7/5/16

2016-821 CITYWIDE L.E.D. STREET LIGHT MAINTENANCE




