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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES

BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016

BID NO: 2016-960
DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

BLACK STALL‘?SCCONTRACTORS' EL PASO A.R.C. ELECTRIC, INC. GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 4 BIDDER 2 OF 4 BIDDER 3 OF 4
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'T:M g’ﬂ UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qly x UNIT PRICE} PRICE {Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE)
ASPHALT AND BASE REMOVAL 6"-12" DEPTH
1. | 4,570 | sY INCLUDES REMOVAL OF EXISTING STRIPING $23.00 $105,110.00 $20.30 $92,771.00 NOBID NO BID
1.5" MILLING TRANSITION AND HMAG TYPE $11,972.95
2. 605 sY COVERPLAY $28.75 $17,393.75 $19.79 coma;:g:;g:zpmcs NC BID NO BID
$11,096.25
3. | 825 | LF CURB & GUTTER REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL $4.60 $3,795.00 $13.45 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$11,095.22
$850.85
4 65 | SY | CONCRETE SIDEWALK REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL $16.10 $1,0468.50 $13.09 GONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$B851.08
NEW 2.5" {MIN) HMAC, TXDOT TYPE C PAVEMENT
5. | 690 | sY COMPLETE IN PLACE $34.50 $23,805.00 $20.30 $14,007.00 NO BID NO BID
CONTROLLED LOW-STRENGTH MATERIAL (CLSM) $6,352.30
6. | 695 | SY 12" DEPTH GOMPLETE IN PLACE $46.00 $31,970.00 $9.14 conTRAGTORS PRcE NO BID NO BID
$55,484.00
7. | 5335 | LF | NEW 6" CURB AND GUTTER COMPLETE IN PLACE $11.50 $61,352.50 $10.40 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$55,504,01
8. | 65 | sy | NEW4 CONCRETEPSL’R?SALK COMPLETE IN $34.50 $2.242.50 $28.42 $1,847.30 NO BID NO BID
NEW REFLECTIVE THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT $945.50
S. 310 LF MARKING TYPE |, 4" WHITE (SLD) AT $4.60 $1,426.00 $3.05 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NOBID
DECELERATION LANE COMPLETE IN PLACE $943.9
Approy Vi ‘g//”//b
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016

BID NO: 2016-360

DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

BLACK STALLION CONTRACTORS,

NG EL PASO A.R.C. ELECTRIC, INC. GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 4 BIDDER 2 OF 4 BIDDER 3 OF 4
RICE SCHEDULE:: BASE BID |
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'T:M gg UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRIGE)
NEW CURB MARKING TYPE |, YELLOW (SLD) AT $716.75
10. | 235 LF MEDIAN NOSE COMPLETE IN PLAGE $4.60 $1,081.00 $3.05 conm.qs?:g?ss PRICE NG BID NO BID
1M.] 1 Ls | TEMPORARY TRAFFfLiggTROL COMPLETE IN $29,900.00 $29,900.00 $30,450.00 $30,450.00 NO BID NO BID
12.| 1 | Ls |SWPPPINSTALLATION & MANAGEMENT COMPLETE} o\ o0 0 $11,500.00 $20,300.00 $20,300.00 NO BID NO BID
IN PLACE
SUM TOTAL BASE BID [ (ITEMS 1 through 12) $200,622.25 coﬁ?;iﬁ,i?;,?gcs NO BID
5246,808.42_
MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM
TOTAL BASE BID | $14,500.00 $12,339.58 NO BID
$259,133.48
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID AND MOBILIZATION) $305,122.25 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID
$259,148.00

2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016

BID NO: 2016-960
DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

BLACK STALL'CI’PZ"CCONTRACTORS' EL PASO A.R.C. ELEGTRIG, INC. GLOBE BUILDERS, LLG
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 4 BIDDER 2 OF 4 BIDDER 3 OF 4
T PRICE SCHEDULE ; BASE BIDTT
| or UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
T:M ory | UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRIGE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE {Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE {Qty X UNIT PRICE)
$4,045.00
1. | 5750 | sF ROCK DEMO & DISPOSAL - EXISTING $1.10 $6,325.00 $0.86 CONTRAGTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$4,360.81
$456.78
2 6 | EA TREE DEMO & DISPOSAL $550.00 $3,300.00 $76.13 CONTRAGTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$456.75
3. | 82 | EA SHRUB DEMO & DISPOSAL $27.50 $2,255.00 $10.15 $832.30 NO BID NO BID
$609.20
4| 40 | EA TREE PROTECTION - EXISTING TREE $165.00 $6,600.00 $15.23 CONTRACTOR'S FRICE NO BID NO BID
$609.00
$80,763.64
5. | 101 | EA TREE INSTALLATION 4" CAL. $900.00 $90,900.00 $799.64 O A TOaS o NO BID NO BID
$80,763.37
$26,301.20
6. | 940 | EA SHRUB INSTALLATION - 5G $25.20 $23,688.00 $27.98 CONTRAGTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$26,304.54
$1,968.76
7. | 166 | EA SHRUB INSTALLATION - 1G $10.80 $1,792.80 $11.86 CONTRAGTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$1,967.96
[
Appraved;By:
Date: £/ 11 2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES Page 3 of 12
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BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016

BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOKN HAYES

BID NO: 2016-960

DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

BLACK STALL'?SCCONTRACTORS' EL PASO A.R.C. ELECTRIC, INC. GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 4 BIDDER 2 OF 4 BIDDER 3 OF 4
PRICE SCHEDUEL: BASE BID e . .
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'TEM Eﬂ UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRIGE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRIGE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRIGE)
$30,750.00
8. |37,500] SF FRANKLIN RED GRAVEL %0.90 $33,750.00 $0.82 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$30,830.63
g | 1 LS IRRIGATION $36,000.00 $36,000.00 $52,917.03 $52,917.03 NO BID NO BID
SUM TOTAL BASE BID Il (TEMS 1 through 9) $204,610.80 o199,543.91 NO BID
$199,642.38
MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM
TOTAL BASE BID I $10,000.00 $9,981.62 NO BID
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID AND MOBILIZATION) $214,610.80 o 5209,525.53 NO BID
%$209,624,00
=
2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOMN HAYES Page 4 of 12
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TC JOHN HAYES
BiD DATE: JULY 27, 2016

BID NO: 2016-960
DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL iMPROVEMENT

BLACK STALL'?:CCONTRACTORS' EL PASO A.R.C. ELECTRIC, INC. GLOBE BUILDERS, LLC
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 4 BIDDER 2 OF 4 BIDDER 3 OF 4
I PRICE SCHEDUEE: BASEBID 11| L
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'TEM Eﬂ, UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE {Qty x UNIT PRICE)
$383,373.80
1. ] 85 | EA 30' FLUTED POLE AND INSTALLATION $4,200.00 $357,000.00 $4,510.28 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$383,373.38
$150,825.70
2. | 170 | EA 120 LED LIGHT FIXTURE AND INSTALLATION $1,820.00 $309,400.00 $887.21 CONTRAZTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$150,825.51
$93,775.00
3. | 17,050 LF 2" PVC CONDUIT $2.20 $37,510.00 $5.50 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NQ BID NOC BID
$93,696.57
4| 8 I:;( WIRING #4 THHW AND #4 THHW GROUND $1,430.00 $11,440.00 $3,557.10 $28,456.80 NO BID NO BID
5. | 45 111}'( WIRING #6 THHW AND #6 THHW GROUND $880.00 $39,600,00 $3,045.90 $137,065.50 NO BID NO BID
SERVICE POLE, ELECTRICAL SERVICE AND $21,029.50
6.1 2 | Ea SERVICE FEEPERS $7,150.00 $14,300.00 $10,514.75 conTescroms rce NO BID NO BID
7.1 3 | EA GROUND BOX AND INSTALLATION $770.00 $2,310.00 $1,017.00 $5,751.00 NO BID NO BID
Approved By:
Date: 17 2016-950 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES Page 5 of 12
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016

BID NO: 2016-960
DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

BLACK STALLION CONTRACTORS,
INC.

EL PASOQ, TX
BIDDER 1 OF 4

EL PASO A.R.C. ELECTRIC, INC.

EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 2 OF 4

GLOBE BUIL.DERS, LLC

EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 3 OF 4

- PRICE SCHEDULE : BASE BID 1IF maE
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'T:M Sﬂ UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT BRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE)
8. | 82 | EA FOUNDATION $924.00 $75,768.00 $1,171.50 $96,063.00 NO BID NO BID
$92,939.04
9. | 2,493 | LF BORING $33.00 $82,269.00 $37.28 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$92,926,58
$35,990.40
10. {14,996 LF TRENCHING AND BACKFILL $22.00 $329,912.00 $2.40 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID NO BID
$35,934.17

SUM TOTAL BASE BID (ITEMS 1 through 10)

$1,045,269.74

$1,259,508.00 CONTRACTOR'S PRICE NO BID
$1,045,421.99
MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM
TOTAL BASE BID 1) $62,000.00 $52,255.01 NO BID
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID AND MOBILIZATION) $1,321,509.00 >1.097,524.75 NO BID
— $1,097,377.00 .

SUM TOTAL BASE BID |, BASE BID Il AND BASE BID II $1,841,242.05 1,566,183.76 NO BID

AMENDMENTS NO. 1 ACKNOWLEDGED: YES YES YES

BID BOND SUBMITTED: YES YES YES

Approved By:
Date: i

2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES BID NO- 2016960
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MEDLOCK COMMERCIAL
CONTRACTORS, LLG
EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 4
UNIT PRICE SCHEDULE : BASE BID: o el e
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT
”5“" g?{, UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE (Gty x UNIT BRICE) PRICE {Gty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE)

ASPHALT AND BASE REMOVAL 6"-12" DEPTH
1. | 4870 | SY INCLUDES REMOVAL OF EXISTING STRIPING $9.24 $42,228.80

1.5" MILLING TRANSITION AND HMAC TYPE

2. 605 SY COVERPLAY $41.07 $24,847.35
P8 825 LF CURB & GUTTER REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL 5205 $1,691.25
4, 65 SY | CONCRETE SIDEWALK REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL $18.48 $1,201.20

NEW 2.5" (MIN} HMAC, TXDOT TYPE C PAVEMENT

5. 690 SY COMPLETE IN PLACE $23.62 $16,297.80
CONTROLLED LOW-STRENGTH MATERIAL (CLSM)
6. 695 SY 12" DEPTH COMPLETE IN PLACE $30.81 $21.412.85
7. 1 5335 | LF | NEW6" CURB AND GUTTER COMPLETE IN PLACE $15.66 $83,546.10
8 . sy NEW 4" CONCRETE SIDEWALK COMPLETE IN $71.88 $4.672.20
PLACE
NEW REFLECTIVE THERMOPLASTIC PAVEMENT
9. 310 LF MARKING TYPE ), 4" WHITE {SLD) AT $6.16 $1,909.60

DECELERATION LANE COMPLETE IN PLACE

Approved By:
Pate: 2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES Page 7 of 12



aﬂmnml of
(2
S

Frocuremants

3 2016 ﬂm.fm’d"}"\li't"'mer@-)u|

CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES BID NO: 2016-960
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MEDLOCK COMMERGIAL
CONTRACTORS, LLC
EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 4
;R|CE??._S_GHED_UEEEZEIET BASEBIDIi
o esr UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'TE el TN BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qty x UNIT PRICE} PRICE {Oty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE)
NEW CURB MARKING TYPE [, YELLOW (SLD) AT
0.1 235 | LF MEDIAN NOSE COMPLETE IN PLACE $6.67 $1,567.45
1.l 1 | Ls | TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL COMPLETE IN $18.483.00 $18.483.00
PLACE
i2.| 1 | Ls [SWPPPINSTALLATION & MANAGEMENT COMPLETE| ¢ ... o $2.772.45
IN PLACE
SUM TOTAL BASE BID 1 (ITEMS 1 through 12) $220,628.15
MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM $6.177.50
TOTAL BASE BID I) AL
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID | AND MOBILIZATION) $226,805.74

Approved, By:
Date: _&, 2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES Page 8 of 12
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING « JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
BID DATE: JULY 27, 20186

BID NO: 2016-960
DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

MEDLOGK COMMERCIAL
CONTRACTORS, LLG
EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 4
PRICE SCHEDULE : BASE BID/]

cer UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT

'TEM ooy | unim BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRIGE)
1. | 5,750 | SF ROCK DEMO & DISPOSAL - EXISTING $0.88 $5,060.00
2| & | EA TREE DEMO & DISPOSAL $1,700.68 $10,258.08
.| 8 | EA SHRUB DEMO & DISPOSAL $19.77 $1,621.14
4.1 a0 | Ea TREE PROTEGTION - EXISTING TREE $255.68 $10,227.20
5.1 101 | EA TREE INSTALLATION 4" CAL. $617.13 $62,330.13
6. | 940 | EA SHRUB INSTALLATION - 5G $20.02 $18,818.80
7. | 166 | EA SHRUB INSTALLATION - 1G $7.70 $1,278.20

Approved By:
Iz

Date:

2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING « JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016

BID NO: 2016-960

DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT

MEDLOCK COMMERCIAL
CONTRACTORS, LLC

EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 4
T PRICE SCHEDUEL: BASE BID. o
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'TEM gﬁ UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE {Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE)
8. |37,500] SF FRANKLIN RED GRAVEL $0.87 $32,625.00
9 1 | Ls IRRIGATION $24,222 01 $24,222.01
SUM TOTAL BASE BID Il (ITEMS 1 through 9) $166,440.56
MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM $4.660.34
TOTAL BASE BID II) AN
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID il AND MOBILIZATION) $171,100.90

Approved By:

Date: gSZ it

2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES
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CITY OF EL PASO
‘ 2016 Award Winn e i

BID TABULATION FORM

BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JONN HAYES BID NO: 2016-960
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MEDLOCK COMMERCIAL
CONTRACTORS, LLC
EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 4
TI'ERICE SCHEDULE : BASE Bl = . o

o UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
T b gﬂ, UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRIGE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE})

1.| 85 | EA 30" FLUTED POLE AND INSTALLATION $5,913.54 $502,650.90

2.1 170 | EA 120 LED LIGHT FIXTURE AND INSTALLATION $834.13 $141,802.10

3. [17,050| LF 2" PVC CONDUIT $16.64 $283,712.00

4 | s ;Er( WIRING #4 THHW AND #4 THHW GROUND $2,053.67 $16,429.36

5 | 45 ;'T( WIRING #6 THHW AND #6 THHW GROUND $513.42 $23,103.90

SERVICE POLE, ELECTRICAL SERVICE AND
.| 2 |EA SERVICE FEEPERS $6,766.84 $13,533.68
7.1 3 | EA GROUND BOX AND INSTALLATION $1,180.86 $3,542.58

Approved By:
Date: ¥/ ¢t /1 & 2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES Page 11 of 12
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BID TITLE: PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES BID NO: 2016.960
BID DATE: JULY 27, 2016 DEPARTMENT: CAPITAL IMPROVEMENT
MEDLOCK COMMERGIAL
CONTRACTORS, LLC
EL PASO, TX
BIDDER 4 OF 4
UNITPRICE SCHEDULE  BASEBID I e
UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT UNIT TOTAL AMOUNT
'T:M 2?1 UNIT BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF ITEM PRICE {Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE) PRICE (Qty x UNIT PRICE)
8. | a2 | Ea FOUNDATION $2,002.33 $164,191.06
9. | 2403 | LF BORING $30.29 $75,512.97
10. | 14,996 | LF TRENCHING AND BACKEILL $7.09 $106,321.64
SUM TOTAL BASE BID il (TEMS 1 through 10) $1,330,800.19
MOBILIZATION AND DEMOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 5% OF SUM 637 262.41
TOTAL BASE BID IIl) 1262,
SUM TOTAL (BASE BID It AND MOBILIZATION) $1,368,062.60
totiti T e o | o]
SUM TOTAL BASE BID i, BASE BID Il AND BASE BID II! $1,765,969.24
AMENDMENTS NO. 1 ACKNOWLEDGED: YES
BID BOND SUBMITTED: YES

Approved By:
Date: 1] 2016-960 PEBBLE HILLS ARTERIAL LIGHTING - JOE BATTLE TO JOHN HAYES Page 12 of 12



