
BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ___ % DISCOUNT     -  10   % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

1:   + _____  % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

11/1/2016

    GROUP 1:

    ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS

REFER TO EXCEPTIONS MOHAWK NET PRICE LIST                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST OFFER P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

X

X

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 1



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ___ % DISCOUNT     -  10   % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

2:   + _____  % MARKUP   +   0      % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

    GROUP 2:

    BODY COMPONENTS

MOHAWK NET PRICE LIST                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST OFFER P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

11/1/2016

REFER TO EXCEPTIONS

X

X

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 2



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ___ % DISCOUNT     -  10  % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

3:   + _____  % MARKUP   +         % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

          GROUP 3: 

          STEERING COMPONENETS

MOHAWK NET PRICE LIST                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST OFFER P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

11/1/2016

REFER TO EXCEPTIONS

X

X

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 3



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NET NET NET

ITEM     - ___ % DISCOUNT     -  10  % DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

4:   + _____  % MARKUP   +         % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

    GROUP 4:

    BRAKE COMPONENTS

MOHAWK NET PRICE LIST                   Price List or Catalog

PART A: PRICE LIST OFFER P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

ITEM DESCRIPTION
NET OR % DISCOUNT

11/1/2016

REFER TO EXCEPTIONS

X

X

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 4



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

NET NET NET

ITEM     - __% DISCOUNT     - 10% DISCOUNT     -____ % DISCOUNT

5.   + _____  % MARKUP   +      % MARKUP   +          % MARKUP

Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the

(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)

List Number_____________________

Dated__________________________

TYPE OF PRICE LIST

WHOLESALER

DISTRIBUTOR

JOBBER

DEALER

RETAILER

OTHER_____________________ __________ __________ __________

YES NO YES NO YES NO

YES NO YES NO YES NO

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

11/1/2016

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

MOHAWK NET PRICE LIST

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

                   Price List or Catalog

NET OR % DISCOUNT

OR MARKUP

PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING P R I C E     A D J U S T M E N T     F A C T O R

NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT

TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD)

O.E.M.    Certifications / Documentation submitted for

    GROUP 5:

    SUSPENSION COMPONENTS

ITEM DESCRIPTION
OR MARKUP

 

OR MARKUP

                           NABI / New Flyer / Thermo King / Carrier

REFER TO EXCEPTIONS

X

X

X

X

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 5



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 1 TOTAL:
$0.00 $462.22 $0.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

DESCRIPTION: PROXIMITY SWITCH NEW FLYER PROXIMITY SWITCH NEW FLYER PROXIMITY SWITCH NEW FLYER

122824 122824 122824

$313.70

DESCRIPTION: RAMP SWITCH NEW FLYER RAMP SWITCH NEW FLYER RAMP SWITCH NEW FLYER

33433

ALLEN BRADLEY 033433

DESCRIPTION: DIMMER SWITCH NEW FLYER DIMMER SWITCH NEW FLYER DIMMER SWITCH NEW FLYER

NO BID

DESCRIPTION:

508005 508005

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING GROUP 1: ELECTRICAL COMPONENTS

NO BID

6361891

5013754

NO BID $282.33

$179.89NO BID

BATTERY DISCONNECT SWITCH NABI

508005

33433

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

FAN CONTROLLER NABI

6361891

FAN CONTROLLER NABI

6361891

NO BID NO BID

$199.88

MOHAWK 5013754

NO BID NO BID

33433

BATTERY DISCONNECT SWITCH NABI

5013754

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BATTERY DISCONNECT SWITCH NABIDESCRIPTION:

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

FAN CONTROLLER NABI

5013754

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 6



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MOHAWK 052634

$33.63

$30.27NO BID

DESCRIPTION: PROP LOCKING CYLINDER NABI PROP LOCKING CYLINDER NABI PROP LOCKING CYLINDER NABI

52634 52634 52634

NO BID NO BID

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING GROUP 2: BODY COMPONENTS

DESCRIPTION: VALVE DUMP NABI VALVE DUMP NABI

$21.64

NO BID $19.48

DESCRIPTION: Q  STRAINT TIE DOWNS Q  STRAINT TIE DOWNS Q  STRAINT TIE DOWNS

Q-8101-F Q-8101-F Q-8101-F

DESCRIPTION: PANEL KIT, RH CONTROL NEW LIFT PANEL KIT, RH CONTROL NEW LIFT PANEL KIT, RH CONTROL NEW LIFT

NO BID NO BID

416.00.304.778 416.00.304.778

6344617

MOHAWK AC0108114

VALVE DUMP NABI

6344617 6344617

416.00.304.778

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 7



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

6. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

GROUP 2 TOTAL: $0.00 $49.75 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

DESCRIPTION: RAMP ASSY. NABI RAMP ASSY. NABI RAMP ASSY. NABI

633-8645 633-8645 633-8645

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING

DESCRIPTION: COVER EMERGENCY NEW FLYER COVER EMERGENCY NEW FLYER COVER EMERGENCY NEW FLYER

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

GROUP 2: BODY COMPONENTS

6329476 6329476 6329476

NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 8



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 1 TOTAL: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

341876 341876 341876

NO BID

DESCRIPTION: STEERLING COLUMN NEW FLYER STEERLING COLUMN NEW FLYER STEERLING COLUMN NEW FLYER

DESCRIPTION: DAMPER ASM NABI DAMPER ASM NABI DAMPER ASM NABI

336047 336047 336047

NO BID NO BID

5012727 5012727 5012727

NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: STEERING COUMN NABI STEERING COUMN NABI STEERING COUMN NABI

DESCRIPTION: PUMP HYDRAULIC & STEERING NEW FLYER PUMP HYDRAULIC & STEERING NEW FLYER PUMP HYDRAULIC & STEERING NEW FLYER

489605 489605 489605

NO BID NO BID

5012727 5012727 5012727

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING GROUP 3: STEERING COMPONENETS

DESCRIPTION: STEERING COLUMN NABI STEERING COLUMN NABI STEERING COLUMN NABI

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 9



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 1 TOTAL:
$0.00 $201.01 $0.00

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

$122.81

NO BID $110.53

6335561 6335561 6335561

HALDEX 6335561

NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: SLACK ADJUSTER NEW FLYER SLACK ADJUSTER NEW FLYER SLACK ADJUSTER NEW FLYER

DESCRIPTION: SLACK ADJUSTER NABI SLACK ADJUSTER NABI SLACK ADJUSTER NABI

6337676 6337676 6337676

$100.53

NO BID $90.48

6318797 6318797 6318797

MERITOR 6318797

NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: CAMSHAFT NABI CAMSHAFT NABI CAMSHAFT NABI

DESCRIPTION: BRAKE CHAMBER NABI BRAKE CHAMBER NABI BRAKE CHAMBER NABI

6900914 6900914 6900914

NO BID NO BID

397910 397910 397910

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING GROUP 4: BRAKE COMPONENTS

DESCRIPTION: BRAKE CHAMBER NEW FLYER BRAKE CHAMBER NEW FLYER BRAKE CHAMBER NEW FLYER

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 10



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

1. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

2. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

3. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

4. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

ITEM MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

5. BIDDER'S PART NUMBER & MANUFACTURER:

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET:          

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

GROUP 1 TOTAL: $0.00 $503.21 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

BIDDER'S PRICE

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

498171 498171 498171

NO BID NO BID

DESCRIPTION: SHOCK ABSORBER NEW FLYER SHOCK ABSORBER NEW FLYER SHOCK ABSORBER NEW FLYER

DESCRIPTION: BELLOWS NABI BELLOWS NABI BELLOWS NABI

1R11266 1R11266 1R11266

$157.64

NO BID $151.88

902184 902184 902184

KONI 90-2184

NO BID $351.33

DESCRIPTION: SHOCK ABSORBER KONI SHOCK ABSORBER KONI SHOCK ABSORBER KONI

MERITOR 6329846

$390.37

DESCRIPTION: TIE ROD NEW FLYER TIE ROD NEW FLYER TIE ROD NEW FLYER

6329846 6329846 6329846

NO BID NO BID

BXSV1468 BXSV1468 BXSV1468

PART B:  SAMPLE PRICING GROUP 5: SUSPENSION COMPONENTS

DESCRIPTION: LEVELING VALVE NABI LEVELING VALVE NABI LEVELING VALVE NABI

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 11



BID ITEM:   BUS COMPONENT PARTS BID # 2017-411

DEPARTMENT:  MASS TRANSIT (SUN METRO)

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION

TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE

CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD

NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS 

CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS 

BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE 

CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND. 

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE

TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),

IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION

OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

Within ___ consecutive calendar days

Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of 

verbal order in cases of emergency.

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL.  A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

BIDS SOLICITED:   17      LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED:    1      BIDS RECEIVED:        2       LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED:        0         NO BID:  0

BID DATE:   NOVEMBER 2, 2016

NO OPTION OFFERED.

CITY OF EL PASO

 BID TABULATION

NET - 30 DAYS

THE AFTERMARKET PARTS 

COMPANY, LLC

DELAWARE, OH

NET - 30 DAYS

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

PAYMENT TERMS:

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

MOHAWK MFG & SUPPLY CO

NILES, IL

24 - 48 24 - 48

BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:
7 7

X X

APPROVED BY: _____/s/__________

DATE: ___11/9/16_______  2017-411 BUS COMPONENET PARTS - MASS TRANSIT 12


