hievement of

CITY OF EL PASO d =
BID TABU LATION 2016 Award Winnér i
BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE BID # 2017-487
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016 DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT
BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP | - HARLEY DAVIDSON (Did not submit a bid, only a letter)
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION — — —
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET  [X] NeT ] NET ]
ITEM HARLEY DAVIDSON MOTORCYCLES PARTS -__%nDiscount [ ] -__%DISCOUNT  [] - %oiscount  []
1: + %MARKUP || + % MARKUP ] + % MARKUP L]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
__ Price List or Catalog NO BID
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number
Dated
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER L] L] L]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ] ]
RETAILER L] L] L]
OTHER M M ]
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES NO YES NO YES NO
INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE. D D D D D

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

hievement of

celllnce

In Procurement:

2016 Award Winnér i

4

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE

BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BID # 2017-487

DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

GROUP | - HARLEY DAVIDSON

RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC
EL PASO, TX

VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC
EL PASO, TX

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

PART B: INSTALLATION SERVICE RATES - HARLEY DAVIDSON

SHOP BILLING RATE
REGULAR HOURS $90.00 per hour $0.00 per hour $0.00 per hour
AFTER HOURS/WEEKENDS/ HOLIDAYS $90.00 per hour $0.00 per hour $0.00 per hour
LABOR GUIDE USED / YEAR BIKES OLDER THAN 5 YEARS ONE TIME AND NO BID

MATERIAL

SOFTWARE NAME / VERSION OR CATALOG LINK:

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - HARLEY DAVIDSON

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

HARLEY-DAVIDSON #68572-64B SIGNAL

HARLEY-DAVIDSON #68572-64B SIGNAL

HARLEY-DAVIDSON #68572-64B SIGNAL

DIRECTIONAL DIRECTIONAL DIRECTIONAL
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

1. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $2.00 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $2.00 NOBID $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B
REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $92.00 $0.00

. HARLEY-DAVIDSON #65324-83B HARLEY-DAVIDSON #65324-83B HARLEY-DAVIDSON #65324-83B
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: EXHAUST DEAL EXHAUST DEAL EXHAUST DEAL
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 415896

2. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $4.79 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $4.79 NOBID $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B
REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $94.79 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

hievement of

celle

In Procurement:

2016 Award Winnér [

(

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BID # 2017-487

DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

GROUP | - HARLEY DAVIDSON

RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC
EL PASO, TX

VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC
EL PASO, TX

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - HARLEY DAVIDSON

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

HARLEY-DAVIDSON #65989-97C

HARLEY-DAVIDSON #65989-97C BATTERY

HARLEY-DAVIDSON #65989-97C BATTERY

BATTERY SEALED 19AH SEALED 19AH SEALED 19AH
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 581318
3. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $117.95 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET: $117.95 NO BID $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B $90.00 $0.00
REGULAR RATE) ' )
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $207.95 $0.00
] HARLEY-DAVIDSON #25416-99C DERBY | HARLEY-DAVIDSON #25416-99C DERBY | HARLEY-DAVIDSON #25416-99C DERBY
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: COVER CLUTCH GASKET COVER CLUTCH GASKET COVER CLUTCH GASKET
ITEM (BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 047510
4. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $5.10 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET: $5.10 NO BID $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B
REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $95.10 $0.00
$489.84 NO BID $0.00

GROUP 1 ITEMS (1-4) TOTAL COST

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

hievement of

celle

In Procurement:

2016 Award Winnér [

(

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE

BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BID # 2017-487

DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

GROUP | - HARLEY DAVIDSON

RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC
EL PASO, TX

VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC
EL PASO, TX

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

PART D: SCHEDULED MAINTENANCE - HARLEY DAVIDSON

OIL /FILTER CHANGE FOR HARLEY

OIL /FILTER CHANGE FOR HARLEY

OIL /FILTER CHANGE FOR HARLEY

SERVICE DESCRIPTION: DAVIDSON MOTORCYCLES DAVIDSON MOTORCYCLES DAVIDSON MOTORCYCLES
ITEM |MILEAGE TIME: 2,500 MILES SERVICE 2,500 MILES SERVICE 2,500 MILES SERVICE
1. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 36 EACH 36 EACH 36 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $189.95 $0.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $6,838.20 NO BID $0.00
SERVICE)
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $20,514.60 $0.00
(2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS || (2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS || (2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS
SERVICE DESCRIPTION: AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP* FOR||AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP* FOR| AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP* FOR
HARLEY DAVIDSON MOTORCYCLES | HARLEY DAVIDSON MOTORCYCLES HARLEY DAVIDSON MOTORCYCLES
ITEM |MILEAGE TIME: 5,000 MILES SERVICE 5,000 MILES SERVICE 5,000 MILES SERVICE
2. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 18 EACH 18 EACH 18 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $300.00 $0.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $5.400.00 NO BID $0.00
SERVICE)
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $16,200.00 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO

BID TABULATION

hievement of

celloce

In Procurement:

2016 Award Winnér

G

@i

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE

BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BID # 2017-487
DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

GROUP | - HARLEY DAVIDSON

RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC
EL PASO, TX

VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC
EL PASO, TX

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

PART D: SCHEDULED MAINTENANCE - HARLEY DAVIDSON

(5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS
REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR

(5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS
REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR

(5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS
REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR

SERVICE DESCRIPTION: SPROCKET FOR HARLEY DAVIDSON SPROCKET FOR HARLEY DAVIDSON SPROCKET FOR HARLEY DAVIDSON
MOTORCYCLES MOTORCYCLES MOTORCYCLES
ITEM [MILEAGE TIME: 15,000 MILES SERVICE 15,000 MILES SERVICE 15,000 MILES SERVICE
3. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 18 EACH 18 EACH 18 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $1,580.50 $0.00
lg};l'\fl«(l:.El;«NNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $28.449.00 NO BID $0.00
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $85,347.00 $0.00
TOTA(I:_ S\SNTNUAL $40,687.20 TOTA(I:_ g«SNTNUAL NO BID TOTA(I:_ (;\SNTNUAL $0.00
GROUP | TOTAL COST PART D - HARLEY DAVIDSON
TOTAL 3 YEAR COST $122,061.60 TOTAL 3 YEAR COST NO BID TOTAL 3 YEAR COST $0.00
GROUP | TOTAL COST $122,551.44 NO BID $0.00

(PARTS C & D *USE 3 YEAR COST) - HARLEY DAVIDSON

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVE

D BY: Isl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

hievement of

celllnce

In Procurement:

2016 Award Winnér i

4

INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.

[ ]

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE BID # 2017-487
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016 DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT
BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il - KAWASAKI (Did not submit a bid, only a letter)
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT NET OR % DISCOUNT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR % OR % OR %
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET [X] NET ] NET ]
TEM KAWASAKI MOTOR PARTS - %piscount  [] - % DISCOUNT ] - %DiscoUNT [ ]
1: + %MARKUP || + cosT 20% MARKUP + % MARKUP L]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog KAWASAKI
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number 10032
Dated 11/15/16
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] [x] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER ] ] ]
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES NO YES NO YES NO

[ ]

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE



CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

hievement of

cellence

In Procurement®

2016 Award Winnér i

¢

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BID # 2017-487
DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

GROUP Il - KAWASAKI

RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC
EL PASO, TX

VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC
EL PASO, TX

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

PART B: INSTALLATION SERVICE RATES - KAWASAKI

SHOP BILLING RATE
REGULAR HOURS $90.00 per hour $70.00 per hour $0.00 per hour
AFTER HOURS/WEEKENDS/ HOLIDAYS $90.00 per hour $70.00 per hour $0.00 per hour
LABOR GUIDE USED / YEAR TIME & MATERIAL SERVICE MANAGER PRO 2.0/2016

SOFTWARE NAME / VERSION OR CATALOG LINK:

https://lwww.servicemanagerpro.com

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - KAWASAKI

ITEM

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

KAWASAKI #16099-003 FILTER OIL

KAWASAKI #16099-003 FILTER OIL

KAWASAKI #16099-003 FILTER OIL

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 140404

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $5.18 $5.09 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $5.18 $6.11 $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B

REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $95.18 $76.11 $0.00

ITEM

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

KAWASAKI #BR7ES SPARK PLUG

KAWASAKI #BR7ES SPARK PLUG

KAWASAKI #BR7ES SPARK PLUG

BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 380035

PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $3.13 $1.50 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $3.13 $1.80 $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B

REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $93.13 $71.80 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE



https://www.servicemanagerpro.com/#

hievement of

cellorce

In Procurement:

CITY OF EL PASO ‘

BID TABU LATION 2016 Award Winnér @
BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE BID # 2017-487
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016 DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT!
BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il - KAWASAKI (Did not submit a bid, only a letter)
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - KAWASAKI
. KAWASAKI #13156-4001 KAWASAKI #13156-4001 KAWASAKI #13156-4001
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: LEVER GEAR LEVER GEAR LEVER GEAR
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 13156-4001
3. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $41.95 $20.63 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET: $41.95 $24.76 $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B
REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $131.95 $94.76 $0.00
. KAWASAKI #14026-1202 KAWASAKI #14026-1202 KAWASAKI #14026-1202
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: CHAIN COVER CHAIN COVER CHAIN COVER
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER: 14026-1202
4. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $166.95 $107.12 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $166.95 $128.54 $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B

REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $256.95 $198.54 $0.00
GROUP 1 ITEMS (1-4) TOTAL COST $577.21 $441.21 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16 2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE 8




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

ichievement of

cettence
In Procurement

2016 Award Winnér

(

i

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE BID # 2017-487
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016 DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT
BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
Did not submit a bid, only a letter
GROUP Il - KAWASAKI (A6 bl i kil 2 feter
PART D: SCHEDULED MAINTENANCE - KAWASAKI
] OIL / FILTER CHANGE FOR OIL / FILTER CHANGE FOR OIL / FILTER CHANGE FOR
SERVICE DESCRIPTION: KAWASAKI MOTORCYCLES KAWASAKI MOTORCYCLES KAWASAKI MOTORCYCLES
ITEM |MILEAGE TIME: 2,500 MILES SERVICE 2,500 MILES SERVICE 2,500 MILES SERVICE
1. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 36 EACH 36 EACH 36 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $179.95 $187.50 $0.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $6,478.20 $6.750.00 $0.00
SERVICE)
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $19,434.60 $20,250.00 $0.00
(2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS || (2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS || (2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS
SERVICE DESCRIPTION: AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP* AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP* AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP*
FOR MOTORCYCLES FOR MOTORCYCLES FOR MOTORCYCLES
ITEM |[MILEAGE TIME: 5,000 MILES SERVICE 5,000 MILES SERVICE 5,000 MILES SERVICE
2. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 18 EACH 18 EACH 18 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $300.00 $733.37 $0.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $5,400.00 $13,200.66 $0.00
SERVICE)
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $16,200.00 $39,601.98 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE




hievement of

celloce

In Procurement:

CITY OF EL PASO ‘

BID TABU LATION 2016 Award Winnér I
BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE BID # 2017-487
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016 DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT,
BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
Did not submit a bid, only a letter
GROUP I - KAWASAKI ( v alettor)
PART D: SCHEDULED MAINTENANCE - KAWASAKI
(5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS (5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS (5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS
SERVICE DESCRIPTION: REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR
SPROCKET FOR KAWASAKI MOTORCYCLES SPROCKET FOR KAWASAKI MOTORCYCLES SPROCKET FOR KAWASAKI MOTORCYCLES
ITEM |MILEAGE TIME: 15,000 MILES SERVICE 15,000 MILES SERVICE 15,000 MILES SERVICE
3. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 18 EACH 18 EACH 18 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $1,295.00 $929.37 $0.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $23.310.00 $16.728.66 $0.00
SERVICE)
BIDDER'S PRICE $23,319.00
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $69,930.00 $50,185.98 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE $69,957.00
TOTAL ANNUAL $35,188.20 TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
COST ‘ BIDDER'S PRICE COST $36’679'32 COST $0'00
GROUP I TOTAL COST PART D - KAWASAKI $1§;§’;Z"60
TOTAL3YEARCOST|  piocrsprce | TOTAL3YEARCOST  $110,037.96 | TOTAL 3 YEAR COST $0.00
‘ $105,591.60
GI}OUP | TOTAL COST $106,141.81 $110,479.17 $0.00
(PARTS C & D *USE 3 YEAR COST) - KAWASAKI BIDDER'S PRICE $106,168.81

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16 2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE 10




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

hievement of

celloce

In Procurement:

2016 Award Winnér [

(

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE BID # 2017-487
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016 DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT
BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP Il - YAMAHA (Did not submit a bid, only a letter)
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR
NET OR % DI NT NET OR % DI NT NET OR % DI NT
ITEM DESCRIPTION OR % DISCOU OR % DISCOU OR % DISCOU
OR MARKUP OR MARKUP OR MARKUP
NET  [x] NET (] NET [ ]
ITEM YAMAHA MOTORCYCLES PARTS - %DISCOUNT || - % DISCOUNT ] - %pDISCOUNT [ ]
1: + %MARKUP [ | + cOST 20% MARKUP + % MARKUP L]
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the
Price List or Catalog YAMAHA
(MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)
List Number 343120
Dated 11/15/16
TYPE OF PRICE LIST
WHOLESALER ] ] ]
DISTRIBUTOR ] ] ]
JOBBER ] ] ]
DEALER ] ]
RETAILER ] ] ]
OTHER |:| |:| |:|
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) YES NO YES NO YES NO
INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE. [x] [] [X] ] L] ]

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE

11




CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION

hievement of

celllnce

In Procarement:

2016 Award Winnér I

(

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BID # 2017-487

DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

GROUP lll - YAMAHA

RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC
EL PASO, TX

VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC
EL PASO, TX

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

PART B: INSTALLATION SERVICE RATES - YAMAHA

SHOP BILLING RATE
REGULAR HOURS $90.00 per hour $70.00 per hour $0.00 per hour
AFTER HOURS/WEEKENDS/ HOLIDAYS $90.00 per hour $70.00 per hour $0.00 per hour
LABOR GUIDE USED / YEAR TIME AND MATERIAL SERVICE MANAGER PRO 2.0/2016

SOFTWARE NAME / VERSION OR CATALOG LINK:

https://lwww.servicemanagerpro.com

PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - YAMAHA

DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:

YAMAHA #3P6-2581T-01-00

YAMAHA #3P6-2581T-01-00

YAMAHA #3P6-2581T-01-00

DISC BRAKE ASSY DISC BRAKE ASSY DISC BRAKE ASSY
ITEM (BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

1. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $244.25 $115.93 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $244.25 $139.12 $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B
REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $334.25 $209.12 $0.00

. YAMAHA #3P6-W0045-00-00 YAMAHA #3P6-W0045-00-00 YAMAHA #3P6-W0045-00-00
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: BRAKE PAD KIT BRAKE PAD KIT BRAKE PAD KIT
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

2. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $60.99 $32.86 $0.00
CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $60.99 $38.86 $0.00
LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B
REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $150.99 $108.86 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
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CITY OF EL PASO ‘
BID TABULATION |

BID # 2017-487
DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
GROUP III- YAMAHA (Did not submit a bid, only a letter)
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING - YAMAHA
. YAMAHA #1MC-12420-01-00 YAMAHA #1MC-12420-01-00 YAMAHA #1MC-12420-01-00
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: WATER PUMP ASSY WATER PUMP ASSY WATER PUMP ASSY
ITEM |BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

3. |PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $188.99 $89.58 $0.00

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /IMARK-UP) or NET: $188.99 $107.50 $0.00

LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B

REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00

TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $278.99 $177.50 $0.00

. YAMAHA #2H7-16325-00-00 YAMAHA #2H7-16325-00-00 YAMAHA #2H7-16325-00-00
DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER: CLUTCH PLATE CLUTCH PLATE CLUTCH PLATE
ITEM (BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:

4. PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP): $13.25 ea $6.17 $0.00

CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP) or NET: $13.25 ea $7.40 $0.00

LABOR COST (ASSUME ONE (1) HOUR LABOR FROM PART B

REGULAR RATE) $90.00 $70.00 $0.00

TOTAL COST (City's Cost + Labor Cost): $103.25 $77.40 $0.00

BIDDER'S PRICE $156.25
. $867.48 $572.88 $0.00
GROUP 1 ITEMS (1-4) TOTAL COST BIDDER'S PRICE $920.48

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.

The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
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BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE

BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BID # 2017-487

DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

GROUP lll - YAMAHA

RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC
EL PASO, TX

VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC
EL PASO, TX

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

PART D: SCHEDULED MAINTENANCE - YAMAHA

SERVICE DESCRIPTION:

OIL / FILTER CHANGE FOR YAMAHA

OIL / FILTER CHANGE FOR YAMAHA

OIL / FILTER CHANGE FOR YAMAHA

MOTORCYCLES MOTORCYCLES MOTORCYCLES
ITEM |[MILEAGE TIME: 2,500 MILES SERVICE 2,500 MILES SERVICE 2,500 MILES SERVICE
1. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 36 EACH 36 EACH 36 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $179.95 $252.19 $0.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $6,478.20 $9,078.84 $0.00
SERVICE)
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $19,434.60 $27,236.52 $0.00
(2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS | (2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS | (2,500 MILE SERVICE SEE ITEM#1) PLUS
SERVICE DESCRIPTION: AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP* AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP* AIR FILTER CHANGE WITH TUNE UP*
FOR MOTORCYCLES FOR MOTORCYCLES FOR MOTORCYCLES
ITEM |MILEAGE TIME: 5,000 MILES SERVICE 5,000 MILES SERVICE 5,000 MILES SERVICE
2. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 18 EACH 18 EACH 18 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $300.00 $889.95 $0.00
lgg\fl«cl:.El;«NNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $5,400.00 $16,019.10 $0.00
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $16,200.00 $48,057.30 $0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
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CITY OF EL PASO ‘
BID TABULATION

BID # 2017-487
DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT

BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016

BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX
Did not submit a bid, only a letter
GROUP IIl - YAMAHA ( v alettor)
PART D: SCHEDULED MAINTENANCE - YAMAHA
(5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS (5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS (5,000 MILE SERVICE, SEE ITEM #2) PLUS
SERVICE DESCRIPTION: REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR REPLACE CHAIN, REPLACE FRONT & REAR
SPROCKET FOR YAMAHA MOTORCYCLES SPROCKET FOR YAMAHA MOTORCYCLES SPROCKET FOR YAMAHA MOTORCYCLES
ITEM [MILEAGE TIME: 15,000 MILES SERVICE 15,000 MILES SERVICE 15,000 MILES SERVICE
3. |ANNUAL QUANTITY: 18 EACH 18 EACH 18 EACH
TOTAL COST PER SERVICE: $1,295.50 $1,096.45 $0.00
TOTAL ANNUAL COST (QUANTITY X TOTAL COST PER $23.319.00 $19,736.10 $0.00
SERVICE)
BIDDER'S PRICE $23,310.00
TOTAL 3-YEAR COST (ANNUAL COST X 3) $69,957.00 $59,208.30 $0.00
BIDDER'S PRICE $69,930.00
TOTAL ANNUAL $35,197.20 TOTAL ANNUAL TOTAL ANNUAL
COST BIDDER'S PRICE COST $44,834.04 COST $0.00
GROUP Ill TOTAL COST PART D - YAMAHA ; 133;"5“;-12‘;0
TOTAL3 YEARCOST  gpooersprice | TOTAL3YEARCOST — $134,502.12 | TOTAL 3 YEAR COST $0.00
$105,564.60
GR?UP Il TOTAL COST $106,459.08 $135,075.00 $0.00
(PARTS C & D *USE 3 YEAR COST) - YAMAHA BIDDER'S PRICE 'NO BID'

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
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hievement of

CITY OF EL PASO ‘ el
In?rotle-em:
BID TABULATION B 2016 Award Winnér [
BID ITEM: POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE BID # 2017-487
BID DATE: NOVEMBER 16, 2016 DEPARTMENT: STREETS & MAINTENANCE DEPT!
BARNETT HARLEY-DAVIDSON
RIO GRANDE SHOVELHEADS LLC VIVA POWERSPORTS LLC EL PASO, TX
EL PASO, TX EL PASO, TX

(Did not submit a bid, only a letter)

OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT

THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION
TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE
CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD
NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS
CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS
BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE

CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.

BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE
TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:

TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S),
IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION
OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.

High

NO OPTION OFFERED. [ ] [ ]
PAYMENT TERMS: NET - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS
BIDS SOLICITED: 14 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 2 BIDS RECEIVED: 3 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 3 NOBID: 0

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl

DATE: 12/1/16

2017-487 POLICE MOTORCYCLES PARTS, SERVICE, AND MAINTENANCE
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