



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED** **BID # 2017-584**  
**BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX	C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC ALTERNATIVE EL PASO, TX	DARDEN PETROLEUM AND ENERGY SOLUTIONS, LLC MARIETTA, GA
<b>GROUP 1: UNLEADED FUEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
<b>ITEM 1:</b>	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>
		+ <u>.1406</u> % MARKUP per Gallon	+ <u>.1215</u> % MARKUP per Gallon	+ <u>.30</u> % MARKUP per Gallon
		- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED EXCISE TAX .1830 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .0019238 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 1.70000	FED EXCISE TAX .1830 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .0019238 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 1.70000	<b>STATE EXCEISE TAX .20</b>  <b>FEDERAL TAX .1840</b>
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
<b>ITEM 2:</b>	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>
		+ <u>.1406</u> % MARKUP per Gallon	+ <u>.1215</u> % MARKUP per Gallon	+ <u>.25</u> % MARKUP per Gallon
		- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED EXCISE TAX .1830 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .0019238 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 3.40000	FED EXCISE TAX .1830 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .0019238 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 3.40000	<b>STATE EXCEISE TAX .20</b>  <b>FEDERAL TAX .1840</b>
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
<b>ITEM 3:</b>	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>
		+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon	+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon	+ <u>.05</u> % MARKUP per Gallon
		- <u>.0375</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	- <u>.0565</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED EXCISE TAX .1830 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .0019238 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 5.45000	FED EXCISE TAX .1830 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .0019238 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 5.45000	<b>STATE EXCEISE TAX .20</b>  <b>FEDERAL TAX .1840</b>

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     /isl    

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED		BID # 2017-584		
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017		DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE		
		C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX	C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC ALTERNATIVE EL PASO, TX	DARDEN PETROLEUM AND ENERGY SOLUTIONS, LLC MARIETTA, GA
GROUP 2: ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 - DELIVERY QUANTITIES		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 1:	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>.1250</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>.0864</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>.30</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		FED EXCISE TAX .24300 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 1.70000	FED EXCISE TAX .24300 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 1.70000	<u>STATE EXCEISE TAX .20</u> <u>FEDERAL TAX .2440</u>
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 2:	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>.0025</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>.0411</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>.25</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		FED EXCISE TAX .24300 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 3.45000	FED EXCISE TAX .24300 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 3.45000	<u>STATE EXCEISE TAX .20</u> <u>FEDERAL TAX .2440</u>
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 3:	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>.0249</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>.0653</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>.05</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		FED EXCISE TAX .24300 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 5.45000	FED EXCISE TAX .24300 FED LUST TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 5.45000	<u>STATE EXCEISE TAX .20</u> <u>FEDERAL TAX .2440</u>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:   /  sl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED</b> <b>BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017</b>		<b>BID # 2017-584</b> <b>DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE</b>								
		<b>C &amp; R DISTRIBUTING, LLC</b> EL PASO, TX		<b>C &amp; R DISTRIBUTING, LLC</b> ALTERNATIVE EL PASO, TX		<b>DARDEN PETROLEUM AND</b> <b>ENERGY SOLUTIONS, LLC</b> MARIETTA, GA				
<b>GROUP 3: RED- DYED DIESEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>										
<b>ITEM</b>		<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>		<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>		<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>				
<b>1:</b>	UP TO 300 TO 400 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	+ <u>.250</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ <u>.210</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ <u>.50</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon						
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED EXCISE TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 1.70000		FED EXCISE TAX .00100 FED FOSF .002138 TX STATE TAX .20000 TX LOADING FEE 1.70000		<b>FEDERAL EXISE TAX .2440</b> _____				
<b>OPTION:</b>										
<b>VENDOR AGREES TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENT ENTITIES          TO PURCHASE OFF OF THIS BID IN A ESTIMATED QUANTITY OF          1,470,000 GALLONS (570,000 GALLONS DIESEL AND 900,000          GALLONS UNLEADED) PER YEAR.</b>		<b>YES</b> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>	<b>YES</b> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>	<b>YES</b> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:   /  sl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED</b> <b>BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017</b>		<b>BID # 2017-584</b> <b>DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE</b>	
	<b>C &amp; R DISTRIBUTING, LLC</b> <b>EL PASO, TX</b>	<b>C &amp; R DISTRIBUTING, LLC</b> <b>ALTERNATIVE</b> <b>EL PASO, TX</b>	<b>DARDEN PETROLEUM AND</b> <b>ENERGY SOLUTIONS, LLC</b> <b>MARIETTA, GA</b>
<b><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></b>  THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.  BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
<b>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.</b>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
<b>NO OPTION OFFERED.</b>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>	<b>.0025% - 10 DAYS</b>	<b>.0025% - 10 DAYS</b>	<b>.0075% - 10 DAYS</b> <b>.0050% - 20 DAYS</b> <b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>
<b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b> <b>Within ___ consecutive calendar days</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>2</b>	<b>1</b>
<b>Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.</b>	<b>48</b>	<b>48</b>	<b>10</b>
<small>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</small>			

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     / s/    

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED** **BID # 2017-584**  
**BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM	DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE	IPC (USA), INC SANTA ANA, CA
<b>GROUP 1: UNLEADED FUEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 1:	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0395</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0595</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>0.4766</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL: FET.183 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	FEDERAL: FET.183 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	SEE ATTACHED MATRIX
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 2:	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0697</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0897</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0482</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL: FET.183 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	FEDERAL: FET.183 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	SEE ATTACHED MATRIX
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 3:	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.1000</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.1200</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0482</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL: FET.183 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	FEDERAL: FET.183 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	SEE ATTACHED MATRIX

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     /s/    

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED</b>		<b>BID # 2017-584</b>		
<b>BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017</b>		<b>DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE</b>		
		<b>DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM</b>	<b>DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE</b>	<b>IPC (USA), INC SANTA ANA, CA</b>
<b>GROUP 2: ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>		<b>Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries</b>		
<b>ITEM 1:</b>	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>0.0105</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0105</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>0.1958</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL: FET.243 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	FEDERAL: FET.243 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	<b>SEE ATTACHED MATRIX</b>
		<b>Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries</b>		
<b>ITEM 2:</b>	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0392</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0592</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0331</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL: FET.243 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	FEDERAL: FET.243 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	<b>SEE ATTACHED MATRIX</b>
		<b>Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries</b>		
<b>ITEM 3:</b>	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0479</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0679</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0302</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL: FET.243 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	FEDERAL: FET.243 (EXEMPT) LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: TEXAS SET .20 PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)	<b>SEE ATTACHED MATRIX</b>

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     /isl    

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED		BID # 2017-584								
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017		DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE								
		DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM		DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE		IPC (USA), INC SANTA ANA, CA				
GROUP 3: RED- DYED DIESEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES										
ITEM		SUPPLIER'S FEE:		SUPPLIER'S FEE:		SUPPLIER'S FEE:				
1:	UP TO 300 TO 400 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	+ <b>0.2900</b> % MARKUP per Gallon		+ <b>0.2700</b> % MARKUP per Gallon		+ <b>NO BID</b> % MARKUP per Gallon				
		- ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon		- ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon		- <b>NO BID</b> % DISCOUNT per Gallon				
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		FEDERAL: LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)		FEDERAL: LUST .001 OIL SPILL .00214 STATE: PPDF .0009 (ALL TAXES PER GALLON)		SEE ATTACHED MATRIX				
OPTION:										
VENDOR AGREES TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENT ENTITIES TO PURCHASE OFF OF THIS BID IN A ESTIMATED QUANTITY OF 1,470,000 GALLONS (570,000 GALLONS DIESEL AND 900,000 GALLONS UNLEADED) PER YEAR.		YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		NO <input type="checkbox"/>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:   isl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED** **BID # 2017-584**  
**BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

	DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM	DESERT FUELS, INC. ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE	IPC (USA), INC SANTA ANA, CA
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u>            THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.            BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED.</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p><b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b></p>	0.5% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS	0.5% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS
<p><b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b>            Within ___ consecutive calendar days</p>	24 HOURS	24 HOURS	1 TO 2
<p>Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.</p>	2 HOURS	2 HOURS	6 TO 8
<p><small>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</small></p>			

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     / s/    

DATE:   2/21/17





# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED		BID # 2017-584		
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017		DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE		
		INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC GAINSVILLE, GA	JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS, LLC ASHLAND, VA	MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINSVILLE, INC GAINSVILLE, GA
<b>GROUP 1: UNLEADED FUEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 1:	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <b>0.1558</b> % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED LUST .001, FED OIL SPILL .00171 TX EXCISE .20, TX LOADING FEE - VARIES BY AMOUNT	_____ _____	FEDERAL LUST 0.001/GALLON FEDERAL OIL SPILL 0.0019/ GALLON TX MOTOR FUEL 0.20/GALLON
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 2:	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <b>0.0207</b> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED LUST .001, FED OIL SPILL .00171 TX EXCISE .20, TX LOADING FEE - VARIES BY AMOUNT	_____ _____	LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 3:	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <b>0.0207</b> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED LUST .001, FED OIL SPILL .00171 TX EXCISE .20, TX LOADING FEE - VARIES BY AMOUNT	_____ _____	LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:     /isl    

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED		BID # 2017-584		
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017		DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE		
		INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC GAINSVILLE, GA	JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS, LLC ASHLAND, VA	MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINSVILLE, INC GAINESVILLE, GA
GROUP 2: ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 - DELIVERY QUANTITIES		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 1:	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <u>+ 0.1021% MARKUP</u> per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <u>+ 0.046 % MARKUP</u> per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <u>+0.2158% MARKUP</u> per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED LUST .001, FED OIL SPILL .0019 TX EXCISE .20, TX LOADING FEE - VARIES BY AMOUNT	FED LUST: 0.001 FED OIL SPILL: 0.00214 TX DELIVERY FEE: 0.00087	FEDERAL LUST 0.001/GALLON FEDERAL OIL SPILL 0.0021/ GALLON TX MOTOR FUEL 0.20/GALLON
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 2:	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <u>+0.0060 % MARKUP</u> per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <u>+ 0.026 % MARKUP</u> per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <u>+0.1158 % MARKUP</u> per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED LUST .001, FED OIL SPILL .0019 TX EXCISE .20, TX LOADING FEE - VARIES BY AMOUNT	FED LUST: 0.001 FED OIL SPILL: 0.00214 TX DELIVERY FEE: 0.00087	FEDERAL LUST 0.001/GALLON FEDERAL OIL SPILL 0.0021/ GALLON TX MOTOR FUEL 0.20/GALLON
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 3:	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon <u>- .0197 % DISCOUNT</u> per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon <u>- 0.0165 % DISCOUNT</u> 1 per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon <u>-0.0267 % DISCOUNT</u> 1 per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FED LUST .001, FED OIL SPILL .0019 TX EXCISE .20, TX LOADING FEE - VARIES BY AMOUNT	FED LUST: 0.001 FED OIL SPILL: 0.00214 TX DELIVERY FEE: 0.00087	FEDERAL LUST 0.001/GALLON FEDERAL OIL SPILL 0.0021/ GALLON TX MOTOR FUEL 0.20/GALLON

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:   /  sl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED		BID # 2017-584								
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017		DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE								
		INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC GAINSVILLE, GA		JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS, LLC ASHLAND, VA		MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINSVILLE, INC GAINESVILLE, GA				
GROUP 3: RED- DYED DIESEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES										
ITEM 1:	UP TO 300 TO 400 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	SUPPLIER'S FEE:		SUPPLIER'S FEE:		SUPPLIER'S FEE:				
		+ <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP	per Gallon	+ _____ % MARKUP	per Gallon	+ 0.3224% MARKUP	per Gallon			
		- <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT	per Gallon	- <u>0.0550</u> % DISCOUNT	per Gallon	- _____ % DISCOUNT	per Gallon			
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		_____		FED LUST: 0.001 FED OIL SPILL: 0.00214 TX DELIVERY FEE: 0.00087		FEDERAL LUST 0.001/GALLON FEDERAL OIL SPILL 0.0021/ GALLON				
OPTION:										
VENDOR AGREES TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENT ENTITIES TO PURCHASE OFF OF THIS BID IN A ESTIMATED QUANTITY OF 1,470,000 GALLONS (570,000 GALLONS DIESEL AND 900,000 GALLONS UNLEADED) PER YEAR.		YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		NO <input type="checkbox"/>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:   isl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED</b> <b>BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017</b>		<b>BID # 2017-584</b> <b>DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE</b>	
	<b>INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC</b> <b>GAINSVILLE, GA</b>	<b>JAMES RIVER SOLUTIONS, LLC</b> <b>ASHLAND, VA</b>	<b>MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF</b> <b>GAINSVILLE, INC</b> <b>GAINESVILLE, GA</b>
<b><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></b>  THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.  BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
NO OPTION OFFERED.	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>	<b>0.0030 - 10 DAYS</b> <b>0.0015 - 20 DAYS</b> <b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>
<b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b> Within ___ consecutive calendar days	<b>1</b>	<b>24 HOURS</b>	<b>1</b>
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.		<b>2</b>	<b>24</b>
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     /  sl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED		BID # 2017-584		
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017		DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE		
		PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA	RIO VALLEY BIOFUELS, LLC / GLOBAL ALTERNATIVE FUELS, LLC EL PASO, TX	SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CALIFORNINA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA
<b>GROUP 1: UNLEADED FUEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 1:	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>0.0947</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>0.0800</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE	SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT	_____
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 2:	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon <u>-0.0207</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0050</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE	SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT	_____
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 3:	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon <u>-0.0207</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ____ % MARKUP per Gallon <u>-0.0400</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>NO BID</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>NO BID</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE	SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT	_____

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:   /  sl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED</b> <b>BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017</b>		<b>BID # 2017-584</b> <b>DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE</b>		
		<b>PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC</b> <b>HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA</b>	<b>RIO VALLEY BIOFUELS, LLC /</b> <b>GLOBAL ALTERNATIVE FUELS,</b> <b>LLC</b> <b>EL PASO, TX</b>	<b>SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO.,</b> <b>A CALIFORNINA LIMITED</b> <b>PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS</b> <b>ORANGE, CA</b>
<b>GROUP 2: ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>		<b>Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries</b>		
<b>ITEM</b>  <b>1:</b>	<b>UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ 0.062% MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ 0.0800% MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+0.415 % MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE	<b>SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT</b>	FED LUST \$0.001/GAL, FED ENV FEE, \$0.002143/GAL TX STATE EXCISE TAX \$0.20/GAL, TX LOAD FEE \$2.75/LOAD
		<b>Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries</b>		
<b>ITEM</b>  <b>2:</b>	<b>UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ ___ % MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- 0.0196% DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ 0.0050% MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ 0.10 % MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE	<b>SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT</b>	FED LUST \$0.001/GAL, FED ENV FEE, \$0.002143/GAL TX STATE EXCISE TAX \$0.20/GAL, TX LOAD FEE \$5.50/LOAD
		<b>Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries</b>		
<b>ITEM</b>  <b>3:</b>	<b>UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS</b> <b>(FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ ___ % MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- 0.0434% DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ ___ % MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- 0.0400 % DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ ___ % MARKUP per Gallon</b> <b>- 0.0336 % DISCOUNT per Gallon</b>
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE	<b>SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT</b>	FED LUST \$0.001/GAL, FED ENV FEE, \$0.002143/GAL TX STATE EXCISE TAX \$0.20/GAL, TX LOAD FEE \$8.65/LOAD

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:   /s/  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED</b>				<b>BID # 2017-584</b>								
<b>BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017</b>				<b>DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE</b>								
				<b>PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA</b>		<b>RIO VALLEY BIOFUELS, LLC / GLOBAL ALTERNATIVE FUELS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		<b>SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CALIFORNINA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA</b>				
<b>GROUP 3: RED- DYED DIESEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>												
<b>ITEM 1:</b>	UP TO 300 TO 400 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)			<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>		<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>		<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>				
	+ .3851% MARKUP per Gallon			+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon		+ 0.415 % MARKUP per Gallon		+ 0.415 % MARKUP per Gallon				
	- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon			- 0.0400 % DISCOUNT per Gallon		- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon		- ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon				
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>				LUST = 0.001, FED OIL = 0.0021, STATE EXCISE = 0.20, TX PETROLEUM DELIVERY FEE ENVIRONMENTAL COMPLIANCE FEE		<b>SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT</b>		FED LUST \$0.001/GAL, FED ENV FEE, \$0.002143/GAL , TX LOAD FEE \$2.75/LOAD				
<b>OPTION:</b>												
VENDOR AGREES TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENT ENTITIES TO PURCHASE OFF OF THIS BID IN A ESTIMATED QUANTITY OF 1,470,000 GALLONS (570,000 GALLONS DIESEL AND 900,000 GALLONS UNLEADED) PER YEAR.				<b>YES</b> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>	<b>YES</b> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>	<b>YES</b> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:   /s/  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



	PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA	RIO VALLEY BIOFUELS, LLC / GLOBAL ALTERNATIVE FUELS, LLC EL PASO, TX	SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CALIFORNINA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA
<b><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></b>			
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.			
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
NO OPTION OFFERED.	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>
<b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b>			
Within ___ consecutive calendar days	1	1	1
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.	24	2	2
<small>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</small>			

**NOTE:** The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:     / s/    

DATE:   2/21/17





# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED** **BID # 2017-584**  
**BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, LLC TEMPE, AZ		
<b>GROUP 1: UNLEADED FUEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 1:	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>
		+ <u>0.0075</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL LUST TAX - 0.00100 : FEDERAL OIL SPILL TAX - 0.001929 TX FUEL TAX - 0.20: TX PETROLEUM PRODUCTS DELIVERY FEE - \$1.70		
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 2:	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>
		+ <u>0.0075</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL LUST TAX - 0.00100 : FEDERAL OIL SPILL TAX - 0.001929 TX FUEL TAX - 0.20: TX PETROLEUM PRODUCTS DELIVERY FEE - \$3.45		
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 3:	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b>
		+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon <u>-.0675</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	+ ____ % MARKUP per Gallon - ____ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL LUST TAX - 0.00100 : FEDERAL OIL SPILL TAX - 0.001929 TX FUEL TAX - 0.20: TX PETROLEUM PRODUCTS DELIVERY FEE - \$6.95		

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     /s/    

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED		BID # 2017-584		
BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017		DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE		
		WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, LLC TEMPE, AZ		
GROUP 2: ULTRA LOW SULFUR DIESEL #2 - DELIVERY QUANTITIES		Item 1 : Comprises approximately 5% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 1:	UP TO 1,500 GALLONS (SMALL LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>0.0080</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		FEDERAL LUST TAX - 0.00100 : FEDERAL OIL SPILL TAX - 0.002143 TX FUEL TAX - 0.20: TX PETROLEUM PRODUCTS DELIVERY FEE - \$1.70		
		Item 2 : Comprises approximately 15% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 2:	UP TO 3,500 TO 4,500 GALLONS (HALF LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + <u>0.0080</u> % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		FEDERAL LUST TAX - 0.00100 : FEDERAL OIL SPILL TAX - 0.002143 TX FUEL TAX - 0.20: TX PETROLEUM PRODUCTS DELIVERY FEE - \$3.45		
		Item 3 : Comprises approximately 80% of Total Deliveries		
ITEM 3:	UP TO 7,000 TO 9,000 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - <u>0.0515</u> % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon
List all State and Federal mandated fees:		SEE EXHIBIT A ATTACHMENT		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:   /  sl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED</b> <b>BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017</b>		<b>BID # 2017-584</b> <b>DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE</b>								
		<b>WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, LLC TEMPE, AZ</b>								
<b>GROUP 3: RED- DYED DIESEL - DELIVERY QUANTITIES</b>										
ITEM	UP TO 300 TO 400 GALLONS (FULL TRANSPORT LOAD)	<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> <b>+ 0.010 % MARKUP</b> per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon		<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon		<b>SUPPLIER'S FEE:</b> + ___ % MARKUP per Gallon - ___ % DISCOUNT per Gallon				
1:										
<b>List all State and Federal mandated fees:</b>		FEDERAL LUST TAX - 0.00100 : FEDERAL OIL SPILL TAX - 0.002143 TX FUEL TAX - 0.20: TX PETROLEUM PRODUCTS DELIVERY FEE - \$1.70								
<b>OPTION:</b>										
<b>VENDOR AGREES TO ALLOW OTHER GOVERNMENT ENTITIES TO PURCHASE OFF OF THIS BID IN A ESTIMATED QUANTITY OF 1,470,000 GALLONS (570,000 GALLONS DIESEL AND 900,000 GALLONS UNLEADED) PER YEAR.</b>		<b>YES</b> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>	<b>YES</b> <input type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>	<b>YES</b> <input type="checkbox"/>		<b>NO</b> <input type="checkbox"/>

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:   /  sl  

DATE:   2/21/17



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: AUTOMOTIVE FUEL - DIESEL AND UNLEADED** **BID # 2017-584**  
**BID DATE: FEBRUARY 1, 2017** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

	<b>WESTERN REFINING WHOLESALE, LLC TEMPE, AZ</b>		
<b><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></b>  THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.  BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
<b>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.</b>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<b>NO OPTION OFFERED.</b>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>		
<b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b> Within ___ consecutive calendar days	<b>7</b>		
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.	<b>24</b>		

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

**BIDS SOLICITED: 17    LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 5    BIDS RECEIVED: 13    LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 3    NO BID: 0**

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:     /s/    

DATE:   2/21/17