



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

TRANSMISSION FLUID					BREWER OIL COMPANY CHEVRON ALBUQUERQUE, NM			BREWER OIL COMPANY VALVOLINE ALBUQUERQUE, NM			C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
1.	TRANSYND	55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$1,758.14	\$140,651.20	\$421,953.60 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$421,954.00</small>	\$1,758.14	\$140,651.20 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$140,651.00</small>	\$421,953.60 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$421,954.00</small>	\$2,100.00	\$168,000.00	\$504,000.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					TRANSYND			TRANSYND			CASTRO L TRAN SYNCL		
2.	MERCON LV ATF TRANSMISSION OIL MOTOR CRAFT	QUART	60 DRUMS	600 QUARTS	\$5.83	\$3,498.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,497.00</small>	\$10,494.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$10,492.00</small>	\$5.83	\$3,498.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,497.00</small>	\$10,494.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$10,492.00</small>	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOTORCRAFT MERCON LV ATF			MOTORCRAFT MERCON LV ATF			NO BID		
3.	MERCON VI TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.352	\$435.20 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$435.18</small>	\$1,305.60 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,306.00</small>	\$3.20	\$320.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$319.00</small>	\$960.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$958.00</small>	\$4.40	\$440.00	\$1,320.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					HAVOLINE SYN ATF MV DEXRON VI			VALVOLINE DEXRON VI FULL SYN			MOBIL DEXRON VI		
4.	ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.14	\$414.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$414.42</small>	\$1,242.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,243.00</small>	\$3.10	\$310.00	\$930.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$931.00</small>	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					HAVOLINE ATF +4			VALVOLINE ATF +4 FULL SYN			BO BID		
4A.	TRANSMISSION FLUID (ZF LIST OF LUBRICANTS TE-ML 14, PART E)	BULK-55 GALLON DRUM	55		\$1,852.92	\$1,852.92	\$5,558.76	\$1,852.92	\$1,852.92	\$5,558.76	\$3,064.84	\$3,064.84	\$9,194.52
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SHELL SPIRAX S6 ATF ZM			SHELL SPIRAX S6 ATF ZM			ZF ECO FLUID A LIFE		
MOTOR OIL													
5.	SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL	QUART	100 QUARTS	800 QUARTS	\$5.05	\$4,040.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$4,043.00</small>	\$12,120.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$12,129.00</small>	\$3.75	\$3,000.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,002.00</small>	\$9,000.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$9,006.00</small>	\$5.37	\$4,296.00	\$12,888.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					HAVOLINE PRO DS SYN 5W 20			VALVOLINE FULL SYN W/MAXLIFE TECH			MOBIL SUP SYN 5W-20		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET

Solicitation #: 2017-749

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

					BREWER OIL COMPANY CHEVRON ALBUQUERQUE, NM			BREWER OIL COMPANY VALVOLINE ALBUQUERQUE, NM			C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX		
MOTOR OIL													
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
6.	ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 LOW ASH (CUMMINS APPROVED)	GAL. BULK	1,000 DRUMS	25,000 DRUMS	\$10.01	\$250,250.00	\$750,750.00	\$8.05	\$201,250.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$201,190.00</i>	\$603,750.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE</i>	\$10.80	\$270,000.00	\$810,000.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					DELO 400 NG 15W 40			VALVOLINE PREM BLUE GEO M-85			MOBIL DISLVAC CNG/LNG 15W-40		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
7.	HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR EQUIVALENT	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	110 DRUMS	\$310.22	\$34,124.20 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$34,124.00</i>	\$102,372.60 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$102,373.00</i>	\$257.65	\$28,341.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$28,342.00</i>	\$85,024.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$85,025.00</i>	\$342.15	\$37,636.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$342,215.00</i>	\$112,909.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$102,645.00</i>
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHEV HYD OIL AW 150 68			VALVOLINE AW 68 HYD OIL			MOBIL HUMBLE 68W		
8.	HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXASCP # 765-1542 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	5 CANS	50 CANS	\$54.83	\$2,741.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$32,741.00</i>	\$8,224.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$8,225.00</i>	\$54.83	\$2,741.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,741.00</i>	\$8,224.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$8,225.00</i>	\$8.31	\$415.50	\$1,246.50
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA HYDRAULIC JACK OIL			NAPA HYDRAILIC JACK OIL			MOBIL FLUID 424		
9.	AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	10 CANS	100 CANS	\$29.25	\$2,925.00	\$8,775.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$8,776.00</i>	\$29.25	\$2,925.00	\$8,775.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$8,776.00</i>	\$18.90	\$1,890.00	\$5,670.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SHELL AERO SHELL FLUID 4			SHELL AERO SHELL FLUID 4			MOBIL DTE 10 EXCEL #15		
10.	GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC SAE 75W - 90 W	400 POUND DRUM	2 DRUMS	12 DRUMS	\$1,277.94	\$15,335.28	\$46,005.84 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$46,005.00</i>	\$1,504.38	\$18,052.56 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE 18,053.00</i>	\$54,157.68 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$54,158.00</i>	\$1,389.70	\$16,676.40	\$50,029.20
MANUFACTURER BRAND					DELO SYN-GEAR XDM 75W 90			VALVOLINE HD SYN GEAR 75W 90			MOBIL DISLVAC SYN		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: / sl
DATE: 04/05/2017



**CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION FORM**



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
 Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
 MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

					BREWER OIL COMPANY CHEVRON ALBUQUERQUE, NM			BREWER OIL COMPANY VALVOLINE ALBUQUERQUE, NM			C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
11.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	120 POUND CAN	2 CANS	14 CANS	\$291.13	\$4,075.82 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$4,075.00</i>	\$12,227.46 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$12,227.00</i>	\$303.31	\$4,246.34 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$4,246.00</i>	\$12,739.02 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$12,739.00</i>	\$325.34	\$4,554.76	\$13,664.28
MANUFACTURER BRAND					DELO GREASE EP 2			VALVOLINE CERULEAN GREASE #2			MOBIL XHP 222		
12.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	150 DRUMS	\$960.99	\$144,148.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$144,149.00</i>	\$432,445.50 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$432,446.00</i>	\$964.30	\$144,645.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$144,644.00</i>	\$433,935.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$433,933.00</i>	\$985.62	\$147,843.00	\$443,529.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					DELO GREASE EP 2			VALVOLINE CERULEAN GREASE #2			MOBIL XHP 222		
13.	ESTER OIL CAN. R134a	1 GAL. CAN	2 CANS	50 CANS	\$94.40	\$4,720.00	\$14,160.00	\$94.40	\$4,720.00	\$14,160.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					ESTERCOOL R134a			ESTERCOOL R134a			NO BID		
14.	ANTIFREEZE 50/50 BLEND	GAL.	1,000 GALLONS	10,000 GALLONS	\$7.27	\$72,700.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$72,688.00</i>	\$218,100.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$218,064.00</i>	\$5.31	\$53,100.00	\$159,300.00	\$9.45	\$94,500.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$94,598.93</i>	\$283,500.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$283,796.79</i>
MANUFACTURER BRAND					DELO ELC 50/50			DELO ELC 50/50			MOBIL DISLVAC ELC 50/50		
ANNUAL AMOUNT (LINES 1 - 14)					\$681,911.62 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$681,900.00</i>			\$609,654.02 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$609,592.92</i>			\$749,317.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$745,994.43</i>		
LUBRICANTS 3 - YEAR GRAND TOTAL (LINES 1 - 14)					\$2,045,734.86 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,045,708.76</i>			\$1,828,962.06 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,828,785.76</i>			\$2,247,951.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,237,983.29</i>		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/
 DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES					BREWER OIL COMPANY CHEVRON ALBUQUERQUE, NM	BREWER OIL COMPANY VALVOLINE ALBUQUERQUE, NM	C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)
			MIN	MAX (A)						
1.	ENGINE OIL	EA	500	3,500	\$9.72	\$34,020.00	\$11.55	\$40,425.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$40,433.00	\$20.00	\$70,000.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					ALS TRIBOLOGY C3 TESTY PACKAGE NATGAS		ALS TRIBOLOGY LEVEL III NAT GAS			
2.	TRANSMISSION FLUID	EA	500	3500	\$7.19	\$25,165.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$25,152.00	\$8.48	\$29,680.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$29,695.00	\$20.00	\$70,000.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					ALS TRIBOLOGY C1 TEST PACKAGE TRANSMISSION		ALS TRIBOLOGY LEVEL I TRANSMISSION			
3.	FREIGHT FOR BOX OF TEST KITS	BOX			\$29.50	\$29.50	\$29.50	\$29.50	N/A	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					10 KITS PER BOX		10 KITS PER BOX		NO FREIGHT	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES ANNUAL TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$59,214.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$59,201.50		\$70,134.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$70,157.50		\$140,000.00	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES 3 - YR GRAND TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$177,643.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$177,604.50		\$210,403.50 BIDDER'S PRICE 210,472.50		\$420,000.00	
3 -YR GRAND TOTAL PRICE LUBRICANTS (ITEM 1 - 14) + OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES (ITEM 1 - 3)					\$2,223,378.36 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,223,313.26		\$2,039,365.56 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,039,258.26		\$2,667,951.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,657,983.29	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

	BREWER OIL COMPANY CHEVRON ALBUQUERQUE, NM	BREWER OIL COMPANY VALVOLINE ALBUQUERQUE, NM	C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u> THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	3% - 10 DAYS	3% - 10 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: WITHIN <u> 7 </u> CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS</p>	3	3	2
<p>WITHIN <u> 24 </u> HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY</p>	24	24	24
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/
 DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

TRANSMISSION FLUID					C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE			HOSTEIN OIL & DISTRIBUTING, LLC SANTA FE, NM			MJ. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
1.	TRANSYND	55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$2,100.00	\$168,000.00	\$504,000.00	\$1,866.00	\$149,280.00	\$447,840.00	\$1,159.00	\$92,720.00	\$278,160.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CASTROL TRANSYND			CASTROL TRANSYND			LUBRIGUARD HD FULL SYNTHETIC AFT		
2.	MERCON LV ATF TRANSMISSION OIL MOTOR CREAFT	QUART	60 DRUMS	600 QUARTS	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2.61	\$1,566.00	\$4,698.00	\$6.00	\$3,600.00	\$10,800.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NO BID			P66 VERSATRANS LV AFT			MERCON LV ATF		
3.	MERCON VI TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.400	\$440.00	\$1,320.00	\$2.61	\$261.00	\$783.00	\$3.50	\$350.00	\$1,050.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOBIL DEXRON VI			P66 VERSATRANS LV AFT			LUBRIGUARD FULL SYNTHETIC MV DEXRON VI		
4.	ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$2.41	\$241.00	\$723.00	\$6.00	\$600.00	\$1,800.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					BO BID			P66 VERSATRANS			ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID		
4A.	TRANSMISSION FLUID (ZF LIST OF LUBRICANTS TE-ML 14, PART E)	BULK- 55 GALLON DRUM	55		\$3,064.84	\$3,064.84	\$9,194.52	\$528.16	\$528.16	\$528.16	\$1,159.00	\$63,745.00	\$191,235.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					ZF ECO FLUID A LIFE			P66 VERSATRANS			LUBRIGUARD HD FULL SYNTHETIC AFT		
MOTOR OIL													
5.	SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL	QUART	100 QUARTS	800 QUARTS	\$5.37	\$4,296.00	\$12,888.00	\$2.08	\$1,664.00	\$4,992.00	\$3.89	\$3,112.00	\$9,336.00
					MOBIL SUP SYN 5W-20			P66 SHIELD ARMOR FULL SYNTHETIC			LUBRIGOLD FULL SUNTHETIC 5 - 20		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: / sl
 DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749

MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

MOTOR OIL					C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE			HOSTEIN OIL & DISTRIBUTING, LLC SANTA FE, NM			MJ. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
6.	ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 LOW ASH (CUMMINS APPROVED)	GAL. BULK	1,000 DRUMS	25,000 DRUMS	\$9.97	\$249,250.00	\$747,750.00	\$6.85	\$171,250.00	\$513,750.00	\$6.11	\$152,750.00	\$458,250.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOBIL GEO 15W - 40			P66 GUARDOL NG 15/40			WARREN GEO LOW ASH AW 15-40		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
7.	HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR EQUIVALENT	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	110 DRUMS	\$342.15	\$37,636.50 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$34,215.00</small>	\$112,909.50 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$102,645.00</small>	\$319.00	\$35,090.00	\$105,270.00	\$243.00	\$26,730.00	\$80,190.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOBIL HUMBLE 68W			P66 MEGAFLOW AW HYDRAULIC 68			WARREN PREMIUM AW HYDRAULIC 68		
8.	HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXASCP # 765-1542 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	5 CANS	50 CANS	\$8.31	\$415.50	\$1,246.50	\$12.50	\$625.00	\$1,875.00	\$25.00	\$1,250.00	\$3,750.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOBIL FLUID 424			NAPA HYDRAULIC JACK OIL			HYDRAULIC JACK OIL TEXACO DR EQUIVALENT 5		
9.	AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	10 CANS	100 CANS	\$18.90	\$1,890.00	\$5,670.00	\$16.58	\$1,658.00	\$4,974.00	\$25.00	\$2,500.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,250.00</small>	\$7,500.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,750.00</small>
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOBIL DTE10 EXCEL #15			P66 X/C AVIATION HYD 5606a			AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL TEXACO OR EQUIVALENT		
10.	GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC SAE 75W - 90 W	400 POUND DRUM	2 DRUMS	12 DRUMS	\$1,389.70	\$16,676.40	\$50,029.20	\$971.30	\$11,655.60	\$34,966.80	\$893.00	\$10,716.00	\$32,148.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOBIL DELVAC SYN			P66 TRITON SYNLUBE LDO			COASTAL FULL SYNTHETIC 75-90		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: / sl
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

					C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE			HOSTEIN OIL & DISTRIBUTING, LLC SANTA FE, NM			MJ. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
11.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	120 POUND CAN	2 CANS	14 CANS	\$297.13	\$4,159.82	\$12,479.46	\$223.67	\$3,131.38	\$9,394.14	\$275.16	\$3,852.24 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,852.21</small>	\$11,556.72
MANUFACTURER BRAND					ROYAL LC HI-TEMP #2			P66 DYNALIFE HT #2			AUTOGUARD HI-TEMP GRASE #2		
12.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	150 DRUMS	\$784.97	\$117,745.50 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$11,920.00</small>	\$353,236.50 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$357,600.00</small>	\$706.32	\$105,948.00	\$317,844.00	\$721.00	\$108,150.00	\$324,450.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					ROYAL LC HI-TEMP #2			P66 DYNALIFE HT #2			AUTOGUARD HI-TEMP GRASE #2		
13.	ESTER OIL CAN. R134a	1 GAL. CAN	2 CANS	50 CANS	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$21.60	\$1,080.00	\$3,240.00	\$150.00	\$7,500.00	\$22,500.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NO BID			CARQUEST R134A 30 LBS CAN (1 GALLON = 4.26 LBS)			ESTER OIL R 134a		
14.	ANTIFREEZE 50/50 BLEND	GAL.	1,000 GALLONS	10,000 GALLONS	\$8.10	\$81,000.00	\$243,000.00	\$6.95	\$69,500.00	\$208,500.00	\$4.90	\$49,000.00	\$147,000.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					PEAK FINAL CHANGE 50/50			CHEVRON DELO ELC 50/50 RED			BARSOL K - 101 50-50 ANTIFREEZE		
ANNUAL AMOUNT (LINES 1 - 14)					\$684,574.56 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$575,327.56</small>			\$553,478.14			\$526,575.24 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$525,325.21</small>		
LUBRICANTS 3 - YEAR GRAND TOTAL (LINES 1 - 14)					\$2,053,723.68 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,163,822.68</small>			\$1,660,434.42 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,660,434.40</small>			\$1,579,725.72 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,575,975.63</small>		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl/
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES					C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE	HOSTEIN OIL & DISTRIBUTING, LLC SANTA FE, NM	MJ. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)
			MIN	MAX (A)						
1.	ENGINE OIL	EA	500	3,500	\$20.00	\$70,000.00	\$8.75	\$30,625.00	\$18.00	\$63,000.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					MOBIL SERV ENGINE		ALS LABS PHOENIX - P66 3BN (MUST USE P66 OIL)			
2.	TRANSMISSION FLUID	EA	500	3500	\$20.00	\$70,000.00	\$4.50	\$15,750.00	\$18.00	\$63,000.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					MOBIL SERV POWETREAIN		LAB ONE - PHOENIX - CON - B- PP			
3.	FREIGHT FOR BOX OF TEST KITS	BOX			NO BID	\$0.00	\$10.00	\$7,500.00 2ND DAY UPS 7000/10 = 750	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					NO FRIGHT		BOX OF 10 EL PASO - PHOENIX			
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES ANNUAL TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$140,000.00		\$53,875.00		\$126,000.00	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES 3 - YR GRAND TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$420,000.00		\$161,625.00		\$378,000.00	
3 -YR GRAND TOTAL PRICE LUBRICANTS (ITEM 1 - 14) + OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES (ITEM 1 - 3)					\$2,473,723.68 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,583,822.68		\$1,822,059.42 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,822,059.40		\$1,957,725.72 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,957,725.63	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: / sl
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

	C & R DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE	HOSTEIN OIL & DISTRIBUTING, LLC SANTA FE, NM	MJ. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u> THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	NET - 30 DAYS		5% - 10 DAYS
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: WITHIN <u> 7 </u> CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS</p>	2	3	1
<p>WITHIN <u> 24 </u> HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY</p>	24	24	24
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/
 DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

TRANSMISSION FLUID					M.J. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE			TIGUA DISTRIBUTING EL PASO, TX					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
1.	TRANSYND	55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$1,147.30	\$91,784.00 <small>*SEE ITEMS 2 PAGE 14</small>	\$275,352.00	\$2,181.30	\$174,504.00	\$523,512.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CITGO QUATRASYND TRANS FLUID			MONARCH SYN TRANS PLUS 40					
2.	MERCON LV ATF TRANSMISSION OIL MOTOR CREAFT	QUART	60 DRUMS	600 QUARTS	\$6.00	\$3,600.00	\$10,800.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MERCON LV ATF								
3.	MERCON VI TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$6.00	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	\$4.95	\$495.00	\$1,485.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					TRANSGUARD VI			MONARCH MULTITRANS PLUS ATF					
4.	ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$6.00	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	\$4.95	\$495.00	\$1,485.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID			MONARCH MULTITRANS PLUS ATF					
4A.	TRANSMISSION FLUID (ZF LIST OF LUBRICANTS TE-ML 14, PART E)	BULK- 55 GALLON DRUM	55		\$1,147.30	\$63,101.50	\$189,304.50	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CITGO QUATRASYND TRANS. FLUID								
MOTOR OIL													
5.	SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL	QUART	100 QUARTS	800 QUARTS	\$4.71	\$3,768.00	\$11,304.00	\$3.59	\$2,872.00	\$8,616.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
					CITGO SUPERGUARD SYN 5/20			MONARCH SYN LUBE SELECT 5W20					

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: / /
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

MOTOR OIL					MJ. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE			TIGUA DISTRIBUTING EL PASO, TX					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
6.	ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 LOW ASH (CUMMINS APPROVED)	GAL. BULK	1,000 DRUMS	25,000 DRUMS	\$7.08	\$177,000.00	\$531,000.00	\$5.82	\$145,500.00	\$436,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
					*SEE ITEMS 1, 2 PAGE 14								
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CITGO CITGUARD CNG-LNG 15/40			GEOGUARD 300 La 15W40					
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
7.	HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR EQUIVALENT	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	110 DRUMS	\$267.80	\$29,458.00	\$88,374.00	\$324.58	\$35,703.80	\$107,111.40	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CITGO HYDRANCE N W 68			ROZEP AW HYD 68					
8.	HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXASCP # 765-1542 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	5 CANS	50 CANS	\$25.00	\$1,250.00	\$3,750.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					TEXACO # 765-1542 OR EQUIVALENT								
9.	AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	10 CANS	100 CANS	\$25.00	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					TEXACO # 15 OR EQUIVALENT								
10.	GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC SAE 75W - 90 W	400 POUND DRUM	2 DRUMS	12 DRUMS	\$949.75	\$11,397.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,139.00	\$34,191.00	\$1,716.55	\$20,598.60	\$61,795.80	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CITGEAR HEAVY DUTY SYN 75-90			MONARCH SYNGEAR PLUS 75W90					

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/
DATE: 04/05/2017



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION FORM**



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

					M.J. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE			TIGUA DISTRIBUTING EL PASO, TX					
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
11.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	120 POUND CAN	2 CANS	14 CANS	\$275.16	\$3,852.24	\$11,556.72	\$285.80	\$4,001.20	\$12,003.60	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					LITHOPLEX RT #2			ROYAL 98 LITHIUM COMPLEX					
12.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	150 DRUMS	\$843.90	\$126,585.00	\$379,755.00	\$835.20	\$125,280.00	\$375,840.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					LITHOPLEX RT #2			ROYAL 98 LITHIUM COMPLEX					
13.	ESTER OIL CAN. R134a	1 GAL. CAN	2 CANS	50 CANS	\$150.00	\$7,500.00	\$22,500.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					ESTER OIL CAN R 134A								
14.	ANTIFREEZE 50/50 BLEND	GAL.	1,000 GALLONS	10,000 GALLONS	\$7.24	\$72,400.00	\$217,200.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					BARSOL K102 50/50 ELC								
ANNUAL AMOUNT (LINES 1 - 14)					\$595,395.74 BIDDER'S PRICE \$585,137.74			\$509,449.60			\$0.00		
LUBRICANTS 3 - YEAR GRAND TOTAL (LINES 1 - 14)					\$1,786,187.22 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,755,713.22			\$1,528,348.80			\$0.00		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /sl/
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES					M.J. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE		TIGUA DISTRIBUTING EL PASO, TX			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)
			MIN	MAX (A)						
1.	ENGINE OIL	EA	500	3,500	FREE	\$0.00 WITH PURCHASE OF ITEM 6	\$16.25	\$56,875.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LUBE ALERT ANALYSIS					
2.	TRANSMISSION FLUID	EA	500	3500	FREE	\$0.00 WITH PURCHASE OF ITEM 1	\$16.25	\$56,875.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LUBE ALERT ANALYSIS					
3.	FREIGHT FOR BOX OF TEST KITS	BOX			\$150.00 70 BOXES	\$10,500.00 WITH PURCHASE OF ITEM 1 & 6	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					100 KITS PER BOX					
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES ANNUAL TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$10,500.00		\$113,750.00		\$0.00	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES 3 - YR GRAND TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$31,500.00		\$341,250.00		\$0.00	
3 -YR GRAND TOTAL PRICE LUBRICANTS (ITEM 1 - 14) + OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES (ITEM 1 - 3)					\$1,817,687.22 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,786,913.22		\$1,869,598.80		\$0.00	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/
DATE: 04/05/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 15, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-749
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

	M.J. MADER ENTERPRISE INC. DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX ALTERNATIVE	TIGUA DISTRIBUTING EL PASO, TX	
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u> THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	0 NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: WITHIN <u> 7 </u> CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS</p>	1	2	
<p>WITHIN <u> 24 </u> HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY</p>	24	4	
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			
<p>BIDS SOLICITED: 37 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 26 BIDS RECEIVED: 8 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 5 NO BID: 0</p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /
 DATE: 04/05/2017