



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|-------------------------------------|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|----------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 1. | WILD HERBIVORE PLUS MAZURI #5Z8W | PER LB | 2,500 | 3,000 | \$0.6474 | \$1,942.20 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 528W | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 B | | | | | | | |
| 2. | MARINE TABS MAZURI #5Twx | PER GRAM | 8,000 | 9,000 | \$0.16667 | \$1,500.03 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 1811966 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KN | | | | | | | |
| 3. | FLAMINGO COMPLETE MAZURI #5644 | PER LB | 1,800 | 2,000 | \$1.44 | \$2,880.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,888.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5644 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50LB | | | | | | | |
| 4. | FLAMINGO BREEDER MAZURI #5645 | PER LB | 1,300 | 1,500 | \$1.5874 | \$2,381.10 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2381.11 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5645 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|-------------------------------------|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|------------------------|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 5. | RATITE MAZURI #5647 | PER LB | 1,500 | 2,000 | \$0.5758 | \$1,151.60 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5647 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 6. | RODENT DIET MAZURI #5663 | PER GRAM | 3,000 | 3,400 | \$0.8144 | \$2,768.96 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5633 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 7. | FERRET DIET MAZURI #5M08 | PER LB | 100 | 150 | \$1.5328 | \$229.92 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M08 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 8. | EMCELLE TOCOPHEROL MAZURI #10111 | PER LITER | 20 | 24 | \$145.30 | \$3,487.20 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 10111 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 LITER | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/_____
DATE: 05/23/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 9. | HERBIVORE ADF 16 MAZURI #5648 | PER LB | 4,500 | 5,000 | \$0.512644 | \$2,563.22 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,563.32 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5648 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 10 | LLAMA SUPPLEMENT MAZURI #5M17 | PER LB | 800 | 900 | \$0.5584 | \$502.58 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M17 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 11 | ELEPHANT SUPPLEMENT MAZURI #5666 | PER LB | 15,000 | 20,000 | \$0.59212 | \$11,842.40 BIDDER'S PRICE \$11,842.44 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5666 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 B | | | | | | | |
| 12. | CRICKET FOOD, HI CALCIUM MAZURI #5M38 | PER LB | 300 | 375 | \$3.77 | \$1,413.75 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M38 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|------------------------|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 13. | GUINEA PIG DIET MAZURI #5664 | PER LB | 75 | 100 | \$0.7916 | \$79.16 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5664 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 14. | REPTOVITE MINERAL SUPPLEMENT WITHOUT D3 ZOO MEDS #ZMA35-80 | PER LB | 150 | 175 | \$13.00 | \$2,275.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZOO MED | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | ZMA35-80 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 5 LB | | | | | | | |
| 15. | CHIA SEED- GROUND SPECTRUM | PER LB | 30 | 40 | \$29.28 | \$1,171.20 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | SPECTRUM | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | CHIA SEED | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 10 OZ BAG | | | | | | | |
| 16. | ENRICH 32 HORSE PURINA #35ML | PER LB | 1,100 | 1,200 | \$0.592 | \$710.40 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 35ML | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|------------------------|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 17. | REPTOVITE MINERAL SUPPLEMENT WITH D3 ZOO MEDS #ZMA3680 | PER LB | 125 | 150 | \$30.00 | \$4,500.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZOO MEDS | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | ZMA3680 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 3 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 18. | INSECTIVORE MAZURI #5MK8 | PER LB | 1,100 | 1,250 | \$1.516 | \$1,895.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5MK8 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 19. | GAMEBIRD LAYENA CRUMBLES PURINA #5438 | PER LB | 1,500 | 1,800 | \$0.4496 | \$809.28 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5438 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 20. | SENIOR EQUINE PURINA #352Q | PER LB | 3,000 | 3,650 | \$0.50 | \$1,825.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 352Q | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 B | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|---|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 21. | CORN, CRACKED PURINA #L52M | PER LB | 500 | 600 | \$0.22 | \$132.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$135.84 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | L52M | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 22. | OMNIVORE CHOW ZUPREEM #69950 | PER LB | 1,200 | 2,500 | \$1.9815 | \$4,953.75 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 66950 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 20 B | | | | | | | |
| 23. | WATER FOWL MAINTENANCE MAZURI #5642 | PER LB | 3,000 | 3,750 | \$0.776 | \$2,910.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5642 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 24. | WILD HERBIVORE DIET, HI FIBER MAZURI #5ZF1 | PER LB | 30,000 | 32,500 | \$0.549 | \$17,842.50 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5ZF1 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|---|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|--------------|--|--------------|--|--------------|--|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | | | | | | | | |
| 25. | EXOTIC CANINE MAZURI #5MN2 | PER LB | 1,485 | 1,815 | \$1.1378 | \$2,065.11 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,665.25 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5MN2 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 33 LB | | | | | | | |
| 26. | CRANE MAINTENANCE MUZURI #5646 | PER LB | 3,600 | 4,000 | \$0.777 | \$3,108.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,110.42 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5646 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 27. | COLOR COMPANION PARROT SEED MIX PURINA #62032 | PER LB | 1,000 | 1,200 | \$1.2457 | \$1,494.84 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,494.89 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | COLOR COMPANION | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 62032 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 28. | COLOR COMPANION FINCH SEED MIX PURINA #62021 | PER LB | 1,000 | 1,200 | \$1.1793 | \$1,415.16 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,415.19 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 62021 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LBS | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|-----------------------------------|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 29. | SUNFLOWER SEEDS GREY STRIPED | PER LB | 200 | 300 | \$0.779 | \$233.70 BIDDER'S PRICE \$223.73 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 1459 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 30. | PEANUT, RAW IN SHELL | PER LB | 1,600 | 1,800 | \$1.75 | \$3,150.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | JONES SEED | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | PEANUTS | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 31. | BRAN | PER LB | 350 | 400 | \$0.38 | \$152.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | WHEAT BRAN | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 32. | IAMS LESS ACTIVE CAT FOOD IAMS | PER LB | 30 | 40 | \$1.25 | \$50.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | IAMS | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | IAMS LA CAT | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 16 LBS | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 33. | BROWSE BISCUITS MAZURI #5MA4 | PER LB | 1,600 | 1,800 | \$1.50 | \$2,700.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,701.44 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5MA4 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 34. | GROWTH & REPRO. PRIMATE MAZURI #5MA1 | PER LB | 1,200 | 1,400 | \$0.8648 | \$1,210.72 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5MA1 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 35. | COLORFUL COMPANION COCKATIEL PURINA #62023 | PER LB | 2,400 | 2,600 | \$1.09 | \$2,834.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 62023 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 36. | KOI POND NUGGETS MAZURI #5M78 | PER LB | 50 | 75 | \$1.4055 | \$105.41 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M78 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 20 LBS | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.

Solicitation #: 2017-918

Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|---|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|--------------|---|--------------|---|--------------|---|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (C) | | (C) | | (C) | | (C) |
| 37. | PLAIN SALT BRICKS | PER LB | 50 | 80 | \$0.75 | \$60.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5B-4 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 4/15 60 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 38. | REPTI CALCIUM WITHOUT D3 ZOO MEDS ZM13308M | PER LB | 50 | 75 | \$30.00 | \$2,250.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZOO MEDS | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | ZM13308M | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 2 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 39. | HERBIVOROUS REPTILE LS MAZURI #5E5M | PER LB | 900 | 1,000 | \$1.768 | \$1,768.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,768.25 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5E5M | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 40. | WATER FOWL BREEDER MAURI #5640 | PER LB | 2,000 | 2,500 | \$0.8314 | \$2,078.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,078.70 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5640 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LBS | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 41. | CALCIM CARBONATE POWDER | PER LB | 250 | 300 | NO BID | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | NO BID | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | NO BID | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | NO BID | | | | | | | |
| 42. | COLOR COMPANION MACAW PURINA #25713 | PER LB | 1,400 | 1,500 | \$2.027 | \$3,040.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,040.56 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 25713 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 43. | OYSTER SHELL PURINA #2653340 | PER LB | 150 | 200 | \$0.357 | \$71.40 BIDDER'S PRICE \$71.44 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 3151 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 44. | GEL, BIRD ZULIFE MAZURI #5ME4 | PER KILOGRAM | 100 | 150 | \$23.69 | \$3,553.50 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5ME4 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KG | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: 05/23/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 45. | GEL, CALLITRICHID DIET MAZURI #5M15 | PER KILOGRAM | 80 | 150 | \$24.49 | \$3,673.50 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M15 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KG | | | | | | | |
| 46. | TABLETS, VITA ZU BIRD MUZURI #5M25 | PER GRAM | 760 | 760 | \$0.1723 | \$130.95 BIDDER'S PRICE \$130.99 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M25 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KG | | | | | | | |
| 47. | TURTLE DIET FRESHWATER MAZURI #5M87 | PER LB | 200 | 250 | \$1.49 | \$372.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$372.80 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M87 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 48. | VIONATE MINERAL SUPPLEMENTS | PER LB | 100 | 140 | \$7.557 | \$1,057.98 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | FUTURE PETS | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | VIONATE | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 10 LB | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|---|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 49. | ZEBRA PELLETS MAZURI #5662 | PER LB | 8,500 | 9,200 | \$0.6172 | \$5,678.24 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5662 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| 50. | PETTING ZOO MAZURI #5Z95 | PER LB | 900 | 1,250 | \$0.741 | \$926.25 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5Z95 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 40 LB | | | | | | | |
| 51. | TOTOISE LS MAZURI #5E5L | PER LB | 2,500 | 3,650 | \$1.308 | \$4,774.20 BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,651.18 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5E5L | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 52. | GEL, AQUATIC OMNIVORE DIET MAURI #5Z94 | PER KILOGRAM | 2 | 4 | \$30.96 | \$123.84 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5Z94 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KG | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|---|-----------------|-----------------------|---------------|---|--|--------------|--|--------------|--|--------------|--|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | PRICE (A) | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE (A) X (B) = (C) (C) |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | | | | | | | | |
| 53. | CANNED PRIMATE ZUPREEM #69300 | PER OZ | 11,600 | 13,050 | \$0.1793 | \$2,339.87 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,340.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | 69300 | | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | 1 CAN 14.5 OZ | | | | | | | | |
| 54. | CANNED MARMOSET ZUPREEM #69200 | PER OZ | 8,352 | 8,700 | \$0.1793 | \$1,559.91 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,560.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | 69200 | | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | 1 CAN 14.5 OZ | | | | | | | | |
| 55. | PRIMATE DRY MAINTENANCE ZUPREEM #69850 | PER LB | 1,400 | 1,500 | \$2.1615 | \$3,242.25 BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,167.25 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | 69850 | | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | 20 LB | | | | | | | | |
| 56. | FRUIT BLEND BIRD FOOD PARROT/CONURE/SOFTBILL ZUPREEM #83500 | PER LB | 50 | 100 | \$2.9 | \$290.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | 83500 | | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | 20 LB | | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|---|-------|----------------------|-------|----------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 57. | NATURAL BIRD DIET - CANARIES/FINCH/SOFTBILL (LOW IRON) ZUPREEM #91500 | PER LB | 1,800 | 2,000 | \$2.94 | \$5,880.00 BIDDER'S PRICE \$5,890.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 91500 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 20 LB | | | | | | | |
| 58. | NATURAL BIRD DIET - PARROT/CONURE/SOFTBILL (LOW IRON) ZUPREEM #93500 | PER LB | 900 | 960 | \$3.1545 | \$3,028.32 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 93500 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 20 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 59. | ENRICH BITS MAZURI #57G7 | PER LB | 20 | 40 | NO BID | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | DISCONTINUED | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | DISCONTINUED | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | DISCONTINUED | | | | | | | |
| 60. | GOAT, HONOR SHOW CHOW PURINA #597J | PER LB | 1,000 | 1,250 | \$0.492 | \$615.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 597J | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LBS | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/_____
DATE: 05/23/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 61. | MINI-PIG, ADULT MAZURI # 5 Z91 | PER LB | 3,000 | 3,650 | \$0.6622 | \$2,417.03 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,417.15 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5Z91 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 62. | MINI-PIG, ELDER MAZURI # 5Z92 | PER LB | 8,750 | 9,125 | \$0.6664 | \$6,080.90 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5Z92 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |
| 63. | BAGGED TIMOTHY HAY FOR SMALL MAMMALS | PER LB | 180 | 250 | \$3.2 | \$800.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | OXBOW | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | OX101-105-0400 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 2.5 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 64. | PRIMATE LOW STARCH CINNAMON MAZURI #5M1S | PER LB | 1,800 | 2,400 | \$1.60 | \$3,840.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M1S | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 25 LB | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--------------------------------------|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|------------------------|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 65. | ALFALFA CUBES 1" CUBE | PER LB | 800 | 1,000 | \$0.3 | \$300.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 59ZM | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 66. | TIMOTHY CUBES 1" CUBE | PER LB | 1,000 | 1,800 | \$0.325 | \$585.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | STANDLEE | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 1580-40101-0-0 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 40 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 67. | GEL, AQUATIC MAZURI #5M70 | PER KILOGRAM | 10 | 25 | \$30.99 | \$774.75 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5M70 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KG | | | | | | | |
| 68. | RABBIT CHOW COMPLETE PURINA #53OJ | PER LB | 50 | 100 | \$0.3704 | \$37.04 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 53OJ | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|--|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|----------------------------|-------|----------------------|-------|----------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 69. | AVIAN BREEDER NATURAL ML (PARROT/CONURE) ZUPREEM #75600 | PER LB | 800 | 960 | \$1.858 | \$1,783.68 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 75600 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 40 LB | | | | | | | |
| 70. | AVIAN BREEDER NATURAL M (COCKATIEL) ZUPREEM #76600 | PER LB | 800 | 960 | \$1.8580 | \$1,783.68 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | ZUPREEM | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 76600 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 40 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 71. | SHEEP MINERAL DUMOR | PER LB | 100 | 150 | \$0.52 | \$78.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | DUMOR | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 222839599 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LBS | | | | | | | |
| 72. | TRACE MINERAL BLOCK | PER LB | 880 | 960 | \$0.325 | \$312.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | MB-40 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 40 LBS | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.

Solicitation #: 2017-918

Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|----------|---|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|--|-------|----------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|----------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) | | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | | (A) |
| 73. | THIAMINE-E MAZURI #10112 80 GRAMS | PER GRAM | 2,000 | 2,880 | \$0.2625 | \$756.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 10112 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 80 GRAM | | | | | | | |
| 74. | GEL, PRIMATE LS MAZURI #5B25 | PER KILOGRAM | 25 | 50 | \$17.99 | \$899.50 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 5B25 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KG | | | | | | | |
| 75. | LUBEE BAT SUPPLEMENT LUBEE BAT | PER LB | 100 | 150 | NO BID | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | NO BID | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | NO BID | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | NO BID | | | | | | | |
| 76. | FRISKIES CANNED CAT FOOD- VARIETY PURINA #49654 | PER OZ | 528 | 792 | \$0.1325 | \$104.94 BIDDER'S PRICE \$105.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 49654 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 5.5 OZ CASE OF 24 | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: ___05/23/2017_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: ANIMAL FOOD - PELLETS, GRAINS, ETC.
Bid Opening Date: MAY 17, 2017

Solicitation #: 2017-918
Department: ZOO

| | | | | | LAB ANIMAL SUPPLIES, INC. HIGHLAND VILLAGE, TX | | | | | | | |
|--|--------------------------------------|-----------------|-----------------------|---------|---|------------------------|--------|------------------------|-------|------------------------|-------|------------------------|
| ITEM NO. | DESCRIPTION | UNIT OF MEASURE | ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY. | | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE | PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE |
| | | | MIN | MAX (B) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) | (A) | (A) X (B) = (C) (C) |
| 77. | GUM ARABIC MAZURI #1815099 | PER KILOGRAM | 1 | 2 | \$60.00 | \$120.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | MAZURI | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 1815099 | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 1 KG | | | | | | | |
| 78. | PIGEON FEED EXCELLO QUALITY BRAND | PER LB | 1,000 | 1,800 | \$0.38 | \$684.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | BRAND: _____ | | | | PURINA | | | | | | | |
| | STOCK# _____ | | | | 54FW | | | | | | | |
| | PKG SIZE: _____ | | | | 50 LB | | | | | | | |
| TOTAL EXTENDED- ITEMS 1 AND 78 | | | | | \$158,156.41 | | \$0.00 | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 | | \$0.00 |
| | | | | | BIDDER'S PRICE \$156,975.92 | | | | | | | |
| PAYMENT TERMS: | | | | | NET - 30 DAYS | | | | | | | |
| BIDS SOLICITED: 16 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 6 BIDS RECEIVED: 1 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0 NO BID: 0 | | | | | | | | | | | | |

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___05/23/2017_____