



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM:** HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR **BID #** 2018-1092

**BID DATE:** APRIL 18, 2018

**DEPARTMENT:** STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING</b>		<b>PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR</b>		
<b>DESCRIPTION</b>		<b>NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP</b>	<b>NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP</b>	<b>NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP</b>
<b>ITEM 1.</b>	HYDRAULIC CYLINDER/SYSTEM COMPONENT PARTS	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - <u>20</u> % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - ___ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - ___ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
	_____ Price List or Catalog (MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)	<b>HERCULES</b>		
	List Number _____ Dated _____	<u>LEFT BLANK</u> <u>LEFT BLANK</u>		
<b>TYPE OF PRICE LIST</b>				
WHOLESALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER _____		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>

**NOTE:** This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/  
DATE: 04/20/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM:** HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR **BID #** 2018-1092

**BID DATE:** APRIL 18, 2018 **DEPARTMENT:** STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING</b>		<b>PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR</b>		
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP	NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP	NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP
ITEM  2.	<b>HYDRAULIC CYLINDER/SYSTEM COMPONENT PARTS (ALTERNATE PRICE LIST)</b>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>
		- ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>
		+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
_____ Price List or Catalog (MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)		NO BID		
List Number _____ Dated _____		<u>NO BID</u> <u>NO BID</u>		
<b>TYPE OF PRICE LIST</b> WHOLESALER <input type="checkbox"/> DISTRIBUTOR <input type="checkbox"/> JOBBER <input type="checkbox"/> DEALER <input type="checkbox"/> RETAILER <input type="checkbox"/> OTHER _____ <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/> _____		
<b>TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.</b>		YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		NO <input type="checkbox"/>
YES <input type="checkbox"/>			NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/>
YES <input type="checkbox"/>			NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/>

**NOTE:** This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/  
DATE: 04/20/2018



## CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



**BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR** **BID # 2018-1092**  
**BID DATE: APRIL 18, 2018** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

	<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>			
<b>PART B: SERVICE LABOR RATES</b>				
ITEM NO.	ITEM	REGULAR	REGULAR	REGULAR
1.	REPACK/RESEAL CYLINDER AND REBUILD CYLINDERS	\$175.00 /HOUR		
2.	REPAIR OF HYDRAULIC PUMPS, JACKHAMMERS (HYDRALIC, PNEUMATIC OR GAS)	\$175.00 /HOUR		

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
 DATE:   04/20/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR** **BID # 2018-1092**  
**BID DATE: APRIL 18, 2018** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART C: SAMPLE PRICING</b>				
	<b>DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>SEAL KIT TAILGATE CYLINDER</b>	<b>SEAL KIT TAILGATE CYLINDER</b>	<b>SEAL KIT TAILGATE CYLINDER</b>
<b>ITEM NO.</b>	<b>MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>PART #MTM-0606953</b>	<b>PART #MTM-0606953</b>	<b>PART #MTM-0606953</b>
1.	<b>PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):</b>	\$128.43		
	<b>CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):</b>	\$107.74		
	<b>LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)</b>	\$175.00		
	<b>TOTAL COST (City's Cost &amp; Labor Cost):</b>	\$282.74		
		BIDDER'S PRICE: \$277.74		
	<b>DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>SEAL KIT AUTO REACH CYLINDER</b>	<b>SEAL KIT AUTO REACH CYLINDER</b>	<b>SEAL KIT AUTO REACH CYLINDER</b>
<b>ITEM NO.</b>	<b>MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>PART #MTM-644187</b>	<b>PART #MTM-644187</b>	<b>PART #MTM-644187</b>
2.	<b>PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):</b>	\$157.16		
	<b>CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):</b>	\$125.73		
	<b>LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)</b>	\$175.00		
	<b>TOTAL COST (City's Cost &amp; Labor Cost):</b>	\$300.73		

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
 DATE:   04/20/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM:** HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR **BID #** 2018-1092  
**BID DATE:** APRIL 18, 2018 **DEPARTMENT:** STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART C: SAMPLE PRICING</b>				
<b>ITEM NO. 3.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>SEAL KIT SWEEP CYLINDER (PAKMOR)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT SWEEP CYLINDER (PAKMOR)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT SWEEP CYLINDER (PAKMOR)</b>
	<b>MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>PART #PAKMOR 1362-34</b>	<b>PART #PAKMOR 1362-34</b>	<b>PART #PAKMOR 1362-34</b>
	<b>PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):</b>	\$189.32		
	<b>CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):</b>	\$151.46		
	<b>LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)</b>	\$175.00		
	<b>TOTAL COST (City's Cost &amp; Labor Cost):</b>	\$326.46		
<b>ITEM NO. 4.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>SEAL KIT DUMP CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT DUMP CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT DUMP CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>
	<b>MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>PART #MTM-614398</b>	<b>PART #MTM-614398</b>	<b>PART #MTM-614398</b>
	<b>PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):</b>	\$122.97		
	<b>CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):</b>	\$98.37		
	<b>LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)</b>	\$175.00		
	<b>TOTAL COST (City's Cost &amp; Labor Cost):</b>	\$273.37		

**NOTE:** This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
 DATE:   04/20/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM:** HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR **BID #** 2018-1092  
**BID DATE:** APRIL 18, 2018 **DEPARTMENT:** STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART C: SAMPLE PRICING</b>				
<b>ITEM NO. 5.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>SEAL KIT PACKER CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT PACKER CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT PACKER CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>
	<b>MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>PART #MTM-630862</b>	<b>PART #MTM-630862</b>	<b>PART #MTM-630862</b>
	<b>PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):</b>	\$187.16		
	<b>CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):</b>	\$149.73		
	<b>LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)</b>	\$175.00		
	<b>TOTAL COST (City's Cost &amp; Labor Cost):</b>	\$324.73		
<b>ITEM NO. 6.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>SEAL KIT ARM EXT CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT ARM EXT CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>	<b>SEAL KIT ARM EXT CYLINDER (MCNEILUS)</b>
	<b>MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>PART #MTM-1143852</b>	<b>PART #MTM-1143852</b>	<b>PART #MTM-1143852</b>
	<b>PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):</b>	\$133.87		
	<b>CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):</b>	\$107.10		
	<b>LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)</b>	\$175.00		
	<b>TOTAL COST (City's Cost &amp; Labor Cost):</b>	\$282.10		

**NOTE:** This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
DATE:   04/20/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM:** HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR **BID #** 2018-1092  
**BID DATE:** APRIL 18, 2018 **DEPARTMENT:** STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART C: SAMPLE PRICING</b>				
<b>ITEM NO. 7.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>REPAIR KIT HYDRAULIC JACKHAMMER STANLEY BREAKER</b>	<b>REPAIR KIT HYDRAULIC JACKHAMMER STANLEY BREAKER</b>	<b>REPAIR KIT HYDRAULIC JACKHAMMER STANLEY BREAKER</b>
	<b>MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:</b>	<b>PART #MB-656</b>	<b>PART #MB-656</b>	<b>PART #MB-656</b>
	<b>PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):</b>	\$287.43		
	<b>CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):</b>	\$229.44		
	<b>LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)</b>	\$175.00		
	<b>TOTAL COST (City's Cost &amp; Labor Cost):</b>	\$404.44		
<b>TOTAL COST ( ITEMS 1 - 7)</b>		<b>\$2,194.57</b>  <b>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$2,189.57</b>		

**NOTE:** This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
 DATE:   04/20/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM:** HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR **BID #** 2018-1092  
**BID DATE:** APRIL 18, 2018 **DEPARTMENT:** STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART D: REFUSE BODY REPAIR</b>				
<b>ITEM NO.</b>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF PACKER RAILS</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF PACKER RAILS</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF PACKER RAILS</b>
1.	ESTIMATED HOUR(S) PER ITEM (A)	16		
	REGULAR COST PER HOUR (B)	\$175.00 /HOUR		
	TOTAL REGULAR COST (C)	\$2,800.00		
<b>ITEM NO.</b>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF PACKER FLOORS</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF PACKER FLOORS</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF PACKER FLOORS</b>
2.	ESTIMATED HOUR(S) PER ITEM (A)	24		
	REGULAR COST PER HOUR (B)	\$175.00 /HOUR		
	TOTAL REGULAR COST (C)	\$4,200.00		
<b>ITEM NO.</b>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF HOPPER COMPONENTS</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF HOPPER COMPONENTS</b>	<b>REPAIR/REPLACE OF HOPPER COMPONENTS</b>
3.	ESTIMATED HOUR(S) PER ITEM (A)	31		
	REGULAR COST PER HOUR (B)	\$175.00 /HOUR		
	TOTAL REGULAR COST (C)	\$5,425.00		

**NOTE:** This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
 DATE:   04/20/2018





# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR** **BID # 2018-1092**  
**BID DATE: APRIL 18, 2018** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<b>PART D: REFUSE BODY REPAIR</b>				
<b>ITEM</b>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>REPLACE PACKER CYLINDER</b>	<b>REPLACE PACKER CYLINDER</b>	<b>REPLACE PACKER CYLINDER</b>
<b>4.</b>	<b>ESTIMATED HOUR(S) PER ITEM (A)</b>	<b>12</b>		
	<b>REGULAR COST PER HOUR (B)</b>	<b>\$175.00 /HOUR</b>		
	<b>TOTAL REGULAR COST (C)</b>	<b>\$2,100.00</b>		
<b>ITEM</b>	<b>ITEM</b>	<b>REPLACE WEAR STRIPES/PADS ON MOVING COMPONENTS</b>	<b>REPLACE WEAR STRIPES/PADS ON MOVING COMPONENTS</b>	<b>REPLACE WEAR STRIPES/PADS ON MOVING COMPONENTS</b>
<b>5.</b>	<b>ESTIMATED HOUR(S) PER ITEM (A)</b>	<b>8</b>		
	<b>REGULAR COST PER HOUR (B)</b>	<b>\$175.00 /HOUR</b>		
	<b>TOTAL REGULAR COST (C)</b>	<b>\$1,400.00</b>		
<b>PART D - TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1-5)</b>		<b>\$15,925.00</b>		
<b>TOTAL COST (PARTS C AND D)</b>		<b>\$18,119.57</b>		
		<b>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$2,189.00</b>		

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
 DATE:   04/20/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC CYLINDER REPACK/REBUILD; HYDRAULIC SYSTEM COMPONENT REPAIR AND REFUSE BODY REPAIR** **BID # 2018-1092**  
**BID DATE: APRIL 18, 2018** **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

	<b>INTEGRATED MECHANICS, LLC EL PASO, TX</b>		
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>		
<b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b>	<b>6</b>		
Within ___ consecutive calendar days			
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.	<b>24</b>		

IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.

**BIDS SOLICITED: 22    LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 19    BIDS RECEIVED: 1    LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 1    NO BID: 0**

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY:           /s/            
 DATE: 04/20/2018