



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE

Solicitation #: 2018-1174

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 28, 2018

Department: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

				AMERICAN WIRE GROUP, INC. MIAMI, FL			TRAFFIC SIGNAL INC. JERICHO, NY					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	EST. ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL
				(B)	(C)	(D)	(B)	(C)	(D)	(B)	(C)	(D)
1.	IMSA SPEC. 5-2 LEAD-IN (FEEDER) CABLE	5,000 SPOOL	28	\$1,300.00	\$36,400.00	\$109,200.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE NO BID</small>	\$1,125.00	\$31,500.00	\$94,500.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#				ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE			ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE #8780					
2.	IMSA SPEC. 20-1 FIVE (5) CONDUCTOR CABLE	5,000 SPOOL	28	\$2,175.00	\$60,900.00	\$182,700.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE NO BID</small>	\$1,845.00	\$51,660.00	\$154,980.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#				ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE			ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE #8205					
3.	IMSA SPEC. 20-1 NINE (9) CONDUCTOR CABLE	5,000 SPOOL	28	\$3,875.00	\$108,500.00	\$325,500.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE NO BID</small>	\$3,345.00	\$93,660.00	\$280,980.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#				ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE			ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE #8209					

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: 04/05/2018



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 28, 2018

Solicitation #: 2018-1174
Department: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

				AMERICAN WIRE GROUP, INC. MIAMI, FL			TRAFFIC SIGNAL INC. JERICHO, NY					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	EST. ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL
				(B)	(C)	(D)	(B)	(C)	(D)	(B)	(C)	(D)
4.	IMSA SPEC. 20-1 TWELVE (12) CONDUCTOR CABLE	5,000 SPOOL	28	\$5,106.16	\$142,972.48 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$143,080.00</small>	\$428,917.44 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE NO BID</small>	\$4,345.00	\$121,660.00	\$364,980.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#				ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE			ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE #8212					
5.	IMSA SPEC. 20-1 TWENTY-ONE (21) CONDUCTOR CABLE	5,000 SPOOL	18	\$9,125.00	\$164,250.00	\$492,750.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE NO BID</small>	\$7,535.00	\$135,630.00	\$406,890.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#				ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE			ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE #8221					
6.	IMSA SPEC. 60-2 COMMUNICATION CABLE	5,000 SPOOL	12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,215.00	\$62,580.00	\$187,740.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#							FALCON WIRE #986P1960-2					
7.	VIDEO COXIAL CABLE/POWER	5,000 SPOOL	12	\$1,525.00	\$18,300.00	\$54,900.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE NO BID</small>	\$820.00	\$9,840.00	\$29,520.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#				ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE			ADVANCED DIGITAL CABLE #9912CA					

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: 04/05/2018



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE
Bid Opening Date: MARCH 28, 2018

Solicitation #: 2018-1174
Department: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

				AMERICAN WIRE GROUP, INC. MIAMI, FL			TRAFFIC SIGNAL INC. JERICHO, NY					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	EST. ANNUAL QUANTITY	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL	UNIT PRICE	ANNUAL TOTAL	3-YR TOTAL
			(A)	(B)	(C)	(D)	(B)	(C)	(D)	(B)	(C)	(D)
8.	SINGLE MODE 48 STRAND FIBRE OPTIC CABLE	1,000 SPOOL	25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$454.00	\$11,350.00	\$34,050.00			
MANUFACTURER/BRAND PRODUCT#							PRYSMIAN C-ETHIJKT-12-HB 048-E3					
TOTALS ITEM 1-8:					\$531,322.48 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$531,322.44</small>	\$1,593,967.44 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE NO BID</small>		\$517,880.00	\$1,553,640.00			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: ___04/05/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: TRAFFIC SIGNAL CABLE

Solicitation #: 2018-1174

Bid Opening Date: MARCH 28, 2018

Department: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

	AMERICAN WIRE GROUP, INC. MIAMI, FL	TRAFFIC SIGNAL INC. JERICHO, NY	
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	1% - 10 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within ___ consecutive calendar days</p>	28 (4 WEEKS ARO)	10	
<p>Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.</p>		24	
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			
<p>BIDS SOLICITED: 14 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 8 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0 NO BID: 0</p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: 04/05/2018