



**CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION**



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**

BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

	BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
DESCRIPTION		NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP	NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP
ITEM 1:	HOSE (MUST BE APPLICABLE WITH THE RENTAL EQUIPMENT LISTED IN PART B BELOW)	NET <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>
		- ___ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- <u>25</u> % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
		+ ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
_____ Price List or Catalog (MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)		FLEXTRAL	CONTITECH
List Number _____ Dated _____		<u>SCH 12017 PL - 310317</u> <u>4-18-2018 LP NET PRICING</u>	<u>2018</u> <u>5/2018</u>
TYPE OF PRICE LIST			
WHOLESALER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER _____ <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> USER	

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___ 5/25/2018 _____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



**CITY OF EL PASO
BID TABULATION**



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**

BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018

DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

		BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR		
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP
ITEM 2:	FITTINGS (MUST BE APPLICABLE WITH THE RENTAL EQUIPMENT LISTED IN PART B BELOW)	NET <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>
		- ___ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- <u>25</u> % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	- ___ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>
		+ ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ___ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
_____ Price List or Catalog (MANUFACTURER OR BRAND NAME)		FLEXTRAL	CONTITECH	
List Number _____ Dated _____		SCH 12017 PL - 310317 4-18-2018 LP NET PRICING	2018 5/2018	
TYPE OF PRICE LIST				
WHOLESALER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER _____ <input type="checkbox"/>		<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> USER	<input type="checkbox"/> _____	<input type="checkbox"/> _____
TWO (2) COPIES (EITHER HARDCOPY OR CD) INCLUDED WITH THE BID PACKAGE.		YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/>
PRICE LIST INCLUDED		YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NO <input type="checkbox"/>	YES <input type="checkbox"/>

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: ___ 5/25/2018 _____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



**CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION FORM**



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

	BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART B: SERVICE LABOR RATES	(MUST INCLUDE ALL FEES/TRANSPORATION TO JOB SITES AND LANDFILLS)		
REGULAR HOUR SERVICE LABOR RATES:	RATE PER HOUR	RATE PER HOUR	RATE PER HOUR
REGULAR HOUR SERVICE LABOR RATE	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
AFTER HOUR SERVICE LABOR RATE	RATE PER HOUR	RATE PER HOUR	RATE PER HOUR
AFTER HOUR SERVICE LABOR RATE	\$50.00	\$180.00	\$0.00

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___5/25/2018_____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 1.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	1/2" HYDRAULIC HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 4,000 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	1/2" HYDRAULIC HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 4,000 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	1/2" HYDRAULIC HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 4,000 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	PL250-08	XR16SC-08	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$10.42	\$8.32	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$1.99	\$6.24	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$1.99	\$126.24	\$0.00	
ITEM 2.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	3/4" HYDRAULIC HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 3,120 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	3/4" HYDRAULIC HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 3,120 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	3/4" HYDRAULIC HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 3,120 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	PX250-12	XR16SC-12	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$15.90	\$13.17	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$3.04	\$9.87	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$3.04	\$129.87	\$0.00	

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___5/25/2018_____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 3.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	1" HYDRAULIC HOSE, HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 2,395 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	1" HYDRAULIC HOSE, HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 2,395 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	1" HYDRAULIC HOSE, HOSE, 2 WIRE BRAID, 2,395 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	PX250-16	XR16-16	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$21.91	\$16.83	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$4.20	\$12.62	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
	TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$4.20	\$132.62	\$0.00
ITEM 4.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	3/8" 100R7 NON-CONDUCTIVE THERMOPLASTIC HOSE, 2250 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	3/8" 100R7 NON-CONDUCTIVE THERMOPLASTIC HOSE, 2250 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	3/8" 100R7 NON-CONDUCTIVE THERMOPLASTIC HOSE, 2250 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	607-06	NR706	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$7.69	\$6.39	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$2.13	\$4.79	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
	TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$2.13	\$124.79	\$0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___5/25/2018_____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	3/4" HOSE MENDER	3/4" HOSE MENDER	3/4" HOSE MENDER
5.	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	212-12-HM	DM06	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$31.38	\$10.00	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$10.68	\$7.50	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
	TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$10.68	\$127.50	\$0.00
ITEM	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	3/4" MJIC / 1/2" MNPT STRAIGHT ADAPTER	3/4" MJIC / 1/2" MNPT STRAIGHT ADAPTER	3/4" MJIC / 1/2" MNPT STRAIGHT ADAPTER
6.	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	2404-12-08	DM07	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$8.85	\$18.00	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$1.79	\$13.50	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
	TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$1.79	\$133.50	\$0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___5/25/2018_____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



**CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION**



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 7.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	2" LOW PRESSURE RETURN LINE 100R4 HIGH TEMP. 200 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	2" LOW PRESSURE RETURN LINE 100R4 HIGH TEMP. 200 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	2" LOW PRESSURE RETURN LINE 100R4 HIGH TEMP. 200 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	HH-32	HR4-32	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$64.01	\$34.15	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$14.80	\$25.61	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
	TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$14.80	\$145.61	\$0.00
ITEM 8.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	3" LOW PRESSURE RETURN LINE 100R4 HIGH TEMP. 200 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	3" LOW PRESSURE RETURN LINE 100R4 HIGH TEMP. 200 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT	3" LOW PRESSURE RETURN LINE 100R4 HIGH TEMP. 200 PSI WORKING PRESSURE - PER FOOT
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	HH-48	HR4-48	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$128.26	\$62.87	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$27.69	\$47.15	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
	TOTAL COST (City's Cost):	\$27.69	\$167.15	\$0.00

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___ 5/25/2018 _____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



**CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION**



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 9.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	5/16" HOSE BORE X 5/8" BUMPED TUBE O-RING MALE SWIVEL COUPLING	5/16" HOSE BORE X 5/8" BUMP TUBE O-RING MALE SWIVEL COUPLING	5/16" HOSE BORE X 5/8" BUMP TUBE O-RING MALE SWIVEL COUPLING
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	206-06-BTF	ACOTM0606	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$22.06	\$19.12	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$3.66	\$14.34	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost):		\$3.66	\$134.34	\$0.00
ITEM 10.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	3/4" JIC "T" FITTING	3/4" JIC "T" FITTING	3/4" JIC "T" FITTING
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	2603-12-12-12	2603-1212-12	
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$25.17	\$19.50	\$0.00
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$6.54	\$14.62	\$0.00
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00	\$120.00	\$0.00
TOTAL COST (City's Cost):		\$6.54	\$134.62	\$0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.



CITY OF EL PASO



APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___5/25/2018_____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



**CITY OF EL PASO
 BID TABULATION**



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

		BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX			MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX					
PART C: SAMPLE PRICING										
ITEM 11.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	1" JIC FEMALE SWIVEL FITTING, 37°			1" JIC FEMALE SWIVEL FITTING, 37°			1" JIC FEMALE SWIVEL FITTING, 37°		
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	E 16-16FJ			BZ-JCFX16-16					
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$45.91			\$34.35			\$0.00		
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$11.91			\$25.76			\$0.00		
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00			\$120.00			\$0.00		
TOTAL COST (City's Cost):		\$11.91			\$145.76			\$0.00		
ITEM 12.	DESCRIPTION / MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	3/4" JIC FEMALE SWIVEL FITTING, 37°			3/4" JIC FEMALE SWIVEL FITTING, 37°			3/4" JIC FEMALE SWIVEL FITTING, 37°		
	BIDDER'S PART NUMBER:	E 12-12 FJ			BZ-VCFX12-12					
	PRICE LIST COST (BEFORE DISCOUNT/MARK-UP):	\$24.75			\$20.56			\$0.00		
	CITY'S COST (AFTER DISCOUNT or /MARK-UP or NET):	\$6.42			\$15.42			\$0.00		
	LABOR COST (assume one (1) hour labor from PART B Regular Rate)	\$0.00			\$120.00			\$0.00		
TOTAL COST (City's Cost):		\$6.42			\$135.42			\$0.00		
TOTAL COST (ITEMS 1 - 12) (INCLUDES PART B)		PART B		TOTAL COST	PART B		TOTAL COST	PART B		TOTAL COST
		\$0.00		\$94.85	\$1,440.00		\$1,637.42	\$0.00		\$0.00

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___ 5/25/2018 _____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID # 2018-1321**
BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT: STREETS AND MAINTENANCE**

PART D: RENTAL EQUIPMENT			BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX			MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	EST. MONTHLY QTY.	UNIT RENTAL PRICE	MONTHLY ESTIMATED QTY. X UNIT RENTAL PRICE	YEARLY UNIT RENTAL PRICE (Monthly X 12)	UNIT RENTAL PRICE	MONTHLY ESTIMATED QTY. X UNIT RENTAL PRICE	YEARLY UNIT RENTAL PRICE (Monthly X 12)	UNIT RENTAL PRICE	MONTHLY ESTIMATED QTY. X UNIT RENTAL PRICE	YEARLY UNIT RENTAL PRICE (Monthly X 12)
1.	END ASSEMBLY MACHINE	2 EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$50.00	\$100.00	\$1,200.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,400.00</small>	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER/ BRAND/ PART NUMBER			FLEXTRAL FY-21			NP40					
2.	HOSE CUTTING MACHINE	2 EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$50.00	\$100.00	\$1,200.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,400.00</small>	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER/ BRAND/ PART NUMBER			FLEXTRAL 243-97								
3.	BENCH MOUNTED CRIMPER	2 EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$50.00	\$100.00	\$1,200.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,400.00</small>	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER/ BRAND/ PART NUMBER			FLEXTRAL RWB-U								
TOTAL (ITEMS 1-3)				NO BID	NO BID		\$300.00	\$3,600.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE \$7,200.00</small>		\$0.00	\$0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
 DATE: ___ 5/25/2018 _____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
 HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



BID ITEM: HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS, HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE **BID #** 2018-1321

BID DATE: MAY 16, 2018 **DEPARTMENT:** STREETS AND MAINTENANCE

	BRIDGESTONE HOSEPOWER, LLC EL PASO, TX	MILESTONE INDUSTRIAL, INC. EL PASO, TX	
<u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u>			
THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.			
BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
PAYMENT TERMS:	2% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS	2% - 10 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS	
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:		24	
Within ___ consecutive calendar days		4	
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.			
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			
BIDS SOLICITED: 11 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 11 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 2 NO BID: 0			

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/_____
DATE: ___ 5/25/2018 _____

2018-1321 HYDRAULIC, BRAKE AND A/C HOSE LINE AND FITTINGS,
HOSE MACHINES RENTAL AND FIELD SERVICE (RE-BID)