



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: FINE ART SHIPPING (RE-BID)
Bid Opening Date: JUNE 27, 2018

Solicitation #: 2018-1495
Department: MUSEUMS AND CULTURAL AFFAIRS

GROUP I (A) - NATIONAL FINE ART SHIPPING - SHUTTLE SERVICE				DISPLAYS LLC DBA DISPLAYS FINE ART SERVICES ARLINGTON, TX			TRANSPORT CONSULTANTS INTERNATIONAL, INC CRANFORD, NJ					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL EST. QTY.		UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)
		MIN (A)	MAX (B)									
1.	CLIMATE CONTROLLED, AIR-RIDE SUSPENSION VEHICLE EQUIPPED WITH GPS TRACKING	1	20	\$2,670.00 TRIP	\$53,400.00	\$160,200.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00
2.	TWO (2) TRAINED ART HANDLERS	1	20	\$195.00 TRIP	\$3,900.00	\$11,700.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00
3.	SOFT-PACK WORKS OF ART	1	20	\$195.00 EA.	\$3,900.00	\$11,700.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00
4.	CRATE WORKS OF ART	1	20	\$260.00 EA.	\$5,200.00	\$15,600.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00
SUB-TOTAL - GROUP 1 (A) (ITEM 1-4)					\$66,400.00	\$199,200.00		NO BID	NO BID		\$0.00	\$0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: 07/02/2018



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: FINE ART SHIPPING (RE-BID)

Solicitation #: 2018-1495

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 27, 2018

Department: MUSEUMS AND CULTURAL AFFAIRS

GROUP 1 (B) - NATIONAL FINE ART SHIPPING - EXCLUSIVE SERVICE				DISPLAYS LLC DBA DISPLAYS FINE ART SERVICES ARLINGTON, TX			TRANSPORT CONSULTANTS INTERNATIONAL, INC CRANFORD, NJ						
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL EST. QTY.		UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)	
		MIN (A)	MAX (B)										
1.	CLIMATE CONTROLLED, AIR-RIDE SUSPENSION VEHICLE EQUIPPED WITH GPS TRACKING	1	20	\$14,190.00 TRIP	\$283,800.00	\$851,400.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
2.	TWO (2) TRAINED ART HANDLERS	1	20	\$195.00 TRIP	\$3,900.00	\$11,700.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
2.	SOFT-PACK WORKS OF ART	1	20	\$195.00 EA.	\$3,900.00	\$11,700.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
3.	CRATE WORKS OF ART	1	20	\$260.00 EA.	\$5,200.00	\$15,600.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 EA.	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
SUB-TOTAL - GROUP 1 (B) (ITEM 1-4)					\$296,800.00	\$890,400.00		NO BID	NO BID		\$0.00	\$0.00	

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: 07/02/2018



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: FINE ART SHIPPING (RE-BID)

Solicitation #: 2018-1495

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 27, 2018

Department: MUSEUMS AND CULTURAL AFFAIRS

GROUP II - INTERNATIONAL FINE ART SHIPPING				DISPLAYS LLC DBA DISPLAYS FINE ART SERVICES ARLINGTON, TX			TRANSPORT CONSULTANTS INTERNATIONAL, INC CRANFORD, NJ					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL EST. QTY.		UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL COST (D)	3-YEAR TOTAL COST (E)
		MIN (A)	MAX (B)									
1.	INTERNATIONAL FINE ART SHIPPING OF BOXED OR CRATED ARTWORKS	1	20	NO BID TRIP	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00
2.	CUSTOMS BROKER FEE	1	20	NO BID TRIP	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00 TRIP	\$0.00	\$0.00
SUB-TOTAL - GROUP II (ITEM 1-2)					NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID		\$0.00	\$0.00

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: 07/02/2018



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Solicitation #: 2018-1495

Bid Opening Date: JUNE 27, 2018

Department: MUSEUMS AND CULTURAL AFFAIRS

	DISPLAYS LLC DBA DISPLAYS FINE ART SERVICES ARLINGTON, TX	TRANSPORT CONSULTANTS INTERNATIONAL, INC CRANFORD, NJ	
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: Within ___ consecutive calendar days</p>	30		
<p>Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.</p>			
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			
<p>BIDS SOLICITED: 12 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 2 BIDS RECEIVED: 2 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0 NO BID: 0</p>			

NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/_____
DATE: 07/02/2018