



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

TRANSMISSION FLUID					BREWERS OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM			BREWERS OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE			C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC EL PASO, TX		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
1.	TRANSYND	55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$2,086.62	\$166,929.60	\$500,788.80	\$2,086.62	\$166,929.60	\$500,788.80	\$1,729.00	\$138,320.00	\$414,960.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					EMGARD 2805			EMGARD 2805			MOBIL DELUAC 1 ATF		
2.	MERCON LV ATF TRANSMISSION OIL MOTOR CREAFT	QUART	60 DRUMS	600 QUARTS	\$4.00	\$2,400.00	\$7,200.00	\$3.97	\$2,382.00	\$7,146.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					MOTORCRAFT MERCON LV ATF			MOTORCRAFT MERCON LV ATF			LET BLANK		
3.	MERCON VI TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.090	\$409.00	\$1,227.00	\$4.09	\$409.00	\$1,227.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV HAV SYN ATFMV DEX VI			CHV HAV SYN ATFMV DEX VI			LEFT BLANK		
4.	ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.09	\$409.00	\$1,227.00	\$4.09	\$409.00	\$1,227.00	\$2.39	\$239.00	\$717.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHU HAV AFT +4			CHU HAV AFT +4			MOBIL ATF +4		
5.	TRANSMISSION FLUID (ZF LIST OF LUBRICANTS TE-ML 14, PART E)	BULK- 55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$2,008.20	\$160,656.00	\$481,968.00	\$2,008.20	\$160,656.00	\$481,968.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SHELL SPIRAX 56 ATF ZM			SHELL SPIRAX 56 ATF ZM			LEFT BLANK		
MOTOR OIL													
6.	SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL	QUART	100 QUARTS	800 QUARTS	\$4.38	\$3,504.00	\$10,512.00	\$4.38	\$3,504.00	\$10,512.00	\$2.13	\$1,704.00	\$5,112.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV HAV PRODS SYN MO 5W20			CHV HAV PRODS SYN MO 5W20			MOBIL SUP SYN 5W-20		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

MOTOR OIL					BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM			BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE			C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC EL PASO, TX		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
7.	ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 LOW ASH (CUMMINS APPROVED)	GAL. BULK	1,000 DRUMS	25,000 DRUMS	\$9.48	\$237,000.00	\$711,000.00	\$8.03	\$200,750.00	\$602,250.00	\$6.97	\$174,250.00	\$522,750.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV DELP 400 NG 15W40			VALV PERM BLUE GEO M85 15W40			MOBIL DIELUAC CNG/LNG 15W-40		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
8.	HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR EQUIVALENT	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	110 DRUMS	\$332.75	\$36,602.50	\$109,807.50	\$291.50	\$32,065.00	\$96,195.00	\$242.55	\$26,680.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$26,678.30	\$80,041.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$80,034.90
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV HYD AW 68			VALV AW HYD 68			MOBIL HUMBLE HYD 68		
9.	HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXACO # 765-1542 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	5 CANS	50 CANS	\$65.00	\$3,250.00	\$9,750.00	\$65.00	\$3,250.00	\$9,750.00	\$8.31	\$415.50	\$1,246.50
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA HYDRAULIC JACK OIL			NAPA HYDRADULIC JACK OIL			MOBIL FLUID 424		
10.	AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	10 CANS	100 CANS	\$40.00	\$4,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$40.00	\$4,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$16.34	\$1,634.00	\$4,902.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SHELL AEROSHELL FLUID 4			SHELL AEROSHELL FLUID 4			MOBIL DTE #10 EXCEL 15		
11.	GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC SAE 75W - 90 W	400 POUND DRUM	2 DRUMS	12 DRUMS	\$1,379.08	\$16,548.96	\$49,646.88	\$1,379.08	\$16,548.96	\$49,646.88	\$925.00	\$11,100.00	\$33,300.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV DELO SYNGEAR XDM 75W90			CHV DELO SYNGEAR XDM 75W90			MOBIL DIELUAC SYN 75W-90		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

					BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM			BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE			C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC EL PASO, TX		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
12.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	120 POUND CAN	2 CANS	14 CANS	\$298.91	\$4,184.74	\$12,554.22	\$300.84	\$4,211.76	\$12,635.28	\$239.00	\$3,346.00	\$10,038.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV DELO GREASE EP 2			VALV CERVLEAN #2			MOBIL XHP 222		
13.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	150 DRUMS	\$987.16	\$148,074.00	\$444,222.00	\$943.00	\$141,450.00	\$424,350.00	\$741.65	\$111,247.50	\$333,742.50
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV DELO GREASE EP 2			VALV CERVLEAN #2			MOBIL XHP 222		
14.	ESTER OIL CAN. R134a	1 GAL. CAN	2 CANS	50 CANS	\$100.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$100.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					ESTERCOOL R134A			ESTERCOOL R134A			LEFT BLANK		
15.	ANTIFREEZE 50/50 BLEND	GAL.	1,000 GALLONS	10,000 GALLONS	\$7.08	\$70,800.00	\$212,400.00	\$5.34	\$53,400.00	\$160,200.00	\$7.21	\$72,100.00	\$216,300.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHV DEL ELC 50/50			ZEREZ HD ELC 50/50			MOBIL DIELUAC ELC		
ANNUAL AMOUNT (LINES 1 - 15)					\$859,767.80 BIDDER'S PRICE \$859,760.80			\$794,965.32			\$541,036.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$541,214.30		
LUBRICANTS 3 - YEAR GRAND TOTAL (LINES 1 - 15)					\$2,579,303.40 BIDDER'S PRICE \$2,579,282.40			\$2,384,895.96			\$1,623,109.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,623,102.90		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES					BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM		BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE		C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC EL PASO, TX	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)
			MIN	MAX (A)						
1.	ENGINE OIL	EA	500	3,500	\$10.00	\$35,000.00	\$10.00	\$35,000.00	\$14.70	\$51,450.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					ALS TRIBOLOGY C3 TEST PACKAGE NATGAS		LEFT BLANK		MOBIL SERV	
2.	TRANSMISSION FLUID	EA	500	3500	\$10.00	\$35,000.00	\$10.00	\$35,000.00	\$14.70	\$51,450.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					ALS TRIBOLOGY C1 TEST PACKAGE TRANS		LEFT BLANK		MOBIL SERV	
3.	FREIGHT FOR BOX OF TEST KITS	BOX			\$29.50	\$206,500.00	\$29.50	\$206,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					10 KITS PER BOX		LEFT BLANK		FEUL-EX	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES ANNUAL TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$276,500.00		\$276,500.00		\$102,900.00	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES 3 - YR GRAND TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$829,500.00		\$829,500.00		\$308,700.00	
3 -YR GRAND TOTAL PRICE LUBRICANTS (ITEM 1 - 15) + OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES (ITEM 1 - 3)					\$3,408,803.40 BIDDER'S PRICE \$3,408,782.40		\$3,214,395.96		\$1,931,809.50 BIDDER'S PRICE \$1,931,802.90	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
 Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
 MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

	BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM	BREWER OIL COMPANY ALBUQUERQUE, NM ALTERNATIVE	C & R DISTRIBUTING LLC EL PASO, TX
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND. BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
NO OPTION OFFERED	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
PAYMENT TERMS:	NET 30 - DAYS	NET 30 - DAYS	NET 30 - DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: WITHIN <u>7</u> CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS	3	3	2
WITHIN <u>24</u> HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY	24	24	24
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
 DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

TRANSMISSION FLUID					GENUINE PARTS COMPANY DBA NAPA EL PASO, TX			HONSTEIN OIL AND DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX			M.J MADER ENTERPRISES INC DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
1.	TRANSYND	55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$1,531.30	\$122,504.00	\$367,512.00	\$1,866.00 PER DRUM	\$149,280.00	\$447,840.00	\$1,229.00	\$98,320.00	\$294,960.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					VALVOLINE NAPA PART #718143			CASTROL ALLISON TRANSYND ATF			BASF EMGARD 2805 ATF		
2.	MERCON LV ATF TRANSMISSION OIL MOTOR CREAFT	QUART	60 DRUMS	600 QUARTS	\$5.65	\$3,390.00	\$10,170.00	\$2.63 PER QT	\$1,578.00	\$4,734.00	\$6.00	\$3,600.00	\$10,800.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					VALVOLINE NAPA PART #VV3246			P66 VERSTRANS LV ATF - 1075031			MOTORCRAFT MERCON LY ATF		
3.	MERCON VI TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.040	\$404.00	\$1,212.00	\$2.63 PER QT	\$263.00	\$789.00	\$3.47	\$347.00	\$1,041.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA PART #75208			P66 VERSTRANS LV ATF - 1075031			LUBRIGOLD FS MV DEX VI		
4.	ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$3.89	\$389.00	\$1,167.00	\$2.42 PER QT	\$242.00	\$726.00	\$3.82	\$382.00	\$1,146.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA PART #75206			P66 VERSTRANS ATF - 1074652			COASTAL FS MV ATF +4		
5.	TRANSMISSION FLUID (ZF LIST OF LUBRICANTS TE-ML 14, PART E)	BULK- 55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$1,531.30	\$122,504.00	\$367,512.00	\$1,539.85	\$123,188.00	\$369,564.00	\$1,674.00	\$133,920.00	\$401,760.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					VALVOLINE NAPA PART #718143			SHELL SPRIAX 56 ATF ZM			SHELL SPIRAX S6 ATF ZM		
MOTOR OIL													
6.	SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL	QUART	100 QUARTS	800 QUARTS	\$3.61	\$2,888.00	\$8,664.00	\$2.11	\$1,688.00	\$5,064.00	\$3.31	\$2,648.00	\$7,944.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA PART #75530			1076574 P66 SHEILD ARMOR SYNTHETIC			LUBRIGOLD FS 5W20 DEXOS I		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

MOTOR OIL					GENUINE PARTS COMPANY DBA NAPA EL PASO, TX			HONSTEIN OIL AND DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX			M.J MADER ENTERPRISES INC DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
7.	ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 LOW ASH (CUMMINS APPROVED)	GAL. BULK	1,000 DRUMS	25,000 DRUMS	\$16.36 55 GAL DRUM \$90,000 = 16.36 PER GALLON	\$409,000.00	\$1,227,000.00	\$7.03 PER GALLON	\$175,750.00	\$527,250.00	\$7.03	\$175,750.00	\$527,250.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					VALVOLINE NAPA PART #70505			1045181 - P66 GUARDOL NG 15/40			CITGO GITGARD CNG/LNG 15W40		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
8.	HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR EQUIVALENT	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	110 DRUMS	\$360.75	\$39,682.50	\$119,047.50	\$313.50 PER DRUM	\$34,485.00	\$103,455.00	\$269.00	\$29,590.00	\$88,770.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA PART #85-755			1055932 - P66 MEGAFLOW HYD 68			CITGO HYDURANCE AW 68		
9.	HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXACO # 765-1542 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	5 CANS	50 CANS	\$9.81	\$490.50	\$1,471.50	\$16.85 PER GALLON JUG	\$842.50	\$2,527.50	\$8.50	\$425.00	\$1,275.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA 1542			NAPA HYDRAULIC JACK OIL			COASTAL HYDRAULIC JACK OIL		
10.	AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	10 CANS	100 CANS	\$18.55 92.75/5 = 18.55 PER GALLON	\$1,855.00	\$5,565.00	\$16.37 PER GALLON	\$1,637.00	\$4,911.00	\$30.61	\$3,061.00	\$9,183.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					CHEVRON 5606A NAPA PART #2477707448			1045377 - P66 X/C AVIATION HYD 5606A			AEROSHELL FLUID 4		
11.	GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC SAE 75W - 90 W	400 POUND DRUM	2 DRUMS	12 DRUMS	\$1,889.24 PER 55 GALLON DRUM	\$22,670.88	\$68,012.64	\$972.00 (\$2.43 PER POUND)	\$11,664.00	\$34,992.00	\$725.00	\$8,700.00	\$26,100.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					VALVOLINE NAPA 70026			1074594 - P66 TRITON SYN LUBE LDO			COASTAL FULL SYNTHETIC 75W90		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

					GENUINE PARTS COMPANY DBA NAPA EL PASO, TX			HONSTEIN OIL AND DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX			M.J MADER ENTERPRISES INC DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX		
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
12.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	120 POUND CAN	2 CANS	14 CANS	\$376.28	\$5,267.92	\$15,803.76	\$235.20	\$3,292.80	\$9,878.40	\$270.00	\$3,780.00	\$11,340.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					VALVOLINE NAPA PART #70130			1073948 - P66 DYNALIFE HT#2			WARREN AUTOGUARD HI-TEMP #2		
13.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	150 DRUMS	\$1,218.97 PER 400 LB KEG	\$182,845.50	\$548,536.50	\$720.00	\$108,000.00	\$324,000.00	\$700.00	\$105,000.00	\$315,000.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					VALVOLINE NAPA PART #70129			1073951 - P66 DYNALIFE HT#2			WARREN AUTOGUARD HI-TEMP #2		
14.	ESTER OIL CAN. R134a	1 GAL. CAN	2 CANS	50 CANS	\$100.06	\$5,003.00	\$15,009.00	\$47.19	\$2,359.50	\$7,078.50	\$120.00	\$6,000.00	\$18,000.00
	MANUFACTURER BRAND					A1 NATIONAL REFRIGERANT LTD PE 321G A1 - ALSO CAN USE PE681G COST = \$113.08 PER GALL ANNUAL \$5,654.00 3 YEATS \$16,962.00			MIGHTY SUPER COOL - E127 ESTER REFI LB100			NATIONAL REFRIGERANTS R134a	
15.	ANTIFREEZE 50/50 BLEND	GAL.	1,000 GALLONS	10,000 GALLONS	\$6.30	\$63,000.00	\$189,000.00	\$6.70	\$67,000.00	\$201,000.00	\$6.25	\$62,500.00	\$187,500.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					NAPA PART #RTU1GAL			CHEVERON - DEL ELC 50/50 RED			ZEREX E1C 50/50		
ANNUAL AMOUNT (LINES 1 - 15)					\$981,894.30			\$681,269.80			\$634,023.00		
LUBRICANTS 3 - YEAR GRAND TOTAL (LINES 1 - 15)					\$2,945,682.90			\$2,043,809.40			\$1,902,069.00		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES					GENUINE PARTS COMPANY DBA NAPA EL PASO, TX	HONSTEIN OIL AND DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX	M.J MADER ENTERPRISES INC DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)
			MIN	MAX (A)						
1.	ENGINE OIL	EA	500	3,500	LEFT BLANK	NO BID	\$8.75	\$30,625.00	FREE	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LEFT BLANK		ALS LAB PHOENIX - P66 3BN (MUST BE P66 PRODUCT)		LUBE ALERT OIL ANALYSIS CNG/LNG	
2.	TRANSMISSION FLUID	EA	500	3500	LEFT BLANK	NO BID	\$4.50	\$15,750.00	FREE	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LEFT BLANK		LAB ONE - PHOENIX - CON-B_PP		LUBE ALERT OIL ANALYSIS TRANSMISSION	
3.	FREIGHT FOR BOX OF TEST KITS	BOX			LEFT BLANK	NO BID	\$10.00	\$7,000.00	\$150.00	\$10,500.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LEFT BLANK		BOX OF 10 EL PASO TO PHOENIX		100 KITS PER BOX - 70 BOXES	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES ANNUAL TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					NO BID		\$53,375.00		\$10,500.00	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES 3 - YR GRAND TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					NO BID		\$160,125.00		\$31,500.00	
3 -YR GRAND TOTAL PRICE LUBRICANTS (ITEM 1 - 15) + OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES (ITEM 1 - 3)					\$2,945,682.90		\$2,203,934.40		\$1,933,569.00	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
 Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
 MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

	GENUINE PARTS COMPANY DBA NAPA EL PASO, TX	HONSTEIN OIL AND DISTRIBUTING, LLC EL PASO, TX	M.J MADER ENTERPRISES INC DBA BIO-DYNE CHEMICAL CO. EL PASO, TX
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND. BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
NO OPTION OFFERED	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
PAYMENT TERMS:	NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	5% 10 DAYS
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: WITHIN <u>7</u> CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS	7	2	1
WITHIN <u>24</u> HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY	48	24	24
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
 DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

TRANSMISSION FLUID					SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC RICHARDSON, TX			SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
1.	TRANSYND	55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$1,318.61	\$105,488.80	\$316,466.40	\$1,894.40	\$151,552.00	\$454,656.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			CASTROL					
2.	MERCON LV ATF TRANSMISSION OIL MOTOR CREAFT	QUART	60 DRUMS	600 QUARTS	\$4.21	\$2,526.00	\$7,578.00	\$3.80	\$2,280.00	\$6,840.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			MOTORCRAFT (ECO-BOXES)					
3.	MERCON VI TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.210	\$421.00	\$1,263.00	\$5.79	\$579.00	\$1,737.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			PENNZOIL 6/1 CASE					
4.	ATF +4 TRANSMISSION FLUID	QUART	10 QUARTS	100 QUARTS	\$4.21	\$421.00	\$1,263.00	\$5.52	\$552.00	\$1,656.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			PENNZOIL 6/1 CASE					
5.	TRANSMISSION FLUID (ZF LIST OF LUBRICANTS TE-ML 14, PART E)	BULK- 55 GALLON DRUM	8 DRUMS	80 DRUMS	\$1,318.61	\$105,488.80	\$316,466.40	\$1,165.00	\$93,200.00	\$279,600.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SHELL					
MOTOR OIL													
6.	SAE 5W20 FULL SYNTHETIC OIL	QUART	100 QUARTS	800 QUARTS	\$3.50	\$2,800.00	\$8,400.00	\$2.63	\$2,104.00	\$6,312.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SUPER S 6/1 CASE					

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

MOTOR OIL					SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC RICHARDSON, TX			SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
7.	ENGINE OIL, 15W-40 LOW ASH (CUMMINS APPROVED)	GAL. BULK	1,000 DRUMS	25,000 DRUMS	\$6.47	\$161,750.00	\$485,250.00	\$14.96	\$374,000.00	\$1,122,000.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SHELL					
MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT													
8.	HYDRAULIC OIL, GRADE 68 SHELL OR EQUIVALENT	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	110 DRUMS	\$291.00	\$32,010.00	\$96,030.00	\$201.41	\$22,155.10	\$66,465.30	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			PERFORMANCE 500					
9.	HYDRAULIC JACK OIL, TEXACO # 765-1542 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	5 CANS	50 CANS	\$5.80	\$290.00	\$870.00	\$6.37	\$318.50	\$955.50	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SUPER S 12/1 CASE					
10.	AIRCRAFT HYDRAULIC OIL, TEXACO #15 OR EQUIVALENT	1 GAL. CAN	10 CANS	100 CANS	\$7.86	\$786.00	\$2,358.00	\$25.32	\$2,532.00	\$7,596.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SHELL					
11.	GEAR LUBRICANT, FULLY SYNTHETIC SAE 75W - 90 W	400 POUND DRUM	2 DRUMS	12 DRUMS	\$1,270.00	\$15,240.00	\$45,720.00	\$888.00	\$10,656.00	\$31,968.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SUPER S					

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

MISCELLANEOUS OIL, FLUIDS, GREASE, AND COOLANT					SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC RICHARDSON, TX			SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA					
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	3-YEAR TOTAL (D) (C X 3 = D)
			MIN	MAX (A)									
12.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	120 POUND CAN	2 CANS	14 CANS	\$285.00	\$3,990.00	\$11,970.00	\$312.01	\$4,368.14	\$13,104.42	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			MYSTIK					
13.	HI-TEMP #2 AUTO GREASE	55 GAL. DRUM	10 DRUMS	150 DRUMS	\$960.00	\$144,000.00	\$432,000.00	\$1,022.58	\$153,387.00	\$460,161.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			MYSTIK					
14.	ESTER OIL CAN. R134a	1 GAL. CAN	2 CANS	50 CANS	\$115.78	\$5,789.00	\$17,367.00	\$75.74	\$3,787.00	\$11,361.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SUPERCOOL					
15.	ANTIFREEZE 50/50 BLEND	GAL.	1,000 GALLONS	10,000 GALLONS	\$5.20	\$52,000.00	\$156,000.00	\$6.23	\$62,300.00	\$186,900.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
MANUFACTURER BRAND					SAFETY-KLEEN PERFORMANCE PLUS SEE SPEC SHEET			SHELL					
ANNUAL AMOUNT (LINES 1 - 15)					\$633,000.60			\$883,770.74			\$0.00		
LUBRICANTS 3 - YEAR GRAND TOTAL (LINES 1 - 15)					\$1,899,001.80			\$2,651,312.22			\$0.00		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES					SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC RICHARDSON, TX		SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)	UNIT PRICE (B)	ANNUAL AMOUNT (C) (A X B = C)
			MIN	MAX (A)						
1.	ENGINE OIL	EA	500	3,500	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$8.50	\$29,750.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LEFT BLANK		LAB ONE			
2.	TRANSMISSION FLUID	EA	500	3500	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$8.50	\$29,750.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LEFT BLANK		LAB ONE			
3.	FREIGHT FOR BOX OF TEST KITS	BOX			\$0.00	\$0.00	\$30.00	\$10,500.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
IDENTIFY VENDOR AND TEST					LEFT BLANK		30.00/BOX			
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES ANNUAL TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$0.00		\$70,000.00		\$0.00	
OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES 3 - YR GRAND TOTAL - (ITEMS 1 THRU 3)					\$0.00		\$210,000.00		\$0.00	
3 -YR GRAND TOTAL PRICE LUBRICANTS (ITEM 1 - 15) + OIL SAMPLE TESTING KITS AND ANALYSIS SERVICES (ITEM 1 - 3)					\$1,899,001.80		\$2,861,312.22		\$0.00	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
DATE: 11/14/2017



Project Name: LUBRICANTS FOR TRANSIT FLEET
 Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 8, 2017

Solicitation #: 2018-360
 MASS TRANSIT - SUM METRO

	SAFETY-KLEEN SYSTEMS INC RICHARDSON, TX	SOUTHERN COUNTIES OIL CO., A CA LIMITED PARTNERSHIP DBA SC FUELS ORANGE, CA	
OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND. BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:			
TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
NO OPTION OFFERED	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
PAYMENT TERMS:	0 NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY: WITHIN <u>7</u> CONSECUTIVE CALENDAR DAYS	7	3	
WITHIN <u>24</u> HOURS OR OVERNIGHT AFTER RECEIPT OF VERBAL ORDER IN CASES OF EMERGENCY	48	24	
IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.			
BIDS SOLICITED: 27 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 23 BIDS RECEIVED: 8 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 4 NO BID: 0			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____/s/
 DATE: 11/14/2017