



**CITY OF EL PASO  
 BID TABULATION FORM**



**Project Name: MAST ARM POLES (RE-BID)  
 Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 15, 2017**

**Solicitation #: 2018-438  
 Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE**

				CONTINENTAL POLE & LIGHTING PORTLAND, OR			STRUCTURAL & STEEL PRODUCTS, INC. FORT WORTH, TX			VALMONT INDUSTRIES, INC. VALLEY, NE		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B x C = D) (D)	3 YEAR TOTAL (D x 3 = E) (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B x C = D) (D)	3 YEAR TOTAL (D x 3 = E) (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B x C = D) (D)	3 YEAR TOTAL (D x 3 = E) (E)
		MIN (A)	MAX (B)									
1.	MAST ARM POLE, 20' GALVANIZED FINISH ARM	20 EACH	25 EACH	\$2,135.00	\$53,375.00	\$160,125.00	\$3,326.00	\$83,150.00	\$249,450.00	\$2,873.00	\$71,825.00	\$215,475.00
2.	MAST ARM POLE, 25' GALVANIZED FINISH ARM	20 EACH	25 EACH	\$2,311.00	\$57,775.00	\$173,325.00	\$3,426.00	\$85,650.00	\$256,950.00	\$3,026.00	\$75,650.00	\$226,950.00
3.	MAST ARM POLE, 30' GALVANIZED FINISH ARM	15 EACH	20 EACH	\$2,561.00	\$51,220.00	\$153,660.00	\$3,505.00	\$70,100.00	\$210,300.00	\$3,298.00	\$65,960.00	\$197,880.00
4.	MAST ARM POLE, 35' GALVANIZED FINISH ARM	10 EACH	13 EACH	\$2,651.00	\$34,463.00	\$103,389.00	\$3,941.00	\$51,233.00	\$153,699.00	\$3,727.00	\$48,451.00	\$145,353.00
5.	MAST ARM POLE, TYPE III 40' GALVANIZED FINISH ARM	10 EACH	12 EACH	\$2,750.00	\$33,000.00	\$99,000.00	\$4,400.00	\$52,800.00	\$158,400.00	\$4,595.00	\$55,140.00	\$165,420.00

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_ /s/ \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: 11/16/17 \_\_\_\_\_



## CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



**Project Name: MAST ARM POLES (RE-BID)**  
**Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 15, 2017**

**Solicitation #: 2018-438**  
**Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE**

				CONTINENTAL POLE & LIGHTING PORTLAND, OR			STRUCTURAL & STEEL PRODUCTS, INC. FORT WORTH, TX			VALMONT INDUSTRIES, INC. VALLEY, NE		
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QTY.		UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B x C = D) (D)	3 YEAR TOTAL (D x 3 = E) (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B x C = D) (D)	3 YEAR TOTAL (D x 3 = E) (E)	UNIT PRICE (C)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B x C = D) (D)	3 YEAR TOTAL (D x 3 = E) (E)
		MIN (A)	MAX (B)									
6.	MAST ARM POLE, TYPE III 48' GALVANIZED FINISH ARM	10 EACH	12 EACH	\$2,886.00	\$34,632.00	\$103,896.00	\$5,132.00	\$61,584.00	\$184,752.00	\$5,239.00	\$62,868.00	\$188,604.00
7.	TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLE ASSEMBLY FOR ITEMS 1 4	15 EACH	20 EACH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,188.00	\$43,760.00	\$131,280.00	\$2,094.00	\$41,880.00	\$125,640.00
TOTAL (ITEMS 1-7)						\$793,395.00			\$1,344,831.00			\$1,265,322.00

**NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_ /s/ \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: 11/16/17 \_\_\_\_\_



## CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: MAST ARM POLES (RE-BID)

Solicitation #: 2018-438

Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 15, 2017

Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE

	CONTINENTAL POLE & LIGHTING PORTLAND, OR	STRUCTURAL & STEEL PRODUCTS, INC. FORT WORTH, TX	VALMONT INDUSTRIES, INC. VALLEY, NE
<p><b><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></b></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p><b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b></p>	1% - 10 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS
<p><b>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</b> Within__ consecutive calendar days</p>	80	84	75
<p>Within__ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.</p>	N/A	N/A	N/A
<p><b>BIDS SOLICITED: 16    LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 9    BIDS RECEIVED: 3    LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0    NO BID: 0</b></p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_ /s/ \_\_\_\_\_

DATE: 11/16/17 \_\_\_\_\_