



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES** **Solicitation #: 2018-870**  
**BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018** **Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE**

			BARNETT HARLEY - DAVIDSON LP EL PASO, TX		DFW HONDA GRAPEVINE, TX		GLOBAL ENFORCEMENT MOTORS INC. / SPECIALTY RECREATION & MARINE DALTON GARDENS, ID	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY.	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)
1.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES WITH SPECIAL POLICE PACKAGE	18	\$17,377.00	\$312,786.00	\$17,838.00	\$321,084.00	\$17,777.00	\$319,986.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			2018-H-D-FLHTP		HONDA ST1300 POLICE		YAMAHA FTR1300P 2018 MODEL	
2.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PACKAGE EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION	18	\$3,651.00	\$65,718.00	\$5,889.00	\$106,002.00	\$5,580.00	\$100,440.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			ALL EQUIPMENT		WHELEN, SSIW, HB HONDA, DELL CITY, BLUE SEA		GEM WHELEN YAMAHA	
3.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES CRASH PROTECTION	18	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$712.00	\$12,816.00	\$640.00	\$11,520.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			COMES WITH IT		MC ENTERPRISE ST CRASH BARS		GEM YAMAHA RTP	
4.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PD RADIO (POLICE COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION)	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$7,644.00	\$137,592.00	\$8,880.00	\$159,840.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			NO BID		MOTOROLA APX8500		MOTOROLA APX8500 ALL BAND M RADIOS	

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.**  
**The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
 DATE: 3/14/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018			Solicitation #: 2018-870 Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE					
			BARNETT HARLEY - DAVIDSON LP EL PASO, TX		DFW HONDA GRAPEVINE, TX		GLOBAL ENFORCEMENT MOTORS INC. / SPECIALTY RECREATION & MARINE DALTON GARDENS, ID	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY.	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)
5.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PUSH TO TALK KIT (POLICE COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION)	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$944.00	\$16,992.00	\$768.95	\$13,841.10  BIDDER'S PRICE: \$13,841.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			LEFT BLANK		SETCOM KA23		SETON KA23MMCUCU-71, M625-0694	
6.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES RADIO BOX (POLICE COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION)	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,657.00	\$29,826.00	INC.	INC.
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			LEFT BLANK		R BOX XL RADIO TRUNK		YAMAHA	
7.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES HAND-HELD RADAR	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,446.00	\$44,028.00	\$2,806.00	\$50,508.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			LEFT BLANK		STALK II MDR		STALKER II MDK INCLUDES CASE DESK TOP CHARGERS, 12 VT CHARGE MOTORCYCLE LOCKABLE HOLSTER RAM GUN MOUNT	
8.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES HAND-HELD LIDAR		NO BID	NO BID	\$2,536.00	\$45,648.00	\$2,807.00	\$50,526.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			LEFT BLANK		STALKER XLR LIDAR		STALKER LIDAR XLR INCLUDES CASE, DESK TOP CHARGERS, 12 VT CHARGE MOTORCYCLE LOCKABLE HOLSTER	

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE: 3/14/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES			Solicitation #: 2018-870					
BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018			Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE					
			BARNETT HARLEY - DAVIDSON LP EL PASO, TX		DFW HONDA GRAPEVINE, TX		GLOBAL ENFORCEMENT MOTORS INC. / SPECIALTY RECREATION & MARINE DALTON GARDENS, ID	
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY.	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)
9.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES DIGITAL VIDEO RECORDER (DVR)	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,711.00	\$102,798.00	\$6,046.90	\$108,844.20
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			LEFT BLANK		WATCHGUARD 4RE		WATCHGUARD 4RE CAMERA SEPTEN INCLUDES INSTALLATION & MOUNTING BRACKETS	
10.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PDA FOR E-TICKETS	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,454.00	\$44,172.00	\$2,514.00	\$45,252.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			LEFT BLANK		MOTOROLA MC67		MOTOROLA MC64 INCLUDES MAGNETIC STRIP READER 12 VT CHARGER QUANTITY (5) 4 SLOT CRADLE CHARGERS	
11.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES ZEBRA PRINTER FOR E-TICKETS	18	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,183.00	\$21,294.00	\$1,236.00	\$22,248.00
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			LEFT BLANK		ZEBRA ZQ520		ZEBRA ZQ520 PRINTER INCLUDES 12VT CHARGER & POWER SUPPLY PRINTER OPTION	
TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 10)			\$378,504.00		\$882,252.00		\$883,005.30	
			ELECTRONIC ITEMS #4-#10 TOTAL NEXT PAGE				BIDDER'S PRICE: \$883,005.20	

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE: 3/14/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



<b>BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES</b> <b>BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018</b>		<b>Solicitation #: 2018-870</b> <b>Department: STREETS &amp; MAINTENANCE</b>	
	<b>BARNETT HARLEY - DAVIDSON LP EL PASO, TX</b>	<b>DFW HONDA GRAPEVINE, TX</b>	<b>GLOBAL ENFORCEMENT MOTORS INC. / SPECIALTY RECREATION &amp; MARINE DALTON GARDENS, ID</b>
<p><b><u>OPTION TO PURCHASE ADDITIONAL QUANTITY OF ITEMS</u></b>          THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO PURCHASE AN ADDITIONAL QUALITY OF ITEMS BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE-HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:</p> <p>SIXTY [60] DAYS FROM THE DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>NINETY [90] DAYS FROM THE DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>ONE-HUNDRED AND EIGHTY [180] DAYS FROM THE DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>NO OPTION OFFERED.</p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>	<b>NET - 30 DAYS</b>

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee. The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
 DATE: 3/14/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES** **Solicitation #: 2018-870**  
**BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018** **Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE**

			MAX MOTORCYCLES NH HAMPTON, NH		SANDIA BMW MOTORCYCLES ALBUQUERQUE, NM			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY.	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)
1.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES WITH SPECIAL POLICE PACKAGE	18	\$26,702.00	\$480,636.00	\$22,204.09	\$399,673.62		
	MANUFACTURER / MODEL		BMW R1200 RT-P		LEFT BLANK			
2.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PACKAGE EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION	18	LEFT BLANK	LEFT BLANK INCLUDED IN PRICE SHOWN IN ITEM 1	\$4,180.35	\$75,246.30		
	MANUFACTURER / MODEL		BMW R1200 RT-P		LEFT BLANK			
3.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES CRASH PROTECTION	18	LEFT BLANK	LEFT BLANK INCLUDED IN PRICE SHOWN IN ITEM 1	\$728.94	\$13,120.92		
	MANUFACTURER / MODEL		BMW R1200 RT-P		LEFT BLANK			
4.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PD RADIO (POLICE COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION)	18	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
	MANUFACTURER / MODEL		NO BID		NO BID			

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE: 3/14/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES** **Solicitation #: 2018-870**  
**BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018** **Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE**

			MAX MOTORCYCLES NH HAMPTON, NH		SANDIA BMW MOTORCYCLES ALBUQUERQUE, NM			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY.	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)
5.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PUSH TO TALK KIT (POLICE COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION)	18	\$416.50	\$7,497.00	\$2,249.24	\$40,486.32		
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			SETCOM KA23		LEFT BLANK			
6.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES RADIO BOX (POLICE COMMUNICATIONS EQUIPMENT AND INSTALLATION)	18	LEFT BLANK	LEFT BLANK INCLUDED IN PRICE SHOWN IN ITEM 1	\$171.34	\$3,084.12		
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			BMW R1200 RT-P		LEFT BLANK			
7.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES HAND-HELD RADAR	18	\$2,188.00	\$39,384.00	\$87.53	\$1,575.54		
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			STALKER STALKER II MOVING RADAR		LEFT BLANK			
8.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES HAND-HELD LIDAR		\$2,267.00	\$40,806.00	\$238.33	\$4,289.94		
MANUFACTURER / MODEL			STALKER LIDAR XLR		LEFT BLANK			

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE: 3/14/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES** **Solicitation #: 2018-870**  
**BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018** **Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE**

			MAX MOTORCYCLES NH HAMPTON, NH		SANDIA BMW MOTORCYCLES ALBUQUERQUE, NM			
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	ESTIMATED QTY.	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)	UNIT PRICE	(ESTIMATED QUANTITY X UNIT PRICE)
9.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES DIGITAL VIDEO RECORDER (DVR)	18	\$5,734.45	\$103,220.10  BIDDER'S PRICE: \$103,320.00	\$247.21	\$4,449.78		
	MANUFACTURER / MODEL		WATCHGUARD 4RE		LEFT BLANK			
10.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES PDA FOR E-TICKETS	18	\$2,445.00	\$44,010.00	\$165.00	\$2,970.00		
	MANUFACTURER / MODEL		MOTOROLA MC 67		LEFT BLANK			
11.	POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES ZEBRA PRINTER FOR E-TICKETS	18	\$935.00	\$16,830.00	\$175.67	\$3,162.06		
	MANUFACTURER / MODEL		ZEBRA ZQ 520		LEFT BLANK			
<b>TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 10)</b>			<b>\$732,383.10 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$732,381.84</b>		<b>\$548,058.60</b>			

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.  
The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.**

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
DATE: 3/14/2018



# CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



**BID ITEM: POLICE PATROL MOTORCYCLES** **Solicitation #: 2018-870**  
**BID OPENING DATE: FEBRUARY 28, 2018** **Department: STREETS & MAINTENANCE**

	MAX MOTORCYCLES NH HAMPTON, NH	SANDIA BMW MOTORCYCLES ALBUQUERQUE, NM	
<p><b><u>OPTION TO PURCHASE ADDITIONAL QUANTITY OF ITEMS</u></b>            THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO PURCHASE AN ADDITIONAL QUALITY OF ITEMS BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF PURCHASING ONE-HUNDRED PERCENT (100%) OF THE ORIGINAL CONTRACT QUANTITIES, AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE, IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED WITHIN:</p> <p>SIXTY [60] DAYS FROM THE DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>NINETY [90] DAYS FROM THE DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>ONE-HUNDRED AND EIGHTY [180] DAYS FROM THE DATE OF AWARD OF THE CONTRACT.</p> <p>NO OPTION OFFERED.</p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input checked="" type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>	<p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p>YES <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> NO <input type="checkbox"/></p> <p style="text-align: center;"><input type="checkbox"/></p>
<b>PAYMENT TERMS:</b>	NET - 30 DAYS	100 % - 30 DAYS	
<b>BIDS SOLICITED: 41    LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 5    BIDS RECEIVED: 5    LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 1    NO BID:</b>			

**NOTE: This is a Best Value Procurement. Price and other factors shall be evaluated to determine an awardee.**  
 The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: \_\_\_\_\_/s/\_\_\_\_\_  
 DATE: 3/14/2018