



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

	AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS, INC. HUNTERSVILLE, NC	BORDER RECAPING LLC dba BORDER TIRE EL PASO, TX	THE GOODYEAR TIRE AND RUBBER COMPANY AKRON, OH
--	---	--	--

SECTION A - TIRES - NEW: (Please Note: All Tires will be ordered on an "As Needed Basis").

ITEM NO.	TIRE DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)						
1.	11 R22.5	1	10	\$316.87	\$3,168.70	\$350.00	\$3,500.00	\$503.60	\$5,036.00
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE FS561 248307		BF GOODRICH CROSS CONTROL S 03117		GOODYEAR H G 751 SA TL 138799576	
2.	12 R22.5	1	110	\$346.12	\$38,073.20	\$475.00	\$52,250.00	\$584.18	\$64,259.80
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE FS561 248494		MICHELIN YXE 85335		GOODYEAR H G 751 SA TL 138127576	
3.	445/65 R22.5	1	10	\$582.00	\$5,820.00	\$813.10	\$8,131.00 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$8,130.00</small>	\$741.08	\$7,410.80
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE FS818 #247797		MICHELIN XZY3 83691		GOODYEAR L G296 SA TL 756314365	
4.	425/65 R22.5	1	20	\$748.80	\$14,976.00	\$525.00	\$10,500.00	\$692.61	\$13,852.20
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			BRIDGESTON R244 225221		BF GOODRICH CROSS CONTROL S 19321		GOODYEAR L G296 SA TL 756160365	
5.	315/80 R22.5	1	50	\$463.12	\$23,156.00	\$425.00	\$21,250.00	\$415.22	\$20,761.00
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE T819 157147		BF GOODRICH ST230 55458		GOODYEAR L G289 WHA TL 756141613	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

	AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS, INC. HUNTERSVILLE, NC	BORDER RECAPING LLC dba BORDER TIRE EL PASO, TX	THE GOODYEAR TIRE AND RUBBER COMPANY AKRON, OH
--	--	--	---

SECTION A - TIRES - NEW: (Please Note: All Tires will be ordered on an "As Needed Basis").

ITEM NO.	TIRE DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)						
6.	385/65 R22.5	1	60	\$466.00	\$27,960.00	\$445.00	\$26,700.00	\$623.34	\$37,400.40
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER				FIRESTONE FS818 247780	BF GOODRICH CROSS CONTROL S 53214		GOODYEAR G296 SA TL 756315365	
7.	225/70 R19.5	1	140	\$220.00	\$30,800.00	\$231.20	\$32,368.00	\$261.08	\$36,551.20
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER				FIRESTONE FS561 248409	BF GOODRICH ST230 74208		GOODYEAR G G647 RSS TL 139172053	
8.	215/85 R16	1	10	\$101.31	\$1,013.10	\$116.13	\$1,161.30	\$124.81	\$1,248.10
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER				GENERAL GRABBER HD 04507140000	BF GOODRICH T/A AS2 19836		GOODYEAR 115R E WRL TRAILRUNNER AT 742517681	
9.	245/75 R17	1	50	\$129.85	\$6,492.50	\$154.84	\$7,742.00	\$141.85	\$7,092.50
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER				GENERAL GRABBER HTS60 04505140000	BF GOODRICH RUGGED TRAIL 61626		GOODYEAR 121S E WRL TRAILRUNNER AT 742104681	
10.	265/70 R17	1	10	\$108.09	\$1,080.90	\$162.74	\$1,627.40	\$118.70	\$1,187.00
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER				GENERAL GRABBER HTS 6004504780000	BF GOODRICH T/A AS2 17795		GOODYEAR 115R SL WRL FORTITUDE HT BSWTL 157042622	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
 Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
 Department: FIRE

				AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS, INC. HUNTERSVILLE, NC	BORDER RECAPING LLC dba BORDER TIRE EL PASO, TX	THE GOODYEAR TIRE AND RUBBER COMPANY AKRON, OH			
SECTION A - TIRES - NEW: (Please Note: All Tires will be ordered on an "As Needed Basis").									
ITEM NO.	TIRE DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)						
11.	235/70 R17	1	10	\$105.12	\$1,051.20	\$136.05	\$1,360.50	\$119.50	\$1,195.00
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER				GENERAL GRABBER HTS60 04504760000		MICHILIN LTX M/S2 01721		GOODYEAR 109T XL WRL TRAILRUNNER A/T 741134681	
TOTAL SECTION A (ITEMS 1-11)							\$166,590.20 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$166,589.20</small>		\$195,994.00
				TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE	3 YR TOTAL (Dx3)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE	3 YR TOTAL (Dx3)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE	3 YR TOTAL (Dx3)
GRAND TOTAL SECTION A				\$153,591.60	\$460,774.80 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$--0.00--</small>	\$166,590.20 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$166,589.20</small>	\$499,770.60 <small>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$499,767.60</small>	\$195,994.00	\$587,982.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES

Solicitation #: 2019-009

Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Department: FIRE

		AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS, INC. HUNTERSVILLE, NC		BORDER RECAPING LLC dba BORDER TIRE EL PASO, TX		THE GOODYEAR TIRE AND RUBBER COMPANY AKRON, OH			
GROUP I - EMERGENCY VEHICLE ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES									
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)						
1.	Monday through Friday 7:00 AM - 5:00 PM	15	30	NO BID	NO BID	\$45.00	\$1,350.00	\$47.50	\$1,425.00
2.	After Hours, Weekends & Holidays 5:00 PM - 7:00 AM	25	40	NO BID	NO BID	\$75.00	\$3,000.00	\$62.50	\$2,500.00
GROUP I - ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 2)					NO BID		\$4,350.00		\$3,925.00
GROUP II - EMERGENCY VEHICLE ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES *Tires above 10R22.5 will be considered heavy duty tires.									
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		FLAT RATE FOR SERVICE CALL (C.)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)						
1.	Monday through Friday 7:00 AM - 5:00 PM	10	20	NO BID	\$0.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$--0.00--</i>	\$75.00	\$1,500.00	\$47.50	\$950.00
2.	After Hours, Weekends & Holidays 5:00 PM - 7:00 AM	20	40	NO BID	\$0.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$--0.00--</i>	\$90.00	\$3,600.00	\$62.50	\$2,500.00
GROUP II - ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 2)					\$0.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$--0.00--</i>		\$5,100.00 <i>BIDDER'S PRICE: \$5,000.00</i>		\$3,450.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

				AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS, INC. HUNTERSVILLE, NC	BORDER RECAPING LLC dba BORDER TIRE EL PASO, TX	THE GOODYEAR TIRE AND RUBBER COMPANY AKRON, OH				
GROUP III - EMERGENCY VEHICLE ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR AIRPORT CRASH TRUCK VEHICLES *Tires size 24 R21 will be considered heavy duty tires. This shall include ring replacements.										
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)							
1.	Monday through Friday 7:00 AM - 5:00 PM	1	4	NO BID	\$0.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$ --0.00--	\$75.00	\$300.00	\$47.50	\$190.00	
2.	After Hours, Weekends & Holidays 5:00 PM - 7:00 AM	1	4	NO BID	\$0.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$ --0.00--	\$90.00	\$360.00	\$62.50	\$250.00	
GROUP III - ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 2)					\$0.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$ --0.00--		\$660.00		\$440.00	
					GRAND TOTAL ANNUAL	GRAND TOTAL THREE (3) YEARS	GRAND TOTAL ANNUAL	GRAND TOTAL THREE (3) YEARS	GRAND TOTAL ANNUAL	GRAND TOTAL THREE (3) YEARS
GRAND TOTAL - GROUPS I, II, III					\$0.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$ --0.00--	\$0.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$ --0.00--	\$10,110.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$10,010.00	\$30,330.00 BIDDER'S PRICE: \$30,030.00	\$7,815.00	\$23,445.00

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES

Solicitation #: 2019-009

Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Department: FIRE

	AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS, INC. HUNTERSVILLE, NC	BORDER RECAPING LLC dba BORDER TIRE EL PASO, TX	THE GOODYEAR TIRE AND RUBBER COMPANY AKRON, OH
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	NET - 30 DAYS	___% - 30 DAYS NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</p> <p>Within ___ consecutive calendar days</p>	1 - 2	2	20
<p>Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.</p>	24	24	8
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

				REDBURN TIRE COMPANY SUNLANDPARK, NM	SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC COLUMBIA, MS				
SECTION A - TIRES - NEW: (Please Note: All Tires will be ordered on an "As Needed Basis").									
ITEM NO.	TIRE DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)						
1.	11 R22.5	1	10	\$339.78	\$3,397.80	\$319.00	\$3,190.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE FD663 281042		FIRESTONE FS561 #248307			
2.	12 R22.5	1	110	\$404.63	\$44,509.30	\$348.00	\$38,280.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE FD663 151009		FIRESTONE FS561 #248494			
3.	445/65 R22.5	1	10	\$850.20	\$8,502.00	\$579.00	\$5,790.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			BRIDGESTONE M854 241456		FIRESTONE FS818 #247797			
4.	425/65 R22.5	1	20	\$699.00	\$13,980.00	\$522.00	\$10,440.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			BRIDGESTONE M860 001741		FIRESTONE FS818 #241235			
5.	315/80 R22.5	1	50	\$575.00	\$28,750.00	\$425.00	\$21,250.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			BRIDGESTONE M860 244329		FIRESTONE FS820 #233874			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

				REDBURN TIRE COMPANY SUNLANDPARK, NM	SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC COLUMBIA, MS				
SECTION A - TIRES - NEW: (Please Note: All Tires will be ordered on an "As Needed Basis").									
ITEM NO.	TIRE DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)						
6.	385/65 R22.5	1	60	\$465.00	\$27,900.00	\$466.00	\$27,960.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE FS818 247780		FIRESTONE FS818 #247780			
7.	225/70 R19.5	1	140	\$231.20	\$32,368.00	\$224.00	\$31,360.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			BF GOODRICH ST230 41208		FIRESTONE FS561 #248409			
8.	215/85 R16	1	10	\$107.67	\$1,076.70	\$104.40	\$1,044.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE 189701		FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE #189701			
9.	245/75 R17	1	50	\$123.96	\$6,198.00	\$122.10	\$6,105.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE 225425		FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE #225425			
10.	265/70 R17	1	10	\$139.56	\$1,395.60	\$113.80	\$1,138.00		
	PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER			FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE 200156		FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2 #097912			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

				REDBURN TIRE COMPANY SUNLANDPARK, NM	SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC COLUMBIA, MS					
SECTION A - TIRES - NEW: (Please Note: All Tires will be ordered on an "As Needed Basis").										
ITEM NO.	TIRE DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (B) X (C.) = D (D)	
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)							
11.	235/70 R17	1	10	\$106.02	\$1,060.20	\$102.80	\$1,028.00			
PRODUCT BRAND AND PART NUMBER				FIRESTONE DESTINATION 097776		FIRESTONE DESTINATION LE2 #09776				
TOTAL SECTION A (ITEMS 1-11)						\$169,137.60		\$147,585.00		
					TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE	3 YR TOTAL (Dx3)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE	3 YR TOTAL (Dx3)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE	3 YR TOTAL (Dx3)
GRAND TOTAL SECTION A					\$169,137.60	\$507,412.80	\$147,585.00	\$442,755.00		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

				REDBURN TIRE COMPANY SUNLANDPARK, NM	SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC COLUMBIA, MS					
GROUP I - EMERGENCY VEHICLE ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES										
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)							
1.	Monday through Friday 7:00 AM - 5:00 PM	15	30	\$110.00	\$3,300.00	\$95.00	\$2,850.00			
2.	After Hours, Weekends & Holidays 5:00 PM - 7:00 AM	25	40	\$192.00	\$7,680.00	\$145.00	\$5,800.00			
GROUP I - ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 2)					\$10,980.00		\$8,650.00			
GROUP II - EMERGENCY VEHICLE ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES										
*Tires above 10R22.5 will be considered heavy duty tires.										
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		FLAT RATE FOR SERVICE CALL (C.)	TOTAL ANNUAL PRICE (B) X (C.) = D (D)	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)							
1.	Monday through Friday 7:00 AM - 5:00 PM	15	20	\$110.00	\$2,200.00	\$145.00	\$2,900.00			
2.	After Hours, Weekends & Holidays 5:00 PM - 7:00 AM	20	40	\$192.00	\$7,680.00	\$165.00	\$6,600.00			
GROUP II - ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 2)					\$9,880.00		\$9,500.00			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

				REDBURN TIRE COMPANY SUNLANDPARK, NM	SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC COLUMBIA, MS					
GROUP III - EMERGENCY VEHICLE ROADSIDE TIRE SERVICE FOR AIRPORT CRASH TRUCK VEHICLES										
*Tires size 24 R21 will be considered heavy duty tires. This shall include ring replacements.										
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION OF ITEM	ANNUAL ESTIMATED QUANTITY		UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	UNIT PRICE (C.)	TOTAL PRICE ANNUAL (D) (B) X (C.) = D	
		MINIMUM (A)	MAXIMUM (B)							
1.	Monday through Friday 7:00 AM - 5:00 PM	1	4	\$173.00	\$692.00	\$195.00	\$780.00			
2.	After Hours, Weekends & Holidays 5:00 PM - 7:00 AM	1	4	\$357.00	\$1,428.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00			
GROUP III - ANNUAL TOTAL (ITEMS 1 - 2)					\$2,120.00		\$1,780.00			
					GRAND TOTAL ANNUAL	GRAND TOTAL THREE (3) YEARS	GRAND TOTAL ANNUAL	GRAND TOTAL THREE (3) YEARS	GRAND TOTAL ANNUAL	GRAND TOTAL THREE (3) YEARS
GRAND TOTAL - GROUPS I, II, III					\$22,980.00	\$68,940.00	\$19,930.00	\$59,790.00		

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION FORM



Project Name: APPARATUS TIRES AND SERVICES
Bid Opening Date: NOVEMBER 14, 2018

Solicitation #: 2019-009
Department: FIRE

	REDBURN TIRE COMPANY SUNLANDPARK, NM	SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC COLUMBIA, MS	
<p><u>OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT</u></p> <p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p>			
<p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF THE CONTRACT:</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>NO OPTION OFFERED</p>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
<p>PAYMENT TERMS:</p>	NET - 30 DAYS	NET - 30 DAYS	
<p>BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:</p> <p>Within ___ consecutive calendar days</p>	24	1-7	
<p>Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency.</p>	8	24	
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			
<p>BIDS SOLICITED: 38 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 33 BIDS RECEIVED: 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 1 NO BID: 0</p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

Approved By: ___/s/___
 Date: ___11/16/2018_____