



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137	
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
	DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP	NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP
		NET <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>
ITEM 1:	Ammunition	- ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- <u>11</u> % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
		+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the _____ Price List or Catalog <small>(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)</small>		<u>No Bid</u>	<u>SUPER VAL AMMUNITION</u>
List Number _____ Dated _____		_____ _____	<u>NA</u> <u>2019</u>
TYPE OF PRICE LIST			
WHOLESALER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER _____ <input type="checkbox"/>		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> SUGGESTED RETAIL

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137	
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
	DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP	NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP
		NET <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>
ITEM 2:	Ammunition	- ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- <u>11</u> % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
		+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	- <u>43</u> % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
		+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the _____ Price List or Catalog <small>(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)</small>		<u>No Bid</u>	<u>SUPER VAL AMMUNITION</u>
List Number _____ Dated _____		_____ _____	<u>NA</u> <u>2019</u>
TYPE OF PRICE LIST			<u>2019 DOMESTIC PRICE LIST</u> <u>5/10/2019</u>
WHOLESALER	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER _____	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <u>MSRP</u>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		BID # 2019-1137 DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
	DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP	NET <u>OR</u> % DISCOUNT <u>OR</u> MARKUP
ITEM 3:	Ammunition	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - 11 % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> + ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the Price List or Catalog (note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)		<u>No Bid</u>	<u>SUPER VAL AMMUNITION</u>
List Number _____ Dated _____		_____ _____	<u>NA</u> <u>2019</u>
TYPE OF PRICE LIST WHOLESALE DISTRIBUTOR JOBBER DEALER RETAILER OTHER _____		<input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> MSRP

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		BID # 2019-1137 DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
		DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV
		GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP
ITEM 4:	Uniforms	NET <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>
		- ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- <u>11</u> % DISCOUNT <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
		+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the Price List or Catalog (note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)		<u>No Bid</u>	<u>Super Vel Ammunition</u>
List Number _____ Dated _____		_____ _____	<u>NA</u> <u>2019</u>
TYPE OF PRICE LIST			
WHOLESALE		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER _____		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <u>MSRP</u>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137		
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE		
		DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 1.	DESCRIPTION:	.308 Caliber 165 Grain	.308 Caliber 165 Grain	.308 Caliber 165 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FEDERAL LE308T1
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FC-LE308T1
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$765.02
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$382.51
ITEM 2.	DESCRIPTION:	.338 Caliber 250 Grain	.338 Caliber 250 Grain	.338 Caliber 250 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FEDERAL GM338LM
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FC-GM338LM
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,189.16
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,094.58
ITEM 3.	DESCRIPTION:	.50 Caliber 647 Grain	.50 Caliber 647 Grain	.50 Caliber 647 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	N/A
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	LEFT BLANK
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM 4.	DESCRIPTION:	.40 Caliber 165 Grain	.40 Caliber 165 Grain	.40 Caliber 165 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FEDERAL P40HST3
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FC-P40HST3
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$892.50
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$446.25

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137		
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE		
		DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 5.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DEFTECH 1210
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DT-1210
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.75
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.41
ITEM 6.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 1026 Def-Tec Mod 4Cs Charger	DT- 1026 Def-Tec Mod 4Cs Charger	DT- 1026 Def-Tec Mod 4Cs Charger
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DEFTECH 1026
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DT-1026
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$44.90
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$42.66
ITEM 7.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 6064 Foam Rubber Baton 40 mm	DT- 6064 Foam Rubber Baton 40 mm	DT- 6064 Foam Rubber Baton 40 mm
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DEFTECH 6064
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DT-6064
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.10
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.80
ITEM 8.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DEFTECH 1210
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DT-1210
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.75
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.41

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137		
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE		
		DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 9.	DESCRIPTION:	FOF-FF556BI Force on Force Ammo 5.56 Blue	FOF-FF556BI Force on Force Ammo 5.56 Blue	FOF-FF556BI Force on Force Ammo 5.56 Blue
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FORCE ON FORCE FF9B2
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FOF-FF9B2
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$594.66
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$297.33
ITEM 10.	DESCRIPTION:	FOF- FF9B2 Force on Force Ammo 9mm Blue	FOF- FF9B2 Force on Force Ammo 9mm Blue	FOF- FF9B2 Force on Force Ammo 9mm Blue
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FORCE ON FORCE FF556B1
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FOF-FF556B1
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$707.90
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$353.95
ITEM 11.	DESCRIPTION:	.40 Cal Practice	.40 Cal Practice	.40 Cal Practice
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	BLAZER 3589
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	CCI-3589
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$637.00
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$318.50
ITEM 12.	DESCRIPTION:	12 ga Slug	12 ga Slug	12 ga Slug
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FEDERAL F-127 RS
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	FC-F127RS
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$325.00
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$162.50

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137		
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE		
		DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM	E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING				
13.	DESCRIPTION:	9 mm Duty	9 mm Duty	9 mm Duty
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	LEFT BLANK	HORNADY 90225
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	5V911SSCHP-20 20 COUNT	HORNADY-90225
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	\$18.17	\$900.40
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	\$16.17	\$513.23
14.	DESCRIPTION:	40mm Ferret OC, CS and Powder CS	40mm Ferret OC, CS and Powder CS	40mm Ferret OC, CS and Powder CS
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DEFTECH 1260
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DT-1260
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.20
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.94
15.	DESCRIPTION:	Riot Control Grenade CS	Riot Control Grenade CS	Riot Control Grenade CS
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DEFTECH 1082
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DT-1082
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.35
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$30.73
16.	DESCRIPTION:	Tripe Chaser Grenades Continuous Discharge CS	Tripe Chaser Grenades Continuous Discharge CS	Tripe Chaser Grenades Continuous Discharge CS
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DEFTECH 1026
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	DT-1026
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$44.90
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	\$42.66

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137								
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE								
		DOÑA ANA MUNITIONS COMPANY DBA DAM AMMO CO LAS CRUCES, NM		E. CAMERON N. HOPKINS DBA NEVADA CARTRIDGE CO, LLC DBA SUPER VEL CARTRIDGE CO. HENDERSON, NV		GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC. AUSTIN, TX				
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING										
ITEM 17.	DESCRIPTION:	Distraction Device Reloads- 15 Gram		Distraction Device Reloads- 15 Gram		Distraction Device Reloads- 15 Gram				
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID		N/A				
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID		LEFT BLANK				
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID				
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID				
ITEM 18.	DESCRIPTION:	40 mm Skat Shell Saf-Smoke Product		40 mm Skat Shell Saf-Smoke Product		40 mm Skat Shell Saf-Smoke Product				
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID		DEFTECH 6173				
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID		DT-6173				
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID		NO BID		\$33.55				
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID		NO BID		\$31.87				
Total (items 1-18)			\$0.00	\$0.00		\$16.17	\$16.17		\$7,232.14	\$3,778.33

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137	
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
	PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP
ITEM 1:	Ammunition	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - _____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + <u>51</u> % MARKUP <input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - 25+ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + _____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the _____ Price List or Catalog <small>(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)</small>		<u>WINCHESTER</u>	<u>REMINGTON</u>
List Number _____ Dated _____		<u>LAW ENFORCEMENT LE</u> <u>MSRP</u> <u>2019</u>	<u>www.proforceonline.com</u> <u>2019</u>
TYPE OF PRICE LIST WHOLESALER DISTRIBUTOR JOBBER DEALER RETAILER OTHER _____		<input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> RETAIL MSRP FOR LAW ENFORCEMENT	<input type="checkbox"/> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137	
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
	PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP
ITEM 2:	Ammunition	NET <input type="checkbox"/> - 0 % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> *set price - ____ % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/> + ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the Price List or Catalog <small>(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)</small>		<u>NONE</u>	<u>UTM</u>
List Number _____ Dated _____		<u>www.proforceonline.com</u> <u>2019</u> <small>*please see attached info on pricing</small>	
TYPE OF PRICE LIST		<input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/> <input checked="" type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/> <input type="checkbox"/>
WHOLESALE			
DISTRIBUTOR			
JOBBER			
DEALER			
RETAILER			
OTHER			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137	
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
	PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR	
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP
ITEM 3:	Ammunition	NET <input type="checkbox"/>	NET <input type="checkbox"/>
		- 0 % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>	- % DISCOUNT <input type="checkbox"/>
		+ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the _____ Price List or Catalog (note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)		<u>NONE</u>	<u>NO BID</u>
List Number _____ Dated _____		=	=
TYPE OF PRICE LIST			
WHOLESALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DISTRIBUTOR		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
JOBBER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
DEALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
RETAILER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>
OTHER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019

2019-1137 AMMUNITION



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION				BID # 2019-1137
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE		
		PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
PART A: PRICE LIST PRICING		PRICE ADJUSTMENT FACTOR		
ITEM DESCRIPTION		NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	NET OR % DISCOUNT OR MARKUP	
		NET	NET	
ITEM 4:	Uniforms	- 0 % DISCOUNT	- N/A % DISCOUNT	
		+ ____ % MARKUP <input type="checkbox"/>	+ <u>N/A</u> % MARKUP	
Discount/Mark-up or Net proposed from the _____ Price List or Catalog <small>(note Manufacturer or Brand Name, as applicable)</small>		<u>NO BID WE DO NOT SELL UNIFORMS</u>	<u>N/A</u>	
List Number _____ Dated _____		_____ _____	<u>NO BID NO BID</u>	
TYPE OF PRICE LIST				
WHOLESALE		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
DISTRIBUTOR		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
JOBBER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
DEALER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
RETAILER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	
OTHER		<input type="checkbox"/>	<input type="checkbox"/>	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137	
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
		PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING			
ITEM 1.	DESCRIPTION:	.308 Caliber 165 Grain	.308 Caliber 165 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	WINCHESTER SBST308A/S308M	PRA308WB
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	SBST308A S308M	PRA308WB *PER1000 RND
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	\$412.50/\$372.80	\$1,637.50
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	\$202.13/\$182.67	\$1,228.13 <small>Bidders Price \$987.56</small>
ITEM 2.	DESCRIPTION:	.338 Caliber 250 Grain	.338 Caliber 250 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	R338W2
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	R338W2
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	\$3,199.00
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	\$2,399.25 <small>Bidders Price \$2,178.28</small>
ITEM 3.	DESCRIPTION:	.50 Caliber 647 Grain	.50 Caliber 647 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM 4.	DESCRIPTION:	.40 Caliber 165 Grain	.40 Caliber 165 Grain
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	<small>WINCHESTER RA40BA/RA40TA/USA40SW/USA40SWVP</small>	L40SW4 *PER1000 RND
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	<small>RA40BA/RA40TA/USA40SW/USA40SWVP</small>	L40SW4
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	\$344.30/\$284.30/\$212.80/\$198.50	\$349.00
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	\$168.71/\$139.31/\$104.27/\$97.27 FILL PACKS 500 RDS/CS	\$261.75 <small>Bidders Price \$237.67</small>

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137		
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE		
		PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 5.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
ITEM 6.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 1026 Def-Tec Mod 4Cs Charger	DT- 1026 Def-Tec Mod 4Cs Charger	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
ITEM 7.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 6064 Foam Rubber Baton 40 mm	DT- 6064 Foam Rubber Baton 40 mm	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
ITEM 8.	DESCRIPTION:	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	DT- 1210 Def-Tec #35 Launch Cort	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION		BID # 2019-1137	
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019		DEPARTMENT: POLICE	
		PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING			
ITEM 9.	DESCRIPTION:	FOF-FF556BI Force on Force Ammo 5.56	FOF-FF556BI Force on Force Ammo
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM 10.	DESCRIPTION:	FOF- FF9B2 Force on Force Ammo 9mm	FOF- FF9B2 Force on Force Ammo
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID
ITEM 11.	DESCRIPTION:	.40 Cal Practice	.40 Cal Practice
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	WINCHESTER USA40SW/USA40SWVP/Q4238	L40SW3
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	USA40SW/USA40SWVP/Q4238	L40SW3
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	\$212.80/\$198.50/\$219.30	\$349.00
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	\$104.27/\$97.27/\$107.46 500 RDS PER CS	\$261.75 Bidders Price \$237.67
ITEM 12.	DESCRIPTION:	12 ga Slug *STANDARD	12 ga Slug
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	WINCHESTER RA12RS15/RA12RS15S/*X12RS15*	SP12RS
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	RA12RS15/RA12RS15S/*X12RS15	SP12RS
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	\$251.50/\$263.50/*\$256.00	\$1,020.00
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	\$123.24/\$129.12/\$125.44 250 RDS PER CS	\$765.00 Bidders Price \$454.66

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: AMMUNITION				BID # 2019-1137
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019				DEPARTMENT: POLICE
		PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING				
ITEM 13.	DESCRIPTION:	9 mm Duty *124GR	9 mm Duty	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	WINCHESTER RA9T/RA9TA*/RA9124TP*/RA9B*/RA9BA*	L9MM3	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	RA9T/RA9TA*/RA9124TP*/RA9B*/RA9BA*	L9MM3	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	\$261.70/\$270.70*/\$269.30*/\$333.00*/\$333.00*	\$261.40	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	\$128.23/\$132.64*/\$131.96*/\$163.17*/\$163.17* 500 RDS PER CS	\$196.05 <small>Bidders Price \$177.88</small>	
ITEM 14.	DESCRIPTION:	40mm Ferret OC, CS and Powder CS	40mm Ferret OC, CS and Powder CS	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
ITEM 15.	DESCRIPTION:	Riot Control Grenade CS	Riot Control Grenade CS	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
ITEM 16.	DESCRIPTION:	Tripe Chaser Grenades Continuous	Tripe Chaser Grenades Continuous	
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID	NO BID	
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID	NO BID	

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: /s/

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION

BID ITEM: AMMUNITION				BID # 2019-1137			
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019				DEPARTMENT: POLICE			
				PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS		PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
PART B: SAMPLE PRICING							
	DESCRIPTION:	Distraction Device Reloads- 15 Gram		Distraction Device Reloads- 15 Gram			
ITEM 17.	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID			
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID			
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID		NO BID			
	CITY'S COST (after Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID		NO BID			
ITEM 18.	DESCRIPTION:	40 mm Skat Shell Saf-Smoke Product		40 mm Skat Shell Saf-Smoke Product			
	MANUFACTURER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID			
	BIDDER PART NUMBER:	NO BID		NO BID			
	PRICE LIST COST (before Discount or Mark-up)	NO BID		NO BID			
Total (items 1-18)			\$4,694.50	\$2,300.33		\$6,815.90	\$5,111.93 Bidders Price \$4,273.72

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: _____ /s/ _____

DATE: 9/20/2019



CITY OF EL PASO BID TABULATION



BID ITEM: AMMUNITION	BID # 2019-1137		
BID DATE: SEPTEMBER 11, 2019	DEPARTMENT: POLICE		
	PRECISION DELTA CORPORATION RULEVILLE, MS	PROFORCE MARKETING, INC DBA PROFORCE LAW ENFORCEMENT PRESCOTT, AZ	
<p>THE CITY AT ITS SOLE DISCRETION, MAY EXERCISE ANY OPTION TO EXTEND THE TERM OF THE AGREEMENT, BY GIVING THE CONTRACTOR WRITTEN NOTICE WITHIN THE TIME PERIOD NOTED ON THE SELECTED OPTIONS. THE TERM OF THIS CONTRACT SHALL BE BASED ON ONE OF THE SELECTIONS BELOW AND UNDER THE SAME TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE CITY MANAGER OR DESIGNEE MAY EXTEND THE OPTION TO EXTEND.</p> <p>BIDDER OFFERS THE CITY THE OPTION OF EXTENDING THE TERM OF THE CONTRACT FOR:</p> <p>TWO (2) ADDITIONAL YEARS AT THE SAME UNIT PRICE(S), IF THE OPTION IS EXERCISED PRIOR TO THE EXPIRATION OF THE ORIGINAL TERM OF CONTRACT.</p> <p>NO OPTION OFFERED.</p>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<p>*for % off list price items</p>
	<input type="checkbox"/>	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>	<p>*will review with price increase</p>
PAYMENT TERMS:	Net-30 Days	Net-30 Days	
BIDDER'S PROMISED DELIVERY:	30-90	30-160	
Within ___ consecutive calendar days.	Note: Delivery times depend upon supply and demand of product (s) time orders are placed. We work directly w/ Winchester to furnish all or partial orders as needed by ordering agency. Depending upon product availability.		
Within ___ hours or overnight after receipt of verbal order in cases of emergency	1-2	N/A	
AMENDMENTS ACKNOWLEDGED:	Yes	Yes	
<p>IF BIDDER DOES NOT SPECIFY AN EARLIER DELIVERY, THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY SHALL PREVAIL. A DELIVERY DATE LATER THAN THE CITY'S REQUIRED DELIVERY MAY BE CAUSE FOR THE REJECTION OF THE BID.</p>			
<p>BIDS SOLICITED: 27 LOCAL BIDS SOLICITED: 4 BIDS RECEIVED: 5 LOCAL BIDS RECEIVED: 0 NO BID: 1</p>			

NOTE: The information contained in this bid tabulation is for information only and does not constitute actual award/execution of contract.

APPROVED BY: ___/s/___

DATE: 9/20/2019